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Lowell to host 
state festival 

THURSDAY, APRIL R ' 0 6 6 
•»/' 

The Lowell Area Schools will 
be hosts this Saturday. April 
18, to two sections of the State 
Junior High School Band and 
Orchestra Festival. 

Thirty-two school organiza-
tions, arriving in approximately 
70 buses will participate in this 
festival. 

Fifteen orchesUas and bands 
will perform at the Senior High 
School and seventeen bands will 
perform in the Junior High 
School gymnasium. 

Distinguished musicians from 
various state colleges and uni-
versities will judge the com-
petition. 

Lowell's Interest In hosting 
this festival Is to profit by 
serving meals and refreshments 

for the participants and to help 
the Michigan School Band and 
Orchestra Association find sites 
for these state festivals. 

Much student and adult help 
is required to manage this fes-
tival and blanks have been sent 
home with junior and senior 
band members. So far, not 
enough adult help has been of-
fered. 

Anyone who Is willing and 
can help two or more hours 
Saturday, please call Mr. or 
Mrs. Donald Kelley, general 
chairmen. 897-7963, or Mr. Jes-
suo. 897-7366. 

Profits from the festival will 
help send the senior band to 
marching camp. 

Luther Sterzichs 
wed fifty years; 
set open house 

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Sterzlck 
of Route 2, Alto, will be honor-
ed at an open house Saturday, 
Aoril 23. In observance of their 
50th wedding anniversary. 

The open house will be held 
at the Freeport United Breth-
ren Church. Freeport, Michigan, 
from 2 to 5 p. m. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sterzlck were 
united in marriaee on April 21, 
1916. In Alto. Michigan. The 
ceremony was performed by the 
p™ Chamberlain. 

Having lived In the Alto-Free-
port areas, all of their married 
life. Mr. Sterzlck is now seml-
retired as a farmer. 

Hosting the open house will 
bo the Sterzlck's children, Don-
ald of Alto. Mr. and Mrs. Har-
old Langerles of Ravenna, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Jeffery 
of Freeoort. 

No formal Invitations have 
been Issued, and all friend.s 
and relntives of the Sterzlcks 
are cordially Invited to attend. 

The last passenger pigeon on 
earth died 51 years ago on Sep-
tember 1. 

Child Study Club to 
hold dinner meeting 

Members of the Lowell Child 
Studv Club will meet for dinner 
at John Brann's Restaurant in 
Grand Raoids Thursday, April 
21, at 6:30 p. m. 

After dinner, they will gather 
at Helmholdfs Home Decora-
ting Center for a free demonsta-
tlon. 

Reservations are made for 
both, and the telephone com-
mittee will be calling. However, 
any ladles wishing to join this 
group are cordially invited and 
may call Mrs. Don MacNaugh-
ton or Mrs. King Dovle to re-
serve a place for the dinner 
and. or the demonstration, next 
Tuesday. 

The demonstration at Helm-
hnldt's will be held at 8 p. m. 
Plan now to attend. 

VFW AUXILIARY PLANS TO 
HOLD POTLUCK SUPPER _ 

The VFW Auxiliary to Post 
8303 will have a potluck supper 
at the hall Thursday. April 14, 
at 6:30 p. m. 

The regular meeting will fol-
low at 8:15, with nomination 
and election of officers. 

All members are urged to at-
tend. 

Schlernitzauer, Hagen and Poe 
are honor students at LHS 

Pearl Poe 

Pearl Poe. daughter of the 
Reverends RoIHe and Beulah 
Poe of 11353 60th Street. Alto, 
attended Delton School through 
the eighth grade, entering the 
l,owell Area School system in 
her freshman year of high 
school. 

Pparl has been very active 
during her four vears at LHS. 
especlallv in band: having been 
In the Tri-Rlver select band, for 
throe vears and the All-Star 
band for the last two vears. 

One of her special Interests, 
naturally. Is music, and shp en-
joys playing the piano. Pearl 
plans to attend Taylor Univer-
sity and follow a musical voca-
tion. probably teaching. 

Active in manv other fields. 
Pe^rl belonged to the French 
Club, Future Teachers' Gub. 
Pep Club, was a member of 
the National Honor Society and 
served on the play committee. 

Besides music, she Is Inter-
ested in astronomy and has ser-
ved as a sub-district officer in 
the MVF. as well as being busy 
In MYF work In her local chur-
ch and participating In 4-H 
Club work. 

Tom Hagen 

Tom Hagen, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Hagen of 315 North 
Jackson Street. Lowell, has been 
an honor student throughout his 
four years at Lowell High 
School. 

He has been a member of the 
l^tln Club and Is a charter 
member of the National Hon-
or Society, Lowell Chapter. 

Tom has been a representa-
tive from I-owell to Wolverine 
Boy's State in East Lansing for 
the Clark-Ellis American Leg-
Ion Post 152, and was also se-
lected as a Junior Rotarian. 

He has been accepted at Mich-
igan State University for the 
fall term, but hasn't definitely 
made up his mind what his 
major will be. 

VteU Schlernitzauer 

Vlckl Schlernitzauer, daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
F. Schlernitzauer. 514 North 
Monroe Street. Lowell, w a s 
named to the list of top honor 
students of the graduating class 
of 1966. 

Vlckl, a member of the Na-
tional Honor Society, plans to 
attend Michigan State Univer-
sity tills fall and will major in 
languages. 

She has been a member of 
the Pep Club for three years, 
Co-op Club In her senior year, 
with on-the-job training at the 
Runclman Elementary School. 

Serving on the Play and Prom 
Committees In her junior year, 
and on the homecoming com-
mtttee for four years as well 
as belonging to the French Club 
for her first three years, she 
has Indeed been busy during 
her career at Lowell High. 

Increased fire costs 
discussed by city and 
townships at meeting 

Members of the Lowell and 
Vergennes Township Boards met 
Monday evening, with members 
of the Lowell City Council to 
discuss firv protection in the 
two townships, served by the 
City. 

Increased costs have pushed 
the City to talk with the Town-
shins, where most of the fire 
calls come from to assume 
more of a share in the cost of 
operating the department. 

Meeting with the five City 
council members were Ray Rit-
tenger. Mrs. Rex Collins," Mrs. 
Edward Boyd. Simon Wingeier 
and Freest Roth of Ixwell 
Township: and Fred Roth. Ar-
vil Hellman. Mrs. Floyd Clark. 
Adelbert Odell and Elmer Wlt-
tenbach of Vergennes Township. 

Present at the meeting was 
Kent County Fire Chief Jeff 
Geldersma. Lowell's Fire Chief 
Frank Baker and City Manag-
er Bernard C. Olson. 

The meeting adjourned after 
agreeing to study the sharing 
of the Increasing costs, at their 
next meeting and appoint one 
member of each group to come 
up with an equitable solution. 

Modelettes win 
blue ribbons 

At Spring Achievement Day 
held April 2 at the Lowell Run-
clman Elementary building, the 
Modelettes 4-H Sewing Club 
were all blue ribbon winners. 

Senior Miss division winners 
were Brenda Anderson. Birdie 
Lou Detmers, Susan Comdure, 
Carol Wittenbach and Lynn Wit-
tenbach. 

Jackie Brewer, Jeanie Roth 
and Joyce Olin were blue rib-
bon winners In the Junior Miss 
category. 

Young Miss winners included 
Nancy Roth, Paula Detmers, 
Mary Hall. Susie Wieringa, 
Shirley Babcock. Sandy Vos, 
Pattl Kerr and Christine Hos-
kins. 

The following girls were se-
lected for their modeling abiliiy 
to compete in th^ County Style 
Revue to bo held April 30 in 
the Calvin College Cafeteria on 
the Knollcrest Campus: 

Brenda Anderson. Birdie Det-
mers, Susan Comdure. Carol 
Wittenbach and Lvnn Witten-
bach, S e n i o r Miss; Jackie 
Brewer, Junior Miss. 

Honor ribbons for modeling 
were won bv Joyce Olln, Junior 
Miss & Paula Detmers, Young 
Miss. 

The leaders for the Model-
ettes are Mrs. Paul Detmers 
and Mrs. Harold Wittenbach, 
Senior Miss division: and Mrs. 
John Brewer and Mrs. Sidney 
Kerr. Junior and Young Miss 
divisions. 

Purchases 10,000 
red pine trees 

Over fifty Kent County land-
owners have purchased wild-
life seedling packets and pine 
and spruce seedlings from the 
Michigan Conservation Depart-
ment and local nurseries. 

Plantings will be made for 
reforestation and !o Improve 
wildlife habitat food and cover. 

One of the larger tree orders 
was that of Roy Rinard of Low-
ell. for 13.000 red pine. 

According to a report releas-
ed this week bv the K^nt Soil 
and Water Conservation depart-
ment. conservation plans have 
been made with Robert Vanden-
Berge of Ada Township and 
John Cannon and Gerald 
Schutte of Cascade Township. 

Conservation farm plan re-
visions have been made with 
Robert Near of Caledonia Town-
ship. Most of the farm plan re-
visions Include added farm land 
or a change In crop land use. 

New cooperators approved by 
your Kent District directors at 
the April 4th board meeting 
were Ralph Ubaldo. Orle Van-
derBoon and Roger Vanden-
Berge of Ada Township; and 
Rov Rinard of Lowell Town-
ship. 

Harry Ericksnn of Bowne 
Township, has laid out new 
field strip cropping systems this 
spring, on 66 acres. 

Erickson was assisted by Jim 
Emerv and Jim Squires of the 
Soil Ccnservation service. 

Alto physician, 
H. D. Smith. 
dies in Florida 

A practicing osteopathic phys-
ician at Alto the past 29 years, 
Dr. II. Dudley Smith, aged 63, 
died unexpectedly Thursday Ap-
ril 7, in Lido Beach, Florida. 

Funeral services were held 
Monday afternoon at the Roth 
Funeral Home. The Rev. Beu-
lah Poe of the Alto Methodist 
Church was the officiating cler-
gyman. Interment was made In 
the Bowne Center Cemetery. 

Dr. Smith was bom in Ion-
la September 12, 1902. the son 
of Walter T. and Josephine 
Smith. He graduated from Ion-
la high school In 1922. attend-
ed Grand Rapids Junior Col-
lege. Northwestern University, 
and graduated from DeMoines 
Still College, Iowa. 

Following his graduation, he 
served two years of Internship 
at the American Hospital in 
Chicago. Illinois. 

He was a member of the Ton-
la Elks Club, the Lowell Moose 
I.odge. acting Health Officer tor 
Bowne Township, and attending 
physician for the C&O Railroad. 

Dr. Smith Is survived by his 
wife, Evelyn Kimble Smith; a 
daughter. .Mrs. Richard (Con-
stance: LeVaUey ol loma; two 
grandchildren, one brother. Max 
Smith of Lowell; several nie-
ces and nephews: and a host 
of friends. 

Marine private 
ends individual 
combat training 

Marine Private Robert B. 
Tower, |r., son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert B. Tower, sr., of 
1043 Lincoln Lake Ave.. Lo-
well. has completed Individual 
combat training at Camp Pen-
dleton, California. 

The four-week course Includ-
ed over 200 hours of instruction 
under simulated combat condi-
tions. covering sauad tactics, 
guerrilla warfare, day and night 
combat, patrolling and the use 
of Infantry weapons. 

His next stop Is four weeks 
of basic specialist training in 
his milltarv occupational field. 

Marines to be assigned to In-
fantry units will be taught In-
fantry sub-speclaltles. such as 
the machine gun. grenade laun-
cher. rifle .or mortar. Marines 
to be assigned to highly tech-
nical specialties will be sent to 
military schools for their spec-
ialist training. 

Leathernecks bound for the 
Pacific will receive more train-
ing when they report to the Sta-
ging Battalion at Camp Pendle-
ton. California. 

This training will emphasize 
jungle warfare, patrolling and 
civic action based on exper-
ience gained in Vietnam. 

Women of the Moose fo 
meet; plan banquets 

The regular business meeting 
of the Women of the Moose, 
Chapter 1388. will be held Mon-
day, April 18. at the Chapter 
rooms on East Main Street. 

Preparations will be made for 
the bowling banquets, which 
will be hosted by the Chapter, 
the first week In May. 

Any members having time to 
help on May 2. 4. or 5. are 
urged to contact the Senior Re-
gent or the Recorder. 

INSURANCE THAT PAYS 
Is our motto. We have all 

kinds of Insurance for your pro-
tection. and prompt claim serv-
ice for your losses. Peter Speer-
stra Agency, TW 7-9259. c l 

Fire destroys 
Crosby home 

The home of the Dan Crosby 
family at 12360 Grand River 
Drive south of I>0well was near-
ly destroyed by fire that was 
discovered by a passing motor-
ist at 11:45 p. m. Friday. Low-
ell firemen fought the fire for 
nearly 3 hours. The fire broke 
out again on Saturday morning 
and the firemen had to return 
.o complete the job. 

Fire Chief Frank Baker said 
t l e fire started from a defective 
o-I burner that allowed oil to 
leak into the crawl space under 
the house. The fire had a big 
start before the firemen a-rived 
and spread through the two-
story dwelling. Damage was es-
timated at $9,000 to building 
and contents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Crosby and 3 
children had left for Cadillac 
on Friday afternoon for the 
weekend A" their clothing and 
household furnishings were des-
troyed by the fire. 

Consumers to 
make refund 
to customers 

Consumers Power Company's 
natural gas customers this week 
began getting a share of the 
refunds, recently received by 
Consumers Power from Its na-
tural gas suppliers. 

The Company In passing on 
the customer's share of the 
refunds In the form of a credit 
on their next bill. Gas space 
heating customers will receive 
credits averaging about 11.50. 
Gas customers who do not use 
space heating service will re-
ceive credits averaging about 
30 cents. 

The refund Is going to cus-
tomers who took gas service 
from the Company during Oc-
tober. November and December 
of 1965. and who still were cus-
tomers of the Company on Mar. 
25, 1966. 

Those who changed their ad-
dress after December will have 
to apply to Consumers Power 
directly, before July 1, if they 
want their refund. 

The refund credit is going to 
some 697.000 customers as a re-
sult of lower wholesale gas 
rates than those originally col-
lected by the suppliers. The to-
tal amount returnable to cus-
tomers of the Company was set 
at SI.326.122 by the Michigan 
Public Service Commission In 
March 1966. 

Ionia County's 
Home-Sport Shoto 
opens April 15 

The Ionia County Home-Sport 
Show, which Is sponsored an-
nually by the Ionia Jacees, will 
begin its three day run Friday, 
April 15. 

The show will feature dis-
plays of the most modem pro-
ducts available today. Displays 
will include homes, home Im-
provements, appliances, furni-
ture. lawn and garden care 
equipment. One section of the 
show will be devoted to boats, 
camping trailers and sporting 
goods. 

There will be an Interior dec-
orator at the show to discuss 
home decorating and answer 
questions about colors, fabrics, 
styles, etc. 

Another attraction at the 
show will be personal appear-
ances by A1 E. Khatt. Mayor 
and Pansey, area television 
characters. 

A display from the National 
Aeronautics and Space Admin-
istration will Include a full size 
Mercury Space Capsule which 
children can get In. 

A full size A frame cabin will 
be set up In the building at the 
show. 

Retriever Club 

Near million dollar school 
budget set for 1966-67 

The 1966-67 budget for I^well 
Area Schools will reach the 
near million dollar mark. Su-
perintendent Stephen NLsbet re-
vealed to the school board on 
Monday night. 

The coming year's budget 
calls for expenditures of $993.-
094. an Increase over the past 
year's budget of $961,917. 

The Board has approved a 
salary schedule that requires 
$96,421 more than last year: 
with the provision of percent-
age reductions depending on 
the amount of state aid that Is 
received. 

Also Included in the budget 
Is a capital expenditure of $16,-

000 to provide for new seating 
on the home side of the foot-
ball field and Install lighting 
for the track. 

The Board has authorized full 
time secretaries for the elemen-
tary and junior high school prin-
cipals. 

This Increase In overall "x-
pense and salary Increases in 
the administration, moves this 
portion of the budget from $57.-
600 in 1965-66. to a total of $88.-
100, In the coming school year. 

Approve More Classes 

The Board has approved the 
recommendation of Principal 
Carl Hagen to require fresh-

men, sophomores and juniors to 
take five courses each semes-
ter. which will mean that stu-
dents will need 20 credits to 
graduate. 

Band and chorus will receive 
credit with the regular courses 
and freshmen and sophomores, 
out for sports, would not lie 
required to take physical educa-
tion. 

Increased enrollment in the 
high school will make either 
halfday sessions or alternate 
day attendance necessary for 
the first month or two of the 
school year, until the addition-
al rooms are completed at the 
high school. 

plans 2-day 
'Field TriaV 

The Flat River Retriever 
Club of Michigan announces 
plans for Its 6th annual Spartan 
Classic Field Trial to be held 
on Saturday and Sunday, April 
16 and 17 at Tlmberllne Ken-
nels, Pratt Lake Road, Lowell. 

The trial Is open to all re-
trieving breeds and Is sanction-
ed by the American Kennel 
Club. Over 100 dogs are ex-
pected. 

The puppy, qualifying and 
hunting dog stakes will be held 
on Saturday, beginning at 8:30 
a. m. The derby and open all-
age stakes will be run on Sun-
day beginning at 9 a. m. 

Raymond H. Hemer of Low-
ell. is Field Trial chairman. In-
quiries are Invited. Phone 897-
7138. The public Is Invited to 
attend. 

Reqisfer now, for trip 
thru Oldsmobile plont 

The Lowell YMCA is sponsor-
ing a trip through the Oldsmo-
bile Plant in Lansing Thursday, 
April 21. 

Call the 'Y' office. TW 7-7375, 
to make reservations for this 
trip and check the departure 
times, etc. 

Call early, to be sure and 
get your reservation for this In-
teresting trip. 

Plons formulated for 
annual meeting, election 

At the monthly board meet-
ing of the West Central Michi-
gan Historical Society Tuesday 
evening, Apnl b, at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Ed Denkema, 
the members formulated plans 
for the annual membership 
meeting for the election of of-
ficers. 

This meeting will take place 
at the Runciman Elementary 
Building In Lowell Tuesday eve-
ning, May 3, at 8 p. m. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Dumond 
of Grand Rapids will be special 
guests. Mr. Dumond Is project 
director for the Gaslight Village 
at the Grand Rapids Public 
Museum. 

The Society is very privileged 
to have him for a guest speak-
er. New members are cordially 
Invited and all friends are wel-
come. | 

Lowell drops 
double header 

The weather was chilly for 
the opening day Saturday of 
the Lowell High School base-
ball season, and so were the 
players, as they dropped a 
double-header to Ionia High 
School 6 to 4 and 8 to 2. 

The outstanding hitter of the 
day was Jruzanska of Lowell. 
He played first base in the 
first game and came through 
with a home run and double. 
In the second game he was the 
catcher and had two singles. 

Lowell took a one run lead 
In the first half of the first 
Inning, but Ionia came through 
in its half with two runs. 

In the second inning Lowell 
tied the score and Ionia added 
two more in the third and 
fourth to take the lead 4 to 2. 
The score was tied again In 
the fifth Inning when Lowell 
scored twice, but Ionia added 
two more in the sixth for the 
victory. 

Ionia scored its second vic-
tory over the Red Arrows 8 to 
2 on six hits and one error 
while Lowell also had six hits, 
but committed seven errors. 

Coach Jack Kempker said 
the squad has three more non-
league games, with Caledonia, 
Mlddlevllle and Lakewood, be-
fore they play their first Tri-
River league game against Ce-
dar Springs on Tuesday, April 
19. 

Former Loweflites, 
Hoon, Craig Phelps 
eye European tour 

Haan and Craig Phelps, sons 
of Mr. and Mrs. John Phelps, 
formerly of Lowell, will tour 
Europe from July 20 to August 
18 with the "Christian Teens 
Abroad." 

The tour is sponsored by the 
Michigan Conference of the 
Methodist Church, and designed 
for Christian youth and adult 
workers with youth. 

This group will do intensive 
sightseeing In seven countries 
and 32 cities of Europe. They 
will make a study tour of Cal-
vinism and the Reformation, 
and will devote one moming to 
a study of the influence of 
communism on the social, econ-
omic and religious life of 
Czechoslovakia, and will tour 
Prague in search of physical 
examples of Communist influ-
ence 

They will see places, build-
ings and landmarks of great 
historical, religious, intellectual 
and cultural significance. 

On August 14. they will at-
tend the 1966 Work Methodist 
Youth Rally, and on August 18, 
before their flight home, they 
will attend the moming service 
of the opening of the World 
Methodist Conference in Lon-
don. 

T Red Arrow 
track meet 
is Saturday 

Saturday, April 16, the Low-
ell YMCA. in conjunction with 
the Lowell Area Public School, 
Is sponsoring the 1-owell Red 
Arrow Relay Track meet. 

This meet Is sanctioned by 
the MHSAA and 12 teams from 
various Westem Michigan leag-
ues have entered the event. 

The meet is open to the pub-
lic. It begins at 1 p. m. and 
there will be no admission fee 
charged. 

It Is hoped that this track 
event will be continued as a 
regular feature of the spring 
sports events. 

Open House to 
celebrate 40th 
anniversary 

The children of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Weeks are hosting an op-
en house in honor of their par-
ent's 40th wedding anniversary 
Sunday, April 17, from two un-
til five. 

The open house will be held 
in the Rebekah Hall, located at 
the comer of Church and Cen-
ter Streets in Saranac. 

No formal invitations are be-
ing issued, but the honored 
couple do request that there be 
no gifts. 

Area students to 
get degrees at 
Westem Michigan 

The first commencement pro-
gram since Westem Michigan 
University began operating un-
der the spilt third term school 
year, last fall, will take place 
in Read Field House on Satur-
day, April 16, at 3 p. m. 

Featured speaker will be Dr. 
Harold Taylor, nationally-known 
educational philosopher and for-
mer president of Sarah Law-
rence College. He will be 
awarded an honorary doctor of 
laws degree by the university. 

The traditional ceremony will 
see 1,217 Westem Michigan Uni-
versity seniors awarded bach-
elors degrees, while an addi-
tional 276 graduate students will 
receive masters degrees. 

The diplomas will be present-
ed by WMU President James 
W. Miller and Dr. Russell H. 
Seibert, vice-president for aca-
demic affairs. 

Westem Michigan students 
from Ada, who will receive de-
grees Saturday are Joseph R. 
Glllard II, 9133 East Fulton 
Road, Bachelor of Arts, and 
Patricia McClellan, Route 1, 
Master of Arts. 

Forest Hills area students 
who will be graduating, in-
clude Phillip M. Bogglann. 2035 
Burton Street. BBA; Sybrant 
Dykhouse, III, 6915 Cascade 
Road. SE. BS secondary certi-
ficate; Elaine M. Jautala, 2021 
Paris, SE, BS, secondary certi-
ficate. 

Douglas J . Jeltema, 2263 
9as t Leonard. BS; David J . 
Kelly, 1950 East Beltline, SE. 
BBA; Richard J. Quist, 2305 
Paris, SE. BA; Roberta J . 
Smith. 3250 Thomcrest Drive, 
SE. BS, elementary certificate; 
and Dennis G. Spooner. 1410 
Woodcliff Drive, SE, BS. 

Students from the Lowell 
area to be awarded degrees 
are John Bergin. 9693 Downs, 
BS; Patricia A. Lee, 829 Mon-
roe Street, BS, elementary cer-
tificate; and Elenor M. Rollins, 
911 North Hudson Street, MA. 

Janet C. VanWyck. 14050-
64th Street, Alto, will receive 
an MA degree, and Stanford L. 
Wingeier, 7336 Wingeier Avenue, 
SE. Alto, will be awarded a 
BS degree. 

VFW Post to 
SPRING TOPPINGS! elect officers 

Welcome Spring with the best 
topping of all—an alluring new 
hair-do designed by us just for 
you. Walk in or bv appointment. 
Donri's Hair Stylists. 2164 E. 
Main St., Lowell, 897-8155. cl-S 

INCOME TAX 
Retums prepared for farm, 

business and personal. Closed 
Mondays. Bill Fritz, TW 7-7262. 

Flat River Post 8303, Veter-
ans of Foreign Wars, will 
meet In their post rooms at 307 
East Main Street, Lowell, on 
Tuesday evening, April 19. 

On the agenda tor the eve-
ning, will be the annual election 
of t new slate of officers for 
the ensuing year. 

All members of Post 8303 are 
urged to be in attendance at 
this important meeting. 

Rites held for 
Nora Peckham 

Lenora (Nora) A. Peckham, 
widow of Perry C. Peckham, 
passed away Monday afternoon, 
April 11, in Butterworth Hos-
pital. at the age of 82. 

Mrs. Peckham will be well 
remembered for her work for 
the TB Society, which she par-
ticipated in for many years, 
even to the extent of delivering 
the TB stamps personally, be-
fore they were sent through the 
mails. 

In later years, after the death 
of her husband. Perry C. Peck-
ham, she volunteered much of 
her time to the fight against 
cancer. 

Mrs. Peckham also served 
as a Red Cross Volunteer, serv-
ing In many different capaci-
ties. 

She was forced to drop this 
community service work, the 

fiast several years because of 
ailing health. 

Surviving besides her daugh-
ter, Mrs. Jane Joyoux of East 
Lansing, are three sons: John 
of Fresno, California, Richard 
of Lowell and Robert of Dear-
bom Heights, Michigan; one 
sister, Mrs. Marguerite Llttell 
of Grand Rapids: 18 grand-
children; 9 great-grandchildren 
and one nephew. 

A son. Perry C., jr., preceded 
her in death in 1964. 

Funeral services will be held 
Thursday, April 14. at 2 o'clock 
at the Roth Funeral Home, the 
Reverend Charles Davis officia-
ting, Interment at Oak HUl 
Cemetery In Grand Rapids. 

Mothers9 Club 
will present 
style show 

The Alto Mothers' Club will 
have a "Style Show," present-
ed by the Debonalre Shop, at 
the Alto School Tuesday eve-
ning, April 19, at eight o'clock. 

Members of the Mothers' Club 
a n d their teenage daughters 
will model the clothes. The style 
show will be open to the public 
with a twenty-five cent admis-
sion charge. 

There will be door prizes do-
nated by the Debonalre, the Van-
ity Beauty Shop of Lowell, Dln-
taman's Hardware, Bergy Bro-
thers Elevator, Rosenberg's, Ly-
ons Food Market, and the Alto 
Mothers' Chib. 

Following the show, refresh-
ments will be served. Everyone 
plan to attend and bring your 
friends. 

Lowell ioins 
baseball league 

At last Friday's Tri-County 
Baseball League meeting in 
Ionia, plans were formulated 
for the coming baseball season. 

Two new teams were added 
to the league's roster. Portland, 
after a year's absence from the 
league, will enter a team. Low-
ell, for the first time In the 
league's history will also have 
a team in competition. 

The hold-over teams Include 
Belding, Pewamo, Sheridan, 
Sidney, Carson City and Lake-
view. 

Tentative plans Indicate that 
the league will open their sea-
son on May 22 and end their 
league play in late August. 

The Tri-County Baseball Lea-
gue will again be affiliated 
with the National Baseball Con-
gress and for the second year 
in a row the West Michigan 
Umpire's Association will fur-
nish the umpires for the league. 

NOTICE OF ANNUAL 
MEETING OF LOWELL 
SAVINGS tc LOAN ASSOC. 

The annual meeting of the 
Lowell Savings and Loan Asso-
ciation will be held at thelGtate 
Savings Bank on Monday. April 
18, 1966, at 7:30 p. m. ' for the 
purpose of electing directors 
and such other business as may 
come before the meeting. 

David F. Coons, Secretary 
c-52-1 

LOWELL BEER STORE 
Open every day and evenings 

until 10 p. m. Sundays until 
8 p. m. c l 
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South Boston 
Mrs. Relic Young 

Miss Ellen May Everett, R.N. 
and missionary on the Ivory 
coast in West Africa, spoke In 
the Clarksvillc Bible Church on 
Sunday evening. She is a sister-
in-law of Mrs. Anna Cahoon 
Everett. 

Mr. & Mrs. Thad Wigfield's 

for the 
price of 

FManiAM 
in one tiny set by 

CHANNEL 
MASTER 
This S-transistor Channel 
Master miniature meas-
ures only 2 * " x 4%*' x 

—but the pu l l - in 
power, sensitivity, and 
tonal quality are really 
remarkable. Smart black-
and-silver combination. 
An outstanding buy! 
Model 6475. 

Radio Service Co. 
206 E. Main Street 

Lowell, Michigan 

son-in-law is critically ill in the 
Walter Reed Hospital, Washing-
ton, D. C., and is in a coma 
much of the time. His wife is 
the former Marie Wigfield. 

Kenneth Dawson has been 
home on a short leave from 
the U. S. Navy and expects 
soon to be sent to the Saigon 
vicinity. 

Wayne Fahrni was brought 
home Friday by ambulance 
from Butterworth Hospital and 
is said to be slowly gaining. 

Boston Township Farm Bur-
eau group held their April 
meeting Friday evening, April 
1, at the June Fahrni home. 

An addition is being built on 
Jimmy's Grill, located at the 
comer of Hastings Road and 
Grand River Avenue. 

South Boston Grange is spon-
soring a pancake festival Sat-
urday. April 16. Serving will be 
from 11 a. m. to 1 p. m. and 5 
to 7 p. m. 

Guy Thorpe. 65, died unex-
pectedly Saturday morning at 
his farm home. He had been 
a farmer here for several yrs. 
and leaves his wife, formerly 
Letha Mick; his mother, Mrs. 
Eliza Thorpe; three sisters and 
a brother. Funeral rites were 
Tuesday p. m. at the Pickens 
Funeral Home in Clarksville 
with interment in Clarksville 
cemetery. 

Mrs. June Fahrni entertained 
her children and grandchildren 
Sunday. 

Segwum 
Mrs. Iva Mclntyre 

Easter Sunday dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Kinyon 
were Mr. and Mrs. Bill Kinyon 
and family of Greenville, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Dekok and fam-
ily of Grand Rapids and Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Kinyon and 
family. 

Congratulations to Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Kinyon for the new 
grandson bom to Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Myers of Plainwell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Stephens 
and family, Mr, & Mrs. James 
Stephens and family and Mrs. 
Schlesinger of Grand Rapids 
were Sunday dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Stephens. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Olson 
and family were Pre-Easter 
dinner guests of their mother, 
Mrs. Oscar Nelson Saturday 
night. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Zoodsma 
and Clara Kingdom were din-
ner guests of Mrs. Oscar Nel-
son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Kinyon 
called on Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Kinyon Saturday evening. 

for work or 
play 

Slacks—$9.99 

Shorts—$6.99 

Tops—$6.99 

ADA—€76-9231 SIM)P BOTH STORES F i t , Sa t , 9 Jo • 
Friday 9 to 9 DAILY 9 TO 6 LOWELL-W-WH 

Sunday callers at the Emer-
son Stevens home were Mr. & 
Mrs. Roger Stevens of Grand 
Rapids, Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Stevens and family of Marion, 
Ohio, and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Zoodsma. 

Tom Rash who is attending 
Olivet Nazarene College at Kan-
kakee spent his spring vacation 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Rash. 

Mrs. Oscar Nelson was a Sun-
day dinner guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Emil Nelson. 

Mrs. Paul Estermyer and 
son, Dick of Ypsilanti, and 
Ethel Ann Estermyer of Olivet 
Nazarene College' called on 
their mother and grandmother. 
Mr. and Mrs. John Zoodsma 
Wednesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emerson Stev-
ens spent Friday with his broth-
er. Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stevens 
of LaPort. Indiana. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ron Stevens of 
Grand Rapids called on Iva 
Mclntyre Sunday aftemoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Stevens 
and family of Marion, Ohio 
spent over Easter with their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. John 
Zoodsma. 

Mr. and Mrs C.aylrn Hass of 
Lake Odessa called on Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Jones Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Mullen 
and family of Lamont and Mr. 
and Mrs.' Loyal Mullen were 
Sunday dinner guests of their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. William 
Mullen. Callers in the aftemoon 
were Miss Hattie Forist and 
friend. Tom Hiler of Lamont. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Rogers and 
family of Grand Rapids were 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Will Rogers. 

Mrs. Sable Baker spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Keith Baker of Portland. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Baker and 
children of Ionia were supper 
guests of their grandmother, 
Mrs. Sabie Baker Monday. 

Gove Lake 
Mrs. Leon Seeley 

Mrs. Ella Buttrick, Mrs. Leon 
Seeley and Jacqueline DeVries 
of Rockford attended the White 
Breakfast on Wednesday mom-
ing at the Ada Congregational 
Church. 

Mrs. Rufus Gregory. Mrs. 
Leon Seeley and Jacqueline De-
Vries attended Good Friday 
services at Cascade Christian 
Church in Cascade Friday after-
noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Gessner, 
jr., and family attended a fam-
ily dinner at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul Gessner, sr., in 
Grand Rapids, Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Darold Seeley 
spent Friday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. Douglas Antonides. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Keyt of 
Lakeview were Easter dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Keyt and family. Mr. and Mrs. 
Leslie Keyt and Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Kevt called on Miss 
Margaret Qinnucane at the St. 
Francis Home in Grand Rapids 
in the aftemoon. 

Billy Schroeder was an over-
night guest of Gary Keyt on 
Wednesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Seeley 
were Easter dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Cook and 
family in Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Seeley 
were Easter dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack DeVries and 
family of Rockford. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Seeley at-
tended the wedding of Miss 
Marcia DeVries and Douglas 
Holloran, both of Dorr, in SL 
Stanislaus Church in Hillards 
with reception at the school in 
Dorr, April 2. 

Snow Area 
Mrs. S. P. Reynolds 

There will be a guest speak-
er at Snow Church from the 
Grand Rapids YMCA. It is hop-
ed that a large crowd will turn 
out to hear him. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Fox 
spent Saturday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. Urban Lipps of Lo-
well. 

There was a very large crowd 
attending the Good Friday ser-
vices at Snow Church Friday 
aftemoon. 

Mrs. Seymour Dalstra, Mrs. 
Clifford Dalstra. Mrs. Claire 
Stannard. Mrs. Sherman Reyn-
olds, Mrs. Lester Antonides. Jen-
nie Antonides, Mrs. Kenneth 
Fox and Mrs. Elizabeth Shim-
mel were members of Snow 
Church attending the White 
Breakfast at Ada Congregation-
al Church Wednesday moming. 

The Rev. and Mrs. R. A. Wit-
tenbach and son, Bob, of Map-
le Rapids and Lawrence Wit-
tenbach of Adrian College were 
supper guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Ulrich to celebrate Al-
an Wittenbach's birthday and 
Sunday evening supper guests 
at the Ulrich home were his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Ulrich and sister, Rebecca of 
Allendale. 

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Chapin 
and family of Sapford spent Fri-
day aftemoon & Saturday with 
her parents. Mr. and Mrs. Sey-
mour Dalstra. 

Mrs. Clark Hoxie called on 
Mrs. LeRoy Stanley of Cascade 
Sunday noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Overholt 
of near Clarksville and Mr. and 
Mrs. Urban Lipps of Lowell 
were dinner guests Sunday of 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Fox and 
Sunday evening supper guests 
were Mr. and Mi's. Clark Nel-
list of Ada. 

Sunday guests »)f Mr. and Mrs. 
Alex Robertson were Mr. and 
Mrs. C. E. Snyder and sons of 
Kalamazoo. Mr. and Mrs. John 
Blanding and Mrs. Sherman 
Reynolds, local, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Merle Aldrlch of Ml. Pleas-
ant. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Pfaller 
of Lowell and Mr. and Mrs, 
Leo Pfaller and sons visited rel-
atives in Chicago, Illinois, ov-
er the week end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clark Hoxie vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Dean Jen-
sen of Rochester. Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Hoxie and family of Lan-
sing and Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Hoxie and family of Grand Rap-
ids at the home of Mrs. Eve-
lyn Hartman of Greenville. Sun-
day afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clare Carey 
were coffee guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Menno Baker, Friday aft-
ernoon. 

Fox and family. Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Seese and daughter. Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Seese and 
daughter, also Ken Meyers of 
Freeport. 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Seese, 
Richard Blough and two sons 
of Freeport. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Stephen Miller of near Clarks-
ville were Saturday afternoon 
visitors at Ira Bloughs. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Krebs 
were Sunday evening lunch 
guests at tne George Kowalczyk 
home of South Bowne. 

and family. Mr. and Mrs. Clare 
Wingeier and family were Eas-
ter Sunday supper and evenir 

McCords news 
Mrs Effl* Coi 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman De-
Leeuw and family spent Easter 
Sunday with her folks, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Cnimback of Cale-
donia. There were 34 present 
at the Crumback home, to visit 
with Mr. and Mrs. Larry Crum-
back and family of Sacremento, 
Califomia, who are spending a 
month's vacation in Michigan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman De-
lieeuw celebrated their 10th 
wedding anniversary on Wed-
nesday, April 6. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Pollice. 
jr., spent Easter Sunday with 
Mrs. Pollice's brother. Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Jackson, jr., and 
family of Holt. Mrs. Pollice's 
nephew, Steven Jackson, had 
been visiting for the week at 
the Pollice home. 

Donald and John Pollice III 
had sold Easter flowers for the 
Cub Scouts, and had a great 
deal of fun delivering them. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Crumback 
of Caledonia were guests of 
their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Norman DeLeeuw Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Jastifer 
and family of Ada were guests 
one day last week at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Bentley 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wilson a n d , 
family, who have been ill for 
the past week, are reportedly 
recovering satisfactorily. 

Comeal VanderJagt suffered 
a heart attack Sunday, and was 
taken to Blodgett Hospital in 
Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Katolnig # 

called at the Roth Funeral 
Home Sunday evening to pay 
their last respects to Dr. H. 
Dudley Smith of Alto. Thn sin-
cere sympathy of the neighbors 
and friends of the community, 
are extended to Mrs. Smith, 
his daughter and grandchildren 
and brother and nieces and 
nephews. 

Miss Diane Cox and Richard 
Cromwell of East Lansing were 
week end guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Cox and family of 
Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Eva Kaufman and Mrs. 
Effie Cox called at Blodgett 
Hospital in Grand Rapids Sun-
day to see Mrs. Lois Liver-
more. The ladies also called at 
the Robert Cox home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Wingeier 
s. Cl 

! I 
. , /ening 

guests of their' parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Alex Wingeier. 

Miss Barbara Krebs was a 
Sunday lunch and evening guest 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Brock and 
son at Grandville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ira Blough were 
Sunday dinner and aftemoon 
guests at the Ivan K. Blough 
home at Lowell. 

The Star Farm Bureau met 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Enoch Carlson Monday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Krebs vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Seese at Freeport Sunday eve-
ning 

Mr. and Mrs. Philip Wing-
eier relumed home Friday eve-
ning after spending the winter 
months in Florida. 

Carl Feller of Lowell called 
on Mr. and Mrs. Ira Blough 
Monday afternoon. 

Mrs. John Kiuhs, Mrs. Geo. 
Krebs and daughter. Barbara. 
Miss Nancy Krebs called on 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Brock and 
new baby at Grandville Thurs-
day evening. 

S. W. Bowne 
Mrs. L. T. Anderson 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Brower 
of Grand Rapids were Sunday 
dinner guests last week of the 
Joseph Flynn family. 

Sylvester Klein and son of 
Peach Ridge were Thursday 
dinner guests of his sister. Mrs. 
Claire Anderson. 

Mrs. Leon Anderson called at 
the Rhena Da mouth home Wed-
nesday aftemoon, also on Mrs. 
Roger Pitsch and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Ander-
son, Susan and Bobby were in 
Grand Rapids Saturday. 

James Howard, Joe Howard 
and Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Howard spent Friday night with 
their parents, the George How-
ards. All attended the funeral 
of their aunt, Katherine Eardly 
of Grand Rapids S a t u r d a y 
moming. Bonnie and Raymond 
remained at the Howard home 
until Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Anderson 
were Easter dinner guests of 
their son-in-law and daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Pitsch. 
This occasion was in celebra-
tion of Janice's and grandma's 
birthdays. 

Mr. and Mrs. Owen Nash re-
turned home Thursday after 
spending over three months in 
Mesa, Arizona. 

Carrie, Judy and Lori Bow-

man of Martin spent a few 
days of their vacation with 
Grandpa and Grandma Bow-
man. Their mother came after 
them Saturday afternoon. 

Mrs. William Howard of Cale-
donia spent Thursday at the 
George Howard home, l^onore 
has been in Grand Rapids car-
ing for her aunts, the greater 
part of the week. 

Miss June Bowman of Grand 
Rapids spent over the Easter 
week end with her parents, the 
Keith Bowmans. 

Miss Ann McDonald of Co-
lumbus, Ohio is enjoying a few 
days vacation from her nursing 
duties with her parents, the 
John McDonalds. 

Pleasant valley 
Mrs. Rnrt Blank 

The W.M.A. Society will hold 
an all day meeting" for this 
month, Thursday. April 14, at 
the parsonage fellowship room 
with a potluck dinner. A quilt 
is being worked on. 

Mrs. Maud Stadel is hostess. 
Mr. and Mrs. I^oren Gray, 

Mrs. Bea Stahl. Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Flowers, Jr., Dcnisc 
and Deana. Mrs. Ila Hooper 
of Clarksville. Thomas Gray of 
Detroit. Mr. and Mrs. Jay Erb 
of Freeport. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Erb. Colin and Dee Lyn 
of Lake Odessa were Easier 
dinner guests of Mrs. Ethel 
Blank. 

Mrs. Mabel Thompson and 
Mrs. Minnie Skedgall with their 
mother, Mrs. Lizzie Blough of 
Freeport. were in Hastings last 
Wednesday. 

Mrs. Mabel Thompson spent 
Wednesday aftemoon with Mrs. 
Ethel Blank. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Carlson 
and Mr. and Mrs. Dorian EI-
dred dined at the "Southern 
Cafe" In (irand Rapids Satur-
day evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Hend-
ricks and family of Lowell now 
occupy the farm home of Mrs. 
Clair Kauffman. 

The family of Tiny Collins 
from near Clarksville are now 
living in the house on the Dick 
Cline farm on Hell Road. The 
children are still attending the 
Clarksville school. 

Richard Farrls and two chil-
dren of Morenci were guests of 
the Dewey Farrls family, three 
days last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. John D. Stadel 
and son. Dale of Carlton, the 
Dewey Farrls family and Miss 
Janis Healy of near Lake Odes-
sa were Easter dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. John E. Brake 
and Jack. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Geiger and 
family of Lake Odessa were 
visitors of Mrs. Vera Geiger 
Saturday and Mr. and Mrs. 
Emery ' Benedict of Greenville 
were Easter Sunday afternoon 
callers. 

Rev. and Mrs. Max Oven-
shire, and Rebecca and fiance 
John Willette were Easter din-
ner guests of the Harris Back-
afens at Charlotte; then went 
to Detroit, to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. Darrell Ovenshire and 
daughter. 

The Young People's Mission-
ary Band of Michigan Confer-
ence of United Brethren as-
sembly will be held at the Lake 
Odessa Calvary U. B. Church 
at 3 p. m. Saturday, April 16. 
and a banquet for the teenagers 
will be at the Parsonage Fel-
lowship Hall, here at 6:30 p. m. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Letson 
and family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Enoch Letson of near Alto were 

Easter dinner guests of Mr. & 
Mrs. Stephen Carlson and fam-
ily of near Ada. 

Mrs. Dorian Eldred called at 
the Orlie Grindlo home in Alto 
Friday evening. 

Rev. and Mrs. Chalmer Miller 
of E. Freeport, Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvln Starbard and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ovid Miller were Easter 
Sunday visitors of their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Miller. 

CAR 
INSURANCE 

DUE? 

Save with 
Slate Farm*; 
low . 
Insurance 
rates for 
careful 
drivers. 
See me. 

PAUL NOFFKE 

13473 Vergennes Road 

Lowell, Mkh.—Ph. TW 7-8348 

STATE FARM 
MUTUAL 

Aimworu iNSviANct coimurr 
M#m» Otfk*. DIoufflMgton. HUnoU . . 

Jl 
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YOUR MONEY 
CAN ENJOY THE SECURITY OF A SAVINGS 

ACCOUNT AND EARN THE RETURN 
OF AN INVESTMENT 

Sounds like having your cake and eating It too, but Ua t is the way 
It is when you save with our help. 

Your money receives the honest security for which an in-sured 
savings account is famous. 

Your money receives the honest security for which an insured 
even surpasses some of the finest securities in America. 

Why take a chance with your hard-earned dollars. Save where yonr 
money Is Invited, appreciated and protected. 

STATE 
SAVINGS BANK 

L O W E L L MICHIGAN TW 7 - 9 2 7 7 
i - • t i 
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DOUBLE DIVIDEND: Elegance by Caprice. Price by Chevrolet. 

Star Corners 
Mrs. Ira Blough 

Mr. and Mrs. George Krebs 
and Barbara were Sunday din-
ner guests of their parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Kowalczyk at 
South Bowne. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Wingeier 
visited his sister. Mrs. Alma 
Fineleton at Hastings Thursday. 

Mrs. Don Quilter of Escondi-
do. Califomia. spent several 
days recently with her cousin. 
Mr. and Mrs. Emerson Stauf-
fer. 

Mrs. Frank Porter of Bel-
mont was a Monday dinner 
guest of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Krebs. 

Carlos Seese of Pleasant Val-
ley and Mrs. Irene Stahl were 
Tuesday visitors at the Francis 
Seese home. Amnion Miller, sr., 
of Pinhook was a Wednesday 
dinner guest. 

Mrs. John Krebs and Miss 
Christine Wingeier called on 
their sister, Mrs. Fred Graw-
buig at Pennock Hospital on 
Tuesday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Heasley 
and daughters of Grand Rapids 
were Easter dinner guests of 
their parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Francis Shaffer. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Krebs and 
Mr. and Mrs. George Krebs & 
Barbara were Thursday even-
ing lunch guests at the David 
Krebs home at Grand Rapids, 
in honor of the lalter's daugh-
ters. Cheryl and Beth's birth-
days. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Wingeier 
attended church services at the 
Vergennes Methodist Church on 
Sunday moming. and were din-
ner guests at the Donald Mc-
pherson home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clair Kauffman 
and daughters were Easter din-
ner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Stahl and Donald at Zion 
Hill. 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Seese 
entertained their family for Eas-
ter breakfast Sunday morning. 
Guests were Mr. and Mrs. Carl 

SURROUND YOURSELF WITH MUSIC 
Add AM/FM Multiplex Stereo radio. Like 
traveling with your own orchestra. Four 
speakers. Solid stale for " instant music." 

AUTOMATIC HEATING. COOLING 
Comfortron even wrings moisture from 
humid air. Order it and set the thermostat 
on a "Bermuda" climate all year round. 

SELECT YOUR DRIVING POSITION 
Tilt-telescopic steering wheel, you can 
order, adjusts up. down, in and out. And 
you get in and out without crouching. 

GO WITH SPORTS-CAR FLAIR 
Order Strato-buckat seats with smart cen-
ter console in Caprice Custom Coupe, or 
add Strato-back seat with center armrest. 

ASK FOR TURBO-JET V8 POWER 
There's up to 427 cubic inches of quiet 
authority on order for leveling steep grades 
- w i t h plenty of reserve for safe passing. 

EIGHT FEATURES NOW STANDARD 
FOR YOUR ADDED SAFETY, including 
seat belts front and rear, padded instru-
ment panel, padded sun visors, outside 
mirror (use it always before passing). 

CHEVROLET 
DOUBLE 

DIVIDEND DAYS! 
N O . 1 B U Y S * N O . 1 C A R S 
Vow at your Cbevrolet dealer's 

'66 Caprice Custom Coupe. 

All k i nds of goad buys a l l in one p l a c e . . . a t your Chevrolet dealer 's : Chevrolet • Chevelie • Chevy II • Corvair • Corvette 

21-4952 

AZZARELLO CHEVROLET & BUICK, INC 
1250 West Main St., Lowell Phone TW 7-9294 

» 

Art's 
Radio & TV Service 

Main Stroef, I/nvoll, Midi. 

COMPUTE REPAIR OF 
T—RADIOS 

ANTENNAS—ETC. 

PHONE: TV/ 7-8I3G 

Open Frl. & Sat. Evenings 

Art Warning—Proprietor 

- Around 'bout town 

Gravei.. . 
—Cement Grnvrl 
—Hnnk Road Gravel 

or Proeessed 
-Rloek Sand 
—Sfonrs for Drain Fields 
-F i l l Sand. Top Soil 

C A M 

TW 7-7760 or TW7-WM 

WEHICS-RICHARD 
GRAVEL 

e2Hf 

Pre-Easter dinner guests at 
Hi" homo of Mr and '^rs. Fred 
M i n u s were Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Allhaus, jr. ar.d family; 
Mr. and Mrs. Poger Shepard 
end family of Wyoming; Mrs. 
Harry Day and Mr. Ernest Al-
thr.us. 

Following the Enstor Sunrise 
Services i t the LoweU Bautist 
Church brrakfuSt was held at 
lh3 home of Mr. ard Mrs. l^w-
rencc Bieri. Thirty-five persons 
wora present. 

Mr. and Mrs. I/nvronce Bieri 
were Taster Sunday din or 
guests . t th3 home of Mr. and 
Mrs. llGrbcrt BuUcrflcld of 
Je iison. 

Mrs. Trenls Devener, who 
his been ill with the flu at 
Vcstabure for a few days, is 
now back at work. 

Mr. a^d Mrs. Frank Miller 
and sons of Grand Rapids spent 
Faster Sunday at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Fahrni 

Faster Sunday dinner guests 
nt the heme of Mr. and Mrs. 
OriM Grownboom wen; their 
children and grandchildren. 

GrJnd Gpesung 
THURSDAY, APRiL 14 

Barbershop 

Ada Shoppers' Square 

Phone: 676-1803 Ron Plekker 

fun of it 
•« LEGION LANES 

805 EAST MAIN STREET, LOWELL, MICHIGAN 

THE ENTIRE FAMILY CAN BOWL TOGETHER 
Families who bowl together have fun together. Every mem-
ber of the family can easily learn to bowl. Try bowling aoon 
for family fun. 

P H O N E : T W 7-7566 H. KOEWERS, MGR. 

Baggy pants 
are a dead 

giveaway 
about age 

Ournew tropicals 

from Michaels/Stern 

are slimmer than ever 

Slacks have gotten 

more tapered in the leg, 

more fitted in the scat, 

and more youthful 

looking generally. 

Try on a pair of our new 

slacks from Michaels/ 

Stem. Size yourself up 

in our mirror. See if 

you don't look trimmer, 

and even jeel trimmer. 

That 's becausc there's 

no excess cloth flapping 

around your legs and 

your s tem. 

Slacks have gotten 

cooler, too. Come on 

in and we'll show you. 

$9.95 to $17.95 

M I C I I A E L S / S T E R N 

Mr. and Mrs. Clnrence Speak-
er and I.iicille visited Arthur 
I'. isler Sunday at the Veteran's 
Hospihl at Fort Custer in Uat-
l!^ Creek. 

Mr. a -d ?Tr?. Gl?nn Troyer 
and daughter Karen of Caledon-
ia spent Raster Sunday at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Trover. Sunday evening they all 
attended thn Easier Cantata 
Service In Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Porritt 
& drldren v/ero Sunday guests 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Bvron Weeks for bruneh and 
also fo eolebnte a triple birth-
day in their family. 

Mrs. Vie Clemen?, and Carol 
In'^ed with the rest of their 
family at lh" home of Mr. ard 
Mrs. Don Weeks of Alto, for 
E;»sfcr d'rner Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Wyben-
ga of Grand Ranids and Mrs. 
and Mrs. Ballard Phillips and 
two ch'ldren, of Saranac. were 
Thursday guests at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Albert Mirtin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orrin Sterken 
v e r e Eastrr Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ihrold Dolloway 
and family of Muskegon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orrin Sterken 
returned home last Wednesday 
after spending the winter in 
Florida. 

Easter cuests of Air. and Mrs. 
F H. Roth were the Misses Jes-
sie ard Ina O'Harrow of De-
troit. Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Chiffin and familv of Ithaea. 
Mr. and Mrs H. F. Kmm. and 
Mr. nnd Mrs. Charles Ross and 
daughters. 

Frldav evening. April 8. Mr. 
and Mrs. Riehard Marsh of 
Whitehall and granddaughter, 
I.eeanna. took his mother. Mrs. 
Frank Marsh, out for dinner. 

Patricia Marsh and her friend 
Patricia Moore paid a surprise 
visit Faster Sundav on her 
grandmother. Mrs. F. Marsh. 

Easter Sunday dinner and 
afternoon guests at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Larry Law-
rence were Mr. and Mrs. Rob-
ert McWhinney and daughter. 
Patty, of Ada, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Willard Lawrence and 
son. Garrv. of Clarksville. 

Hattie Lvnn spent a few 
davs last week at the home of 
Mrs. Frank Marsh. 

Last Monday visitors a t the 
home of Mrs. Frank Marsh 
were Mrs. Elson Rawson and 
children, her niece, of Wyom-
ing. 

Faster Sunday dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Don Mac-
Naunhton and family were Mrs. 
Shirlev Behnke. Larry and Pat-
tl of Grand Rapids and Frank 
Behnke of Howard City. 

Larry Lawrence, who under-
went ma lor stomach sureery 
Inst Tuesday at the Belding 
Community Hospital, has been 
released, and is convalescing at 
home. 

Dr. Wallace O'Brien. Associ-
ate Grand Guardian of the In-
ternational O r d e r of Job's 
Daughters of Michigan was a 
pnest of Lowell's Bethel No. 14, 
Monday evenine April 11. 

Mrs. Paul Zolliker and daugh-
ters of Rochester snent Monday 
and Tuesday. April 11 and 1" 
with Mr. and Mrs. Claude 
Thome and other relatives in 
Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Flynn 
of Caledonia were Sunday call-
ers at the Robert Ellis home. 

Faster guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Ellis and family 
on Bewell Road were Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Fills of Lowell, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Sonny Sicill-
ano and three daughters of Wy-
oming. 

Mr. and Mrs. LaVeme Hunt-
ington of Eaton Ranids and 
Mr. and Mrs. Ross Stauffer of 
Alto visited Mr. and Mrs. El-
mer Ellis last Wednesday after-
noon. 

Visitors last week at the 
Belding Community Hospital to 
see Larry Lawrence included 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Lawrence. 
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Lawrence 
and son. Garry of Clarksville, 
Mr. and Mrs. Harlan Hunt of 
Greenville. Kenneth Burton. Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Adams of Beld-
ing. Mr. and Mrs. Fred Cahoon. 
Coco Lawrence, and Mr. and 
Mrs. James Doezema of Grand 
Ranids. 

Mrs. Arthur Schneider and 
son. Robert and Mr. and Mrs. 
John Williams and family of 
Saranac spent Easter Sunday 
at the home of the Reverend 
and Mrs. Donald Merrill in Kal-
amazoo. 

The Reverend and Mrs. Rob-
ert Coon and family spent Mon-
day. April II. and Tuesday, 
April 12. visiting Mrs. Arthur 
Schneider and son, Robert, of 
Lowell. 

Mrs. Arthur Schneider and 
Robert Schneider are leaving 
Lowell for Glendale, Arizona, 
this week, to visit Mrs. Schneid-
er's son. Lawrence and family. 

Mrs. Ethel Yeiter spent the 
week end with her daughter. 
Mrs. Ivan Blough and family 
and enjoyed a family dinner 
Easter Sunday with the Rev. 
and Mrs. Dean Blough and son, 
David, of Alton Road and Mr. 
and Mrs. Short of Flint. 

Mr. and Mrs. G. R. Thomp-
son. Jenny and Billy, of 418 E. 
King St.. Lowell, enioyed a visit 
to Sarasota Jungle Gardens, 
while vacationing on Florida's 
lower west coast. 

Sunday evening callers at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Lawrence were Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Malone of Grand Rap-
ids and Mr. and Mrs. Fred Ca-
hoon. 

i%6 LBS Spring spcrt sdsdslss 
M thirty-tw® contests at 
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Inclemcnt weather has put 
a barrier on L o w e l l High 
School's Spring sports work 
outs for the April opening of 
tlicir schedules. 

Full schedules for baseball, 
track, golf & tennis have been 
formally approved, bring 32 con-
tests to Lowell with 17 listed on 
the road, plus the year-end 
tournaments. 

The Arrows hope to do better 
in their Spring activities than 
thoy did list year, when the 
track team won the school's 
lone Trl-River title. 

The athletes at LHS go Into 
their final four sports, af ter a 
faltering fall schedule, with on-
ly the wrestling team taking a 
championship. 

Nine matches with Tri-River 
competitors has been scheduled 
in 19GG for the golf team, which 
will enter its second year of 
competition. 

Last year, the local golfers 
placed second in Tri-River com-
petition, and maintained a six 
win. 3 loss record. They are 
coached by Gerald Smith. 

Golf Schedule 

April 14—Rockford Here 

R t h e 

EQeventh 
pin 

The men's season's high ser-
ies and high record toppled this 
week at the American Legion 
Lanes. 

Dick Dilly, jr.. rolled a real 
big 279 game with a 693 series, 
which is now the new high for 
the year. Congratulations Dick! 

For the women, it was Elaine 
Evon with a fine 540 series, 
and Jean Wilcox with a big 220 
game. 

Men's High Series 
Dick Dillv. jr. 693 
Jack Smith 625 
Hugh VanderVeen 624 
Al Kerr 590 
Floyd Everling 587 
Jim Topp 587 
Charles Nead 586 
Roy Franks 584 
Hugh Linkfield 581 
Les Kline 581 

Women's High Series 
Elaine Evon 540 
Alice Allchin 534 
Jean Wilcox 515 
Ev Wittenbach 513 
Elva Topp 507 
Irene Keech 498 
Katie Lvons 495 
Nettie Walters 461 
Marie Mulder 455 

Men's High Games 
Dick Dilly. jr. 279 
Jack Smith 235 
Hugh VanderVeen 234 
Jim Topp 234 
Lud Kerr 233 
I^ren Barton 233 
Neal DeJongh 223 
Al Gustafson 220 
Floyd Everling 219 
Les* Kline 219 

Women's High Games 
Jean Wilcox 220 
Katie Lvons 189 
Alice Allchin 189 
Nettie Walters 181 
Irene Keech 181 
Ev Wittenbach 179 
PhvHis Earle 179 
Shirley Hoffman 178 
Esther Clemenz 174 

Jackpot RowUng 
In Jackpot bowling Sunday. 

Ray and Fem Hovinga took 
first place. 

Second place went to Lou 
Hunn and Wavne Hoag. The 
Jackpot now stands at $48. 

Dale Hanson led all bowlers 
in the high game department 
bv rolling a fine 151 game in 
the Grade School league. The 
top series was bowled by Chris 
Collins, a 262. for two games. 

Bonita Baker topped the girls 
with a 121 game and 220 ser-
ies. 

In the Junior and Senior High 
School league, Chris Kyser had 
the high game a 188. with Rick 
Peckham taking high series hon-
ors with a 528. 

Norene Baker rolled a 142 
game and 381 series to pace 
the girls. 

Grade school league 

GatT>e 

Dale Hanson 
Kris Kropf 
Chris Collins 

Series 

Chris Collins 
John Doane 
Dale Hanson 

Jr . & Sr. high league 

Game 

Chris Kyser 
Rick Peckham 
Rick Condon 

Arrll 18—Crdnr Springs Thrro 
Mnv 5—lenh H.'re 
Anrll 25—Snorti Hnre 
Mav 2—Brldlni! More 
Miy 9—R^kford There 
m-iv iR—r^wstock Park l i f e 
May 20—Ionia There 

During the 1965 season, th" 
polf team held fhe'r home mat-
ches m 'he golf course at Mor-
rison Lake. 

Hob Perrv and Richard Be-
will coach tho track 

soind at LOWPII High School. 
During 1965. thrv won five 
n e t s and lost one, for a per-
fect season. 

Track Schedule 

AnHI 14—Caledonia. lonh 
Anrll 16—'V Inv'tat'onal 
Anr'l 19—Codar Springs 
Anrll 22—Sparta 
Aorll 26—Rawing 
Mav 3—Rockford 
v-,v 6—Cimsfock Park 
Mav 12—Posinon^ment date 
Mav 11—P«v'lonaIs 
Mav 17—Conference prelim-

inaries 
Mav 19—Conference Finals 
May 21—Slate Meet 

Out of the thirteen matches, 
scheduled for the tennis team 
this "Par. seven matches will 
be held on the tennis courts at 
Recreation Park. 

The 1966 snuad will bo coach-
ed bv Art Bieri and will have 
the following schedule: 

Tennis Schedule 

Anrll 1.1—Mlddlevllle Here 
April 14—Ionia Here 
April 19—Cedar Springs There 
April 21—Sparta Here 
April 26—Reldlng Here 
Anril 28—Rockford There 
Mav J—Comstoek Park Here 
Mav 4—Mlddlevllle There 

May 5—Cedar Springs Here 
Mav 10—Sparta There 
May 12—Belding There 
May 17—Rork'ord H- re 
May !9—Conislnck Park There 

The tennis matches will start 
at 4:15 p. m. 

Recreation PTIC will Ix? ihe 
scene of eight home games for 
the baseball team. Their lOOC 
schedule shows eipht games lo 
be played av/uy from home. 

Jack Kempker will coach the 
varsitv baseball team, and Gor-
don Gould has taken over the 
coaching responsibilities for the 
freshman squad. 

Baseball Schedule 

April 12—Caledonia Here 
April 13—Mlddlevllle Here 
April 14—Lakewocd Here 
Anr'l 19—Cedar Springs There 
April 21—Sparta Here 
AnrI 2&—Belding Here 
Anril 28—Rockford There 
May 3—Comstock Park Here 
May 4—Mlddlevllle Th^re 
May 5—Cedar Springs Here 
May 10—Sparta There 
May 11—Caledonia There 
May 12—Belding There 
May 17—Rockford Here 
May 15—Comstock Park There 

M e n in the 

- s e r v i c e -
Pvt. E2 Delva Burton is serv-

ing with the UN Army over-
seas. in the Dominican Repub-
lic. His new address is: 

Pvt. E2 Delva Burton, US 
55864460 67 Ma int. Sup. Svc. 
Co.. A.P.O., New York, New 
York, 90478. 

Smith, Senneker kick-off 1966 
racing season with Name victories 

Veteran driver Bob Smith of 
Columbus. Ohio, behind the 
wheel of a roadster type race 
car. forged past race leader 
Jimmy Murphy of South Haven 
on the 18th lap and went on to 
win the 2fl-lap feature race for 
super modified stock cars Sat-
urday night kicking off the 1966 
racing season at the Berlin 
Raceway, in Mame. 

Following Murphy across the 
finish line were Benny Rapp of 
Toledo. Ohio. Rich Senneker of 
Grand Rapids. Jack TenBrink 
of Zeeland. Mike Stone of Tor-
onto. Canada, and Buddy Stew-
art of Grand Rapids. 

Bob Senneker of Grand Rap-
ids outdueled Glenn Tanls of 
Hudsonville to win the 20-lap 
main event for semi-late mod-
els on the newly high-banked 
asphalt Mame oval. 

Johnny Johns of Muskegon 
and Huram I-ockwood of South 
Haven escaped injury as their 
respective race cars caught on 
fire and left the race track 
during the hectic feature event. 

Heat race winners were Sen-
neker. Johns. Rapp and Smith. 
Norm Rust of Novl set a new 
one lap qualifying record of 
17.90 seconds for the short one-
half mile oval. Senneker cap-
tured the fast car dash event 
in the late model division with 
Smith capturing similar honors 
in the super modifieds. 

Open competitioo super modi-
fieds and semi-late model auto 
racing will continue every Sat-
urday night during the racing 
season. 

Time trials will be at 6:30 
p. m. and the first race at 8:15 
p. m. 

Speedrome Opens 

The 1966 racing season offic-
ial got underway at the Grand 

Rapids Speedrome. Saturday 
night before a near capacity 
crowd, despite the bitter cold 
weather. 

Cascade's Fddie VanderLaan 
workod his way through con-
jested traffic in the 25-lan sup-
er modified feature on thn ,'.-
mile asnhnlt ovni to win the 
first fentnrp of »ho year. 

Fellowinc Vand^rl-aon amis s 
•Hp finish Pno was Jackie I ind-
hont '•nd Nnrm Rrown. hn*h 
nm'Hnor tho'r suneHnr driving 
ahipfv bv pressing VanderLaan 
oil fho wav. 

Mort Andorson of GreonvHlp 
pscnoed so^oiis inturv when his 
snnor mpdifipH loft »hp track 
in the first heat and flipped ov-
er. 

.Timmv Rohort<; of Midland 
Mi^hiVan a newcomer to the 
'Drnmp "-as hiCT rnonpv win. 
por in fhp snnii.latp modol di-
vision whon ho wop the PCt'nn-
mnVoH foofnro and ^ 
f-rnnd Ropids' Torrv Schmidt 
finfchpd second in the main 
ev^nt 

Preliminirv winners In the 
Smvr rppdifi'vl HaSS won1 Vap-
dorl.pan T.inrthpiit. Don TTnnse 
pnd Jnhnpv Rrpspn. Rph"rts. 
Rnh Folln"*; nnH Jim Adoniq 
g m h W victories in the late 
models. 

Mlssos Otvnlng Nleht 

T / w p I I ' S Larrv f awrence. hos-
nUM|7Pd for suiwrv. piisspd the 
IQfifi ppppjncr ni^ht Of raoinq: 
t»n» fir<;t qinrn hp pinvpd to 
Miohio^n s-^me ten vears ago 
from InHinnfl 

AntWpnfnP Ppttinp bark In-
fo arfipn I O«RROPF>p iq POW RO-
Cii»v*rafinp nt homp. wishlntr 
could cnmnlefp h'S oar while 
convalpspinw but doctor's ord-
ers keep him intact. 

D e a d l i n e s . . . School Hot Lunch 

Series 

Rick Peckham 
Rick Condon 
Tom Koewers 

151 
147 
138 

262 

253 

183 
1S6 
185 

528 
515 
462 

Unless otherwise noted, the 
Lowell Ledger publication dead-
lines for non-holiday weeks will 
be as follows: 
Photographs, 4 p. m. Monday. 
Church News, noon Tnesday. 
Social News, 4 p. m. Tnesday 
Correspondence, noon Tuesday 
Coming events, 5, Tuesdays 
Want Ads, 5 p. m. Tuesdays 

All deadlines are for material 
to be published in the same 
week's issue of the Ledger, 

The Ledger cannot guarantee 
use of material received after 
the above noted deadlines. 

THE LOWELL LEDGER 

Member of the Michigan Press 
Association 

105 North Broadway. Post Of-
fice Box 128. Lowell, Michigan. 

Second class postage paid at 
Lowell, Michigan; published ev-
ery Thursday. 

Subscription price: Kent and 
Ionia Counties, $3 per year; 
outside this area, $3.50 per 
year. 

Week of April 18 

MONDAY-
Spaghetti with Meat Balls 
Crisp Salad 
Bread and Butter 
Cookies Orange Juice 

TUESDAY-
Sloppy Joes 
Oven Fried Potatoes 
Relishes Pudding 

WEDNESDAY-
Chlckon and Biscuits 
Buttered Peas 
Carrot Sticks 
Pear Halves 

THURSDAY-
Mashed Potatoes 
Roast Pork and Gravy 
Bread and Butler 
Vegetable Salad 
Applesauce Cake 

FRIDAY— 
(i rilled Cheese Sandwiches 
Baked Beans 
Pickles 
Fruit Cup Cookies 

AND OF COURSE-
MILK FROM 

/ 

*10.95! 

"Step into" novelty striped jersey knit tucketf t n t o 
checks. Washable, comfortable sheath with easy 3-gore 
back skirt. 

BLUE/WHITE, MINT/WHITE, PINK/WHITE 
BLACK/WHITE 

Half Sizes: 14%-24V4 

^hip'r^hore' 

fans interest { 
with ruffles in 
80% Dacron* 
20% cotton 

a i . 9 8 

Conversation starter. Ring a face gracefully 
in ruffles, add the luxury of polyester and 
cotton. Sophisticate shades and white. 
28 to 38. 

^hip'nghore' 
poor girl 
shirt with 
gilt-edged 
possibilities 

Gamin glamour! A winsome wisp of ribbed cotton 
knit, tee-shirt styled for the "poor girl" look. 
White, pales and sizzle shades. 30 to 38. 

219 WEST MAIN ST.. LOWELL PHONE TW 7-7571 

• 
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Mr. and Mrs. Bud Livingston 
and family of Clarksville came 
Sunday lo prepare the dinner 
for the Glen Lovelands. 

Mrs. Jack Neubecker and 
boys were dinner guests of her 

rents, Mr. and Mrs. George 
umphrey of Freeport Sunday. 
Mrs. Henry Slater, and Mr. 

and Mrs. Emerson Colby called 
on Mrs. Tom Forward Sunday 
evening. 

Lisle Clark was a recent call-
er of the William FairchUds. 

FURNACES 
AND CONVERSION 

BURNERS 

WATER HEATERS 

FOR ESTIMATE 
CALL TW 7.7948 

LYLE COVERT 

Mr. and Mrs. Neil Hoffman 
and family of Grandville and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Johnson and 
boys were Sunday guests of 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Johnson. 

Mrs. Crystal Bergy accom-

ganied Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
ergy to tiie EUB Church in 

Ionia last Sunday to attend the 
baptismal services for yttle 
Patrick Bergy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Denton Wilcox 
and children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Fosberg and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Bancroft 
and family were Easter morn-
ing breakfast guests of their 

irents, Mr. and Mrs. R. D. 
incroft. 
Mr, and Mrs. Loslie Hobbs of 

Hespena, Mrs. Mildred Peak of 
Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. Terry 
Dintaman and family and Dar-
rell Kelly of Lowell were Sun-
day dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Dintaman. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Ander-
son and family were Saturday 
evening supper guests of her 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Glen Par-
sons of South Boston and Sun-
day evening guests of his fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Boyd Ander-
son of Ada. 

S E R V I C E 

PROMPT 
SERVICE 
For Your 

TV—RADIO 

—STEREO 

CaU 

897-9275 
RADIO SERVICE CO 

206 E. Main St.. LoweU Ph. TW 7-9275 

WBUBBliTF 
a total 

insurance plan 

A NEW 
INSURANCE 

IDEA/ 
To Protect Almost Everything You Own 

Mfc your Farm Bureau Insurance Agent about the Sik 
burbanifc. He'll tell you how your home, car(j), travel 
trailer, cottage or cabin and boat — can be protected 
through one plan and one company. 

Ths> Suburbanrte will mean cash savings, greater con-
venience and better service for you and your family. 
Why not contact your Farm Bureau Insurance Agent? 
He'll give you all the details. 

DALE 
JOHNSON 

Phone: 868-6743 

N O 

MEMBERSHIP 

OR POLICY 

FEES REQUIRED 

Auction Sale 
Due to Illness, 1 will sell the following at Auction, located ' i 
mile East and 4' 2 miles Suulh uf Alto, or East of Caledonia 
on 92nd St. to Alden Nash Ave., then South 'A mile, at 9296 
Alden Nash Ave., on 

Saturday, April 16 
STARTING AT 1 P. M. 

FARM EQUIPMENT: Oliver Model 77 Diesel Tractor, 
1954; Oliver Mower; Oliver 2-14 Plow; Oliver Model 50 
Baler; Oliver 13-hole Grain Drill; Oliver 2-row Corn 
Planter; Oliver 3-sec. Drag; International Disc-Cultl-
packer; New Idea PTO Spreader, No. 2W, like new; 
New Idea 6-lon Wagon. 8-ply tires; John Deere Side De-
livery Rake; Wagon and Rack: Lime Spreader; 50-gal. 
f ruit Sprayer; 2-wheel Trailer; Weed Sprayer; Buzz 
Saw; Hay Loader; Corn Shelter. 

MAPLE SYRUP EQUIPMENT: King Evaporator: 1.000 
Spiles; 1,000 Sap Buekets; 250-gal. Gathering Tank; 4 
16-barrcl Storage Tanks; 12-barrei Storage Tank; 2 
Thermometers. 

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS; Jamesway 12-hole Hog Feed-
er; 2 Hog Houses; 2 Eleetrle Fencers; Livestock De-
borner; Bolt Cutters: 275-gal. Gas Tank with stand: 
4-cycle Garden Tractor; Many Electric ?«nd Steel Fence 
Posts; Farm Scales; Anvil; Vise; Drill Press; Elec-
tric Grind Stone; Hand Drill; Many Real Good Wrenches 
and Shop Tools; 1 55-gal. Barrel of Oil, HD-M SAE 20; 
Electric Range; Many Horse Harnesses. 

MILKING EQUIPMENT: DeLaval Milking Machine and 
Pump; Pails; Cream Separator; 4-can Esco Milk Cooler. 

FEED: Appro.v. 500 bales Mixed Alfalfa & Brome Hay; 
Approx. 175 bales of Straw; 500 baskets Ear Corn. 

LUNCH ON GROUNDS-TERMS CASH-COME PREPARED 

Victor Porritt, Owner 
Don L. Zandbergen, Auctioneer 
S4tli St., Grandville, Mich. 
Pheae: SU-7UI 

Mr., Mrs. Harold Yoder 
Clerks 

Alto party line 
MRS. DONNA BLOCHER, UN 8-S171 

Firemen make 
assist call 

The Alto Fire Department 
was called to assist the Cale-
donia Department in extinguish-
ing a fire al the Charles Jous-
ma home on Vincent Avenue, 
west of Campbell Lake, Mon-
day morning. 

Cause of fire was due to a 
chimney burning out. Extensive 
damage was done to the house, 
but most of the contents were 
saved. 

New arrival 
Wednesday, April 6, a 5 lb. 

13 ounce daughter, Kim Marie, 
arrived at Blodgett Hospital 
and will make her home with 
the happy parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. James McFall of Lowell. 

Mrs. McFall is the former 
Sharon Dintaman of Alto. 

Methodist netvs 
The Alto and Bowne Center 

M.Y.F. will have a barbecue 
supper on Satuday. April 16. at 
the Alto Church. Serving time 
is 5:30 to 8:30 p. m. 

The W.S.C.S. will also have 
a Bazaar and Bake Sale at the 
same time. 

Public is invited. 

Baptist news... 
Thursday, April 14, the Ladies 

Mi-^ionary meeting will be held 
in the church at 7:30 p. m. 

Sunday, April 17, Rev. Mel 
Nelson will be speaking at both 
morning and evening services 
in the absence of Pastor Rich-
ard Beach. Rev. Beach starts 
a series of special meetings at 
the Freeport Baptist Church, 
Wednesday, April 13 through 
Sunday, April 17. 

Sunday evening the Young 
People of the church will be 
meeting at the David Hoffman 
home for a time of fellowship 
and singspiration after the eve-
ning service. Due to this, the 
regular 6 p. m. meeting will 
not be held. 

R. L D. S. at Alaska 

Thursday, April 14, 1:30 p. m. 
the Women's Department Hope 
Circle will meet at the home 
of Dorothy Willoughby. At 7:30 
the Zion's League and Zloneers 
will meet at the church. 8 p. m. 
the Women's Department. Will-
ing Hearts Circle will meet at 
the iiome of Linda Roark. 

Saturday, April 16, 11 a. m. 
a baked goods sale will be held 
at Dintaman's Hardware Store 
in Alto. 

Sunday, April 17, the World 
Conference convenes at World 
Headqarters In Idependence, Mo. 
and will continue through April 
24. 

At the 11 a. m. service, the 
speaker for the hour will High 
Priest Dirk Venema. His theme 
is "Even So Send 1 You,". At 
the 7 p. m. service the theme 
is "Power From on High." The 
speaker to bring the message 
will be Priest Robert Johnson. 

Tuesday, April 19, 7 p. m. the 
Field School continues their les-
sons at the church. 

Wednesday. April 20, at 7:30 
p. m. the Mid-Week Worship 
service will be held. The theme 
for the hour will be "I Found 
the Joy He Promised." The 
speaker to deliver the message 
will be Priest Kenneth Colburn. 

Other Alto News 

Mrs. Glen Loveland returned 
home by ambulance fium the 
Osteopathic Hospital Saturday 
morning and is able to be up 
and gets around by wheel chair. 

Mrs. Sherman Reynolds of 
Snow is helping with the house 
work. 

Mrs. Vernon Yeiter entered 
Osteopathic Hospital last Wed-
nesday and had major surgery 
on Thursday. She is coming 
along very well and expects to 
be home this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Mer-
riman and familv were Sunday 
dinner guests of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Von Stout of 
Ionia. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Blocher 
and Heidi of Cascade were Sun-
day dinner guests of their 
grandparents. Mr. and Mrs. 
George Tobias. 

Easter Sunday dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Lee Vanda-
Water were her mother. Mrs. 
Carl Keiser of Grand Rapids 
and his mother, Mrs. Leonard 
VandaWater of Big Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Fair-
child and Mrs. Anna Fairchild 

COLBY 
. ACLHtY 

. W \ 1 V U 

CHARLES I. COLBY 

Alto Off. UN 8-3961 

Clarksville Office: 
OW 3-2231 

called on Mrs. Clyde Kinyon of 
Lowell Thursday aftemoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Lunsford 
of Grand Rapids and Mr. and 
Mrs. Warren Bergy and family 
were Easter dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Alvln Bergy and 
Mabel. 

Mrs. Marlon Carlson, Mrs. 
Myrtle Johnson, Mrs. Leonard 
Johnson and Mrs. Esther Ban-
croft attended a luncheon at the 
YMCA In Grand Rapids for the 
Farm Bureau Women's Com-
mittee meeting last week. The 
Sheriff s Department presented 
a film on "Safety." 

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Thaler of 
Mlddlevllle were Tuesday eve-
ning dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Linton and Janet. 

Judy, Annette and Ricky 
Siegle' spent Easter vacation In 
Boston, Massachusetts, visiting 
thfiir grandmother, Mrs. Mary 
Siegle and other relatives. 

Ray Linton attended the Lum-
berman's Affiliated Meeting In 
Lansing Thursday. Mary and 
Janet accompanied him and 
spent the day touring the Capi-
tol with other groups and had 
the opportunity to meet and 
talk with Martin D. Buth, state 
representative and Senator Ro-
bert VanderLaan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Linton and 
Janet and Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Dutcher of Caledonia attended 
the Installation of the new offi-
cers of the Deir-El-Bahari Tem-
ple, Daughters of the Nile, at 
the Masonic Temple In Grand 
Rapids Saturday evenlnc. • A 
friend, Mrs. Leona Smith of 
Middleville was installed as 
Queen. 

Mrs. Ronald Chaney and Billy 
Mr. and Mrs. Allan Wllhelm 

of Grand Blanc were Easier 
dinner guests of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carlton Fair-
brother. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Craig 
and family called on her par-
ents, Mr. a n d Mrs. Clinton 
Blocher Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Fair-
child were the Sunday dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Fairchild and Mrs. Anna Fair-
chlld. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. C. Roseih 
berg were Sunday dinner guests 
of their daughter, Mr. and Mrs.1 

Lloyd Houghton In Ionia. Mr; 
and Mrs. Raymond Baber of 
Pontiac were also guests. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emerson Colby 
were dinner guests Sunday of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Slater 
and Mrs. Henry Slater. 
were Friday afternoon callers 
of Mr. and Mrs. William Fair-
child and Mrs. Anna Fairchild. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Linton and 
Janet called on Mr. and Mrs. 
George Linton of McCords on 
Friday evening. 

Mothers don't forget the 
"Style Show" to be put on by 
the Debonaire Shop Tuesday 
evening at 8 p. m. at the 
school. Bring your friends. Free 
Door prizes! 

Mr. and Mrs. Val Watts were 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Geor 
Montague and family of 
Odessa Sunday, April tf. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mac Watson 
had as Easter guests their chil-
dren, Mrs. Mabel Wood a n d 
Robert of Ada and Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Camaham and 
children of Grand Rapids. 

South Lowell 
Mrs. George Wlcland 

Mrs. 111a Swanson and Gladys 
Shade were hostesses to thirty 
ladies Thursday aftemoon at 
the former's home for a mis-
cellaneous shower In honor of 
Mis. Bnice Rittenger. After 
several InteresUr.g games and 
a delicious lunch, the bride 
opened her many and useful 
gifts. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Rittenger 
and Lucille Visser attended the 
Easter Church services- in 
Greenville and had dinner with 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Rittenger 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Wie-
land and Bill and Iris Walker 
ate Sunday dinner with Mr. & 
Mrs. Walter Wieland and Earl. 

Jean Strand spent her Easter 
vacation with her father and 
sister, Eric and Judy Strand. 

South Lowell Circle meets on 
Thursday evening, April 21, at 
the home of Louise McDiarmld. 

Mrs. Bertha Rittenger was 
in Grand Rapids on Friday with 
her sister, Mrs. Lucille visser. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Ritten-
ger entertained their family for 
Easter, Mr. and Mrs. Stewart 
Thomet and family and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bruce Rittenger. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Shade and 
family spent Easter with his 

rents, Mr. and Mrs. Marion 
lhade. 

Easter dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. David Sterzlck were 
Mr. and Mrs. Dave Heaorlck, 
Mr, and Mrs. Dick Carton and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Roth and sons. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Gllll-
land of Kalamazoo and Mr. 
and Mrs. Harry Carlson were 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Wells. 

Sol! testing 
clinics set-up 
for farmers 

The Cooperative Extension 
Service of Michigan State Uni-
versity has set up six testing 
clinic locations for Kent Coun-
ty farmers to test their soli 
for Its lime requirement. There 
is no charge lor this service, 
and recommendations will be 
made. 

However, If farmers wish to 
have their soli tested for phos-
phorus and potassium, which is 
very Important, samples will be 
taken and sent to either the 
Allendale Laboratory or the 
Michigan State University Soli 
Labs. 

The fee is 75 cents at the 
Allendale Laboratory and |2 
at the Michigan State Univer-
sity Soils Lab. The MSU Soils 
Lab will give you a better 
picture of what your soli needs. 

To avoid errors, each sample 
of soli you bring in should con-
tain a minimum of 20 soli bor-
ings from the area you are 
testing. This Is extiemely im-
portant if you want a true 
picture of your soil needs. Take 
your samples now and let them 
air dry so that the testing 
clinic will have dry samples to 
work with. 

For those farmers who wish 
to sign up for lime payment 
through the Kent ASCS Office, 
a county committeeman from 
the Kent ASCS office will be at 
the clinic to sign you up at 
this time. 

Testing clinics will he set up 
at the Grattan Fire Barn, on 
Tuesday, April If, 8:30 to 11:30 
a. m.; Alto Fire Bam, Thurs-
day, April 21, 1:30-4:30 p. m.; 
Sparta Fire Bam, April 19; Al-
pine Town Hall, April 10; Har-
vard Library, April 20; and 
CuUervilie Fire Bam, April 21. 

Remember the following, if 
you plan to have your soli 
tested: I i ng air-dried sam-
ples; a minimum of 20 soil 
borings per sample to be test-
ed; and you can sign up with 
ASCS county committeeman for 
lime payments. 

County's faims 
now total 2,422 

A total of 2,422 farms was 
counted In Kent County during 
the 1964 Census of Agriculture, 
the U. S. Departriient of Com-
merce's Bureau uf the Census 

Trts. 
the last previous Census 

of Agriculture (1959), the total 
counted in the county was 
farms. 

The 1964 total Is published la 
a preliminary report on the 
county just Issued. The report 
alo shows that average farm 
siae In the county waa 113» 
acres and that the average val-
ue of the county's farms (land 
and buildings) in 1964 was 
$30,979. 

Other Important county sta-
tistics in the report are: 

1. Value of all farm products 
sold by farms In the county In 
19U. 120,582,511; in 1959. |16,-
250,197. 

2. Value of all crops sold by 
county farms In ll>64, 111,081,-
717; In 1959, $8,244,e70. 

3. Value of all livestock and 
livestock products sold by coun-
ty farms In 1964, $9,488,169; in 
1959, $8,006,127. 

Information obtained for the 
first time in an agricultural 
census Included the amount of 
income received by the coun-
ty's farmers, $12,62*, from rec-
reational services as well as 
data on the use of pest control 
chemicals in the county in 
1964. 

AnHqtie show tmd sole 
set for April 24-26 

The annual Antique Show and 
Sale held each spring at Tem-
ple Emanuel in Grand Rapids 
opens this year on Sunday, 
April 26. 

The exhibits will be open on 
both Sunday and Monday from 
noon until 10 p. m . . . . and 
again on Tuesday from noon to 
6 p. m. 

The exhibit is sponsored by 
the Sisterhood organization of 
Temple Emanuel, located at 
1715 East Fulton In Grand Ra 
ids, a short drive off the 1 
expressway. 

Scrupulous: Picture straight-
ener on the wall of life. 

Kent League Conservation 
Ciub leads in outdoor program 

Ledger Wtnti Ads bring re-
wlta. 

Reputed to be one or the 
staunchest conserve tlon clubs 
in Michigan, the Kent League 
located on Conservation Road 
just north of Ada between Hon-
ey Creek Road and Bailey 
Drive has just finished its win-
ter league skeet and trap tour-
nament. Spring and summer 
activities are about to begin. 

For those who desire, there 
is an archery course winding 
through the woods, a rifle 
range, - and a pistol range. 
There are picnic grounds and 
hiking trails. In fact, there Is 
something for everybody In an 
outdoor-minded family. Photo-
graphers can find a wealth of 
material by watching the mem-
bers themselves or by snapping 
shots of wildlife. 

The members are proud of 
their organization and the ros-
ter represents many walks of 
life all with a common love of 
the out-of-doors. Many mem-
bers just like to take advant 
of the club to relax and 
with others. 

Mr. Wflham N. De Young, 
the league secretary-manager 
said recently, "If you want to 
observe wildlife, you must come 
to a quiet, remote place like 
this property. Then yon can sit 
at the edge of the waterfowl 
pond and wait until the birds 
and animals have settled down 
to their natural routines. Or you 
can stalk slowly through the 
woods, but with your hands be-
hind you, making no sudden 
movements to cause alarm." 

Fishing Is reserved tor chil-
dren under knteen and the 
trout pond Is restricted to the 
youngsters under twelve. Adults 
are not to help the children in 
any way. The bovs and girls 
are on their own. mey win eith-
er be lucky and land one or 
have the experience of losing 
that "whopper." ' 

The winter league of skeet 
and trap which ran from the 
first week In Janoary to the 
first week is April enrolled 245 
skeet shooters lc BS trap shoot-
ers and this is thought to be 
the largest ' winter shooting 
teague m the United States. 
Once a year there is a state 
competition, this year it will be 

to H d t ~ 

The only other club in Michi-
gan with equal facilities has 
yearly dues four times as great 
plus a first year fee of $45. 
Kent League offers so much 
and yet charges only a sur-
prisingly low $5 a year. In-
cluded with the membership fee 
Is the monthly bulletin publish-
ed by the club for its members 
and the siate newspaper pub-
lished by the Michigan United 
Conservation Clubs of which 
Kent League Is also a member. 

Members may participate m 
the twelve monthly meetings of 
the year In Plaid Shirt Niglit, 
and In the spring Boat and Out-
door Show held at the Civic Au-
ditorium. 

Leading sport shops in Grand 
Rapids act as official stations 
for accepting memberships or 
It is possible to go to the club-
house on Wednesday afternoons 
or evenings or on Saturdays or 
Sundays to discuss membership. 
Any questions will gladly be 
answered by Mr. De Young. 

Poor health forces four out of 
ten men to retire, a survey re-
veals. 

RANK ON US TO 
MEET EVERY 

BANKING NEEP 

CHECKING ACCOUNTS 

4 * INTEREST 
ANNUAL RATE PAID ON 

SAVINGS ACCOUNTS 

Fanners State 
Bank of Alto 
ALTO-C LARKS V I L L E 

MICHIGAN 

OFFICE HOURS— 
I to 12 and 1 to S:SI 

Week Days 

Alto—Thin. I to Nasi 
Clarksville—Wed. I to NMI 

- P H O N E -
Alto: 868-2421 

Clarksville—I9J-3231 

" T H E BANK T H A T BACKS 
THE FARMER" 

at n-UMfe Club. 
The Kent League Club, which 

was formed over 35 years ago, 
has an active program In con-
servation. Schools have used 
the property in conjunction with 
the u. S. Soil Service. The Soil 
Scrvlce sends oat personnel for 
half i ' day of schooling in the 
dub house followed by half a 
day in "tne fleid." this ex-
pression really covers the 180 
a c r e s of wildlife .sanctuary 
through which .Honey Creek 
flows and there are both natur-
al and planted forests. Many 
school studanfc have been 
shown the delights of the sanc-
tuary by their teachers and by 
personnel from the Soil Service 
or from the club Itself. Biology 
students from Junior College, 
Rockiord Hirii, and Godwin 
High School nave been sent to 
study conservation as pert of 
their education; 

The clubhouse Is functional, 
not elaborate, but suited to the 
needs of the piembers. This 
keeps It from being a "white 
elephant" which is certainly 
what a non-profit organization 
can do without. 

SOOJ> 

is-

TROUT SEASON 
OPENS 

APRIL 30 
WADERS — CREELS — FLY RODS 

RSHING JACKETS — NETS — REELS 

SALMON EGGS 

LIVE BAIT WIGGLERS MINNOWS 
CRAWLERS WORMS 

Colemfin Fuel — Sucker Spears 

Gllmore's Sport Shop 
I i a h AND U V | IAIT 

PHONK: O f t M B l FULTON BO., ADA 

Get a 1st class buy 
on a new Buick Special! 

( T t i « g e t t i n g W M M W g r e a t e r ! ) 

Immedmte dtHvery 
from § wide choice 
of body ityles. 
colors and BpOonal 

op a«*-Ai 
yovr carl 

Specie! Spring dealtl 

Ada's beauty 
pageant to be 
y d May 28 

The date of the Thomapple 
Valley Pageant, sponsored by 
the Ada Community Associa-
tion, has been changed to Sat-
urday, May 21, Instead of May 
2. as previously reported. The 
Pageant will be held at 8 p. m. 
at Forest Hills High School. 

The deadline for entry appli-
cations is still April 20th. All 
applications should be mailed 
with a self-addressed, stamped 
envelope and the $2.00 entry 
fee to Thomapple Valley Pag-
eant, In care of Mrs. R. E. 
Van Sluyters, Pageant Direc-
tor, 7100 Driftwood Drive, SE, 
Grand Bapids, Michigan. M M . 

with the winner of its class. 
PURE OIL PERFORMANCE TRIALS- -

with tho winner of the 
POPULAR SCIENCE GOLD CUP . •• - , 
for outstanding braking performance In the Trial^ 

get yourcelf 0 winning buy on the car that's all Buick-'66 
Buick Special-from the dealer who's all deal-your BuicK cjealerl 

Wouldn't you really rather have a Buick Special 
right now? (Better now than evert) 

,SM your Buicil duiir duiiA* kb Par-Busting Sale, 

Azzorello Chevrolet & Buick, Inc. 
1250 W. Main St. Lowell Pmmm:TW 7-9294 

• • • • 

Watch Ledger Want Ads for 
'top erade' buys every week. 

LEWIS ELECTRIC 
HOTPOINT-MAYTAG 

SALES AND BCRV1CB 

Service on All Makes 
Washers, Dryers 

Refrigtraton 
ELECTRICAL WIBINQ AND 

CONTKACTI.NO 

Phone TW 7-7746 
Factory Trained Servicemen 
"We Sell the Best and Service 

the Rest" 

Lowell Area School 
board proceedings 

Bothered 
by unpaid bills? 

borrow from us 

Xne loan repays all 
ose bills. Budget 

payments repay us! 
Come in and get a 
loan fast, here. 

$25—TO—$1,000 

Belding Finance 
CO.. LOWELL, MICH. 

m W. Mala Ph. 8S7-W55 

Minutes of the regular meet-
ing of the Board of Education 
held March 14, INI. 

The meeting was called to 
order by President Wessell at 
7:30 p. m. with all members 
present. 

On motion by Kiel, supported 
by Coons, the minutes of the 
regular meeting, held February 
14, 1906, were approved after 
the following correction: 

The sixth paragraph should 
read "three new buses from 
Jackson Motors, two buses with 
Mlchellan tires on the front 
wheels and one bus without 
Mlchelln tires." 

On motion Dy Reagan sup-
ported by Shade, the bills were 
approved' for pxymcnt as list-
ed. 

Mike Doyle, who is the Lo-
well District Representative on 
the Vocational high school pro-
ject, made the following report 
to the Board. 

There was a year and a "half 
study by the County as to the 
needs and requirements of a 
County Vocational School, and 
all this Information and data 
was turned over to the present 
committee. 

The three questions answered 
by this survey were (1) More 
vocational education is needed 
in the county. (2) The facilities 
should be designed primarily 
for the 11th and 12th grade stu-
dents. (3) Necessary financing 
would be obtained through tax 
mlllage, funds from the Voca-
tional Education Act of 1963, 
and other similar Educational 
Acts. 

The following sub-committee 
members were named: 

(1) Finance. Harold Jefferies 
(2) Curriculum, Gerald DeFor 

est. 
(3) Facilities, John Troy 
Don Kelly. Dick Bezlle and 

Miss Barbara Transue presen-
ted the master contract and sal-
ary schedule to the Board for 
their approval. The contract des-
cribes. in detail the teachers' 
and school administrators' ob-

ligations. duties and policies 
that have been in effect here 
for many years. Many ques-
tions were asked and several 
recommendations were made In 
the master contract before It 
Is presented to the faculty. The 
salary schedule will be adjus-
ted a certain percentage at each 
step, depending on the amount 
of State Aid received. The esti-
mated cost of the salary in-
creases will amount to |85,000. 

On motion by Kiel supported 
by Gerard. Supt. Nisbet was 
iiven authorization to purchase 
nguage laboratory equipment 

in the amount of $2,940.55; This 
will complete this phase of the 
high school Language Labora-
tory Department. 

A special meeting was set for 
Monday, March 21, 1966, at 7 
p. m. 

The meeting was adjourned 

Respectfully submitted, 
R. E. REAGAN. D. D. S. 

Look! 
W i t t e n b a c h S a l e s & S e r v i c e C o . 

a i t T I D W K a i M t i n o r 

Ovenfautd 
Camper Coadies 

Quality Built 

Comfort Designed 

Four new Camper Coaches by Overland. Modern, 

beautifully designed with many "extra" features as 
standard equipment These coaches should be looked at 
carefully for comfort, construction, furnishings and con-
venience They have, for example, white vinyl ceilings, 

home type kilcnen cabinets, a wide choice of appliance 
colors, smart interiors and are some of the best of their 

type manufactured today. See them soon at — 

W I T T E N B A C H 
SALES & SERVICE COMPANY 
749 W. Main St., LoweU Phone 897-9227 

Special session 
Minutes of the Special meet-

ing of the Board of Education 
held March 21, 1966. 

The meeting was called to 
order by President Wessell at 
7:35 p. m. with all members 
present. 

General discussion was held 
concerning administrative prac-
tices covering some of the fol-
lowing Items: 

1. Purchase of equipment. 
2. Delegation of authority. 
3. Preparation of the agenda, 

financial reports, newsletters, 
etc. 

4. Recruitment of new teach-
ers. 

The meeting was adjourned 
at 8:30 p. m. 

Respectfully submitted, 
R. E. REAGAN, D. D. S. 

Minutes of the Special Meet-
ing of the Board of Education 
held April 4, 1966. 

The meeting was called to 
order by President Wessell at 
7:45 p. m. with all members 
present. Also present were Rev. 
Charles Davis, Carl Hagen, & 
Dirk Venema. 

Rev. Charles Davis Informed 
the Board of his concern over 
certain problems that he feels 
are developing on the Lowell 
School System. He suggested 
that the Administrative person-
nel seems overloaded with work 
and that additional help should 
be hired. He suggested tHat"a 
Business Manager and Curricu-
lum Coordinator could alleviate 
much of Supt. Nlsbet's work 
load and that an assistant prin-
cipal could do the same for 
Carl Hagen. 

He suggested that Vem Morse 
have a full-time Secretary and 
that a half day principal at Al-
to could help Dirk Venema. 

Rev. Davis also suggested 
that Supt. Nisbet should have 
more adequate office facilities. 
He realized all these additions 
would require increased opera-
ting millage. The Board expres-
sed their appreciation to Rev. 
Davis for his concern and his 
constructive suggestions and al-
so informed us that all of these 
recommendations have been dis-
cussed at various times during 
the past several years. 

Carl Hagen recommended to 
the Board that due to the in-
creased enrollment in the high 
school and the trend towards 
five classes per day, these fol-
lowing changes be considered 
for next fall. Freshman, sopho-
more, and Junior High students 
should be required to take five 
courses each semester, which 
in turn, would neecessitate that 
each student have twenty cred-

its to graduate. Band and Chor-
us would receive credit with 
the regular courses, and fresh-
man and sophomores, out for 
sports, would not be required 
to take Physical Education. 
Several a d d i t i o n a l courses 
would be made available for 
the students to choose from. At 
the present time, there are 55 
electives. Carl Hagen also stat-
ed that due lo the Increased 
enrollment. It will be neces-
sary to have either half-day 
sessions or alternate day at-
tendance for the first month or 
two when school resumes in 
September until the additional 
rooms are available. 

The Secretary read a letter 
from Miss Marion Bushnell con-
cerning her retirement after 43 
years of teaching In the Lowell 
System. All the Board mem-
bers expressed their deep ap-
preciation for her long and out-
standing service to the Lowell 
School System. She estimated 
that she had taught nearly 1700 
students during her teaching 
career here. 

On motion by Reagan, sup-
ported by Shade, the Master 
Contract was given final ap-
proval. 

On motion by Kiel, supported 
by Gerard, the salary schedule 
for ihe teachers was approved 
with the provision that there 
will be a percentage reduction 
at each step, depending on the 
amount of State Aid received. 
This salary schedule calls for 
$96,421.00 more than this year. 

The Board also recommended 
a detailed study of the per-
centage salary of the Athletic 
and non-Athletic Activities, be 
undertaken, before t h e next 
salary schedule is adopted and 
that a maximum amount should 
be set for the A B Degree 
teacher. 

The meeting was adjourned 
at 11:30 p. m. 

Respectfully submitted, 
R. E. Reagan, D.D.S. 

Meekhof 
Lumber & Supply Co. 

SPECIAL! 

DOUBLE Jv/. Green Stamps 
on all 

PAINT—Interior, Exterior 
LADDERS 
BRUSHES 
ROLLERS 

ROLLER TRAYS 
THINNER 
DROP CLOTHS 
SAND PAPER 

THE BIG "M" LUMBER AND SUPPLY COMPANY 
6045 28*h 'A Mile West of C«cacie—Phone 949-2140 

Logan news 
Mrs. Spenor Johnson 

The last, 
firm 'No! 
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Mrs. Genevieve Layer and 
Mrs. Fredia Russell were call-
ers on Mrs. William Porritt 
last week. 

Mr. tc Mrs. Edward Schrock 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Er-
nest Oesch and daughter, and 
Lenard and Carolyn Blough 
were callers at the Kenneth 
Blough home Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Wie-
land and family were Easter 
dinner guests with Mr. & Mrs. 
Harold Krebs and family at 
Easjjniont. 

Mr. and Mrs. Spenor Johnson 
were Easier dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Johnson 
in Grand Rapids. In the eve-
ning, they attended the Canta-
ta, "Amazing Love" at the 
Calvary Baptist Church. 

Rev. Peter Gardner of Grand 
Rapids preached at the Cal-
vary Brethren Church Sunday. 
Rev. Flowers was ill with the 
flu. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Seese of 
Freeport called at the Dan 
Kauffman home Thursday eve-
ning. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Stahl 
and Truman entertained for 
Easter dinner Mr. and Mrs. 
Dean Geiger and children of 
Clarksville, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Amith Stahl and children. 

Saturday evening callers of 
Mr. and Mrs. Lester Thompson 
were Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Timm and son of Hastings. 

Wanda Overbold spent Friday 
night and Saturday forenoon 
with Marva Anderson at Alto. 

Donald and Ronald Ehlert 
spent the past week with their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Spenor Johnson, returning to 
their home Saturday morning. 

Dennis Blough, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Blough, goes 
to Detroit Tuesday for his Army 
physical. 

Ruth Kauffman was taken 
back to Butterworth Hospital 
Wednesday afternoon, to have 
plastic surgery on her leg. 

Ann Wieland of Hastings is 
spending the week at the Gor-
don Stahl home. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Grinnell 
and children of Hastings spent 
Saturday evening at the William 
Wieland home. 

Mr. and Mrs. George John-
son spent Easter with her sis-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Williams 
and family at Stanton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ovid Miller and 
Lyle called on Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Miller Sunday after-
noon. 

Easter Sunday callers al the 
Lester Thompson home were 
Mr. and Mrs. Burdette Timm, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Timm of 
Hastings and Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Thompson and granddaughter, 
Lori. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Beaver 
and family of Lake Odessa 
spent Thursday evening with 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Price 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Over-
boil and Wanda entertained for 
Easter dinner Mr. and Mrs. Al-
lan Overboil & girls of Clarks-
ville and Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Kauffman and children. Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Falconcr and 
children were evening callers. 

Mrs. Cletus Wieland was an 
Easier dinner guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Stahl and Donald. 

Mr. and Mrs. Spenor Johnson 
called on Donna Ehlert in 
Grand Rapids Monday after-
noon. She had just returned 
home from the hospital 

(This Is a reprint of an ed-
itorial, which recently appear-
ed in the Clinton County 
News, St. Johns. Michigan, 
and we are publLshlng It for 
thought and consideration by 
the residents of Lowell) 

Where do you draw the last 
line, say no and mean "NO?" 

The King City, Califomia, 
Rustler commented on this 
question a while back when 
high school students at a Cal-
ifornia school began talking a-
bout a "sit in" at the high 
school in response to action by 
faculty and members regarding 
students' dress and hair styles. 

Recently several boys who 
had adopted the current long 
hair fad began by the Beatles 
and embraced by the beatniks, 
were told to leave school and 
jet their hair cut. Most of them 

so on Iheh own accord. 

Subsequently parents congrat-
ulated the administration for 
the act, saying they had tried 
for months to make the boys 
get haircuts. 

Herein lies the question Why 
should the school, which is pri-
marily an institution geared to 
learning, be forced to assume 
the role of the parent in so 
personal a matter as a haircut? 

In point of fact, all high 
schools throughout the country 
maintain a standard of decent, 
suitable dress and behavior 
which must be met by the stu-
dent. Occasionally a student is 
sent home to change clothing 
to meet this standard and the 
event always receives publicity. 

Again the school must as-
sume ihe parents' role. 

The school Is placed in the 
iition of saying—and mean-

the last firm NO. 
le law states that minors 

cannot buy cigarettes, yet busi-
nessmen sell them and parents 
buy them for youths—and the 
school must say NO. The law 
says teenagers may not drink, 
yet businessmen sell liquor to 
them and parents allow thein 
to have it—and the school at 
Its social functions must say 
NO. 

Youngsters complain that 
there isn't enough for them to 

do—so the schools sponsor a 
myriad of social events, dances, 
clubs, field trips, etc.. In ad-
dition to providing some facili-
ties for teaching them. If the 
students receive poor grades, 
the parents blame the school, 
and then another NO must be 
said. 

The students' moral attitudes 
and behavior must be strength-
ened and protected by the 
school—again In the position of 
saying NO. 

Some teenagers who have 
been encouraged lo think for 
themselves and apply the 
knowledge they have are sin-
cerely concerned about tho 
state of the world in which 
they live and act out of convic-
tion. There are others more 
easily led who have been im-
pressed by the publicity re-
ceived by those involved in 
civil disobedience, beatnik be-
havior and irresponsibility un-
der the guise of "freedom." 

If the school is to perform 
its major function in this or 
any other community, it must 
be allowed lo use its facilities, 
its faculty and its time for edu-
cating our youth to take their 
places in society—prepared and 
confident that their efforts have 
a chance to succeed This can-
not happen if constant personal 
surveillance of each student is 
required of the school. 

It is time for mother and 
father to say and mean—The 
Last Firm 

Alwavs turn the light on when 
you take drugs from the cabi-
net. Never laKe or give medi-
cine in the dark. 

The American housewife to-
day has a choice of 8,000 food 
items. And in 10 years she will 
be able to chose from 12,000 

HARVIST HIALTH. INC: 
If44 Eolarn A** . S. E 
Grtrd Ktpldt Michiqtn 

SPECIAL OlFT FOODS 
•Suq«r FT«»—Salt Fr«« 

•AlUrqy D!«»s 
•Low Ckoltsfarol 

Notmrol-Ortjonic HvatHi Foods 

>ay 
NO! 

Two cor crash Sunday 
on Ada bridge is minor 

A two-car accident occurred 
Sunday evening, April 10. about 
10:30 p. m. at the intersection 
of Pettis Avenue and East Ful-
ton, on the Ada bridge. 

Drivers of the cars, Lillian 
Londack of 44 Eastern, SE. and 
Dennis Holtzander of 4747 West 
River Road, Comstock Park, 
sustained only minor injuries, 
sheriff's deputies reported. 

U. S. Presidents who have 
served during the 20th century 
have averaged 11 yrs. less than 
their normal life expectancy 
when they took office. 

SPECIAL CLOSE-OUT 
PRICESI 

FOUR ROOT-LOWELL 

POWER 
SPRAYERS 
THESE ARE ALL UNUSED DISPLAY SPRAYERS 

IN FIRST CLASS CONDITION. 

Offer will not be repeated—First come, 
first served. 

Item I: One MODEL W1IE SPRAVCAT - Wheel 
mounted, ten gallon tank, VA h. p. electric 
motor. $84.0# ea. 

Item 2: Two MODEL «l5a SPRAVCAT - Wheel 
mounted, 50-gallon tank, I V i h. p. gas engine, 
Including 4:90x12 tires, 23-foot hose and fully 
adjustable gun $187.00 ea. 

Hem 3: One MODEL WM SPRAVCAT - Portable 
pump, mounted on earning frame, l"j h. p. 
gas engine. 1118-73 ea. 

Full product warranty 
on all units 

ALL SALES FINAL—CASH ON DELIVERY 

FOR INSPECTION, CALL AT 

R00T-L0WELL C0RP0RA110N 
BUSINESS OFFICE—8:30 A.M.-4:00 P.M. 

Lowell, Michigan 
cM-1 

Live it up 
'66 i 
Ford W 

3 1 

•m I e » . 

• f r y * • 

W f.~*i 

- . r x " w W*l~M 

Seethe 
Lively Ones, 
...your 

mm t r t r - r — F0P(! DBEll0rS 
Big Fords have p'enty going for theml There's that famous quief ride. Handsome, luxurious inferiors. 
Wide choice of performance engine options. l it»le things liko the convenience of a hey that works 
either side up. B:g things like the convenience of a 2-way wagon Ooorgate that opens like a door 
for people, like a tailgate for loading cargo. Nineteen m o d e l s - a n d the way they're 
priced, you couldn't pick a better time to buy than now. Come on downl 

SAVE now at your Ford Dealers Millionth Mustang Sale! 

Keith Buck Ford Sales 
508 West Main Street — Lowell, Michigan 



• SELL* RENT • SWAP • HI RE • BUY • SELL* RENT •. SWAP f HI RE*BL)Y. • -SELL' RENT • SWAP' MI RE •' 

m m CUSSIFIED us mmm 
•HIRE • BUY • SELL' RENT • SWAP ' HIRE ' BUY* SELL'RENT' SWAP ' HIRE' BUY • SELL* RENT* 

FOR SALE 

FOR SALE - Purr bred York 
boar. MS4S44. cl 

FOR SALE - 1956 Harley-Da-
vidson 74. also a buzz saw. 
Call TW 7-9785. pi 

PPTVATE GARAGE SALE -
Thursday. Friday and Satur-
day. 9 ii] 5. Natural gas in-
cinerator, electrical aDDlianc-
es. baby furniture, clothing, 
dishes, etc. 803 W. Main St.. 
Lowell. cl 

FOR SALE — Drosses. Petite 
si/e 5. Call 897 79.11 cl 

STIHL CHAIN SAWS - With 
17 and 22 inch bars, automa-
tic oiling. Available at K&W 
Small Motors. 23B1 West Main 
Street, Lowell. Phone 897-9537. 

c-52-3 

ANGUS-STEER CAL\T,S—Fan-
cy Duality. Reasonably pric-
ed. Idnal for summer graz-
ing. Holiday Farms. 6185 
Grand River Drive. NE. Ada. 
Call 676-1097 or 676-1791. cl 

FOR SALE - 9x12 rues. 819 95: 
12*12. $35; 12x15. S43; 12x18. 
?49 Write or call Johnson 
Tarpet Co., 4034 Chicaco Dr., 
Grandville, Michigan. Call 534-
8039. c41tf 

FOR SALE — Electric Fencer, 
steel posts, and wire. All like 
new. Also Jamesway 10-hole 
metal nests and feeders and 
automatic water fountains. Al-
so 25 chicken crates 3532— 

_28th Street. SR.'949 3739. cl 

OITBOARD MOTOR - 18 hp. 
Johnson, electric start, used 
verv little. $225. Also 12 ft. 
Wapemaker boat. $50. Call 
676-4871. after 5 p. m. cl-2 

DEPENDABLE 
Trade-in Post" 

SPECIALS! 

w 

196 PIVMOLTR S ATFI.I.TTE 
1965 FORD GALAXIE 5M 
1965 VOLKSWAGEN 2 DR. 
1965 DODGE AIM SPORTSMAN 
1964 DODGE Ml 4-DR. 
1963 DODGE 889 4 DR. 
1963 PONT. CATALTNA 4-DR. 
1965 DODGE 441 4-DR. 
1963 FORD CONVERTIBLE 
1963 DODGE 338 2 DR. 
1963 DODGE DART 4-DR. 
1963 FORD GALAXTE 4-DR. 
19« PONTIAC WAGON 
1963 OÎ DS 4-DR. HARDTOP 
1962 DODGE GT H ARDTOP 
1962 DODGE LANCER 4-DR. 
1962 DODGE LANCER 2-DR. 
1962 FORD RANCH WAGON 
1961 DODGE POLARA 4-DR. 
1961 DODGE PHOENIX HT 
1961 DODGE SENECA 4-DR. 
1961 VOLKSWAGEN 2-DR. 
19M FORD CUSTOM 4 DR. 

Also Several 

TRANSPORTATION 
BARGAINS 

f o r as l o w as $ 1 0 d o w n 

Buy 
with Confidence 

From Your 

DODGE 
"QUAUTY" DEALER 

(One of 11 Seven-Time Winners 
In the U. S. A.) 

JACKSON 
MOTOR SALES 

"The Home of Dependable 
Used Cars" 

939 W. Main. Lowell TW 7-9281 

TNG pot 
Four miles east of Saranac 
comers on M-21, north side of 
the road. cltf 

1959 FORD GALAXTE - Con-
vertible for sale. Swap Allis 
Chalmers 60 All-crop combine 
with motor for baler of equal 
value. Phone 698-8910. cl 

LANDSCAPING - Fill dirt, 
black dirt, gravel, sand, clay. 
Bulldozer and crane service. 
Call EM 3-1014 or 676 3621. 

P M 

TANK FULL?—CALL FULLER 
Septic Tank Cleaning. Licen-
sed and bonded. Day or night 
emergency service. Member 
of Ada Businessmen's Associ-
ation. Phone 676-5986. c22tf 

RENT A POWER RAKE-and 
lawn sweeper. Clean the dead 
grass, leaves and weeds from 
your lawn the easy way. Call 
897-9537. K&W Small Motors, 
2361 West Main St., Lowell. 

c524 

IT CAN HAPPEN TO YOU -
Accidents occur every day. 
Protect yourself and your au-
tomobile with our insurance 
—any type or amount you 
desire. Peter Speerstra Agen-
cy, TW 7-9259. cl 

DONT DISCARD - m a t steam 
iron when you drop it or It 
fails to work; it can be fix-
ed r.t reasonable cost. For 
service on all small applian-
ces and power tools, call TW 
7-7397. Charles Houseman, 
1049 North Washington Street 
LoweU. c45tf 

GARAGE SALE - Oriental 
dining room furniture, gol 
sectional, lamps, chairs, tab-
les, lawn mowers, misc. 147 
El Centro, near Robinson Rd.. 
and Cascade Rd.. East Grand 
Rapids. Mich. Wednesday k 
Thursday, 10 a. m. til 5 p. m. 

c l 

FOR SALE - 1960. 10 x 50 ft. 
housetrailer. Good condition, 
$2.700. Phone 676-1011. c l 

FOR SALE - Electric refrig-
erator. $25. Call 949-2127. cl 

CHEVROLET. 1954 - 6 stick, 
extra snow tires, new exhaust, 
$75. Call 452-9911. 5343 Brook-

i ..Wood Drive, SE. cl 

Special Sale! 

LAUAN 
LIGHT OR DARK—4x7 Sheet 

$3.20 

DOORS 
MOLDINGS 

FURRING STRIPS 

PLYWOOD MARKET, 
Inc. 

3128—28th Street 
Half mile East of Breton Road 

Ph. 245-2151 

See Us for 
for 

RENTAL 
EQUIPMENT 
—MERRY TILLER 

—LAWN 
RENOVATOR 

—POWER 
SPRAYER 

—SPREADER 

—LAWN 
ROLLER 

ADA HARDWARE 
577 Ada Drive 
Ada, Michigan 

OR 64811 
c l 

8 BLENDS OF GAS 

There's one to f i t your 
car—Stop in today! 

Lubricating—Oil ChcRges—Tires—Batteries 

Jim's Sunoco Service 
Jim Vincent, Prop.—M-21, Ada—Ph. 676-9118 

WALNUT — Drop-head type-
writer desk, single pedestal 
34" x 45", $35. 5980 Gavin 
Lake Avenue, corner Seven 
Mile Road. CaU 691-8472. c l 4 

SMALL SIZE — Ben Hur-type 
deep freeze, 28 x 32, $75. Gav-
in Lake Avenue, corner of 7 
Mile Road. CaU 691-8472. cl-S 

MODERN ELECTRIC - SI 
er Sewing Machine with cal 
inet and extras for buttonhol-
ing and zig-zag designs. Guar-
anteed. 7 payments of $6.88. 
See locaUy by writing Credit 
Manager. 1937 Cooper, Jack-
son, Michigan. pl-2 

FIBER-GLASS RESIN - Life 
time coating for your boat, 
$5.95 per gaUon. WUHam's 
Radio and TV. 126 North Hud-
son, LoweU. Phone TW 7-9346. 

c48tf 

FOR LIVESTOCK TRUCKING 
to the Lake Odessa Livestock 
Auction, caU George Fraocto-
co, TW 7-7818, LoweU, or 
Al Helms, 637-2311, Palo. c2tf 

WALTER'S — Lumber Mart. 
Open daily Including Saturday 
until I p. m., Friday night t f l 
• p .m . Everything tor the 
home! 925 West Main Street, 
liOweU. Phone 897-9291. c22tf 

GALLAGHER 
STUMP REMOVAL 

INSURED WORK 

Ph. 374.5861 

Harwood Rd., l a k e Odessa 

C50-10 

FOR SALE — Rotary lawn mo-
wer, Altas-Air, Briggs & Strat-
ton motor, $25; Dormeyer elec-
tric deep fryer, $5; Westing-
house sandwich grill. $S; a 
Toastmaster waffle griU, $3; 
antique oval gramed Gobi 
prints, $20 each or 2 for $35; 
antique picture frames. 949-
1826. cl 

TRUSSES — Trained fitter, sur-
gical appliances, etc., Koss 
RexaU Drags, Saranac, Mich-
igan. cS9tf 

REDUCE SAFE — Simple and 
fast with GoBese tablets. A 
week's supply only K cents. 
Ada RexaU Drags, Ada. p49-2 

FOR SALE — The fines* selec-
tion of carpets for the lowest 
possible price, stop and see 
us, terms available. Johnson 
Carpet Co., 4034 Chicago Dr., 
" - — • lean, 554-8039. Grandville, Michigan, 

c41tf 

CORN — For sale. Phone 897-
9979. Cl 

SHETLAND PONY - Mare. 2 
years old. Chocolate Dapple. 
Light mane and taU. Reason-
able. 868-2300. c l 

NEW GARMENTS - Made, al-
terations, and repair work in 
my home. Ruth Smltter, TW 
7-9853. c l 

8-ROOM OUTFIT 

DINETTE— 
Formica top, and upholstered 
chairs. 

BEDROOM SUTTB-
(Wrawer double dresser, mir-
ror. 4-drawer chest, bookcase 
bed, innerspring mattress, and 
matching box spring. 

LIVING ROOM SUTTE-
Nylon upholstered sofa and 
chair, two walnut end tables, 
and coffee table. Two match-
ing lamps. 

All 8 rooms $279 or $10 month 

SCRIPP'S FINE FURNITURE 

947 Wealthy, SE, Grand Rapids 
456-5381 

c39tf 

FACTORY SAUE 
Dont Pay for BeWtac or Mala 
Htehway high-overhead locations 
—and Salesmen, Deltvery, Ra-
dio-TV Selling Expeue . Bay 
Prestige, Name-Brand Quality 
Sleep Equipment, nil New nt 
Wbofesnk. 

$24.50 Seven Year Crib H I M 
$19 Durable Maple Beds | ISJ8 
$10.98 Crib Mattress 97J9 
$33 Rollaway Bed. comp. t !9J9 
$50 Bed. Spring, Mattress $39.88 
$65 Bunk Beds, complete $49.80 
$88 Bunk Beds, complete $63.80 
198 Trundle Beds. comp. $73.81 
$39 Inner Spring Mattress $17,88 
$109 Orthopedic QuUt-Top 

Mattress and Spring 955.11 
$30 Maple Chest |25 J l 
$12 50 DeLuxe Bed Frames $7J8 
$54 Sofa Couches $39J9 
$139 Hide-a-way Beds with 

Innerspring Mattress $199.91 
$98 Dual Daybed and 

Trundle, complete $79.89 

FACTORY SURPLUS BEDDING 
1416-19 Mndkun, SE GL 2-9918 
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LOWELL LEDGER 
SUBURBAN LIFE WANT AD PAGE 

CASH RATE: 15 words 50c. additional words Sc each. If not 
paid on or before 10 days after insertion, a charge of 10c 
for bookkeeping will be made. 

BOX NUMBER: If box number In care of this office Is de-
sired, add 50c to above. 

ALL ERRORS in telephone advertisements at sender's risk. 

RATES are based strictly on uniform want ad style. 
OUT-OF-TOWN advertisements must be accompanied by re-
mittance. 

Copy for ads on this page must be In 
Ledger office before 5 P. M. on Tuesdays 897-9261 

PAINTING — And paper hang-
ing. Ha PhlUips, 676-4656 

r l f c t 

FOR SALE - AU of P. A. G.'s 
products. Alfalfa seed, clorer, 
timothy, corns, $8 and up. 
AU In stock at farm. High 
quaUty seeds, with discount. 
WiU deliver. CUnton Blocher. 
Route 2, Alto, Michigan. CaU 
U N 8-2451. C52-3 

REMINGTON CHAIN SAWS -
Out cuts & out lasts them 
aU. Sales and Service. K&W 
Small Motors, 2361 West Main 
Street, LoweU. Phone 897-
9537. c-52-3 

PLATFORM ROCKER — Less 
than year old. Dark green, 
tufted back. Call 868-2300. c l 

SANITARY 
SEPTIC TANK SERVICE 

COLCHESTER DR. 
ADA, MICHIGAN 

Cleaning-Repairing 
Installation 

TRENCHING SERVICE 

Licensed—Bonded—Insured 

Ada Office: Wyoming Off.: 

949-2770 243-0266 
c29tf 

LIVE MUSIC — If you want 
the Shaggs with their swing-
ing live entertainment at rea-
sonabfc rates, write Scott Jef-

feries, Box 128. LoweU, Mich-
igan or phone 897-7589 after 
• p. m. p45tf 

FOR SALE — Oose-oot, flew 
store fixtures, below maim-
facturers' cost, see samples 
at Mffler-Newmark Distrinut-

Co., 3787 E. 28th S t Phone 
j W 

LOSE WEIGHT - Safely with 
Dex-A-Diet Tablets. Only «8c 
at Christiansen Drug, LoweU. 

p52-ll 

SMITTY'S 
BODY SHOP 

—CENTERUNE ROAD— 

Rust and Collision Repair 

WE SPECIALIZE IN 
TRACTOR AND TRUCK 

MOTOR REPAIR , 
AND WELDING 

No Job Too Big or Too Smafl 

- F R E E ESTIMATES— 

Phone: 897-7891 

FOR SALE — Plow, John Deere 
single bottom on rubber; Da-
vid Bradley broadcast fertUi-
zer spreader on rubber; al-
so small International Power 
Plant complete with clutch. 
OR 6-2019. pi 

FOR SALE — Ford tractor, re-
built engine, two bottom plow 
and drag. Call 676-1645. c l 

1961 PLYMOUTH - Four door, 
six with straight stick, $225. 

C a U 868-2400. p i 

READY MIX CONCRETE 

Radio Dispatched Concrete 
Trucks 

LoweU in Local Rate Zone 

r ^ O M P T DELIVERY 

Road Gravel—Bank Run Gravel 
Washed Sand and Gravel 

Mortar Sand—Two Grades 
Pea Gravel—FU1 Sand 

WILLIAMS BROTHERS 

PHONE: 642-9486 Saranac, 
or Ionia 527-4570 ' 

cSftf 

POOL HEATERS 

CAN ADVANCE 

SWIMMING SEASdKl 

SEVERAL WEEKS 

Shimming pool owners who 
are waiting impatiently for 
the start of the swimming 
season can take action to 
bring the happy day nearer. 
The OIL INSTITUTE re-
ports that more and more 
pools are being equipped 
with automatic, oil-powered 
swimming pool heaters. 

Completely self contained 
pool heaters are now avail-
able through oU heat deal-
ers. Units are pre-packaged, 
easy to install and ready to 
start operating to bring wa-
ter temperature to a com-
fortable level, regardless of 
outside temperatures. The 
equipment, which consumes 
only a modest amount of 
heating oil, can serve pools 
from 10.000 gaUon to 200,000 
gaUon size. 

The OIL INSTITUTE points 
out that when water temp-
erature is maintained in the 
high 70,s or low 80's, swim-
ming becomes thoroughly 
enjoyable on many days as 
early as April and as late 
as November. 

Zephyr 
V\ 

ADA OIL CO. 
ADA, MICHIGAN 

676-9171 
S&H GREEN STAMPS 

HAY CONDITIONERS - Used. 
John Deere. OUver, Cumming-
ham. New Holland and Ford. 
Plows, used, John Deere, $45; 
two OUvers, radex bottom on 
rubber, many more. We need 
used tractors of aU kinds. 
Caledonia Tractor and Equip-
ment, Caledonia, Michigan, 
TW 1-8141. cl 

DeKALB SEED CORN - And 
Sudax. For the farmer who 
wants more in corn and for-
age—see or call me today, 
whUe supply is best. More 
farmers plant DeKalb than 
any other brand. Gerald Ky-
ser, Route S, LoweU. Phone 
897-7477. cl-2 

FOR SALE — Garden tractor. 
Wards, two attachments and 
trafler, $150. Reo, pwoer lawn 
mower, Firestone, $50. Phone 
897-9057, 9353 28th St , Ada. 

cl-2 

FOR RENT 

FOR RENT — ClarksviUe, near, 
farm house, 3 bedroom, gar-
den, $40 month. Ed Tanls. 
Telephone MO 9-9226. c51-l 

FOR RENT - In LoweU. 3 
bedroom ranch. Rent or lease 
to buy. Close to school and 
stores. CH 5-1365. cl-3 

FOR RENT — Two bedroom 
house in the country. Coal 
and wood furnace, 9194 Sayles 
Road. Phone TW 7-7653. cl 

FOR RENT — Two room fur-
nished apartment on ground 
floor. Newly decorated. CaU 
TW 7-9383. cl 

GOOD THINGS TO EAT 

FRESH EGGS — Spring Brook 
eggs are of the highest qual-
ity and freshness at aU times. 
Serve them at every break-
f a s t Spring Brook Farm. 5298 
Burton Street, SE. No Sun-
day sales. cSOtf 

WANTED 

HELP WANTED - Men or wo-
men. We need high quality 
people, high wages available. 
CaU 534-9761 for appointment. 

c34tf 

WANTED - Babysitter work. 
Experienced. Will work week 
days 6:30 p. m. until mid-
night. Later on week ends. 
Ada, Cascade, Eastmont area 
only. Call Barbara Philllon, 
OR 6-1690. c48tf 

WIVES — Homemakers and 
mothers. If you have a smile, 
than you have what it takes 
to make more money than 
your husband makes. CaU 897-
9077. pl 

WANTED - Babysitting or 
ironing. Week nights. Please 
call 949-5658. cl 

WANTED — Service Station 
Help. Age no barrier. Must 
be dependable. References. 
Apply In person only. Zephyr 
Service Station, 607 West Main 
Street, LoweU. cl-2 

WANTED — Competent Auto-
motive machinist, good in-
come, fringe benefits, pleas-
ant working conditions, please 
state experience. Send replies 
to Lowell Ledger, Box 128V1, 
LoweU, Michigan. cl 

HELP WANTED - Male and 
female. No experience need-
ed. Apnly Newell Manufac-
turing Company, 216 Chatham, 
LoweU. cl 

LOCAL CHILD WELFARE -
Agency desires homes to care 
for very young children on 
a temporary basis. Write in 
care of Lowell Ledger, Box 
128DA, Lowell, Michigan, cl-2 

WANTED — Position open in 
local business office for gen-
eral office work and bookkeep-
ing. Must be able to type 
and have some knowledge of 
bookkeeping. Prefer someone 
with experience. Applv at 127 
N. Broadway, Lowell, Mich. 

c-1 

WANTED — Woman to baby-
sit and do limited amount of 
housework between 7 a. m. 
and 5 p. m. Monday through 
Friday. Pays weU, caU TW 
7-9355, after 5 p. m. cl 

WOMAN—Wanted daily, except 
Sunday, from 2 untU 8 p.m. 
Assist with children, light 
housework and ironing. Pro-
vide own transportation. CaU 
OR 6-5921, between the hours 
of 4 and 6 p.m. cltf 

WAITRESS WANTED — Days. 
FuU or pa i time or Friday 
and Saturday nights. Apply in 
person. LoweU Cafe, LoweU. 
Michigan. pl 

WANTED — To rent two bed-
room house or apartment in 
Lowell area. Call after 6 p. m. 
538-2679. urgently needed, cl 

INSURANCE REPORTER-Par t 
time. Lowell area. Work on 
fee basis. National organiza-
tion. No experience necessary. 
Write Box 128 HH. LoweU. 
Ledger, LoweU, Mich, cl-2 

WANT TO EARN $125 - Per 
week? $6,500 minimum per yr. 
guaranteed, plus commission. 
Opportunity for advancement. 
Can you work without super-
vision? Are you honest and 
reliable? Are you married? 
Do you Uke people and wish 
to be of service? Do you have 
a good work record? If you 
have answered 'yes' so far 
and are between the ages of 
25 and 48, then I'd like to 
talk to you about a career 
position. We furnish the trans-
portation; the merchandise; 
the credit, and pay aU opera-
ting expenses. This position 
is operating an estabUshed 
business for JeweU Home 
Shopping Service. Phone 538-
3263 any evening between 8 
and 9 p. m. or 538-0970 any 
Monday, Friday or Saturday 
a. m. cl-2 

LOST AND FOUND 

LOST — German shepherd dog. 
male, 4 years old. Black and 
tan. Reward. CaU 868-6722 or 
698-6174. cl 

PERSONAL 

WEDDING PHOTOGRAPHY -
Black and white, or color. 
Prices to fit your budget. 
Portraits and advertising pho-
tography. J . E. Colby, Alto, 
868-5001. c24tf 

FINE WEDDING INVITATIONS 
24-hour service, napkins and 
other accessories. FREE box 
of thank you notes, and eti-

Sette book with order. The 
ndy Press. 1127 East Ful-

ton, Grand Rapids, GL 9-6613. 
c34tf 

GRADUATION — Name cards, 
commencements. Fast service. 
Llndy Press, 1127 East Ful-
t o n . G L 9-6613. C51-3 

REAL ESTATE 

BUSINESS PROPERTY - 44' 
x 120* building located In 
Freeport, Michigan. Current 
ly an automotive garaRe—with 
or without equipment and in 
ventory Also ideal for ma 
chine tool shop. SeU or lease 
CaU R. L. Walton, Broker 
Kalamazoo, collect, 345 2969 

C52-3 

NEW SUBURBAN HOMES -
Largest FHA lots. All plaster-
ed hardwood trim throughnut 
FHA financing available. Best 
construction value in this area. 
See these homes while und-
er construction. Half mile 
north of Lowell on Vergennes 
Street. William Schreur. con-
tractor and builder. TW 7 -8189. 

c6tf 

R. J. TIMMER REALTY 

FOREST HILLS SCHOOL -
(Nesr Ada), 4 bedroom brick 
rancher, family room, 2Mi 
baths, garage, fireplace, built-
ins, large wooded lot. $27,900. 

LINCOLN LAKE ROAD - New-
er three bedroom rancher, 
garage, gas heat, over acre 
lot. $10,000. 

LOWELL — 2 bedroom bunga-
low, near school and shopping, 
garage, automatic heat, $7,500 
try low down payment. 

LOWELL - Remodeled throe 
bedroom home, 2 baths, new 
kitchen, gas htat, carpeting, 
garage. $9,500. Try terms. 

MYERS LAKE - (Near Rock-
ford). Lakefront, 3 bedroom 
rancher, garage, fireplace, 
large shady lot, sandy beach 
$14,500. terms. 

WANTED — Cash buyers for 
your farm, large or small, or 
acreage. 

R. J. TIMMER REALTY 
Ada. Michigan; office phone 
676-3901; residence, 949-0139; 
John Fahrni, salesman, TW 
7-9334. cl-2 

DO YOU NEED MONEY - To 
buy. build, remodel or repair 
a home? If you do, try our 
fast, courteous service. You 
will like the "open end" mort-
gage privilege too, that all of 
our borrowers enjoy. Lowell 
Savings Loan Association, 
LowaS, TW 7 8321. c33tf 

WANTED TO RENT - Three 
bedroom home in the Ada 
area. Call Conklin 893-2347. 

cl-2 

THREE BEDROOM - Story S: 
half near John Pall Park. 
Gas heat, large kitchen, two 
porches; one glassed-in, din-
ing room, living room and 
parlor. Will see $7,200 cash 
or $7,500 terms. Call 8C8-2-500. 

Pl 

TW 7yL'61) the number to call 
to place your want ad in the 
next issue*of the LoweU Ledger. 

ELECTRICAL 
WIRING—FIXTURES 

REPAIRS 

6.E. APPLIANCES 

Rickert Electric 
2OS South Hudson 

Phonp TW 7-9802 Lowel l 

Bait & TacUe 
THE BEST FOR LESS 

20% Off List Price 
WHY PAY MORE? 

GOLDS 
LIVE BAIT & TACKLE 

North Hudson, Lowell 
OPEN EVENINGS 'TIL 9 

Ph. TW 7 9966 
cltf 

MONTGOMERY WARD & CO. 
(Serving America for 93 years) 

Offers an exciting opportunity to operate a business of your own 
with no investment. We are Interested in .ay qualified husband 
and wife team with previous retaiTexperience to operate a full 
time franchise catalog store in Lowell, Mich. 

bility in return for a future 
iving full personal qualifications 

If you're willing to accept 
in your own business, write 
to: 

MONTGOMERY WARD & CO. 
D. A. Wade, Sec. 7-1, 618 W. Chicago Ave., Chicago, lUlnols 

cl-3 

Our FIRST 

Anniversary Sale 
SECOND BIG WEEK 

. . . wiHi OUTSTANDING BUYS in new and used 
cars. See Marce or Duke during this big cele-
bration! 

Look for the 
Sign of 
Quality! 

Look for the 
Bbe & White Sign for 

Values Eke these 

o 
Top Quality 

USED CARS 

1965 CHRYSLER Newport Sta. Wagon 

1965 CHEVROLET Impala 2-Dr. HT 

1964 CHRYSLER New Yorker 4-Dr HT 

1964 CHRYSLER 390 2-Dr. HT 

1964 DODGE 4-Dr. Sedan 

1964 OLDS F85 4-Dr. 

1963 DODGE Polara Convertible 

1963 DODGE 339 4-Dr. 

1963 CHEVROLET Belalre 4-Dr. 

1962 VAUANT 4-Dr. Sedan 

1961 DODGE Station Wagon 

7961 DODGE Pioneer 4 - D r r 

1964 D 199 V8 PICKUP 

SEVERAL AS-IS TRANSPORTATION 
SPECIALS 

There is nothing left to chance when you buy a 
TOP QUALITY USED CAR 

at 

McQueen Motor Co. 
INCORPORATED 

222 West Main St., Lowell Ph. 897-9225 

I 

CLARK 
PLM6G. & HTG. 

900 B . M a i n H . L o w t l 

MASTER PLUSIBLR 

CALL ANYTIMEI 

TW 7-7534 
or TW 7-7104 

GERALD M. HENRY 
499 Federal Sqaare Building 
Grand Rapids, MieUgaa 49562 

PUBLICATION ORDER 
File No. 112-667 

State of Michigan. The Pro-
bate Court for the County of 
Kent. 

Estate of Marie GUUssc, 

Deeewed 

IT IS ORDERED that on 
Mav 19, 1961. 

at 9:30 A. M. In the Probate 

Courtroom, Grand Rapids. Mich-
igan, a hearing be held on pe-
tition of Joseph M. Van Dyke, 
Executor, for allowance of his 
final account, the residue of 
said estate be assigned, and the 
Executor discharged. 

Publication and service shall 
be made as provided by sUtute 
and Court rule. 

Date: April 8th. 1966 

A. DALE STOPPELS 
Judge of Probate 

Gerald M. Henry 
Attorney for Executor 

•! r ' I 
: 

• • * 

rgA'Vf. 

Granny feels like she's on 

Cloud 9 since she traded up to 

H A H N E C L I P S E 

for Yardening* fun and pride 

i HAHN-ECUPSE P0WJt - f*0 T -

MOWER works so well Granny feels 

greut about using it. You're looking 

at one reason why. Patented housing 

sucks grass blades straight for slick 

cutting. Notch on tide pulls g n u i 

into mower, eliminates most hand 

trimming. Meets ASA Safety Codt. 

el Haki-Cdifn C*. 

K & W Small Motors 
2361 Wist Main St. Lowttl 8S7-9537 

409 Federal Square Ruilding 
Grand Rapids, Michigan 49502 

A True Copy. 
ROLAND R ROREY, 

Register of Probate cl-3 

VANDER VEEN, FREIHOFER 
I COOK 

112S West Mali Street 
Lowell, Mlchlgai 

PUBLICATION ORDER 
PETITION TO SELL 

REAL ESTATE 
FDe No. lU-Sn 

State of Michigan, the Pro-
bate Court for the County of 
Kent. 

Estate of Charles H Smith, 
Deceased 

IT IS ORDERED that on 
April 29, 1966, 

at 9:30 A. M. In the Probate 
Courtroom, Grand Rapids, Mich-
igan, a hearing be held on the 
petition of Dan A. Wingeier. Ad-
ministrator, for license to sell 
real estate of said deceased. 
Persons interested in said es-
tate are directed to appear at 
said hearing to show cause why 
such license should not be grant-
ed. 

Publication and service shaU 
be made as provided by statute 
n.nri Court rule. 
Date: March 28, 1966. 

WALLACE WAALKES, 
Judge of Probate 

VanderVeen, Freihofer & Cook, 
By: George R. Cook 
Attorney for Estate 
1125 W. Main Street 
LoweU, Michigan 49331 

A true copy. 

ROLAND R. ROBEY. 
Register of Probate c51-l 

Seed Beans 

Spring Farm Supplies 

California Certified Dark Red Kidney 
IdaKo Certified Dark Red Kidney 
Idaho Green Tag Dark Red Kidney 
Calif. Certified Light Red Kidney 
Idaho Certified Light Red Kidney 
Idaho Green Tag Light Red Kidney 
Idaho Green Tag Cranberry 
California Certified Pinks 
Michigan Yelloweye 
Certified Sanilac—-estimated 
Certified Gratiot—estimated 
Certified Seaway—estimated 

Treating—$1.00 extra 

Seed Oots... 
Certified Gerry bu. $1.65 

Seeds... 
All Teweles Legumes are Pre-inoculated 

Fertilizer... Ton 

Cwf. 15— 0—15 $76.10 
$19.10 12—12—12 $76.80 
$19.10 10— 6— 4 $65.80 
$18.10 6—24—12 $83.60 
$19.50 5—20—20 $81.30 
$19.50 5—10—30 $77.00 
$18.50 4—16—16 $68.25 
$19.50 0—32—16 $87.00 
$16.00 ' 0—25—25 $84.30 
$24.25 0—18—36 $87.25 
$12.50 0—13—39 $83.00 
$12.50 0—26— 0 64.15 
$12.50 0—46— 0 $99.00 

Ammonia Nitrate $88.67 

Dura Stan Alfalfa bu. 
Multi Strain Alfalfa bu. 
Socheville Alfalfa bu. 
Alfa-Nure Alfalfa bu. 
Teweles Cert. Vernal Alfalfa bu. 
Teweles Cert. Ranger Alfalfa bu. 
Montana Grimm Alfalfa bu. 
Valley Cert. Ranger Alfalfa bu. 
Teweles Clovamore bu. 
Teweles Mammoth Clover bu. 
Teweles Sweet Clover bu. 
Michigan Red Clover bu. 
Timage bu. 
Teweles Ladino Clover lb. 
Dutch White Clover lb. 
Brome Grass SO lbs. 
Brome Grass lb. 
Teweles Timothy bu. 
Kentucky Blue Grass lb. 
Red Top - lb. 
Perennial Rye Grass lb. 
Chewing Fescua lb. 
Reed Canary Grass lb. 
Rape Seed lb. 
Sughage lb. 
Sorghum lb. 

Steel Posts... 
6,/2 Ft. Steel Posts ea. $1.05 
7 Ft. Steel Posts ea. $1.15 

Baler Twine... 
Valley Brand bale $7.35 
Tip Top Brand bale $8.50 

All Twine Prices Subject to Discounts; 
10 bales or more, 25c bale discount 
Cash at time of sale, 25c bale discount 

Wool Twine lb. .25 

$40.20 
$36.30 
$44.40 
$33.90 
$40.20 
$33.60 
$32.40 
$24.95 
$36.00 
$26.40 
$13.40 
$20.00 
$25.60 

.85 

.70 
$12.00 

.25 
$14.40 

.65 

.75 

.25 

.75 

.90 

.20 

.22 

.25 

Above Fertilizer Prices Are Subject 
to Cash Discount 

Milorganite 50 lbs. $2.25 
Lime spread ton $6.80 

Bulk Fertlizers Will Be Available at 
Ionia and Clarksville. 

Check with us on these prices. 

Fence... 
10—47—6 
10—47— 9 
10—47—12 
9—39—12 
8—32— 6 
9—39— 6 

4' Poultry Fence 
5' Poultry Fence 
6' Poultry Fence 
4 Pt. Heavy Barb 
4 Pt. Medium Barb 
4 Pt, Light Barb 
12' Steel Gates 
14' Steel Gates 
16' Steel Gates 
10 lb. Roll Smooth Wire 
Post Drivers 

Cedar Posts... 

20 rod $36.10 
20 rod $36.60 
20 rod $27.00 
20 rod $24.00 
20 rod $27.70 
20 rod $31.80 
10 rod $13.00 
10 rod $14.55 
10 rod $17.40 
80 rod $10.60 
80 rod $8.90 
80 rod $7.60 

ea. $23.30 
ea. $27.20 
ea. $30.15 

$1.75 
ea. $3.45 

3" 
4" 
S " 

6 " 
4" 
5" 
6 " 

7" 
S " 

7' 
7* 
7' 
7' 
8 ' 

8 ' 

8 * 
8 ' 

xlO* 

ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 

.45 

.65 

.80 

.90 

.75 
$1.10 
$1.25 
$1.35 
$1.60 

WE ALSO HAVE A COMPLETE UNE OF 
FARM CHEMICALS FOR WEED 

CONTROL, ORCHARD AND 
FIELD CROPS 

April 11, 1966 

C. H. Runciman Company 
LoweH lento Freeport CforitsviHe 

ROLAND M. SHIVEL 
• « Michigan Nat l Bank Bid*. 

Grand Rapids, Michigan 

PUBLICATION ORDER 
File NO I I 2 .M6 

State of Michigan, the Pro-
bate Court for the County of 
Kent. 

Estate of Sara B. Phelps, 
Deceased 

IT IS ORDERED that on 
May 9, 1966. 

at 9:30 A. M. in the Probate 
Courtroom, Grand Rapids, Mich-
igan. a hearing be held on the 
petition of Roland M. Shivel, 
Executor, for aUowance of his 
final account. 

Publication and service shall 
be made as provided by statute 
and Court rule. 
Date: April llth. 1966 

WALLACE WAALKES, 
Judge of Probate 

Shivel, Phelps. Linsey & Strain 
Attorney for Fiduciary 
608 Michigan Nat'l Bank Bldg. 
Grand Rapids, Michigan 

A true copy 
ROLAND R. ROBEY 

Register of Probate cl-3 

GERALD M. HENRY, Atty 
409 Federal Square BMg. 

Grand RaukK. Mkh. 49592 
PUBLICATION ORDER 

File No. 113-895 

State of Michigan, the Pro-
bate Court for the County of 
Kent. 

Estate of 
Laura Marie De Graff, 

Deceased 
IT IS ORDERED that on 

June 14, 1966, 
at 9:30 A. M. In the Probate 
Courtroom. Grand RapkLs. Mich-
igan, a hearing be held at 
which aU creditors of said de-
ceased are required to prove 
their claims. Creditors must 
file sworn claims with t h e 
Court and serve a copy on Ger-
ald M. Henry at 400' Federal 
Square Building, Grand Rapids, 
Michigan 49502, prior to hearing. 

Publication and service shall 
be made as provided by statute 
and Court rule. 
Date: March 22. 1966 

WALLACE WAALKES, 
Judge of Probate 

Gerald M. Henry 
Executor 
400 Federal Square Bldg. 
Grand Rapids, Mich., 49502 

A true copy. 
ROLAND R. ROBEY. 

Register of Probate c51-l 

VATjpER VEEN, FREIHOFER 
4 COOK, ATTYS. 

1125 West Main Street 
LoweU, Michigan 

ISTATE OF MICHIGAN 
INr THE CIRCUIT COURT 

FOR THE COUNTY OF KENT 
No. 4238 

ORDER TO PUBUSH NOTICE 
AND SERVE NOTICE 

IN RE THE MATTER OF 
ESTABLISHING THE 
NORMAL LEVEL OF 
ZIEGENFUSS LAKE 

At a session of said Court, 
held at the Courthouse in the 
City of Grand Rapids. Michi-
gan. this 8th day of March, 
1966. 

PRESENT: The Honorable 
Stuart Hofflus, Circuit Judge. 

Frank Bouma, Drain Commis-
sioner of Kent County, having 
fUed his Complaint asking the 
Court to determine the normal 
level of Zlegenfuss Lake pur-
suant to the provisions of Act 
146 of the PubUc Acts of 1961. 
and the Court being fuUy ad-
vised in the premise^, 

NOW, THEREFORE, on mo-
tion by George R. Cook, attor-
ney for the petitioner, 

IT IS ORDERED AND AD-
JUDGED that Friday, the 13th 
day of May, 1966, at 11:00 
o'clock A. M. be and the same 
is hereby assigned as the date 
on which this Court shall hear 
proofs and aUegations of aU 
parties Interested and shall con-
sider and review the descrip-
tion of lands within the special 
assessment district and upon 
which day the court shall de-
termine the level of Zlegenfuss 
Lake, to be established and 
maintained. 

AND IT IS FURTHER ORD-
ERED AND ADJUDGED that 
a copy of this Order be pul)-
lished in the Lowell Ledger 
once each week for eight (8) 
successive weeks prior to the 
13th day of May, 1966 

AND IT IS FURTHER ORD-
ERED AND ADJUDGED that 
copies of this Order shall be 
served by certified mail at 
least three (3) weeks prior to 
the 13th day of May, 1966, to 
each person whose name ap-

??ars on the latest Township 
ax Assessment Rolls as own-

ing lands within the special 
assessment district at the ad-
dress shown on the roU and 
upon the Michigan State Coo-
servation Department. 

AND IT IS FURTHER ORD-
ERED AND ADJUDGED that 
the Kent County Drain Commis-
sinner make available for In* 
speciion to aU interested part-
ies all engineering surveys and 
data heretofore compiled by him 
at his office in the County 
I'.uilding in the City of Grand 
Rapids, Kent County, Michigan. 

STUART HOFFIUS, 
Circuit Judge 

Examined. Countersigned 
I Entered 
JACK BRONKEMA, Clerk 
JAMES B. RYAN. Deputy Clerk 
ATTEST: A TRUE COPY 
JACK BRONKEMA. Clerk 
JAMES B. RYAN, Deputy Clerk 

Elmdale 
Mrs. Ira Sareeant 
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Mr. and Mrs Norman King 
accompanied their daughter & 
husband, Mr. and Mrs Clifford 
V. ailing and daughter to East-
er Sunday services at a church 
at Standale. After which they 
enioyed dinner al a restaurant, 
rvturning to the Walling home 
for the aftemoon. Carl Story of 
Grand Rapids joined the family 
for a couple hours. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Purdy 
and daughter. Robin, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bliss Allison and children, 
and Harold Carigon. sr., en-
joyed Easter Day dinner with 
Mr. and Mrs. Russell Aspinall 
of rural Lowell. 

Mrs. Lizzie Blough, her child-
ren and families enjoyed an 
Faster family dinner in the fel-
lowship hall of Hope Church of 
the Brethren. 

The community extends sin-
cere symnathy to Mrs. George 
Metteriiick, husband and fam-
ily. in the death of her father, 
Ajihur White of Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Purdy 
were the attendants of his bro-
ther. James and Mrs. Janet 
Brealy, who were married Sat-
urday at 10 a. m. in the Uni-
ted Brethren Church of Cale 
donia. The newly-weds left on 
a short honeymoon in the north-
em part of "the state. 

Mr. and Mrs. Morris Story- of 
Grand Rapids enjoyed Sunday 
evening lunch with Mr. and 
Mrs. Norman King. 

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Rickert, 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Cahoon & 
famUy of Saranac' Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Alderink and Mr. 
and Mrs. Duane Weeks were 
Easter day dinner guests of Mr. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN: 

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that 
pursuant to Sec. 2 of Act 184 
of the Public Acts of 1943, as 
amended, the Township Board 
of Lowell Township. Kent Coun-
ty. Michigan, acting upon a pe-
tition signed by the requisite 
number of voters living In the 
unincorporated portion of the 
Township, declares its intent to 
proceed under the provisions of 
said Act to provide by ordin-
ance for the establishment of 
zoning districts in the unincor-
porated portions of the Town-
ship. to appoint a Township zon-
ing Board and to take any and 
all other action authorized by 
said Act. This notice is given 
pursuant to the provisions of 
Act 184 of the PubUc Acts of 
1943, as amended. 

RAY W. RITTENGER. 
i ~ Supervisor 

Township of Lowell, 
Kent County, Michigan 

ATTEST: A True Copv 
DOLORES J. COLLINS. 
Cleric cl 

GERALD M. IIENK1' 
400 Federal Square Bldg. 
Grand Rapids. Michigan 
PUBLICATION ORDER 

File No. 113-691 
State of Michigan. The Pro-

bate Court for the County ol 
Kent. 
Estate of Catherine Malewltz, 

Deceased 
IT IS ORDERED that on 

June 14, 1966 
at 9:30 A. M. in the Probate 
Courtroom. Grand Rapids. Mich-
igan. a hearing be held on 
claims. Such hearing is order-
ed to be held on June 14. 1966, 
9:30 A. M. Therefore, credit-
ors of said deceased shall pre-
sent their claims to the Court 
and send a copy to the fidu-
ciary al 400 Federal Square 
Building. Grand Rapids. Michi-
gan 49502. prior to hearing. 

Publication and service shaU 
be made as provided by statute 
and Court rule. 
Date: March 22, 1966 

WALLACE WAALKES 
Judge of Probate 

Gerald M. Henry-
Attorney for Administratrix 
400 Federal Square Bldg. 
Grand Rapids, Michigan 

A true copy. 
ROLAND R. ROBEY 

Register of Probate c51-l 

Hastings Livestock 

April 8, 1966 

Feeder Pigs |16.00-$30 00 
Top Calves $35.00-639.50 
Seconds $30.00 $35.00 
Common & Culls ..laj.W-Wi.ou 
Young Beef $19.00-623.50 
Beef Cows $14.00-$19.80 
Bulls $17.00-$22.00 
Top Hogs $24.90-$24.50 
Second Grade $23.00-524.00 
Roughs $18.50421 00 
Boars $17.00430.50 
Feeder Cattle $19.00425.50 
Lambs $23.60425.00 

Top Hogs $24.50 
RusseU Gray ClarksvUle 

TOO SMALL-BIT? 

Let Marge 
SeU If For You 

THE THRIFT SHOP 

TOO SMALL—BUT? 

Check 

MARGE'S 

Thrift Shop 
CASCADE 

2795 Orange Street 

and Mrs. Donald Weeks and 
family of near Campau Lake. 

Rev. Conrad Snavely left on 
Sunday afternoon to attsnd a 
four-day Ministers Seminar at 
Columbus. Ohio. 

Mrs. Ira Sargeant attended 
the meeting of the West Camp-
bell Club, which met Wednes-
day at the home of Mrs. Gott-
lieb Roth, of rural Lake Odes-
sa. 

Gary Lott has returned home 
after undergoing an appendec-
tomy at Butterworth hospital, 
last week. 

WELL 
DRILLING 

PUMP REPAIR 
FAST SERVICE 

FREE ESTIMATES 
FULLY INSURED 

E. D. RICHARD 

Cofl: TW 7-8104 
C50-1 

South Boston Bible Church 
A. Peler Gardner, Pastor 

MA Bible Believing Church Where a W a r m 
Welcome AwalU You" 

Morning Worship and Junior Chnrch 19:99 A.M. 
Nursery Provided 

Sunday School 11:15 A. M. 
Yonng Peoples' Meeting «:45 P. M. 
Evening Worship 7:45 P. M. 
Thursday Prayer Meeting 7:3# P. M. 

Snow 
Methodist Church 

Worship Service 
9:39 A. M. 

Church School 
19:35 A. M. 

Vergennes 
Methodist Church 

Worship Service 
11:99 A. M. 

Church School 
19:99 A. M. 

REV. IRA J . NOORDHOF—MINISTER 
Phone: 616 PR 3-2251 

ALTON BIBII CHURCH 
3-HUe and Lincoln Lake Rd. 

DEAN BLOUGH—Pastor PHONE 897-9938 

I$:fl9 A. M. Worship 7:39 P. M. Worship 
Simday School 11:69 A. M. to Noon 

"The gift of God is eternal life"—Rom. 6:23 

Independent - Fundamental 

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
Main at Oiviaion — Lowell, Mich. 

REV. ROBERT WEBBER, PASTOR 

Services at 8:45 and 11:99 A. M. 
Church School at 9:45, Classes for AU Ages Over Two 

Sermon: "HOW CAN I KNOW GOD" 

Nursery During The 11:99 A. M. Service 

Church 
UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST 

H U D S O N A N D S P R I N G S T R E E T S , L O W E L L . MICHIGAN 

Rev. Charles C. Davis, Minister 
P a s t o r Etner i tun: Rev. N o r m a n Woon 

Worship Service—11:61 A. M. Sunday School-9:39 A. M. 
Nursery provided during Moming Worship 

Sermon: -DO YOU LOVE ME MORE THAN THESE"" 
John 21:!-2S 

We un i t e to wor sh ip God with f r e e d o m a n d respect f o r 
Individual belief 

HRSI BAPTIST CHURCH S S T 
Sunday School 19 a. m. Worship 11 a. m. and 7 p. I 

Youth Fellowship—6:19 P. M. 
Wednesday FamUy Prayer Fellowship 7 p. m. 

M. K E I T H MC IVER — PASTOR 

••HAVE YOU MET THE LORD JESUS CHRIST?" 

All men must face the Lord Jesus as Saviour or Judge. 

•HEAVEN IS A PREPARED PLACE FOR A PREPARED 
PEOPLE" 

"I go to prepare a place for you." "Prepare to meet thy 
God." "I am the Way. the Truth and the Life." 

For Transportat ion or Spiritual Counsel, Call T W 

Church Of The Nazarene 
201 North Washington LoweU. Michigan 

THE REV. RUSSELL E. SPRAY 

SUNDAY SCHOOL 
MORNING WORSHIP 
YOUNG PEOPLE AND JUNIORS 
EVENING WORSHIP 

.19:99 A. M. 

.11:99 A. M. 

. 6:45 P. M. 

. 7:39 P. M. 

. 7:39 P. M. PRAYER AND PRAISE WEDNESDAY 
Snpervbcd Ni iwfy During AU S m i e e s 

For (he wages af ihi Is death; hut the gift of God Is eternal 
Ufe through J e m Christ our Lord. Romans 6:23. 

Come and Worship With Us 

COMPLETE AUTO BODY SERVICE 

.-a, 

THE PRICE OF SKILL 

. . . is the low price you pay for our expert job on your 
car body. From the Installation of new windows lo a 
paint and body job, we're equipped for e \ e n thing. 

SEE US 

Mike Koenes' Body Shop 
6896 Cascade Rd. Phone 949-2640 
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SERVICES—10:00 A. M.—7:00 P. M. Sunday School—11:10 A. M. 

Everyone Welcome 

Calvary Christian Reformed Church 
ON WEST MAIN STREET LOWELL. MICH. 

Our FIRST Duty 
. . . IS TO YOU AND YOUR CAR! 

nierp Is much more to mnntag; 
a sen Ice station than fining {jas 
tanks, changing oil, and labrica-
tlng cars . , , ranch more. Be-
cause our Texaco Station reg-
ularly offers that little "some-
thing" extra," we have been 
awarded the Texaco Star Deal-

er Award for Integrity and seniee to the customers. For 
Instance, when you drive In, we think yonll like the way 
our station sparkles with a friendly atmosphere. 

Helm Texaco 
PHONE 897-9825 I KAiK ST. LOWEU 

Want Ads-Today's Best Buy 

) 

ELECTRICITY 
IS THE 

BIGGEST 
BARGAIN 

IN 
YOUR 

BUDGET 

Today there's probably nothing you can buy that gives you 
more for your money than low-cost electricity. 

Think of how much you depend on electricity every day— 
from the miracle of electric lights at the flip of a switch to 
the work-saving, time-saving wonders of electric cooking, wa-
W heating, and other electrical servants. 

No other form of energy today does so many jobs—for so 
little. Join the all-electric parade, and take full advantage 
of the biggest bargain in your budget! 

LOWELL LIGHT 6l POWER 

OWNED BY THE T € PEOPLE OF LOWELL 
t n * § 
^ WNMtfH « 

coming 
events 

The average annual cost at a 
good private college in 1965 was 
about $2,500 and at a state uni-
versity about $1,750. 

Gourmet: a glutton who owns 
a tuxedo. 

Hornets' nest: looking like a 
giant cigar ash. 

bring your 

INSURANCE 
Problems to 

Johnson-Camngton, Inc. 
THE ROLLINS AGENCY 
8SS We* Main St.. Lowell 

H T -

The American legion Auxil-
iary will meet Monday, April 
18, at eight o'clock in the club 
rooms. 

There will be a Family Night 
simper with a while elephant 
ssle before regular lodge meet-
ing at the Rebekah liall Tues-
day, April 19. All members 
come and bring your families. 

Tho Mary-Esther Circle of the 
Lowell Methodist Church will 
meet Thursday, April l i 

Saturday, April II. the S M's 
of the Methodist Church will 
meet at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. David Sterrick at * p m. 
Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Laux will 
have charge of the devotions 
and program. 

The Women of the Moose, 
Chapter 1388, will bold tbetr 
monthly business meeting on 
Monday evening, April 18 in 
their dub rooms. All members 
are urged to attend. 

A Style Show sponsored by 
the Alto Mothers' Chib wiB be 
held Tuesday, April II, at 8 
p. m. at the Alto EJementary 
School. 

A garage sale, sponsored by 
the Showboat Garden Chib, will 
be held at the home of Mrs. 
Jake Callier. 115 N Hudson. 
Friday and Saturday, April 22 
and 23rd, from 9 a. m. to 5 
p. m. 

The Lowell Women's Bowling 
Association meeting will be held 
April 25 at 7 p. m. in the 
American Legion Building, on 
the second floor. cl-2 

Morse Lake McCords Farm 
Bureau will meet with Lisle 
Clark at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Clait Friday eve-
ning, April 15. 

South Boston Grange will 
have a Pancake Festival at 
their hall on OW-ll. in Bos-
ton Township Saturday. April 
16 Serving 11 a. m. to 1 p. m. 
and 5 to 7:30 p. m. 

St Mary's School is having 
a paper drive, April 22 and a . 
There will be a truck parked 
at school fcr yoar papers. • 

Michigan Trails Girt Scout 
Panorama : exhibits, stage show, 
demonstrations. April II and 
17, 1 to 5 p. m. at the Grand 
Rapids Ctvic Auditorium. -Do-
nation, 25 cents. 

•Rje Alto Garden Club will 
meet in the Alto Methodist Chur-
ch Wednesday, April SI. at 2 
p. m. In addition to the re^ilar 
program, there will be a var-
iety sale. 

Cyclamen Chapter No. 94, of 
the' OES, will have a family 
potluck supper Saturday, April 
16. at 7 o'clock. Bring own tab-
le seniee, a dessert, salad or 
vegetable to pass Games and 
entertainment to follow the sup-
per. 

The Senior Citizens * • have 
a potluck supper and card par-
ti' at the VFW Hall niursday, 
April 21, at 8 p. m. 

Hie Jolly Community Club 
meets Wednesday afternoon, Ap-
ril 20. with Mrs. Clara Thomp-
son. Work comm. Ulah Moore. 
Program Comm. Evelyn Olin, 
and Clara Thompson. 

The Vergennes Co-operative 
Club will meet at the home of 
Thelma Heilman Thursday, Ap-
ril 14, at 6 p. m. 

The Garden Lore Club will 
meet in the dub rocms at 2 
p. m. on Tuesday. April 19. 
There will be discussion of civ-
ic betterments and also an auc-
tion sale of house and garden 
plants. The Silver Tea commit-
tee will be Mrs. J. Bannan, 
Mrs. L. Jones and Mrs. * . 
Huffman. 

Merriman Community Farm 
Bureau will meet Saturday eve-
ning, Anril 16. with Mr. and 
Mrs. Willis Hatch. 

The Golden Chain Farm Bur-
eau will meet at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Anil Heilman at 
8:30, Thursday, April 21. 

The Mapes Farm Bureau will 
meet with Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
BeVier at their home Thurs-
day, April 14, at 8 p. m. 

The Alton Ladies Aid will 
meet Thursday. April 14, at the 
home of Mrs. Fay Clark. Guests 
are welcome. 

Snow Farm Bureau will meet 
at Snow Christian Center at 8 

m. on Friday, April 17. Mrs. 
ster Antonides will be the 

hostess. This meeting has been 
postponed one week, because of 
Good Friday. 52-1 
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Mr. and Mrs. Jeffrey Bonn. 

Marlai Lotbe Watrons. the 
daughter tf Mrs. Robert Hrni 
ingsen and the Ule Howard 
Watrous, became the bride of 
Jeffrey Bona, son of Dr. and 
M r s . Douglas R. Bonn wt 
CtaitsvOle, Saturday after-
r o m . April 2, IB the Bethle-
hem L u t h e r a n Church in 
(irand RapUs. 

The bride was given in mar-
riage by her grandfather. Mr. 

Guy Monks of Lowell. 
The couple were attended by 

the bride's brother and sister-
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Watrous. 

A family dinner was held at 
the Rodcet immediately follow-
ing the ceremony. 

Following a short honeymoon. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jeffrey Bonn will 
make their home at 732 Madi-
son Stiwt, Grand Rapids. Mich-
igan. 

WiU present 
organ concert 

Tuesday, April 19, at 7:30 
p. m. Ronald R. McMahon. or-rst and choirmaster of Trin-

Lutheran Church, will pre-
sent an organ coocert with the 
Calvin College orchestra. 

Hie program win be present-
ed in the sanctuary of Trinity 
Lutheran Church, 2700 Fulton 
Road, Eas t Grand Rapids. 

A free will offering will be 
taken to help with the expenses 
of the urogram. 

Mr. McMahon is an organ stu-
dent of Robert C. Gallagher. M. 
Mus. AAGO Minister of Music 
at Westminster Presbvterian 
Church. Besides his duties at 
Trinity Lutheran. Mr. McMah-
on is presentlv the instrumen-
tal music instructor for t h e 
East Grand Rapids Junior High 
School. 

He was co-winner of the Foun-
tain Street Church Student Or-
gan Competition in 1963. and 
was the winner of the 1963 Stu-
dent Playing competition at the 
Regional Convention (Michigan, 
Wisconsin, Illinois and Indiana) 
of the American Guild of Or-
ganist He holds a Bachelor of 
Music Decree and Master of 
Music ixiucation Degree from 
the University of Midiican and 
the University of Louisville, res-
pectively. 

He has played recitals in the 
Grand Ranids area and on the 
eastern side of Michigan, and 
has accompanied the Zeeland 
Civic Chorus in their presenta-
tion of the "Messiah." 

n j e Calvin CoDece Strings 
are under the direction of Har-
old Geerdes, instrumental in-
structor at Cahin College. 

For this performance Mr. 
Geerdes has turned the baton 
over to John Heerspink a sen-
ior student in music at Calvin 
College. 

CARD OF THANKS 

We wish to express our ap-
predation to relatives, friends 
and neighbors for the flowers, 
food and cards of sympathy at 
the death of our mother, grand-
mother and sister. Lena M. 
Gardner. We especially wish to 
thank Rev. Melver for his com-
forting words, also Dr. Myers 
and the Roth Funeral Home for 
their acts of kindness and a 
special thanks to Mrs. Harold 
Kelley. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Geel-
hoed and Mrs. Leo Bryant for 
their help when it was needed 
most. 

Mr. L Mrs. Lynn Gardner 
Mr. & Mrs. Robert Vanderwal 

and Debra Lynn 
Mrs. Sadie Wohlscheid 

Pl 

NOW 

'tfOif** W**' 
CAR INSURANCE 

COVERAGE THAT PAYS 
125, »50 or *100 per week 

IF YOU'RE 
TOTALLY DISABLED 

AS A RESULT OF 
A CAR ACCIDENT 

p a y s »5000, '10 ,000 or *15,000 
in c a s e of dea th 

Whether you ire tn the car or 
by #. DisabUity Inconw up to 2 Jf"* 

-you elect the •mount. 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to express my 

thanks and deep appreciation 
for the many visits tnd cards 
I received while I was in the 
hospital end since my return 
home. 
d John 

a* M O T O p o u c v j l 

RITTENGER 
INSURANCE SERVICE 

897-92fe 
218 C. H a t e SL, Lowefl. M b * . 

DORIS 
ROD TAYLOR 

DO NOT 
CotobrDf HUE DISTURB 

SUN., MON., TUES., 
APRIL 17, 18, 19 

• c n M i m w . / } 
asmnmw 

O S U R W E R H E R 

"A BEAUTIFULLY MADE 
THRILLER-

SPLEHDIDlY 
ACTED!" 

T K E s m m 

WEDNESDAY, APRIL 21 
SURPRISE NIGHT 

AO Seats 23c 
One Show i t 7:11 P. M. 

1 Performance at 7:45 
All Nights Except Wednesday 

Wed. 7:11 p. m. Oily 

Just arrived 
Mr. and Mrs. Janes McFall 

are the p^oud parents of a 
daughter, Kim Marie, bom Ap-
ril 6, at Blodeelt Memorial Hos-
pital. Kim weighed five pounds, 
13 ounces. 

Sharon JSoordhof 
to wed April 28 

The Reverend and Mrs. Ira 
Noordhof of 4598 Apple Avenue, 
Muskegon, w'«.h to announce 
the engagement and forthcom-
ing marriage of their daughter. 
Sharon Lynn, to Jere P. Chand-
ler. 

The bfdegroom-to-be Is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Milton 
Chandler of Detroit. Michigan. 

A May 28th wedding is being 
planned by Miss Noordhof and 
her fiance. 

LETTER TO THE EDITOR: 

Thank you! 
Dear Editor: 

I would like to thank all of 
the citizens who voted for me 
in the election for City Council, 

Many people worked for me 
and I appreciate the confldence 
they placed in me. My sincere 
desire is to represent all of the 
residents of Lowell. 

Thos? people that have sug-
gestions or would like more in-
formation about issues discuss-
ed and decided in the City 
Council meeting should call me. 
It would be most helpful if 
people would share, with me, 
their concerns for Lowell. 

Mrs. Harold R. Myers 

CARD OF THANKS 

I would like lo thank my 
friends, neiehbors and relatives 
for their visits and cards while 
I was in the hospital, 
pl Sylvester Bibbler 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to express our sin-

cere appreciation to relatives, 
friends and neighbors for the 
flowers and many other kind 
and sympathic deeds shown us 
at the death of our husband 
and father, Arthur White. We 
especially wish to thank Dr. Mc-
Kay for his kindness during his 
illness and the Rev. Webber and 
Roth Funeral Home for their 
comforting words and kind as-
sistance at the time of his death, 
pl Hie Family of 

Arthur White 

IN MEMORIAM 
In loving memory of Mat-

hew Mettemick who passed a-
way April 15. 1965. 
Many a Lonely heartache. 

Often a silent tear. 
Always a beautiful memory. 

Of one we loved so dear. 
His memory will be cherished 

forever. 
Wife, children and 
grand & great-grandchfldren 

Pl 

STRAND 
T H E A T R E 

LOWELL - MICHIGAN 

THURS., FRL, SAT. 
APRIL l i IS, II 

A K I S S A B I F DAY! 

GREENVILLE 
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 

- I O N I A -
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 

Reopening for The Season 
THURSDAY. APRIL 14 

Free Admission at Both Theatres 
•TAFFY AND THE 

JUNGLE HUNTERS" 

"THE 
HUMAN DUPLICATORS" 

F r i , Sat, Sib., April 15, II, 17 

SWiley MacLatee, 
Peter Ustinov, Richard Crrwta 

"JOHN GOLDFARB, 
PLEASE COME HOME" 

- A n d -

Kim Novak, Richard JohasM 
• THE AMOROUS 

ADVENTURES OF 
MOLL FLANDERS" 

—Plus— 

3rd Big HH, Sat, April If 
Vincent Price 

"CONVICTS FOUR" 

"SNOW FIRE" 

"BLOOD ON THE 
ARROW" 

Fri., Sat , S n . , April 15, II, 17 

James Garner, Dick VanDyke 
Efte Summer, Angle Dickinson 

"THE ART OF LOVE" 

—And— 

•THE 
HUMAN DUPLICATORS" 

—Plus— 

Jrd Big Hit Sat , April II 

Robert Hottoa 

"SECRET DOOR" 

Ionia County 

Home-Sport 
SHOW 

FRIDAY APRIL 15 
5 lo 10 pjn. 

SATURDAY APRIL U 
1 to 10 p.m. 

SUNDAY APRIL 17 
1 to 9 pjn. 

IONIA FAIRGROUNDS 
IONIA. MICHIGAN 

Special Attractions 
Al E. Khatt, Mayor and Pansey 

Home Decorator to answer 
yovr decorating questions 

Ful site Mercury Space Capsule 

Door Prize 
Winner's choice of 21" Color TV 

or Riding Garden Tractor 

Displays of 
Model kitchens, appliances, homes, 
horr.fr tmprovement idocts. funnture, 
sporting goods, boats, motors, 
camping traSers. lawn and garden 
care equipment. 

SPONSORED BY THE IONIA JAYCEES 

RAVENNA 
- ' LIVESTOCK SALES 

Prices for April 11. 836 head 
of Livestock^ 66 consianments 

of Poultry and Rabbits, 
%' V " 4,800 bales of Hay and Straw 

Ved np to $39.50 cwt. 
Beef Steers and Heifers np to $26.40 cwt. 
Beef Cows — up to $20 JO cwt. 
Beef Bulls np to $23.30 cwt. 
Feeder Cattle from $19.50 to $27.50 cwt. 
Hogs op to $24 JO cwt. 
Sows np to $23.80 cwt. 
Boars up to $19.25 cwt. 
Feeder Figs from $17.25 to $25.00 each 
Hay from 34c to 45c bale 
Straw from 30c to SOc bole 

The sale has the largest number of buyers paying the high-
est maricet prices for your livestock. 

Valuable Free Gift given away at 9:31 "'dock everv Mon-
day night. Must be present to win. You are always welcome 
to attend 'he sales every Monday even though vou do not 
have anything to sell. 

We operate the Ravenna Livestock Sale an Monday and 
the Big Rapids Sale on Wednesday. 

Bonded for your protection. 
SALE STARTS AT S:ll P. M. 

RAVENNA LIVESTOCK SALES 
George Wright RAVENNA, MICHIGAN J . Paul Herman 


