
BLUE MARK NOTICE 

A blue mark around this notice 
will call your attention to your nd-
dreaa label, which BIIOWH that It's 
tlmo to renew. M E i 
L E D G E R 
E N T R I E S 
Beln* • Collrctlon of Various 

Topica of Local ftnd 

General Interest 

BUSINESS MAN'S RESOLVES 

•[F THE BUSINESS MAN consld-
era what New Year's reaolu-

tlons he should make, ho might In-
clude the following; 

1. To try to treat the public as 
he likes to be treated when he Is 
buying anything. 

2. To try to treat his help as he 
wanted to bo treated when ho was 
working for somebody else. 

8. To be patient and courteous 
even when other people do and ae.y 
the most unreasonable and provo-
king thingi. 

4. To remember that it la ex-
tremely difficult to hold one's own 
in modern t rade without coniider-
abie advertising. 

In a radio address last Thurs-
day night, Secretary of the In-
terior lokes painted Henry Ford 
as a villain. Well, If Mr. Ford is 
a villain, then most of us would 
like to live with 1MWMMNM such 
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Branch Office 
For Auto Licenses 
Opens Here Soon 

Mabel H. Bibbler 
Named Manager 

BUSINESS WORKER'S RE-
SOLVES 

T F THE BUSINESS WORKER 
has contemplated New Year 

resolutions, the following would do 
him good: 

L To work Just as hard for his 
employer as he would for himaelf 
If he were the owner of the busl-
ness. 

2. To work just as earnestly 
when the boss ian't looking as 
when he Is. 

8. To maintain such a smiling 
and pleasant manner that people 
enjoy doing buaineas with him. 

4. To try to learn more about the 
buaineaa, so as to be able to an-
swer questions intelligently. 

THE STORY OF OUR LIVES 

TN FORMER YEARS a multitude 
of people started out January 

1 to keep a record of their lives, 
which was Inscribed day by day 
in a neat little leather bound book 
called a diary. Many of these books 
are now sold, but probably most 
people Ui» them to note down dates 
and other memoranda. The mod-
ern world is rushing ao eagerly 
f rom one thing to another, that it 
has little t ime to spend recording 
the events of the past. The years 
that are gone are soon forgotten. 

The old t imers who used to keep 
diaries say they like to turn back 
to theae records of their past, and 
survey the long and perhaps rough 
path over which they have climbed. 
I t gives them courage for the fu-
ture to th ink of all the hilla they 
have ascended, and the weary val-
leys through which they have suc-
cessfully toiled. 

ell Rotary Cli ) last week Wednes-
day, spoke as irlngly of the open-
ing of a brands of his department 
here in the ne r future and fur ther 
assurances of this fact were re-
ceived on Montfny of this week in 

letter f rom secretary Case to 
Mrs. Mabel H. Ribbler announcing 
her appointment as Lowell branch 
manager. The fetter fur ther stated 
that a represektative of the De-
partment of ^tate would be In 
Lowell within I few days for the 
purpose of setting up the office 
and giving insttuotlona as to the 
conduct and matmgement of same. 

On the occasion of his visit here 
last week. Secretary Case express-
ed himself as favorably impressed 
with the advantages and con-
veniences which would be afforded 
all motorists of Lowell and sur-
rounding townships by having a 
branch office established here. 

The new offlcs will cccupy quar-
ters in the Lowell Granite Com-
pany building East ,Maln-st. This 
is looked upon as a rmvenient lo-
cation for the public as it affords 
plsnty of parking ipace and has 
the fur ther advaabge of being 
but a short dlstanol from the State 
Savings Bank, whpc receipts will 
be deposited dall; 

Mrs. Bibbler is 
training and 

A JOB FOB A OIANT 

XTEWTON D. BAKER, who died 
^ a few days ago and who was 
seorstary of war under President 
Wilson, undertook one of the most 
gigantic Jobs ever tackled by a hu-
man being. I t was up to him dur-
ing the World War, to take hold of 
a nation tha t was imbued with 
peaceful habits, and make it 
fighting country, and put nearly 
4,000,000 of Its soldiers in the field 
ready for battle. 

I t will always be the glory at-
taching to Mr. Baker's memory, 
that bis mighty Job was performed 
without any scandal, and that he 
got a exeat army into Europe in 
a time so short as to amaze those 
slow moving nations. He must4iave 
consumed a vast amount of vital 
energy In this superhuman task, 
which may have perhapa led to his 
death a t the aomewhat early age 
of 66. The country parts f rom him 
with deep reg re t 

BALANCE SHEETS OF 19S7 

r P H E F IRST DAYS of the new 
year are a time of anxiety in 

countless business houses, which 
use this time for their annual in-
ventory. The corporation officer Is 
sometimes worried for fear his an-
nual report will look sour to the 
stockholders. The head of the lit-
tle business counts his stock and 
figures on his debts and bills re-
ceivable with the anxiety of a can-
didate listening to the election re-
turns that spell his success or fail-
ure. 

Our optimistic people frequently 
overestimate their receipts and un-
derestimate their expenses. Some 
concerns never seem able to figure 
their costs of operation correctly. 
They estimate what these costs 
should be under favorable condi-
tions, with a good volume of busi-
ness. Then If trade is slow for 
several months, the coats are heavy 
in proportion to the amount of 
goods handled, and the anticipated 
profits are eaten up, or may tu rn 
nut losses. 

Every business, no matter how 
small, ought to know how much it 
costs to handle each item of its 
production or sales. If the owner or 
manager never had a thorough 
business education, he would bet-
ter study this subject. Trade pap-
era and business text-books will 
enable him to analyse hia coats ac-
curately. The successful manager 
will say he keeps a dose eye on 
the little leaks. They may become 
big losses if allowed to continue. 

As a whole the country's busi-
ness is much more efficiently run 
than in former years. I t takes in-
telligence and system and hard 
work to manage business success-
fully. The people who do it confer 
a favor on the community by em-
ploying labor and serving the pub-
lic efficiently. 
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lllness Fatal to 
Mrs. V.E. Armstrong 

The community was greatly 
shocked this week to learn of the 
death of Mrs. Vern E. Armstrong. 
43, which occurred on Tuesday 
night a t 9:00 o'clock In St. Mary's 
hospital. Grand Rapids, where she 
was taken on Sunday. Mrs. Arm-
strong had been In her usual health 
until about the middle of last week. 
She was obliged to take to her bed 
on Friday and soon sank into a 
coma which lasted until hor death. 
Her husband and her mother, Mrs. 
Katie Peetz, were at the bedside 
when the end came. The surviv-
ing children a r e Lawrence, 10; 
Lucille, 17; Charles, 12; and Ed-
ward, 7. 

Funeral rites will be held Friday 
morning at 10:00 o'clock at the 
St. Mary's church, the Rev. Father 
Jewell officiating. Burial will be 
In the Portland cemetery. 

Mrs. Armstrong was held in high 
eateem by all of her frlenda and 
neighbors who unite in extending 
their aincere sympathy to the be-
reaved family. 
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Considerable red It is due the 
Lowell CommOr Council, the Low-
ell Board of Trade, the Lowell Ro-
tary Club and 'he officers of the 
Democrat towrshlp committee for 
their effor ts in presenting to the 
Department of State- the advan-
tages that w iftd accrue to all con-
cerned t h rh^h the establishment 
of a brantet office here for the 
laaulng of pi enaes and plates. 
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FORMER RESIDENT TO B E 
BURIED H E R E FRIDAY 

Charles Foreman received a 
telegram Wednesday telling him of 
the death of his brother, James B. 
Foreman, on Wednesday morning 
at his home In Lansing. 

Mr. Foreman was 82 years of age 
and was a Lowell resident of some 
twenty-five or thirty years ago. 
Besides the brother Charles, he is 
survived by a daughter and three 
sona. 

Funeral services will be held at 
1:80 Friday in Lansing with burial 
in Oakwood cemetery, Lowell. 

Most of us get a s many good 
breaks as bad ones, but we forget 
all about the good ones 

Ben Eatf, Wild Life Writer 
Speaks at Rotary 

Ben Bat . of the Grand Rapids 
Preaa atftT and nationally known 
writer or wild life aubjects, waa 
guest apt iker of Lowell Rotary 
Club on Wedneaday noon of thla 
week. Mi East deacrlbed a hunt-
ing and rfchlng trip made recently 
In the vl Inty of the "Hudson Bay 
country nd St. James' Bay. Mo-
tion plctires were used, most of 
the scen s being laid in a region 
covered -vith barren rocks and de-
void of ill tree growth. A polar 
bear bun was described and trout 
fishing senes shown. 

The ap aker was presented by C 
H. Rune man, program chairman 
Guests present Included E a r l 
Frost, Siranac; Ed. Tanls, Hud-
sonvllle; Henry Davles, Hastings; 
Pat Bethan, Ionia; Carl Mapes, 
Baltlmoi", Md.; and the following 
from Lwell : Dr. J . R. Stryker. 
Rev. R. S. MlUer, Don Dlckeraon, 
Carl Rmclman, Jr., W. C. Doyle 
F. N. fcewell, Glenn Webster and 
E. D. McQueen. 

Mapes Against 
Ludlow Resolution 

Congressman Carl E. Mapea, 
who sp<nt the Chriatmas holidays 
at his liome In Grand Raplda, be-
fore returning to Waahlngton Sat-
urday for the preaent session of 
Congress, declared that he would 
vote against the Ludlow war refer-
endum resolution. 

Mapes said that a popular vote 
before a declaration of war "would 
merely throw the nation Into tur-
moil In event of danger and would 
paralyze the State Department in 
handling foreiftn affairs." 

The ve ten d Michigan Republi-
can said that he did not believe 
any war waa imminent and ex-
pressed the fcellef that the Panay 
Incident was closed. was i 

;r i Manager t Sale 
At A & P Next Week 

Accident Fatal 
To Parnell Man 

Funeral aervlcea for Daniel Jo-
aeph Verlln, 49, of route 2. Ada, 
fatally injured Monday while au-
perviaing the raxing of a Grand 
Trunk railroad yard office a t Mus-
kegon Heights will be held Friday 
a t 9:80 a. m. at S t Patr ick 's 
church, Parnell. Burial will be in 
St. Patr ick 's cemetery. 

He was born in Vergennea town-
ahip, June 28, 1889, and had lived 
in that vicinity all hia life. 

Verlln, who had been employed 
by the Grand Trunk Weatern rail-
road for nearly 20 yeara, waa 
caught in the falling wreckage of 
the Grand Trunk yard office on 
Henry a t , Muakegon Helghta, when 
a guat of wind toppled the struct-
ure. 

Struck on the head by a corner 
of the roof, Verlln was pinned un-
der the wreckage. During the res-
cue work, the debris burst into 
flamea caused by a nearby bonfire, 
and burned for an hour. 

The coroner aald death waa 
caused by fracturea of the akulland 
neck and Internal injuriea. 

Surviving are the widow, Mra. 
Minnie L. Verlln; two aons, Wm. 
and Thomas; two daughters, Betty 
and Phyllis; five slaters, Miss Mary 
Verlln, Mrs. Elizabeth Collins and 
Mrs. Veronica Hutchinson, all of 
Grand Raplda, Mrs. Katharine Bird 
of Ada, and Mrs. Eather Gage of 
Belding; four brothers, John, Rich-
ard and Albert Verlln, all of Grand 
Rapids, and Frank of Rockford. 

Mel Out 
But Still In 

Lowell Man Satisfied 
To Save Jobi of 22 Men 

Kent County 
Starts New Year 
In Good Shape 

First In State 
Financially 

Below will be found paragrapha 
of Intereat regarding Kent Coun-
ty, the paragrapha having been 
gathered from a variety of aourcea: 

County Treaaurer Thomas Vidro 
handled more than $5,500,000 in 
taxes and other public funds in 
1937. On Dec. 20 he had received 
14,526,745 in county funds and 
$995,025 in Kent county welfare 
relief commission funds. Largest 
sum was $1,783,726, received for 
schools in the county. Second lar-
gest sum waa $1,221,756 for roada. 

Firat major public highways in 
Kent county were the road from 
Grandvllle to Bronaon Village, or 
Kalamazoo, and from Grandvllle 
to Black River, both of which were 
developed In 1886-1887. 

The population of Kent county in 
1857 was eatimated a t 1,200. In 1874 
the population of the county was 
Hated a t 62,671. Todays eatimated 
population la 250,000. 

Michigan's firat governor in 
office 100 yeara ago. He waa Steven 
T. Maaon. He waa elected In 1885 
and held office through 1889. Mich-
igan then bad a population of 200,-
000, leaa than that of Kent county 
today, 

February 1, 1938, will be the one-
hundredth anniveraary date of the 
first state appropriation for boring 
the earth. Three thousand dollars 
was set aalde to drill a salt well in 
Kent county. 

More than 6,000 automobile driv-
ing licenaes were issued last year 
by Sheriff Hugh M. Blacklock'a 
office to car ownera residing in 
Kent county outside the city limits. 

Real and personal property in 
Kent county was estimated a t $538,-
628 in 1845. In 1881 the valuation 
had increased to $18,013,810. The 
present assessment valuation is 
eatimated a t $251,427,916. 

Between the opening of the first 
WPA project in Kent county in 
August, 1935, and the doae of buai-
neaa Friday, the last day of 1937, 
the WPA had apent $9,487,800 in 
Kent county, it was reported Fri-
day a t the office of A. D. MacRae, 
district director. Expenditures for 
1987 was $2,886,475. 

C. D. Jewell, head of the district 
auditing department, said tha t the 
average monthly expenditure dur-
ing the year had been $227,250, and 
that 215 projects had been com-
pleted in the county since the WPA 
was started. 

Average monthly employment 
during 1937 was 8,796 persons, with 
3,607 on the rolls as of Friday. 
Peak WPA employment in Kent 
county occurred in January, 1936, 
with 7,930 men employed. At pres-
ent 48 projects are in. operation and 
11 others have been temporarily 
suspended because of adverse wea-
ther conditions. 

Judge Leland W. Carr of Ingham 
county circuit court refused Mon-
day to grant Melville B. McPher-
son, Lowell Republican, a perman-
ent injunction restraining John N. 
Fegan, a Democrat, f rom taking 
over McPherson's position as chair-
man of the state tax commission. 

Judge Carr based his decision on 
the grounds that the legislature, 
while providing a definite term for 
members of the commlaalon, did 
not specify any tenure for the 
chairman. 

"Thla necessarily leads to the 
conclusion that the legislature did 
not intend a definite term for the 
chairman of the tax commission," 
Judge Carr commented. "It Is ap-
parent, on the contrary, that the 
chairman should hold office a t the 
pleasure of the governor." 

Even though denied the right to 
hold the chairmanship, Mr. Mc-
Pherson does not lose his status as 
a commission member. His term 
will not expire until 1941 and he 
will therefore continue as a mem-
ber unless he should, a t some 
future time, voluntarily decide to 
resign from the commission. 

' T h e chairmanship in itself is 
not worth litigation," the veteran 
Republican asserted, denying re-
ports that he would carry the bat-
tle to the supreme court. 

McPherson asserted the office 
"never was the principal point at 
tsme" In the litigation. He said 
the suit was filed originally "to 
protect the Jobs of 22 employes 
whom Mr. Fegan had diamiaaed 
Improperly." 

Fegan relnatated them af te r the 
milt was filed. 

The Atlantic and Pacific Tea 
Company announces that their an-
nual manager's week sale will be 
held In the Lowell store beginning 
Monday, Jan. 10, and ending Satur 
day, Jan. 15. 

This Is an event which Is looked 
forward to each year by large 
numbers of thr if ty buyers and Mr. 
A. V. Walker, manager of the 
Lowell store, la bending every 
effort towarda making thla year'a 
sale the greatest In the history of 
the atore. Mr. Walker extenda a 
cordial invitation to ail to call 'and 
take advantage of ths money sav-
ing opportunities. 

League Baseball 
Pictures Available 

"Batter Up," the fourth official 
sound motion picture to be pro-
duced by the American League In 
cooperation with the Fisher Body 
division of General Motors, will be 
released in January following 
seriee of previews in the eight 
league cities. Entirely new, the 
film was written and directed by 
Lew Fonseca, director of pro-
motion for the league, with Ted 
Husing doing the narration. I t will 
be distributed free of charge by 
the body-building division of the 
automotive concern. 

None of the other 82 counties in 
Michigan is as sound financially 
as Kent county. That was County 
Treasurer Thomaa Vidro's com-
ment as the old year ended. 

"We still have approximately $1,-
000,000 in the general fund and our 
bonded indebtedness, as a govern-
mental unit, is $240,000," he said. 
"The outstanding bonda^ were li 
sued originally in 1912 for county 
roads. They were refunded and the 
first retirements, amounting to 
$15,000, were paid O c t 15. The next 
retirements were to have been paid 
Jan. 1, but that $10,000 was paid 
before New Year'a day." 

Vidro unfolded a story of cautious 
budgeting and spending by the 
county government He aald that 
in addition to "good management,") 
the county was financially In good 
shape because of Increaaed pay-
ments In the last few years on de-
linquent taxes. Moratorium pay-
ments and waiving of Interest and 
penalties also were credited for 
the record. 

Along Main St. 
Hold everything! You will soon 

be able to buy your 1938 auto li-
cense plates In Lowell. t 

Say a glad goodbye to the goofl-
ness of 1937! Bid a fond welcome 
to 1938 with hopes of a bettor un-
derstanding between government 
and business! 

Dr. Jerome G. Thomas, who 
ppent his boyhood in Lowell during 
the time that hia father, John F. 
Thomas, served as superintendent 
of Lowell schools, has been appoint-
ed as merchandising superintend-
ent for the state liquor control 
commission at a yearly salary of 
$7,200. 

Plans have been aet In motion by 
Lowell Rotary Club for holding the 
largest Father and Son banquet 
ever to be held here. I t will be a 
community affair and aeveral of 
the churches already have signified 
their Intention of cooperating. The 
banquet will be held In the high 
school auditorium sometime in 
March and a speaker of prom-
inence Is to be secured. 

A wild bird met with an unusual 
experience at the Charles Doyle 
home a few days ago when it flew 
through an open door of a back 
room and in its quest for food got 
caught in a baited mouse trap. 
Hearing an unusual commotion in 
the room, members of the family 
inveatigated and the bird was re-
leased, apparently none the worse 
f rom its experience. 

The members of the Lowell 
Woman's Club are to be commend-
ed for action taken at their meet-
ing this week Wedneaday when 
they adopted a motion that each 
one should hold herself peraonally 
responsible for placing sand, ashes 
or coarse salt on icy sldewalka 
near her home. Now if something 
could only be done to get rid of 
the icy hummocks along Maln-at 
I t will be too long to wait for the 
warm raina of April to accomplish 
this purpoae. 

C. A Hall plans to open a whole-
sale and retail poultry and sprayer 
equipment atore in the Hostey 
building on West Maln-st. within 
the next ten days, according to 
plans made early this week. The 
firm name will be the American 
Dealers Manufacturing Company. 
Plans are to manufacture poultry 
equipment here a f t e r the present 
stock is exhausted. Mr. tHall, who 
has had many years experience in 
selling and manufacturing poultry 
equipment, will operate the atore 
himself. 

Mrs. Katie Wilson, who was laid 
to rest Monday in Merrlman ceme-
tery a t the age o( 80 years, was one 
of the benefldaries ot the will of 
the late Ernest R . Graham, inter-
nationally famous architect who 
died Nov. 22. 1986 a t his Chicago 
home. Mr. Graham was born in 
Lowell, and went to Chicago in 
1888. Mr. Graham left an estate 
valued a t more than $1£70,000 and 
by the terms of the win Mrs. Wil-
son was bequeathed a l i f t im 
of $800 annually. Mr. Graham's 
fa ther and Mrs. Wilson's fa ther 
were twin brothers. Among Mr. 
Graham's other bequeats was ens 
to Dr. Wilber E. Post of Chicago, 
a graduate of Lowell high school, 
who was given a life annuity of 
$2,000. 

The passing last Saturday of 
Herman Kraf t , of Grand Raplda, 
brother of Charles Kra f t and Mrs. 
William Gramer, both of Lowell, 
recalls the fact that their father, 
Valentine K r a f t who passed aiway 
in 1890, was the proprietor of one 
of Lowell's early day manufactur-
ing Instltutlona, a wagon factory, 
which was atarted here about the 
year 1868 and which continued in 
operation until 1890. This factory 
was a three-story building which 
stood on Eaat Main street on the 
site now occupied by the Central 
Michigan Office Chair Co. I t la 
believed that a t least two of the 
Kra f t wagons are still in more or 
less use, one of which Is owned by 
Ernest Althaus, northwest of Low-
ell. The other wagon was owned 
by the late John Rlttenger. 

Famous Band 
To Give Concert 

The Federal Symphony Band of 
Grand Rapids has been secured to 
play a t a concert here on Friday 
evening, January 14. Last year the 
Symphony Orchestra played to a 
surprised and pleased audience in 
Lowell, surprised because they 
thought it impossible to bring such 
an orchestra here and pleaaed be-
cause they actually enjoyed it. 

The band is Just as good an 
ovganization as the orchestra, if 
not better, especially for the large 
group who favor band music. It is 
under the capable direction of L. 
D. Bullard, who for many years led 
the best theater orchestras in 
Grand Raplda. Mr. Bullard pro-
miaes that the program will not be 
"heavy" but to use hia own worda, 
"We'll make it an entertaining 
program." 

The concert will be given in the 
High School auditorium, brought 
here by the Lowell High School 
Band and Orchestra Association. 
The prices are 10c and 25c. Cheap 
enough for anyone and entertain-
ing to all. 

Notice, Taxpayers 
After January 10, I will collect 

taxea every Saturday a t the State 
Savings Bank until the last week 
in February, af ter which date I 
will be at the bank every day. Dog 
taxes will be delinquent a f te r Mar. 
1, instead of June L 

ROSELLA YETTER 
cS4 Township Treasurer 

Herman Kraft Dies 
At Age of 70 

Funeral services were held in 
Grand Rapids Tuesday aftasnoon 
for Herman Kraf t , 70, who passed 
away last Saturday a t his home in 
that city. Mr. Kra f t was a former 
well known Lowell resident. 

Surviving Mr. Kraf t are the 
widow, Fanny; two daughters, Mrs. 
H. A. Amidon of Greenville and 
Verna L. Kra f t of Grand Rapids; 
a brother, Charles Kra f t of Low-
ell; four sisters, Mrs. Wm. Gramer 
of Lowell, Mrs. Henry Petersen, 
Miss Emma Kra f t and Miss Louise 
Kraf t , all of Grand Rapids, and 
three grandchildren. 

Burial was in Greenwood ceme-
tery in Grand Raplda 

Strand Calendar 

Old Banks to Make 
Another Pay-Off 

City State and Lowell State 
To Pay Out $21,750 

The New Year brings good news 
to former depositors of the City 
State Bank of Lowell and the Low-
ell State Bank. By action of the 
boards of directors of both of the 
above corporations at the annual 
meetings held thla week, a 6</r 
dividend was voted to holdera of 
certlflcatea of Indebtedness. This 
action will release a total of $21,-
750 and will become payable on 
February 1. 

Below is the summary of the 
activities of both corporations dur-
ing the past year and their present 
s tatus: 

The annual meetings of the City 
State Depositors Corporation and 
the Lowell State Depositors Cor-
poration were held at the offices 
of the corporations on Monday 
Jan. 3 and Tuesday, Jan . 4, 1938. 
The vacancy on the Board of the 
City State Depositors Corporation 
occasioned by the death of W. S. 
Winegar was filled by E. C. Fore-
man of Lowell, Michigan. F. H, 
Swarthout waa again appointed 
liquidator for both corporatlona 
with Mrs. Stanley Beach acting as 
ass is tant 

City State Report 

The annual report of the City 
State D e p o s i t o r s Corporation 
showed a net reduction in assets 
of $48,166.77; the payment of a 10% 
liquidating dividend to Impounded 
depositors of $20,498^2 as of July 
15, 1937; and the total elimination 
of borrowed money. Book value of 
the corporation's aasets now atands 
at $211,823.95. Income collected 
from aasets exceeded regular coats 
of liquidation by $487.90 for the cur-
rent year while a survey of this 
particular feature reveals that, 
since the actual opening of the 
offices of this corporation on Aug-
ust 20, 1934, the total income has 
exceeded expense of liquidation by 
$4,509.72. Such report reflected the 
sale of four farma, two village 
propertlea, and the passing of title 
to the former City State Bank 
building. There atill remaina on 
hand one farm, one dwelling In the 

Village of Lowell, a two-family 
f la t In Grand Rapids, and a store 
building in Detroit. The present 
officers of this corporation are: 
President, George Klahn; vice 
president, E. C. Foreman; secre-
tary-treasurer, J . B. Nicholson. 

Lowell State Report 
The assets of the Lowell State 

Depositors Corporation reflected 
a net reduction of $63,484.35, no div-
idends paid to Impounded deposi-
tors since November 4, 1936, but 
a complete elimination of bills pay-
able totalling $21,822.02. Income 
collected from assets was also In 
excess of regular liquidating costs 
by the sum of $1,965.15, and a total 
excess of earnings over expenses 
to date and since August 20, 1934 
amounting to $5,791.60. Book value 
of remaining assets to be liquidated 
totals $210,038.99. This corporation 
reported the sale of the Sherman 
farm, Yelter Block, and the Low-
ell State Bank building and fix-
tures. There remains on the books 
a t the present time six farms, one 
garage, one dwelling in Grand 
Raplda, and one lot In Detroit The 
officers of thla corporation are. 
Prealdent F. F. Coons; vice prea-
Ident, C. E. Bowen; secretary-
treasurer, R. G. Jefferles. 

01,780.00 To Be Distributed 
Funds being on hand in a suffi-

cient amoun t both corporations 
declared, subject to final State 
Banking Department approval, a 
5% liquidating dividend upon the 
original amounts of Certificates 
of Indebtedness now outstanding. 
Such dividend was declared pay-
able on February 1, 1938 to certi-
ficate holders of record as of Jan-
uary 15, 1938, thus making avail-
able to the people of thla commun-
ity the aum of $21,750.00. There still 
remaina on hand and uncalled for a 
large number of dividend checka 
for dividenda previously declared. 
The officers of both corporations 
would appreciate your calling for 
such tha t the checks might be 
cashed and the money again turn-
ed Into productive enterprise. 

Odds unci Ends 
H e r e and T h e r e 

Brief Paragrapha of News and 
Information on a Variety 

of Topics 

Sizeable exports of automobiles, 
aircraft. Iron and steel and agricul-
tural products gave the United 
States a $91,456,000 favorable trade 
balance for November, the com-
merce department reports. 

The latest open dissension with-
in the Tennessee Valley Author-
ity directorate has bolstered senti-
ment among Senators for an In-
vestigation to find out what really 
Is going on. 

The public works administration 
reports that It expended $17,421,669 
in Michigan from the date of Its 
inception through June 30, 1937. 
Michigan PWA expenditures for 
1937 totaled $9,792,799, the report 
says. 

The President Is determined to 
try to close the breach between 
the Administration and the active 
business men of the country as 
contrasted with the financial men, 
who still remain out of favor a t 
the White House. 

There doesn't seem to have been 
any "recession" In tax yields; on 
the contrary Internal revenue col-
lections for the first eleven months 
of the year Just closed show a total 
of $2,060,746,577, an Increase of 
$674,980,650 over the same period a 
year ago. 

Old Program 
Recalls Days of 
SO Years Ago 

An Interesting old invitation con-
taining the names of many of 
Lowell's prominent citlzena of fif-
ty yeara ago has been brought In 
to the Ledger office by Mrs. M. E. 
Simpson. The invitation was for 
a "Centennial Inauguration Party" 
given by Rlckert 's orchestra on 
April 30, 1889, a t the Lowell Music 
Hall. 

The orchestra members included 
J. H. Rickert, Bert E. Quick. F. W. 
Tarleton, J . W. Maynard, G. Wor-
den, Dell Tarleton, H. A. Sherman, 
M. D. Wilson, J . A. Mattern, and 
R. D. Stocking. 

Among the committee-members 
listed on the Invitation were the 
names of the following Lowell busi-
nessmen: Will M. Hine, C. G. 
Stone, Chaa. Althen, S. P. Hicks, 
J . Q. Look, S. E. Morgan, D. G. 
Look and J. C. Moore. 

Of the names mentioned above 
of those taking part in this pro-
gram of nearly f if ty years ago, 
four are still living as follows: Dr. 
J . H. Rickert, brother of Mrs. D. 
G. Look, in England; F. W. Tarle-
ton, E m m e t t Idaho; M. D. Wilson, 
brother of Mrs. Hatt le Peckham, 
Houston, Tex.; and Ber t E. Quick, 
Lowell, Mich. 

Lifelong Resident 
Dies at Age 80 

CALf NDAR of 
COMING fV£NT5 — = # = -

The Ped tham Division will meet 
with Mrs. Hatt le Peckham on Fri-
day afternoon, Jan. 7. 

The Fortnightly Club will meet 
Jan. 11 with Mrs. D. H. Oatley. 

The aecond meeting of the Low-
ell Extension class will be held on 
Tuesday, Jan. 18, a t Viola Van-
Vorst'a with Mablo Stauffer and 
Sue Houseman assisting. Lesson 
on Making Slip Covers will begin 
promptly a t 11 o'clock. All mem-
bers t ry to be present Bring own 
table service.—Anna Ellis. 

The Kent County Odd Fellow 
Association meets with Lowell 
Lodge on Monday, Jan . 10, a t the 
City hall at eight o'clock. Every-
body Invited. 

The Keene Jolly Community Club 
will meet a t the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. J ake Staal on Wednesday, 
Jan. 19, for an all day meeting and 
election of officers. Would like to 
have each division respond on the 
year's work. Members please try 
to be present. 

A pancake supper will be put on 
by the PTA of the Whltneyvllle 
school a t the school house at six 
o'clock on Friday, Jan. 14. C. H. 
R u n d m a n of Lowell will be the 
speaker. Everyone invited. p34 

Now that the Statue of Liberty 
has had her face lifted, additional 
funds provided by the WPA, 
amounting to $158,328, will enable 
her custodians to put her in first-
class condition and make her bea-
con aa damp-proof as modern 
science knows how. 

The steel Industry after apply-
ing the slide rule to its employ-
ment statistics finds that two out 
of every five steel employes are 
more than 40 years old. The aver-
age steel worker'a age la 38 yeara, 
Just two years more than the aver-
age age in the industry in 1930. 

Shortest name in the United 
States is "E" according to the 
Social Security Board's check of 
some 36,000,000 namea in ita card 
catalogue. Most c o m m o n is 
"Smith," leading with 392,000; 
next "Johnson" with 300,000. Close 
followers are "Brown," "Williams" 
and "Jones." 

American highway fatalities dur-
ing the year 1937 top all records 
with 40,300 deaths and 1,060,000 
non-fatal injuries. The Increase in 
fatalltiee during 1937 ia slightly 
over 6 per cent more than In 1936. 
Nearly 3,000 more killed than the 
total of American army battle 
caaurUtiea during the World War! 

Having counted noses, U n d e 
Sam ia now going to count horns. 
As part of the program to conserve 
natural resources the Department 
of Interior's Division of Grazing is 
g d n g to take a census oif the deer, 
antelope and elk, and other forms 
of wildlife which roam the 142,-
000,000 acres of public range set 
aside by the Taylor Grazing A c t 

Fire Chief Ernest C. Daunter of 
Jackson plana to take hia aon to 
Lansing to show some one in the 
secretary of state's office that 
Harold Daunter 's height really is 
six feet nine and one-half inches. 
The height was recorded that way 
on an automobile operator's license 
application which was returned 
with a request for a correction. 

The President is prepared to 
sign the f a rm surplus control bill 
that emerges f rom a conference 
between the Senate and House, re-
gardless of the fact that it will 
contain no provision for financing 
the plan. The idea ia to word the 
final bill in audi a way as to leave 
the question of cost indefinite, 
thereby enabling the White House 
to delay a request for more reve-
nue to meet that cost. 

Another great thriller by Sax 
Rohmer, author of Dr. F u Manchu, 
appears in This Week, the color-
gravure magazine with next Sun-
day's Detroit News. If you like 
daring and adventure, read "Count 
D'Ambro's Window." On sale a t 
Chriatianaen'a or phone for de-
livery. adv 

Miss Edna Allen's division will 
v . t h . r i n * w n . « „ entertain the Greene Circle at the 

# T "«ii W 8 o n ' P l o n e e r church house on Tuesday evening, 
FriH.v ' , Z V 0 ° " P l . n . «re M n / m . d e (?r 

the homV of lfer Nephew, 1 U m t 1 ' :<>rd l«1 

Graham, In Grand Raplda 
Katherlne Graham was born in 

Lowell township on October 6, 1857. 
In 1880 she was united in marriage 
to David A. Wilson, who preceded 
her In death in 1919. 

Her entire life was spent In 
Lowell and vicinity, except for the 
time spent with her nephew in 
Grand (Rapids. 

Her many aincere friends in-
cluded the young and the old, all 
being attracted by her sunny dis-
poaltlon and her desire to do all 
that ahe could to make others 
happy. 

Beaides the nephew whom she 
has mothered from childhood, she 
la survived by a alster, Mra. Sarah 
Wallace of Saskatchewan, Can., a 
brother, Slgel Graham of Alberta 
Can., and aeveral niecea and 
nephews. 

Funeral services were held Mon-
day afternoon at the Congrega-
tional church in Lowell where she 
had been a member of long stand-
ing. 

"The long road has led Into the 

The January meeting of the 
Methodist Ladies Aid will be held 

„ . . j __ on Friday, Jan. 7, a t the home of 
vaUey where pain and sorrow M r B N e ] | l e X n d r e w 8 
never come.' 

Although we have no acceaa to 
atatiatlcs. our general observation 
is that insanity is increasing. 

Friday and Saturday, Jan. 7-8— 
•Confession" with Kay Francis, 

Ian Hunter and Basil Rathbone; 
also "Renfrew of the Royal 
Mounted" with James Hewlll, Car-
ol (Hughes and "Lightning." 

Sunday and Monday, Jan 9-10— 
Edna Ferber and George S. Kauf-
man's sensational Broadway stage 
success, "Stage Door." Those glrla 
who gamble everything for a fling 
at footllght fame—their Uvea, their 
loves and their tragedies, played 
by such notable players as Ginger 
Rogers, Katherlne Hepburn, Gall 
Patrick, Adolph Menjou, Constance 
Collier and many others. Also com-
edy, single and the now famoua 
"Big Apple" on the screen, plus 
Pathe Newa. 

Tuesday and Wedneaday, Jan. 11-
12—''Mr. Dodda Takes the Air,' 
with Kenny Baker, Frank Mc-
Hugh, Alice Brady, Jane Wyman 
and Gertrude Michael; also Buck 
Jones in "Black Aces." Pathe News . . , , . . . . . 

Thursday, Jan. 13— Barbara I , l k e b « , t , n ^ American Weekly, 
Stanwyck and Herbert Marshall l n , t h e S1"®*1 w " k , y magazine which 
"Breakfast for Two" with G l e n d a l c o m « • regularly with The Detroit 
Farrell and Eric Blore; also B r u c e

 s»""lay Tlmea. See this Sunday's 
Cabot and Beatrice Roberts in 'wue. adv 
"Love Takea Flight," plua Fox 

invitation is extended to everyone. 

The Women'a Democrat Club 
will meet Monday, Jan . 10, a t reg-
ular club rooma. At their laat 
meeting they held a Chriatmaa 
party, a tree and exchange of 
gifts. All enjoyed a good time.— 
Secy. 

The Social Arta Lesson will be 
held on Tuesday, J an . 11, a t the 
City hall at 1:30. This will be an 
open meeting to anyone wishing 
to attend. The lesson will be given 
by Miss Eleanor Densmore of 
Michigan State College on "Table 
Etiquette and Table Service." 
Please bring notebooks and pen-
dla. 

Regular communication of Low-
ell Lodge, No. 90, F. A A. M.. Tues-
day evening, Jan. 11, 7:30 o'clock. 
Work on Fellowcraft degree.—D. A. 
Wlngeler, W. M. 

A 81,300.00 YEARLY 
LIFE INCOME TO BE WON 

' W h a t Interests You — And 
Why?", a great new contest, o f fe r s 

^ r a l ^ W - -Pond an eve-
your life! No riddlea to do! No' J ' * ® ' * a n d C O m e 

puzzles to solve! Just tell what you! ^ ' 

Don't forget the South Bell PTA 
to be held at the school house on 
Friday evening, Jan. 14. A penny 
supper will be served at 7:30 p. m., 
followed by a short buslneas meet-
ing and a play, "Look Out, Liz-

News. 

Read the Ledger ads. 

Beauty treatments aeem to do 
thk least fo r thoae who need 'em 
m o s t 

JANUARY CLEARANCE SALE | 

Coons' January clearance sale of 
sulta and overcoats is now on. Thla 
event offera an oppoftunlty for 
big aavings on men's clothing. 

The Rev. Father Charles E . 
Coughlin will s tart his new series 
of radio broadcasts Jan. 9 over a 
network of 60 stations, it was an-
nounced Saturday. The weekly 
broadcasts will be a half-hour long, 
beginning at 4 p. m., and will 
originate from WJR. F a t h e r 
Coughlin said that he would devote 
his talks to "pertinent thoughts on 
labor, unions, wages, finance, debt, 
politics, peace and war." 

Left wing agitators are trying to 
produce friction between the Pres-
ident and certain members of his 
Cabinet who are known to lean to 
the conservative side. A favorite 
technique Is to build publicity 
around second string men In the 
departments who are made to ap-
pear anxious to carry out "liberal" 
objectives, but to feel their efforts 
are being frustrated by superiors. 
The President is said to be well 
aware of these tactics and their 
implications. 

In a year-end check of hia de-
partment 's books Auditor General 
George T. Gundry reveala tha t 
allghtly more than alxty thouaand 
aged residents of Michlgsn are 
now receiving old age asalstance. 
This is an Increase of twenty-
three thouaand over the number 
aided by the State at the end of 
the fiscal year laat July lat . 'The 
bill for Old Age Aaaiatance now 
amounts to $1,200,000.00 per month, 
with the State paying f i f ty per 
cent, or $600,000.00 and the Federal 
Government the reat," Mr. Gundry 
reports. 

# 

"The American home owner is 
the world's beat riak." Take it f rom 
the (Home Ownera' Loan corpora-
tion, which poured out almost 
$3,100,000,000 to aome million home 
ownera who had been ducklqg that 
man with the mortgage during the 
dark daya of the depreaaion. The 
HOIX? hopea to end its career in 
the black if the terma of the con-
tracts with Its borrowera remain 
unchanged, with 13 years to go, a 
total of $719,811,590 had been paid 
back to the HOLC up to October 
31. Of this amount $327,611,731 was 
in principal and $392,369,859 in in-
terest. About 85 per cent of the 
loan accounts a t present, the HOLC 
reported, were either current or 
held by borrowers who are meeting 
current monthly obligations plus 
regular a r rear payments. The 
HOLC said 24,970 loana, totaling 
$56,229,136 have been paid in full 
up to Oct. 31. 

We've tried everything and we 
think that flab are perfect pets. 

If a man sits down in an easy 
chair and waits for the automobile 
of succesa to come along he will 
never get there. 
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A SOUND DOCTRINE 
Every governmental official or board that handles public money 

should publish at regular Intervals an accounting of It, showing 
where and how each dollar Is spent. We hold this to be a funda-
mental principle of domestic government 

/ v p D f R N 

W P / A f N 
Changing Doctors by A. B. CHAP1N 

By OENE ALLEMAN 
Michigan Press Association 

E A R L E N E W H I T E 
President of The Ns-
tional Federation of Bust-
mtm and Profeuional 

Women't Cubs, Inc. 

The Farm Income Analysed 

Lansing, Jan. 6—Like Alice in 
Wonderland Is the conclusion Just 
voiced here by Verne H. Church, 
statistician of the state department 
of agriculture, that Michigan's 
farm Income went up 14 per cent 

The revival of needle-work has during 1937 or $31,000,000 while Its 

fOfi 

ETTER HEALTH 
5/Dr.J.ROSSLYN EARP 

Direaor, N«w Mexico Bureau of Public Health 

EPIDEMIC BLEEDING 

From the surgeon's point of view 
war is an epidemic—of blood let-
ting pnd Infected injuries. Immedi-
ate danger of death to the victims 
of this epidemic results from loss 
of blood. Those who survive this 
risk must face other risks of muti-
lation or death from Infection. 

The Spanish war has shown us 
the first organized attempt to com-
bat blood loss on an epidemic 
scale. As much as ten gallons of 
blood have been sent dally from 
Barcelona to the Spanish govern-
ment front. Young women are glad 
to answer radio appeals to act aa 
donors and literally to "shed their 
blood" for their country. The blood 
Is "typed" and collected Into sealed 

Is then cooled to freezing point and 
sent up to the front, being kepi In 
refrigerators until needed. Before 
use the ampoules are slowly heated 
to body temperature. 

During the Spanish-American 
war 3,000 of our soldiers died of 
typhoid fever, 345 were killed In 
battle. During the World War, our 
soldiers having been Inoculated 
against typhoid fever, only 227 died 
from that dlHcasc. But 36,694 were 
killed In action and 13,700 died of 
wounds. In the next war medical 
science may triumph over deaths 
from wounds as It has already 
triumphed over typhoid fever. Of 
course man should use some of his 
Ingenuity In Inventing an alterna-
tive to war. The very best way to 

glass ampoules under pressure. It fight an epidemic Is to prevent It. 

C a l > p t " c S 
FRtp W. BRAUH 

WkSafUtfWanJf/fy 
Do you believe In New Year's 

resolutions? Whether you do or 
not, you love life, and because of 
that you should resolve not only to 
keep that life but also to protect 
the lives of others. 

Therefore why not make a good 
New Year's resolution for 1938 and 
live up to It? Here are just few 
suggestions: 

L I will be a safe pedestrian. 
2. I will be a safe driver by ex-

ercising care and by protecting 
the rights of others. 

3. I will not take foolish chances. 
4. I will help others to drive and 

walk safely. 

While there could be many more 
resolutions added to these, they 
will be enough .If they are faith-
fully carried out. 

Make your New Year's resolu-
tions now to see 1938 through 
safely. 

Sayings by 

Other Editors 
ANOTHER "FRANKENSTEIN" 

Grand Rapids Chronicle, Dec. 24: 
Economists tell us that the pres-

ent business recession can be 
traced in no small par t to the de-
baole In Michigan last January. 

The Chronicle was one of the 
first publications In the state to 
cry out against the breakdown of 
government in Michigan. In our 
January, 1937, Issues appeared sev-
eral editorials. One was entitled 
"Has Michigan's Government 
Failed?" In another this ra ther 
prophetic paragraph appeared: 
"This strike is no Isolated pheno-
menon; If it continues much long-
er It may mean the beginning of 
another depression." 

Well, here we are, and the same 
Governor who inade the sit-down 
possible Is apparently getting 
ready to raise another "f ranken-
steln." 

been in progress for some time, 
yet It astonished me to learn that 
In a Kentucky town It has reached 
a million-dollar Industry which was 
established sixteen years ago by 
Mrs. D. M. Beard. The Industry 
grew out of a dilemma when she 
and her husband found they had 
quantities of wool on hand, but 
could get very little for It. Some 
one suggested that she use It in 
hand-sewn comforters. At the start, 
the work was done by three wom-
en. Mrs. Beard now employs hun-
dreds of women. 

Experience in Indiana and Se-
attle, Washington, helped to pre-
pare Miss Louise Jorzlck for her 
present Important job. which Is 
that of assistant secretary to the 
New York World's Fair 1939 coi^ 
poratlon. 

Miss Emma Castella, a govern-
ment clerk In Washington, D. C., 
took over the management of a 
small hotel in the national capital 
which was on the verge of failure 
and has made It a success. 

After thirty-five years of service 
as curator-in-chlef of the Brooklyn 
Children's Museum, Miss Anna 
Billings Gallup has retired. When 
she took charge In 1902, It was the 
first children's museum In the 
world. 

N O M E 

Date Squares 

One cup finely chopped dates, 1 
cup broken nut meats (pecans or 
English walnuts). 1 cup granulated 
sugar, \ cup flour, 2 eggs, 1 tea-
spoon baking powder, % teaspoon 
sa l t teaspoon vanilla. 

Beat eggs until light and add 
sugar. S i f t flour, salt and baking 
powder over dates and nuts and 
add with vanilla to f irst mixture. 
Spread thin In buttered pans and 
bake thirty minutes In a slow oven 
(325 degrees F.). Cut in one-inch 
squares while hot and roll In 
powdered sugar. 

Hermits 

Ledger Want Ads. pay. 

Repairs are not quite so likely to 
be necessary to the man who pre-
pares. 

F A R M I N G I T . . . BY WILLARD BOLTE 

IS MUCH EASIER ON 1>4E H08SC5 
THAN FOUft A-BRBAST — 
U 5 5 SlOt ORAPf. 

One and one-half cups granu-
lated sugar, % cup butter, 3 eggs,] 
1 teaspoon salt, 1 teaspoon soda, 
cup sour milk, 3% cups flour, 1 
teaspoon cinnamon, 1 cup nut 
meats, % cup candled cherries, % 
cup candled pineapple, 4 table-
spoons candied lemon peel, % tea-
spoon vanilla. 

Cream butter and add sugar. 
Add ^ cup flour and sift remain-
ing flour, cinnamon and salt over 
chopped fruits and nuts. Add eggs 
well beaten to f irst mixture. Dis-
solve soda in sour milk and add. 
Add floured f ru i t and nuts and 
mix well. Add vanilla and drop 
from teaspoon onto a buttered and 
floured cookie shee t Bake fifteen 
minutes In a moderate oven (330 
degrees F.). 

'TWO-MAN TAMPER.' 

NO CALF 
CAN TUDN THIS 
BUCKET OVER 

Agricultural engineers have def-
initely proven that the tandem 
hitch is much easier on the horse 
than is any other type of h i t c h -
j e t a t least nine out of ten farmers 
•till hitch four-abreast when they 
a r e using four hones . Do you know 
why? 

Ever get tired of holding feed 
pai ls for rambunctious calves? 

Jus t saw a wooden barrel in half— 
cut a socket hole in the top—and 
let the barrel hold the paiL You will 
get less milk on your shoes that 
way. 

Two men can make light work of 
heavy tamping by cutting a Sft 
foot section from a 12-inch log and 
spiking on two handles, as shown 
in the drawing. 

agricultural crops brought $27,000,-
000 l e s H cash on the market than 
did 1936 crops. 

And while you are scratching 
your heads, here Is the answer— 
and It Is of Interest to Main St ree t 

Michigan farmers have been 
withholding a part of their 1937 
crops from market, waiting for 
better cash prices. 

The situation is parallel that of 
one year ago when the 1937 farm 
Income went up sharply due to 
marketing of holdover 1936 crops. 
In fact, this hold-over selling was 
chiefly responsible for the 14 per 
cent Increase. 

The blrd-ln-the-hand Is this: 
Michigan farmers have had 14 per 
cent more money to spend. 

The United States department of 
agriculture adds cheer with the 
announcement that the nation's 
farm Income—and most of this 
money Is spent on Main street in 
small towns—is estimated at NINE 
BILUONS for 1937. Well, this is a 
lot of money. There Is still money 
to be spent and made on Michi-
gan's Main Streets. 

State Income Tax? 

New sources of public revenue 
are constantly being sought by 
politicians. Michigan's legislature 
enacted a "use" tax on outstate 
purchases and expects to pick up 
two million dollars during 1938. 
The legislature authorized an in-
crease of the state's "profit" In li-
quor sales—three millions to be 
applied annually on Improvements 
of state hospitals. 

Now and then the cry is raised: 
Tax the income! 

Thirty-six states has Income tax 
laws a t present Colorado and 
Maryland being the latest to join 
the list in 1937. 

Twenty-eight states have sales 
taxes—Alabama and Kansas enact-
ing such laws In 1937. 

Many home governments in 
Michigan declare that the 15 mill 
tax limitation on local property 
taxation leaves them but one alter-
native: Go to the state for more 
money 

Thus during 1937 the legislature 
was asked to appropriate money 
for township roads, local schools, 
local libraries, local snow removal, 
and so on. The list is long and im-
pressive. 

The administration a t Lansing 
thus is between the devil and the 
deep sea: Either induce local gov-
ernments to "lay o f f the legisla-
ture or find new revenue sources 
to pay the Increasing cost of cen-
tralized state government 

According to the United States 
Chamber of Commerce, one-fifth 
of the national income in 1938 will 
be paid in taxes. Last year saw 
state legislatures pass about 1,100 
new tax laws. 

W h a t is the answer? I t is a prob-
lem worthy of every citizen's at-
tention. And when the legislature 
reconvenes, probably In February, 
it will pay you big dividends to 
keep a watchful eye on your legis-
lators. 

went Into effect January 1 and 
approximately 16,000 state em-
ployees are now being governed 
by Its regulations. 

The phrase "civil service" has 
been glorified Into a label of right-
eousness, smacking almost of be-
ing a cure-all or preventive for 
political spolllsm. 

Actually, the state law means 
just this: 

After a state employee has pass-
ed a qualifying examination and 
has been regularly appointed to 
the classified civil service, he may 
be dismissed at any time. Cause 
for dismissal: That the good of 
the state is being served. 

If the employee suspects that the 
dismissal was unfair, he may ap-
peal to the civil service commiss-
ion. The commission's authority Is 
limited to that of transferring the 
dismissed employee to another de-
partment within 30 days if a va-
cancy exists and If the employee 
Is capable of performing the new 
duties. 

If a department head wants an-
other worker, he requisitions the 
civil service commission and the 
worker is assigned. 

The new law can easily be 
abused. I t can become a mere ex-
cuse for genuine civil service. Re-
sults will be determined chiefly by 
the administrative leaders and the 
commission, the director of which 
is William Brownrlgg lately of 
California. 

Children In Court 
By Judge Malcolm Hatfield 

Civil Service Begins 

Af ter months of advance publi-
city, Michigan's civil service law 

Alcohol and Politics 

Mixing alcohol with gasoline Is 
dangerous. And so Is mixing al-
cohol with politics. 

The recent hubbub in Lansing 
over the disclosure that various 
state pfflclals and employees re-
ceived "gifts" of liquor a t Christ-
mas—the said "gifts" being charged 
to the accounts of distillers and 
d is t r ibutors-has served to remind 
the public that state control of li-
quor is a double-barreled problem. 

Firs t the state must control the 
liquor business. 

And then the public must control 
the s tate that controls the liquor 
business. When distillers received 
a letter from Irving Huston, sec-
re tary of the liquor commission, 
advising them that the liquor had 
been distributed as gif ts to deserv-
ing parties and bad been charged 
against their accounts here, news-
papers published a sensational ex-
pose of the whole mess. It 's just 
another chapter in the thrilling 
continued serial: "Demon Rum vs. 
the State of Michigan." 

Good Credit Bisks 

Michigan farmers are a good 
credit risk. 

Such is the conclusion of a sur-
vey of rural banks just completed 
by Michigan State College through 
its economic depar tment 

The average Michigan -farmer 
pays his bank debt within 12 
months, despite d rough t floods 
and other weather factors which 
affect crop production. Further-
more, the farmer's loans are well 
planned and sensible for the most 
p a r t In other words, the loans are 
for the purpose of better farming 
—machinery, stock, equipment 
and so on. 

These facts are of importance 
in view of the newly enacted Bank-
head-Jones act which provides 
long-term loans to tenant farmers 
for purchase of farms. Two out of 
five farmers work others' lands. 

But It's True ! 

In seeking the causes for the 
United States having three and a 
half million criminals a t large, 
those who are interested in crime 
prevention are now scanning the 
types of reading material which 
our present day criminals read 
when they were passing through 
their adolescent years. 

I t has been found that a score or 
so years ago youngsters were per-
mitted to attend motion picture 
theatres and read books and maga-
zines which not only dealt with 
murders, wars, cattle rustling, and 
Indian massacres, but in many in-
stances the plots were based on 
morbid and depressing subjects. 

Even the public schools of twen-
ty or thirty years ago assigned 
outside reading material which, 
while although literature, also por-
trayed violence and morbid con-
ditions. Among the assigned read-
ings were The Black Cat and Gold 
Bug by Foe, Les Miserables by 
Hugo, Oliver Twist and Nicholas 
Nlchofcy by Dickens, The Deer-
slayer. Spy, and Last of the Mo-
hicans by Cooper, Ivanhoe by 
Scot t Treasure Island by Steven-
son, and The White God by Wal-
lace. 

Educators and others Interested 
in present day crime prevention 
are wondering whether the reading 
material of several decades ago 
might have Indirectly stimulated 
c t r ta ln present day criminals, 
when they were adolescent youths, 
with a desire to imitate the deeds 
of dar ing which their favorite 
characters performed. 
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V O U CAM LEAD 

A FOOL TO TALK, 

BUT YOU CAN'T 

MAKE HIM (OR 

HER.) THINK 

Ledger Entries 
UNEMPLOYMENT BENEFITS 

B U S I N E S S is expected to receive 
something of a stimulus about 

February 1, f rom the payment of 
unemployment benefits under the 
new Insurance system. These bene-
f i t s will be paid quite soon in 21 
states that have accepted the new 
system. Eight other states will 
s t a r t such payments later in the 
year. I t is expected the whole 
country will be covered In 1939. 

This new system represents the 
most ambitious at tempt In our 
country's history to offset the evils 
and misfortunes caused by lack of 
work. The check paid the workless 
wage earner will be a godsend to 
him, and will cheer him and his 
family in those days of Idleness, 
when the world seems to have 
passed him by and to have failed 
to give him any chance to make 
good. 

I t is strange that in a world 
where there is so much to de done, 
and where human needs are so 
acute, that systems can not be 
found for providing work for 
everybody. I t is not so easy to pro-
vide those systems as it may look. 
They boast in Communist Russia 
t h a t there is no unemployment 
Yet the s tandards of living and 
human welfare are f a r lower there 
than here. 

The success of the new unem-
ployment benefit system will de-
pend largely on how prolonged the 
periods of unemployment shall be. 
If such periods last only a short 
time, the benefits will do much to 
keep money in circulation and sup-
port ' ' the purchasing power of the 
people. But if unemployment on a 
great scale should continue a long 
time, the reserves created for these 
payments would probably be ex-
hausted. and these benefits would 
have to stop, or else be made up 
by taxing the whole people to pay 
them. 

Unemployment beneflts will help 
tide over periods of hard times, 
but some plan tha t would help 
business run regularly, so there 
should be little unemployment 
would produce more dependable 
prosperity. 

White's Bridge 
B. M. D. 

Arthur Ridpway, Mrs. Sarah 
Darius and Mrs. Lovisa Ridgway 
were Sunday dinner guests of Mrs. 
Oma Shear. 

Mr. and Mrs. Milo Hornbrook 
and son were New Year's guests 
of their parents, Mr. and Mrs. J ake 
Mooney. 

Miss Violet VanOcker is spend-
ing a few days with her brother 
Ted and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Mallory of 
Lowell were Monday supper guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Ray IngersoU. 

Ledger Want Ads. pay. 

McCorcTs Matters 
• Mrs. f t T. Williams 

'Mr. and M r a Roy Bloomer en-
tertained the Sit Down Club Sat-
urday n igh t Mr. and Mrs. Ed. 
Bigler won head honors while Mrs. 
Walter Clark and Herm Shimmel 
won consolations. 

Mrs. Walter Clark spent several 
days in Grand Rapids last week 
with her son, G. H Clark and fam-
ily. 

Mrs. Ray Linton of Alto, Mrs. 
Jack Rockefellow, Mrs. Walter 
Clark and M r a Jennie Williams 
were dinner guests of Mra George 
Lane in Grand Rapids Monday 
n igh t 

Mr. and Mrs. A. E . Wood enter-
tained Mr. and Mrs. Fred Pattlson 
of Alto New Years for dinner. 

Mr. and Mrs. Myron Henry and 
Kenneth Keiser were Sunday din-
ner guests a t the A. E. Wood home. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Lane and 
Mr. and Mrs. George Clark of 
Grand Rapids were supper guests 
a t the Clark-Williams home Sun-
day night 

Mr. and M r a Otis Vreeland of 
Green Lake entertained Mr. and 
M r a John Hulzinga and children 
for dinner Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Noffke of 
Ionia visited Mr. and Mrs. John 
Hulzinga New Year's eve. 

Hickory Hollow 
Mrt. Mary lllckert 

Mrs. Dell Hardy has been spend-
ing a few days with her mother, 
Mra. Wlngeler, in Lowell 

Mr. and M r a Ellsworth Raymor 
and son Dtiane of Saranac, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clayton Sparks and children 
and Helen Teff t spent Wednesday 
evening a t the Rickert-Cahoon 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Hunter and 
children of Flint are spending a 
few days with their parents here 
and in Lowell. 

Mr. and Mra Dell Hardy and 
son Rober t Mr. and M r a George 
(Hardy, Jr., and son Jimznie and 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Pinckney and 
children were Sunday guests of 
M r a Wlngeler in Lowell. 
| Sunday evening guests a t the 
Clayton Sparks home were Mr. and 
I Mrs. Lyle Wheaton and family, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Sheldon Myera 
and children of Saranac and their 
sister and family of Owosso. 

Mr. and M r a Guy Rickert are 
working a t the L. M. Cahoon home 
a t the present time. 

The Day school started again on 
Monday af te r the Christmas vaca-
tion. 

Mr. and Mra. George Hardy and 
son Jimmie spent Thursday eve-
nt nf with Mr. and Mrs. Theron 
Cahoon. 

M r a Mary Rickert called to see 
her sister, Hrs. B. E Ricker t in 
Saranac Saturday. 

i TAKE HIM, SOM , I WISH YOU LUCK, 
HE'S "WE MOST CANTAKiKEPOUS 
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length of 
of all Michigan Bell employees is 10 yt 
1076 of them have been in this industry fjr 20 
yeara; 467for 25years; 187for 30years; & for 35 
yeara or more. H This means that your te phone 
service is in the care of men and wome thor 
oughly experienced in what they are doim They 
see promotion rewarding merit They that 
the higher positions are filled by those 
up from the ranks. H Telephone work, Hnnting 
every one, has the dignity of a great public s r ice. 
Thus, Michigan** telephone men and woni|n ook 

on it as somethin|l: Kore 
than a job . . . it i i a 

MIC N 16 JIH n i t 

TELEPIONE COHIWT 

UCATION 
the Broad 

Highway 
1 

The bulte of the tiger-lily are 
eaten in China, Japan and Malaya. 

The Spanish are a backward lo t 
T^ey still Mil the bull with 
sword and we just turn the dial 

Our Schools art Worthy Initfaitions . 

Today, as never before, we see the'necessity of 
broader education. Barriers crash before those 
who are prepared. Every child should be given 
the opportunity of attending first-class educa-
tional institutions. We a n fortunate in Lowell. 
Our schools rank high among those of the state. 

To those who have made our schools possible, we 
pay tribute. Likewise, we salute the teaching 
profession, men and women who have given more 
than liberally of their t ime and effort i n making 
our schools outstanding in the field of education. 
Their qualifications tell a story of careful prepar-
ation. 

The Lowell Ledger 
Lowell, Mich. 
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JftnUflRY 
Furniture (or the Home 
Latest designs and best construct ion. Because of 
our low overhead we can and will save you money. 

We xneciallze in—Window Shades, Floor Coverings, 
P ic ture Framing, Etc. 

W. A. Roth 
FURNITURE 

FUNERAL DIRECTOR and AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Fallatburg & Vicinity 
Mrs. Weelev Millar 

Mr. and Mrs. Arvll Hellman and 
daughters, accompanied by his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. F. C. Hell-
man, spent Wednesday In Holland 
visiting his brother-in-law and sis-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Wm. DuMond, 
and family. 

Miss Grace Pollen of Sparta was 
a visitor at the R. G. PoweH home 
during the holidays. 

Several fishermen have their 
shanties on Flat river and from ail 
reports they are having good luck 
spearing. 

Har ry Vaughan. J r , is visiting 
relatives in Det ro i t 

Mr. and Mrs. Leater Stauffer and 
son Lee spent Sunday with her 
parents in Grand Rapids. 

Pupils neither absent nor tardy 
a t Fallasburg school during the 
month of December were Almeta 
Powell, Joyce and Virginia Booth, 
Lucille Bollock. Ward and Dale 
Miller, J sck and Junior Oesch, 
Billy Wright and Phyllis Hellman. 

BurweU Powell, who was very 
III during Christmas vacation, is 
much improved but still unable to 
attend school 

Mr. Dean and son of Ionia were 
recent callers a t the home of Dave 
Garfield. 

Fourteen young folks, mostly of 
Fallasburg, enjoyed a watch party 
New Year's eve In the log cabin. 
The time was spent playing games 
and roasting marsbmallows and 
weiners. 

Jack and Mary Remington of 
Detroit spent the week-end a t the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Vaughan. 

Irene and Lucille Bollock apent 
the week-end a t the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Gelger of Smyrna. 

Gladys Vaughan went to Gary. 
Ind., Sunday with friends end 
spent Sunday night and Monday a t 
the home of Grace Roberts. 

Mra Wm. Booth. Mrs. Dave Gar-

BREAKFAST 
Sfemld be the beet meal of 
the day and It Is if yoo start 
the day right by eatiag at 
Richmond's Cafa 
Breakfast here of panoakes 
and aaoaage. bacon and eggs, 
or of some of the other tasty 
filling * 

Richmond's Cafe 
t l M I M S , Mich. 

field and Mrs. Wesley Miller were 
dinner guests a t the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. F. E. Boynton In Grand 
Rapids last Friday and called on 
Mrs. Warren Bovee and Mr. and 
Mrs. Mllo MHIer. 

Mrs. Wesley Gould ts quite sick 
In a hospital in Grsnd Rapids. 

Bernard Miller was home over 
Saturday and Sunday. 

Mra Pete Edlnger, Evelyn Ed In-
ge r, Mrs. Emlel Stauffer and son 
Lloyd were supper guests a t the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Bradley 
last Thursday. 

Mr. and M r a Emlel Stauffer en-
tertained Mr. and Mrs. Tom Chalm-
ers of Grand Rapids and Mr. and 
M r a Ha r ry Stauffer and daughter 
Rosemary a t a New Year's dinner. 
Mr. and Mrs. Chslmers remained 
over Sunday. Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Edlnger of Lake Odessa were Sun-
day guests. 

The Misses Montes and Beatrice 
Hoogstraat were Sunday visitors a t 
the R. G. Powell home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arvll Heiiman and 
daughters spent Sunday in Ionia 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mra 
Preston. 

Mra Wicks is improving and ex-
pects to be brought home from the 
hospital this week. 

Mr. and M r a Lester Stauffer en-
tertained a t a New Year's dinner, 
her parents, Mr. and Mra Duffiny 
and son Merle end daughter Ger-
aldlne of Grand Rapids and Mr. 
and Mrs. George Johnson of Lan-
sing. 

Whitneyville 
Mrs. El win Flynn 

Mr. and M r a Carl Graham spent 
New Year's day at the home of 
Mrs. Graham's sister in Caledonia. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jarold Raab were 
New Year's day guests of Mr. and Kline is a niece of Mrs. Gould. 

This and That 
From Around 

the Old Town 
Miss Roxlc Elckhoff Is confined 

to her home with scarlct fever. 

Orlo Roth, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
E. H. Roth, Is confined to his bed 
with scarlet fever. 

Mrs. Elizabeth Lalley and son 
Robert spent last week Thursday 
and Friday In Lapeer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Tucker of 
Clarksvllle called at the Ernest 
Althaus home Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry L. Brlggs at-
tended a New Year's eve party with 
friends in Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Ella Robinson spent last 
Monday with her daughter, Mrs. 
Zoe Connor, In Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mra Frank Heillg of 
Grand Rapids called at the R. H 
Dolan home Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Neil Blakeslee and 
Roy spent New Year's day at the 
home of Carl Straub In Cadillac. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alec Reusser of 
Lapeer spent Friday and Saturday 
with relatives in and near Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. N. Henry were 
the Sunday guests of his mother, 
Mra Charles Henry, in Greenville 

Dorothy Lather of St. Charles 
spent over Sunday with her sister, 
Mrs. N. E. Borgerson, and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Crooks 
spent New Year's day as the guests 
of their daughter, Lena Reusser, in 
Elmdale. 

William Doyle returned to Duke 
University in Durham, N. C., on 
New Year's day to resume his col-
lege duties. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Collins spent 
Sunday afternoon In Grand Rap-
Ids with their son, Howard Collins 
and family. 

Mrs. D. G. Mange returned Tues-
day to her home in Muskegon af ter 
spending a week with Mr. and Mra 
F. F. Coons and David. 

Mr. and Mra Royden Warner 
and family spent New Year's day 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. N. 
V. Warner. In Mulllken. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. N. Henry spent 
New Year's day In Grand Rapids 
as the guests of their son and wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. Myron Henry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Kline of 
Charlotte spent Wednesday with 
Mr. and M r a F. A Gould. Mrs 
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Fresh Home-Made 

FUDGE 
ib. 15c 

H. C. SCOTT 
Home of Good Home 

Made Candies 
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Mra Forrest Graham. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Forbes and 

family and Mr. and M r a Elwin 
Flynn were visitors a t the Jam 
Ballard home New Year's day. 

Mrs. NeH Reynhout and daugh-
ters of Grand Rapids were guests 
a t the Rotherick home over New 
Year's day. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Rotherick 
and daughters and Mr. and Mrs. J . 
Ballard and family visited a t the 
Sam Miller home in Caledonia Wed-
nesday evening to help Mr. Miller 
celebrate his birthday. 

Every farm should be equipped 
with a first-aid k i t including band-
ages and antiseptics, so that minor 
injuries may be properly treated 
so as to avoid more serious conse-
quences. 

Joan Ellis spent the week-end 
with her cousin, Marie Nash, in 
South Bowne. Mr. and Mrs. Ellis 
called for her on Sunday evening. 

Mrs. Charles D. Blakeslee, form-
erly of this place, is reported seri-
ously ill a t the home of her daugh-
ter, Mrs. Seth Mllllken, at Lansing. 

Callers the past week on Mra 
Wm. Hitchcock and baby a t the 
C. E Bowen home were Mrs. Ar-
thur Retterstorf and Merrilyn, Mrs. 
Emma Retterstorf, Mrs. Eve ret 
Bowen, Mr. and Mrs. Emory Bow-
en, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Tlngley, 
Misses Marie and Esther Cordtz and 
Carl Cordtz, Marcel Miche, George 
Story. Mr. and Mrs. Ted Gaspar, 
Mary Louise and Joan, Mr. and 
Mrs. C. L. Shear and Ivan and Mrs. 
Luella Burns. 

M I D - W I N T E R 

CLEARANCE 
O F O U R E N T I R E 

STOCK OF SHOES 
Offering you the greatest selection 
from our two stores. All sizes but 
not in every style, on sale in all de-
partments. 

Sale Ends January 15 

One Group 

Children's Ski Boots 

Women's Ski Soots 
Odds and Ends 

$1.49 

(Y 

Women't and 
Children's 

Galoshes 

97c 
Men's 4-buckIes 

All Rubb«r 

$1.99 
Men's 

Wool Knit Felt Shoes 

$1.79 
All Men's Heavy Rubbers 

Greatly Reduced 

60 pairs 

Womi's 

S t r a p s 
and 

Oxfords 

$1.79 

Al l Women's 

$3.45 and?$1.95 Shoes 

Reduced te 

$2.79 

10% off during our Clearance 

Sale on all staple Men's, Wo-

men's and Children's Shoes 

which are not included in the 
above groups. 

BEACH & OUTMAN 
L O W E L L BELDING 

Eugene Nlles spent last week In 
Ionia with relatives. 

Waller J . Kropf spent Monday in 
Detroit on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Bargwell 
of Bay City apent Sunday with 
Mrs. Phil Krum. 

Glendon Swarthout returned to 
the University of Michigan In Ann 
Arbor on Sunday. 

Mrs. Margaret Staal has return 
ed to Lowell a f te r spending two 
weeks visiting relatives In Detroit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Lowrey of 
Detroit spent the week-end at the 
home of Mr. and Mra Ellis Rol 
line. 

Mr. and Mrs. Grant Warner 
spent New Year's eve with Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Blakeslee of South 
Lowell. 

Da^lene Keiser spent a few days 
last week with her uncle and aunt, 
Mr. and Mrs. Geldersma, in Grand 
Raplda. 

Frederick Althaus and sons of 
Lowell were guests of his parenta 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernes t Althaus, on 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Philip Schneider 
and sons of South Lowell were the 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Bennett. 

Mr. and Mra John VanWIngen 
of Grand Rapids spent Sunday af-
ternoon and evening with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. George Lee. 

Margaret Nlles of Detroit, David 
Sigler of Jackson and another 
couple spent the week-end a t the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Don Nlles. 

Miss Eunice Coates of Detroit 
called on old friends in Lowell on 
Monday and attended the funeral 
of her aunt. Mrs. Katherine Wil-
son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Reynolds, 
Mrs. Victor Reynolds and Pat ty 
Sevensma of Grand Rapids were 
Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ed. 
Reynolds. 

Kathryn Schneider returned to 
Central State Teachers College on 
Sunday after spending the holidays 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ar-
thur Schneider. 

Mrs. Carl French and two daugh-
ters of Grand Rapids and Mrs. 
Carl Wlngeler and two daughters 
of Palo spent last week Wednes-
day with relatives in Lowell. 

M r a M. E. Simpson attended a 
bridge luncheon in Grand Rapids 
today (Thursday) as the guest of 
Mrs. Hulwerder, who was hostess to 
the Morrison Lake Gardens Club. 

M r a Simmons and daughter 
Connie left the Luz Maternity hos-
pital last week and have gone to 
visit her parenU In Ionia before 
returning to their home n Detroi t 

Mr. and Mrs. George R. Traver 
and Mr. and Mra. Marc Traver and 
daughter Suzanne of Willlamston 
were the New Year's day guests of 
Principal and Mrs. L R. Miller 
and children. 

Mrs. Kate Hoxle of Belding and 
daughter, Agnes Beard of South 
Gate, Calif., spent a few days last 
week with the former's sister, Mrs. 
Eva Walters, and called on other 
f r lenda Mrs. Beard and husband 
will soon be leaving for Panama. 

Mr. and M r a Vern Good enter-
tained the following on New Year's 
day: Mrs. Good's father. Henry 
Whltford. and aunt, Mrs. Maria 
Smith, both of Dutton and her sis-
ter and brother-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Carpenter, of Grand 
Rapids. 

Mrs. Lucy Duell of Alto was a 
Friday caller at the John Layer 
home. Sunday callers were Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Rowland and daugh-
tera, Eleanor and Betty of Grand 
Rapids. Mrs. Kittle Taylor of Hol-
land and Mrs. Donna Lasby and 
daughter Anne. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Cosgriff en-
tertained with a seven o'clock tur-
key dinner with all its dressing on 
New Year's eve, watching the new 
year In and the old year o u t Those 
present were Mr. and Mrs. H. A. 
Johnson and Junior, Mr. and Mrs. 
Alex Wlngeler and Mr. and Mrs. 
P. J . Stahl of Alto. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ear l Dowllng, ac-
companied by Mrs. Ralph Sher-
wood. Junior and Barbara Sher-
wood called on Ralph Sherwood at 
Blodgett hospital in Grand Rapids 
Sunday. They report him as doing 
as well as possible. Frank Gould 
was also a caller of Mr. Sherwood. 

Mr. and Mrs. (H. L. Weekes, 
daughters. Phyllis of Chicago and 
Jean of East Lansing, attended a 
dinner party a t the Rowe Hotel in 
Grand Rapids with friends from 
that city on New Year's day. 
Phyllis returned to Chicago and 
Jean to East Lansing on Sunday. 

Harold S. Knight of Detroit ar-
rived in Lowell Friday to spend 
the week-end wth Mr. and Mrs. M. 
E. Simpson. Mrs. Knight and son 
returned home with him af ter 
spending the week with her par-
ents. Betty Simpson of Grand 
Rapids spent the latter part of last 
week with Mr. and Mrs. Simpson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Buttrick of 
Cascade entertained thirty guests 
for their annual holiday dinner, 
relatives being present from De-
troit, Marshall, Alto, Lowell, Kala-
mazoo and Grand Rapids. All en-
Joyed the bountiful dinner, many 
gifts for all and the pictures tak-
en and shown by Mr. and Mrs. B. 
S. Peck of Kalamazoo, taken on 
their recent trip to France, Italy, 
Belgium, Switzerland and England. 

CLEARANCE 
Buy In Our January Sales 

Our entire stockjof Suits, the great 
Overcoats and Topcoats offered at 

OVERCOATS 
Alpacas, Fleeces, Caraculs, Boucles, Meltons, 
Raglans, full belts, ^ belts. Heavy, medium 
and California weights. Dark and light ox-
fords, navy and many shades of brown. 

$35.00 Overcoats 

31.50 Overcoats 

30.00 Overcoats 

25.00 Overcoats 

22.75 Overcoats 

18.00 Overcoats 

$28.95 

25.95 

24.95 

20.59 

18.59 

15.95 

majority Two-Trouser Suits, all 
January Clearance Prices. 

SUITS 
Your opportunity to buy Americans standard 
makes at once-a-year savings. Michaels, 
Stern & Co. Sterling Worsteds and Strong-
heart Twists, Fairhaven and Shelby Worsteds 
and Twists from Curlee. Single and double 
breasted models, sport suits, regulars, longs, 
shorts and stouts. 

$33.00 Suits 
29.00 Suits 
25.00 Suits 
22.50 Suits 
18.00 Suits 

now $26.95 
now 23.95 
now 20.95 
now 18.59 
now 15.95 

Selections are good. All prices include the Sales Tax. 

P l i a b i i g , Heillag 

and 

Sheet M t l i l Work 

R A Y C O V E R T 
Plwbfog Reatiag 

Sheet Metal Work 

Mrs. Velma Clinton of Grand 
Rapids spent several daya this 
week with her father. Rev. C. L 
Bradley. 

Fred Bowen left Monday for 
Eas t Lansing where he will take a 
short course In Agricultural en-
gineering. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Snell and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Snay spent Sun-
day afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
James Snell In Greenville. 

Mrs. Lyle Evans and Mrs. Bray-
ton Golds and children spent Tues-
day afternoon and Thursday of 
laat week In Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. William P. Laux 
spent New Year's day with their 
aunt, Mrs. Mary Sears and cousins, 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Sears, in Beld-
ing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Milton Growe and 
daughter and granddaughter of 
Owoeso visited Mr. and Mrs. A. M 
Schneider on Thursday of last 
week. 

Mrs. Perry Halpln and daughter 
Florence and Mrs. Wm. Por te r of 
Grand Rapids visited their mother, 
Mrs. Caroline Smith, on New 
Year's day. 

Miss Grace Boman, of the office 
staff of Moody Bible Insti tute in 
Chicago, spent the holidays here 
with her parents. Rev. and Mra 
C. W. Boman. 

Miss Marlon Brown returned on 
Sunday to Grand Ledge to resume 
her teaching duties there af ter 
spending the Christmas holidays 
with her parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles William-
son, Miss Hazel Hoag and Glenn 
Barnes were guests at a New 
Year's dinner given by Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Henderson. 

Supt. and Mrs. W. W. Gumser 
and son Walter spent New Year's 
day with Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Price In (Holland. Mrs. Price is a 
sister of Supt. Gumser. 

Mra Oscar Moore of Keene and 
Mrs. Herb Howden and daughter 
Dolores of Detroit spent Wednes-
day evening at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Brayton Golds. 

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Travis and 
children of Ionia, Clark Morse and 
Miss Thelma Folkersma of Kala-
mazoo were New Years guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Morse. 

Earl Doyle and Ethel Anne 
Thomaa returned to Central State 
Teachers College, Mt. Pleasant, on 
Sunday af te r spending the holiday 
vacation a t their homes here. 

New Year's day guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Byron Frost and family 
were Mrs. A. J . Nash and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lowell Nash of Lansing. The 
former remained for a few days' 
vlait 

Mr. and Mrs. F. N. Newell, Mr. 
and Mra E. E . Hotchlns and daugh-
ter Janet of East Lansing were 
Sunday dinner gutsts at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Wachter-
hauser. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Spencer 
and Janice Kay of Belding and Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Spenccr and Clyde, 
J r , of Ionia were New Year's 
guests of Mr. . and Mrs. Warner 
Spencer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. T. Condon and 
granddaughter, Agnes, spent New 
Year's day with their son, Wm. iH. 
Condon and family In Alton. Agnes 
returned to her school in Traverse 
City on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Crooks 
called on a friend, Fred DeClaire, 
in a Lansing hospital Sunday. Mr. 
DeClaire had recently been robbed 
and shot but it is reported that he 
is holding his own. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Alexander en-
tertained on New Year's day with 
a family dinner for the following: 
Mr. and M r a Lloyd Shultla and 
children, Leone Alexander and 
daughter Lucille, Mr. and M r a Tim 
Conant and daughter Virginia. 

South Boston 
Miss Belle Young 

Gatea L. Stannard, aged 81 years, 
passed away Dec. 17, 1937 at the 
home of his son, Carl H. Stannard, 
at Huntington Park, Calif. Mr. 
Stannard was the son of the late 
Able! Stannard, was born and 
reared In South Boston, where he 
married Miss Jessie Story, who 
passed away in 1930 in Phoenix, 
Ariz., where the family located 
about 30 years ago when they left 
Michigan. Besides the son, he 
leaves two daughters, Mrs. Ethel 
S. Herald of Huntington P a r k aud 
Mra. Marie Condy of Vallejo, Calif., 
and five grandchildren. 

Charles Wood and family moved 
recently from the Mick f a rm to the 
Lester Stuart place. 

Miss Jewell Mick was an Ann 
Arbor visitor Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Condon enter-
tained her parents, brothers and 
slaters on New Year'a. 

Mr, and Mrs. Leo Tucker and 
family of Lake Odessa and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Atkins of Marietta spent 
Sunday a t the Ernest Tucker 
home. 

Miss Jean Tucker spent the hol-
iday vacation in Marlette with her 
sister, Mrs. John Atkins. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Glbbs received 
a Christmas basket of fruit , candy. 

nuts and flowers by express from 
San Pedro, Calif., from their son 
Robert who is stationed there in 
the U. S. Navy. 

South Bell PTA gave the initial 
performance of their play, "Look 
Gu t Lizzie," a t the Pleasant Val-
ley school Monday evening, Jan. 3. 
Cast of characters consists of Fred 
Fahrnl, Wilbur Young, Wayne 
Fahrni, Scott O'Belrne, Ernestine 
and Betty Roth, Doris Fahrni and 
Mrs. Letha Thorpe. 

Barbara and Clayton Dawson 
spent part of last week with their 
grandparenta, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. 
Tucker. 

John Sterzick and daughter Mel-
ba and Mr. and Mra. George Lake 
of Saranac spent Sunday with Lan-
sing relatives and were accompan-
ied home by Mrs. Sterzick and son 
Jack who spent the week there. 

Fred DeCIair is said to still be in 
a critical condition In St. Lawrence 
hospital, Lansing, from a gun shot 
wound in his face, received when 
he was the victim of a holdup at 
2:00 a. m. last week Tuesday while 
on duty for the Michigan Taxicab 
Co In T.an8lng. He Is well known 
in this locality where he lived for 
three years on the Church farm 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur DeCIair, now of Freepor t 
The family have the sympathy of 
their friends here in this misfor-
tune. 

Mapes District 
Mr*. 8. M. Rowland 

The West Lowell Community 
Club will meet at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Seymour Dalstra Friday 
evening, Jan. 14. 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Heache 
of West Lowell were callers a t S. 
M. Rowland's Thursday evening. 

John Frazee and daughter Inez 
entertained on New Year'a day for 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Myers, Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam Myers and son 
Bruce of Lowell, Mr. and Mra 
John Wright and son Blllle of Ver-
gennes and Mr. and Mrs. S. M. 
Rowland and daughter Marie of 
West Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Place and 
daughter Janice of Grand Rapids 
were Friday guests a t the home of 
S. M. Rowland. 

Home, which should be the saf-
est, happiest place in the world, 
produces more accidents than does 
Industry, or any other accident-
producing unit except traffic. Med-
ical and hospital bills for the care 
of home-accident victims last year 
were almost $2,000,000 a day; and 
every day scores of new graves 
were filled by such accidents. 

Ledger want ads are noted for 
results. tf 

tyubs nifktJ 

iite car does siivit 

Y o u r STANDARD OIL DEALER wants 
TRY this new Gasoline for QUICK STAKTS AND WTLEAGE 

The following; Standard Oil Stations are here to serve you in your own home Com-
munity: 

John Layer East Main-st. 
A- H. Stormzand Central Garage 
C. K. Mackey West Main-st 
J r a n ^ Stepheng M-66 at Segwun 
Roy Richardson.. m.21 and Ada Road 
George A. Story, Local Distributor Phone 27 
Louis LeFebre, Ada Distributor Ada Phone 65 



FOUR THE LOWELL LEDGER. LOWELL, MICHIGAN. THURSDAY. JAN. 6. 1938 

A L T O D E P A R T M E N T 
(Mm. Fi rd I'attlwin) 

MlnrrlliiniMniN Shower 

The L. D. S. entertained with a 
nilflcollnncous shower Thursday 
evpnlng at Alunka In honor of MIBS' 
Izetta Frost and Allison Koark.' 
Games were played, refreshments 
served and the young couple were 
the recipients of many lovely gifts.i 

Alto Club Moeln 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Sllcox enter-
tained the Lion Tamer Club with a 
chop Buey supper Monday evening. 
It was a Christmas party and there 
was much merriment when the 
gifts were passed out. Later in the 
evening pedro was played at five 
tables, head prizes going to Mrs. 
Otto Dygert and Elmer Ellis and 
consolatiotiH to Mrs, Elmer Ellis 
and Lloyd Houghton. 

W. C. T. U. Meeting 

Misses Mary and Addle Sinclair 
spent Tuesday afternoon with Mrs. 
Henry Klahn at her home and 
other members of the board of the 
local W. C. T. U.. Mrs. Schoiten,1 

vice president, and Mrs. Evelyn! 
Shaffer, secretary, were also pres-
ent and they spent the time dis-
cussing and planning the work of 
the local W, C. T. U. The next 
meeting will be held at the home 
of Mrs. Glenn Layer the second' 
Friday in January at 1:30 p. m. All-
who are interested in the temper-
ance cause are urged to bo pres-
ent. 

Davis Lake 
Mrs. Wm. Schradar 

Alto M. E. Church Note* 

The January meeting of the 
Goodfellowship Class will be held, 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Lyle 
Clark Jan. 14 at 7:30 p. m. The 
usual potluck dinner will be serv-
ed. AH are invited to attend who 
are affiliated with the class. Please 
bring table service. 

A new organization in the church 
will be launched next Sunday eve-
ning. the Fellowship Forum. The 
purpose of this organization will 
be to study and discuss religious, 
economic, social and political ques-
tions pertinent to national and in-
ternational welfare. Everyone who 
is sincerely interested in such 
questions is invited to attend this 
meeting when the organization will 
be perfected. The Fellowship For-
um will be open to all, regardless 
of age. The meeting will be called 
at 7:30 p. m. 

Alto Locals 

Mrs. VanKulken entertained her 
children with a Christmas tree and 
exchange of presents at the school 
house Thursday afternoon. After 
several jolly games Mrs. Van-
Kulken served the children Jello 
and cookies. 

Mr. and Mrs. Will Falrchlld 
spent Sunday afternoon with A. J . 
Porr l t t and family of Bowne Cen-
ter. 

Rev. F. S. Kinney and son Stan-
ley returned to M. S. C. Monday 
morning for the winter term. 

Mrs. Will Heldrlck and Mrs. Ray 
Gibbs of Clarksvllle called on Mrs. 
Harold Alderink recently. 

Harold AUerlnk and two chil-
dren of Clarksvllle visited his wife 
at the Walter Thorn home on New 
Years. 

Mrs. Grace Skeldlng and daugh-
ter of Lyons visited her sister, Mrs. 
Ed. Davis, and husband over the 
week-end. 

Mrs. S. VanNamee of East Cale-
donia spent Thursday with Mrs. 
G«orge Skldmore. 

Norman Ferguson was in Battle 
Creek Thursday on business. Mrs. 
Frank Bunker accompanied him 
aa f a r as Freeport and spent the 
day with her moher, Mrs. Cress. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry London of 
Grand Rapids called on Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed. Davis Saturday. 

Thursday dinner guests of Mrs. 
Richard Falrchlld were Miss Vani-
etta Stanton of Lansing and Miss 
Clarabelle Hooper. Mrs. Bernlce 
James of Hastings was a caller. 

Miss Frances Sydnam and Jane 
Orrlne Pappert of Pontlac spent 
the New Year's holiday with the 
former's parents. 

Miss Pauline Montague returned 
to Pontlac Monday after visiting 
her aunt and grandmother. Mrs. 
V. L. Watts and Mrs. Sarah Behler. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Houghton 
and children of Morse Lake were 
recent callers of Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Falrchlld. 

Stanley Kinney spent New Years 
with friends in Union City. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Dygert of 
Clarksvllle spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Mack Watson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vernor Lynn and 
Mrs. Mary Sprague of Battle 
Creek were New Year's guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Kline. 

Arthur Glbbs. who Is attending 
Graceland College in Lamoni, la., 
called on Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Demlng Wednesday afternoon. 

Mr, and Mrs. Robert McWhin-
ney and son of Grand Rapids spent 
Friday and Saturday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Dlntaman and Sunday 
with their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Vanderllp. 

Mrs. Verlle Daniels, Virgil and 
Viola, Mr. and Mrs. Leo Smith, Mr. 
and Mrs. Clifford Daniels and fam-
ily and Glen Sllcox were New 
Year's dinner guests of the form-
ers brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leon Roush, of Clarksvllle. 

Doris and Marilyn Champion of 
Grand Rapids visited Marilyn 
Demlng Wedne84«y. 

Mr. and Mrs. Allen Behler and 
daughter Arleen of Lake Odessa 
called on Mr. and Mrs. Val Watts 
and family Sunday afternoon. 

Mrs. Henry Geldersma and lady 
friend of Grand Rapids called on 
her father, Matt Keiser, Wednes-
day night. 

Charlie Bancroft, Mary a n d 
Addle Sinclair and Mellle Newman 
of Grand Rapids were callers dur-
ing the week on Sam Newman a t 
the F. Falrchlld home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Lorlng and 
daughter Mabel of LaBarge were 
Thursday evening dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Rosenberg. 

Mrs. Eld. Timpson started serv-
ing on Jury Monday morning. 

Alto Locals 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Pattlson of 
Grand Rapids were last Thursday 
evening dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Pattlson and Jack and 
Dick, who have been visiting their 
grandparents, accompanied them 
to the Hllbert Mofflt home at 
Alarka where they all spent the 
night and Friday, 

Rev. and Mrs. F. S. Kinney spent 
Wednesday and Thursday In Con-
cord visiting their son, Lee Kinney 
and wife. 

Norman Ferguson has accepted 
a position with the Miller Dog Food 
Products of Battle Creek and left 
Saturday for Wanetha, Wis., for 
two weeks' training. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Sllcox ac-
companied Mr. and Mrs. Valda 
Chaterdon and family to East Lan-
sing Saturday where they Joined 
other members of the family at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Elmo Dy-
gert for New Year's dinner. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Pattlson spent 
Now Year's day and evening with 
Mr. and Mrs. Arch Wood of Mc-
Cords, Mrs. Wood and Mrs. Pattl-
son called on Mrs. R. E. Colby and 
Inspected the lovely new modern 
home of the Colby's. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wlngeler and 
daughters of Palo were Sunday 
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. Val 
Watts, 

Miss Corlntha Salsbury of Grand 
Rapids spent two weeks with her 
aunts, Mrs. Carrie Nellins and Jos-
ephine Salsbury. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Pattlson were 
Sunday dinner guests "of Mr. and 
Mrs. Will Riddle of Grand Rapids. 

Miss Krombeen, Miss Betty West-
field and Miss Jen Osterhouse of 
Grand Riplds were Wednesday 
dinner guests of Mrs. Harold Nye. 

Ed. Johnson and Orvena Wool-
ston of Grand Rapids were Sunday 
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs 
Charles Colby. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Wlngeler and 
Mr. and Mrs. Leo Bryant attend-
ed the New Year's dance at Cale-
donia. 

New Y e a r t dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest Roaik were Mr. 
and Mrs. Trescott and Mrs. Jane 
Roark and daughter Margaret of 
Lansing. 

Clifford Nash of Grand Rapids 
and Beatrice Lock of Alaska were 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Demlng. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. J . Linton called 
at the Ivan Thaler home Sunday 
to see the new baby. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Bergy and 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Bergy and 
Donnle were New Year's guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Kegerreis. 

Sunday dinner guests at the 
Roy Demlng home were Mr. and 
Mrs. Art Eckert and Harold of 
North Carlton and Mr. and Mrs. 
Eldred Demlng and Buddy of 
Hastings. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. J . Linton were 
New Year's dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward McCarty of 
Green Lake. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. R. Sydnam and 
family attended the Ford Hour 
program in the Masonic Temple in 
Detroit Sunday night, Dec. 26. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Dlntaman 
and Mr. and Mrs. Russell Carr of 
Grand Rapids were New Year's 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. John Keiser 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carl Emmons of 
Lansing. 

Mrs. Claud Sllcox visited her sis-
ter, Mrs. Valda Chaterdon, in 
Grand Rapids Tuesday and Wed-
nesday. Phyllis Chaterdon visited 
her uncle and aunt Thursday and 
Friday. 

We are glad to hear through Mr. 
and Mrs. Lewie Williams, formerly 
of Alto, now at Augusta, that the 
former's mother. Mrs. Kittle Stone-
house, is much improved In health, 
and walks a short distance to their 
oil station and lunch room for din-
ner every day. 

Mrs. Esther Ferguson of Flint 
spent the holidays with her hus-
band and her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Bunker, 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Rankin spent 
the week-end with their parents at 
Croswell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Sllcox were 
Saturday overnight guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Cummlngs of 
Lansing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Sllcox and 
little niece, Phyllis Chaterdon, were 
Thursday supper guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Houghton and Suzanne. 

New Year's callers at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. George H. Miller 
were Mr. and Mrs. Frank Richard-
son and Alice of Ada, Mrs. Anna-
della Richardson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Fenn Lewis of Cascade and F. E. 
Bunker of Alto. Sunday callers at 
the Miller home were Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Colvin and Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Brewer of East Detroit and 
Don MacNaughton of Lowell. 

George L. Miller is spending a 
few days with his sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Shultz, of 
Bloomfleld Hills. Detroit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard P. Lamb of 
Salem, Va., are announcing the 
birth of a daughter, Margaret 
Eleanor, Dec. 23. Mrs. Lamb was 
formerly Miss Helen Hayden, a 
granddaughter of the late Wesley 
Johnson and wife, and has many 
friends near Alto. 

Earl Colby and Charles Foote 
were business visitors In Grand 
Rapids Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hulzinga 
were Wednesday dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Hulzinga in 
honor of Frank's birthday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Phil Diefenbakcr 
of Alaska and Mr. and Mrs. Clif-
ford Rowland and son of Grand 
Rapids were Now Year's dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Schrader. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ceclle Wiseman 
spent the past week with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Freeman. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Llnd and son 
Donald and Mrs. Kate Curley 
spent Wednesday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. Wm. Schrader. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Barnes and 
son of Grand Rapids were Sunday 
afternoon guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ward Stewart. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hulzinga, 

ADA DEPARTMENT 
(Mm. Hattie R. Fitch) 

Ada Locals 

Week-end guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Orvies Kellogg were Mr. and Mrs. 
O. Simmons of Rockford. 

Friday callers at the home of 
Dr. and Mrs. Charles Freeman 
were Mr. and Mrs. George Hasklns 
of Lansing. 

George and Clark Bouwman of 
Hillsdale were in Ada Tuesday. 

Herman and Mliburn DeHaan of 
Grand Rapids were Wednesday 
callers of Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Fitch. 

Dr. and Mrs. Charles Freeman 
entertained with a family dinner 
party at their home on New Year's 

Mr?' a n d ' ^ M r s . ' " w m ^ ^ h r a d e r ' at- t h e ^ e n t b e , " « ' i J T S J L ? ! 
tended the funeral of Mrs. Fred t h e l r . wedding anniversary Their 
Otto of Caledonia Monday after- K u e 8 t 8 were Mr. and ^ Lwn 
noon. Friends from this commun- * r e e ™ n " n d " ° n . S J 

Mrs. Wesley Freeman and twin 
daughters, all of Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Morris. 

Ledger Want Ads pay. 

Battles Braddock 

DR. H. B. J U H L I N 
OSTEOPATHIC PHYSICUN 

AND SURGEON 

754 Burton S t . SE. 
Grand Rapids, Mich. 

I n A l t o 
On Wednesday and Saturday 
afternoons and evenings, a t 
the home of Mrs. Frank 
Falrchlld. 
Grand Raplda Phone S-07M 

Alto Phone M-FSl 

c84-4t 

NEW YORK CITT . . . Walrii 
Tommy n r r , BrltUta baarywalfbl 
champ, t n i T e t to begin training 
for a tctaadaled IK-round go wltn 
Jimmy Braddock in Madison 
Square Garden. January I I . The 
(allure of Joe LouU to kayo Farr 
waa rot of the biggest flatk ap-
lt<l ot 1W7 r lni hutory. 

ity extend their sympathy to the 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Llnd and Mr. 
and Mrs. Emerson Llnd and fam-
ily of Caledonia spent the week-
end with relatives in Lansing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Schrader vis-

Eugene and Joan motored to Sun-
field on New Year's day to visit 
Mr. and Mrs. Dan VanWormer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mahlon Holloway 
and children of Flint, who have ited Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hulzlnga|. .. . . w-n 

cvmo,. been spending the Christmas boll-

3 e f t for C h . . ^ BrUltol, ̂ r e u i r n t d 
Timpson. . - . 

Ira F.-eyUng. Donald Llnd, Frank h o m c o n S u n d a y -
Hulzinga, Wm. Schrader and Tom 
Forward spent Tuesday at Hol-
land. 

ADDITIONAL 
BOWNE BUGLE NOTES 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Shaffer 
and Virginia Ann were Sunday 
dinner guests of Mr. and M r s 
Leonard Johnson and family. 

Rev. and Mrs. R. C. Johnson and 
son Robert of Elmdale spent Tues-
day at the Leonard Johnson home. 

Mr. and Mrr. Matt Matternlck 
and family were caiicrs at Ben 
Alderink's Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Merton Alderink 
and son Marvin of Detroit spent 
the week-end with Ben Alderink 
and family. 

Logan 
Mrs. Spenor Johnson 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Stahl en-
tertained for New Year's dinner: 
Lawrence and Wilma Wleland of 
Manchester, Ind., Mr. and Mra Ray 
Wleland, Lola and Raymond of 
Freeport, Mr. and Mrs. Carl Liv-
ingston and baby of Clarksvllle, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Wleland and 
WilHam and Mr. and Mrs. Spenor 
Johnson and children. 

Ed. Mlshler of Pennsylvania 
spent Wednesday night and Thurs-
day with Mr. and Mrs. Emanuel 
Stahl. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ovid Miller and 
children and Mr. and Mrs. Chas. 
Wleland called on Joe Lehman on 
Sunday afternoon. 

Miss Ellen Seese visited from 
Tuesday until Friday a t the Leo 
Bryant home at Alto. 

Mrs. Polly Eash called on her 
mother, Mrs. Lena Mlshler, Mon-
day. 

Rev. and Mrs. Wilklns of Free-
port called on Mr. and Mrs. Semi-
ah Weaver Tuesday afternoon. 

George, Erma and Harold Krebs 
spent Saturday with their cousins, 
Orton, Philip, Vada and Ellen 
Seese. 

Roscoe and Alfred Custer re-
ceived word of the death of their 
aunt, Mrs. Snyder of Waterloo, 
Can. The boys left early Tuesday 
morning to attend the funeral. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Stahl enter-
tained his brothers and sisters and 
their families for Christmas din-
ner. 

Rev. Gingrich of Elkhart, Ind., 
and Rev. Schrock were Tuesday 
dinner guests at the Emanuel Stahl 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Beverly, 
Mr. and Mrs. Peter Stahl, Mr. and 
Mrs. Shirley Groff and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Seeley surprised Noah 
Thomas on his birthday Wednes-
day evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. J ay Leece and chil-
dren of Elmdale were Sunday din-
ner guests of Mr. and Mrs. Spenor 
Johnson and family. 

Mrs. Rose Bryant of Alto spent 
the last part of the week with her 
sister, Mrs. Ray Seese and family. 

The Young People's Sunday 
School Class of the Brethren 
Church held their social night with 
Vada and Orton Seese Thursday 
night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emanual Stahl 
helped their son-in-law and daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Ira Erb of Carl-
ton Center, with their butchering 
last Wednesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Spenor Johnson 
and children called on their aunt, 
Mrs. Jane Kime, and son Clarence 
and family Wednesday evening. 

Card of Thanks 
I wish to thank our neighbors 

and friends, the Aid Society and 
Young Married People's Class of 
the Brethren Church for the many 
kindnesses shown us during my 
recent illness; those who sent 
fruit and cards, also those who 
helped with the chores and all 
others who assisted us In various 
ways. 

Spenor Johnson. 

Mrs. Doily Weiler of Chicago has' 
come to make an extended visit | 
with Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Furner. / w r n n n 

Mrs. Mate Harris of Chicago w a s ^ I f o r m e r DOWDe F o l k s 

Ada Locals 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Schelling of 
Grand Rapids were week-end vis-
itors of Mr. and Mrs. Monroe 
Whittemore. 

Guests at a New Year's eve 
party at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Boyd Anderson were Mr. and Mrs. 
George Anderson and children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ed. Mueller and children 
and Mr. and Mrs. James McCor-
mick and sons. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Martin of 
Grand Rapids were Tuesday call-
ers of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Martin. 

Sympathy Is being extended to 
the family of Daniel Joseph Verlln, 
who met accidental death at Mus-
kegon Heights on Monday after-
noon. Mr. Verlln had been a life-
long resident of Ada township and 
he had many relatives here and a 
host of friends to mourn his tragic 
death. Surviving are his widow, 
Mrs. Minnie Verlln; two sons, 
William and Thomas, two daugh-
ters. Betty and Phyllis; four broth-
ers and five sisters. Funeral ser-
vices will be held Friday morning 
at 9:30 at St. Patrick's Church. 
Parnell. Interment In St. Patrick's 
cemetery. 

News F rom Grand Rapids 

Farm fires cost $100,000,000 an-
nually in this country. The com-
mon causes of fires on farms are 
spontaneous combustion, improper 
maintenance of gasoline and kero-
sene containers, lightning, over-
heated stoves, brush and pasture 
fires which get out of control. Im-
properly thawing out frozen pipes, 
gas Jets too near curtains, burning 
rubbish too near buildings, im-
proper use of cleaning fluids, and 
faulty electric wiring. 

NOTICE. LEDGER READERS 
Friends of The Ledger and Alto 

Solo having bteiness in the Probate 
Court of R e n r County will confer 
a favor on Hie publisher by request-
ing the court to order probate no-
tices published in this paper. The 
Court will be glad to comply with 
the request when mad-. 

Respectfully, 
R G. Jefferles. Pub. Ledger. 

Valuible Coupon 
Bring in this coupon and 

four permanent waves a t 

$1.25 each and receive a $3.50 

Marvel Oil permanent wave 

free of charge. Good until 

Feb. 28, 19S8. 

CMy't I m t y Sbtn 
IONIA, IDCHl 

a guest of Mrs. Frankle Bristol 
from Tuesday until Friday of the 
past week. 

Sunday guests of Mrs. Mary 
(Harris were Mr. and Mrs. George 
Siliaway and Clara of Cedar 
Springs and Mr. and Mrs. William 
Lockwood of Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Sophie Emory Is expecting 
her sister, Mrs. Gussle Ketchpaw 
of Cleveland, to arrive this week to 
make her an extended visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Monroe Whitte-
more entertained with a New 
Year's eve party at their home. A 
delicious supper was served and 
the guests watched the old year 
out and welcomed the new year. 
Guests were Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Schelling and Miss Marlon Spauld-
ing of Grand Rapids and Dr. and 
Mrs. Howard Messmore and James 
Furner. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis LeFebre are 
being congratulated on the birth 
of a 10 lb. son, born Friday, Dec. 
31, at their home. 

Wayne Kelley of Grand Rapids 
spent the Christmas vacation as a 
guest of his cousin, Walter Afton, 
Jr.. returning to his home Sunday. 

New Year's day guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Afton were Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Blackall and 
Eleanor of Grand Rapids. Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Hoegg and Claire of 
Grandvllle and Orrln Hoegg of 
Grand Rapids. 

Guests of Miss Charlotte Fitch 
on Wednesday evening were Miss 
Evelyn Cramton and Ivan Graham 
and Hubert Freyermuth of Grand 
Rapids, Miss Dorothy Morris and 
Edward Cramton of Ada. A supper 
was enjoyed and the evening's di-
version was games. Late In the 
evening the party motored to 
Grand Rapids to enjoy hamburgers 
at Frankle Ferrell's. 

Mr. and Mra, Tom Morris enter-
tained with a family party a t their 
home on Thursday evening, Dec. 
30, the occasion being in honor of 
their 40th wedding anniversary. 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris were present-
ed with a fine electric percolator. 
Their guests were their son and 
daughter-in-law, Mr. and Mra 
Homer Morris and children. E u 
gene and Joan and their son-in-
law and daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glenn Chaffee. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Morris at-
tended the dinner party given by 
Consumers Power Co. to their em-
ployees at the Pantlind Hotel laat 
Wednesday evening. Following the 
dinner the interesting picture, "All 

[in a Day," was enjoyed. Mr. Morris 
was presented with a service pin 
at the dinner, the pin representing 
ten years of service with the com-
pany. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herman Stukkle 
entertained with a party on New 
Year's eve, honoring their son Gar^ 
rett, who is leaving to attend the 
Normal School at Kalamazoo. 
Several of his young fr iends were 
Invited in for the occasion. That a 
good time was surely had by all 
was Indicated by the fun and en-
thusiasm made by the party to 
welcome In the new year. 

Mrs. Boyd Anderson was hostess 
to the Egypt Bride's Quilt Club a t 
a Christmas party at her home on 
Thursday with a good number at-
tending. This was an all day meet-
ing with a potluck dinner served at 
noon. In the afternoon a quilt was 
tied which is to be given to Mrs. 
Albert Thomet, after which mem-
bers exchanged gifts and enjoyed 
candy which the club had bought 
for their party. A door prize was 
won by Mrs. Erma Swan. The club 
will hold their next meeting on 
Thursday, Jan. 27, with Mrs. Nell 
VandenPeerle as hostess. 

Mrs. Boyd Anderson entertained 
with a family dinner party at her 
home on Sunday, honoring her als-
ter, Mrs. Curtiss Rogers, and son 
Johnnie Mac of Lansing, who are 
leaving to spend the next three 
months in Nebraska and Texaa. 
They are to visit Mr. Rogers 'moth-
er, Mrs. Archie Martin a t Fremont, 
Neb., and spend the month of Feb-
ruary In Texas. Besides the guest 
of honor, other guests were Mr. 
Rogers and Mr. and M r a Harold 
Kitson, Eleanor, Marjorie and 
Marilyn of Bostwick Lake and Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald MacNaughton of 
Grand Rapids. 

The annual evening meeting of 
the Ada Ladies Literary Club will 
be held In the club room at Ada 
school house on Thursday evening, 
Jan. 1. A program will be given 
under the direction of Mrs. Verne 
Furner and a potluck supper will 
be served. Members are to bring 
their own table service. Mrs. Carole 
McCormlck and Mrs. Lottie Svo-
boda have been named to arrange 
the supper tables and Mrs. I r a 
Morris will have charge of the cof-
fee. Members are to Invite their 
husbands or a friend to this meet-
ing. 

Lieut. Q. T. Quick of Selfridge 
Field called on Mr. and Mrs. Wil-
lard Kuiper on New Year's af ter-
noon. 

Dr. and Mrs. A. Beukema of 
Grand Rapids were guests on Sun-
day of Dr. and Mrs. (Howard O. 
Messmore. 

We regret to report that Mra 
Mary Harr is Is confined to her 
home again, due to a akin Infection 
on her ankle and leg. Mrs. Harr is 
consulted a specialist and it i i 
hoped she can be out and about 
again in a few days' time. 

Mr. and Mrs. James McCormlck 
and sons. Bobble and Pat, were 
supper guests on Wednesday of! 
Mr. and Mrs. Glann Spauldlng in 

c84-2t|Grand Rapids. 

By Clara M. Brandebury 

W. J. Glasgow and family enter-
tained for dinner Sunday, Mrs. 
Glasgow's brother, Dewey Hogan 
and family. 

Mrs. Oscar Hogan, who has been 
at the. home of her daughter, Mrs. 
Glasgow, for a couple of weeks, 
leaves this week to visit for sever-
al days with her sister, Mra Wash-
burn, of Lowell. 

Mrs. Ray Seeley of Logan, with 
Mrs. Peter Terry of the city, were 
dinner guests of Mrs. J . S. Brande-
bury and husband last Wednes-
day. Mrs. Seeley was the guest of 
friends in the city for a couple of 
days. She returned to Logan on 
Wednesday night. 

Mrs. Zoa Overholt Sarcia of 
Benton Harbor Is here to care for 
her aunt, 'Mrs. Frank Alger, who Is 
seriously 111. 

Frank Glade, wife and Delores 
of Aberdeen St., were dinner guests 
of J . S. Brandebury and wife Sun-
day, In the afternoon they all 
drove to the Brandebury cottage 
a t Hess Lake to see the beautiful 
lake In Ita winter dress. 

Miss May Whitmer. who spent 
her holiday vacation with her 
mother and brother on Rirtland 
St., left Monday for Holland to re-
sume her school duties Tuesday 
May has been teacher in the Hol-
land school and in the same room 
for nine years and is still very en-
thusiastic about her pupils and 
work. 

Gerald and Wayne Lape, who 
live with their grandmother near 
White Cloud, spent their holidays 
with their father, Seymour Lape. 
and their grandparents. Willis Lape 
and wife. Seymour Lape took the 
boys to visit their uncle and aunt, 
Stephen Weaver and wife of 
Bowne, for a couple of days last 
week. Seymour and mother took 
Gerald and Wayne to their home 
near While Cloud Sunday. 

Campau Lake 
Mr*. E. f t Hurd 

Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Hurd enter-
tained New Years with a dinner 
for Mr. and Mrs. Ray Lock. Miss 
Beatrice and grandpa Lock of Al-
aska and Clifford Nash of Grand 
Rapids. 

Little Carl Sherlngton was In-
jured quite severely Monday, Dec. 
27, while coasting down hill. He 
struck a tree and cut the left leg. 
He was taken to a physician where 
eleven stitches were taken to close 
the Injury. We are glad to report 
him as on the gain although not 
able to be on his feet. 

Roy Graham attended the funer-
al of an aunt in Lowell Monday. 

Glen Snyder has been a t the 
home of his parents the past week 
suffering from a gathering In the 
head. 

Mr. and Mrs Herbert Cronlnger 
and family spent New Years with 
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Dygert and fam-
ily of Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Murray who 
have been visiting his parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Pltsch have 
gone to Lowell to make their home. 

U. S. Hunter attended the funeral 
of his brother Dr. Hunter at Green-
ville, Ohio, Saturday. 

Mrs. Rowley called on her sons 
John and Edward Cole and family-
Sunday. 

New Years dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Pltsch were 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Warren of Bel-
ding, and Mr. and Mrs. Pete Pltsch 
and children. 

Maynard Harig and family spent 
Sunday afternoon and evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Norman Pltsch 
and family. 

New Years dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. M. Clark were Mra. Laura 
Moore of Cutlervllle, Mrs. C. D. 
Terrell and two sons of Stanton, 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Gilmore and 
baby of Ravenna and Mr. amd Mrs. 
Charles Terrell of Grand Rapids. 

The 4-H club held their Christ-
mas party at the Wm. Bates home 
Dec. 29. 

Whitneyville Sunday school Is 
every Sunday morning now a t 10:30 
in the church basement No church 
services for the present. Everyone 
invited. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Campbell of 
Alto and Mr. and Mrs. Carroll 
Kraf t and son of Dutton were 
Saturday evening callers a t the 
Sam Snyder home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Camburn of 
Grand Rapids called on the Apsej-
and Sherlngton families Sunday. 

The Roy Graham family spent 
the holidays visiting their children 
in Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. Clark accom-
panied by Mr. and Mrs. Wally 
Meyers spent New Years eve at 
the home of H. Northrupp near 
Bradley. 

Mr. and Mrs. Burrwell McDiar-
mld and baby and grandpa Draper 
spent Christmas with her mother 
at Cannonsburg. Her sister came 
and spent the week with her. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orln Parish and 
son of Gull Lake spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Roy Wilson and 
all enjoyed Christmas dinner with 
Mr. and J f rs. F . Pariah of Allen-
dale. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Curtis had 
Sunday dinner with Mr. and Mrs. 
Lyle Benjamin in Grand Rapids 

Mr. and Mra. Lewis McDiarmid 
entertained their children New 
Years. 

HOW 
TO MAKE AN INEXPENSIVE 
HAT BOX; SIMPLE TASK.-
To make your own hat box Is sim-
ple. 

Docs it sound like quite an 
order? It's really not hard, and 
you'll have something individual 
and distinctive, yet inexpensive, 
says a writer in the Washington 
Star. 

Decidc on the shape and size of 
box you want and ask your gro-
cer for a wooden one with a cov-
er. There are several ways of 
finishing. For a plain box, enam-
el it inside and out, add a design 
on the cover, and there you are. 

For a fancier one, use a round 
box covered with pretty cre-
tonne. Line the Inside first, cut-
ting a strip a little wider than 
the depth of the box and long 
enough to go completely around 
it. Glue it on smoothly, over-
lapping it on the bottom. Now 
cut a piece to fit the bottom and 
glue it in place. Line the cover 
the same way, inside and out. 
and you're ready for the outside. 

Measure the box to where the 
cover fits down, cut a strip of 
cretonne the necessary length 
and width and glue it in place. 

Now bore a small hole in the 
center of the cover, insert the 
small end of a bronze curtain 
ring, slip a piece of wood or 
metal through it on the inside, 
and you have a handle to com-
plete your box. 

For a square box, cut the ma-
terial to fit two sides a t a time, 
to keep it even and smooth, then 
work the same way as before. 

How Halloween Started 
With Belief in Witches 

Halloween and the ceremonies 
that formerly attended it long an-
tedate Christianity. The chief char-
acteristic in the ancient celebrations 
of Halloween was the lighting of 
bonfires. The ancient belief was that 
on this night, the one night in the 
year, ghosts and witches were 
abroad. 

The main celebration of Hallow-
een was, no doubt, Druidical, says 
an authority, because the Druidi 
held great autumn festivals on or 
about the date of November 1, and 
lighted great bonfires in honor of the 
sun god as a thank offering for the 
harvest of the year. The Druids 
also supposed that the wicked souls 
that had been condemned to live in 
the bodies of animals were allowed 
to come forth on the eve of the 
festival. 

The custom of lighting bonfires on 
Halloween night survived until re-
cent years in the highlands of Scot-
land and in Wales. On the invasion 
of the Romans, certain character-
istici of the celebration of Pomona, 
such as offering of apples and nuts, 
were introduced into the celebration 
of the Druids. 

Bow F n e r a l Car Lights Started 
The custom of lighting the head-

lights on automobiles in a funeral 
procession originated some years 
ago in a general discussion by the 
members of the National Selective 
Morticians, an organization of fu-
neral directors, says the Washing-
ton Star. Any number of sugges-
tions came up at this meeting, such 
as signs to be carried, and pennants 
on cars, but the final decision was 
that the lights be placed on all cars 
in the procession. This would not 
be an added expense. While gen* 
erally used in many large cities 
and towns, it is not a national cus-
tom. However, some large cities 
such as Washingtmn, D. C., provide 
for this in their traffic regulations. 
Any driver or individual who goes 
through a funeral procession is vio-
lating a traffic law. 

Hew Snake Venom Is Extracted 
Here's how the venom is extract-

ed from a snake: The reptile is 
held firmly—in fact, very firmly— 
with the hand Just back of the head. 
The fangs are brought down into 
striking position. The venom is 
"milked" into a small bottle and 
sealed until used to prepare the anti-
venom. Poisonous fluid f rom the 
rattlers' tangs is turned into serum 
for treatment of rattler bites and 
nervous conditions such as S t Vi-
tus' dance. 

How Gears Compare in Efficiency 
Rated according to maximum effi-

ciency attainable with each type, 
common types of gears would prob-
ably stand in the following o r d e r -
spur. bevel, spiral, worm. However, 
efficiencies over 90 per cent are 
common for all types, and perform-
ance in practice will probably de-
pend more upon how well the gears 
are designed and built and the op-
erating conditions under which they 
work than upon the type. 

IncrMte Your Sot tho lety Krogor Way I 

Still lime to romplele your Ml 
uf Lwrfljr Lady Durit Sliverwara 
Ihrough •mall daily purrhann al 
yoar Kroger Store. liuild your 
ael thl* eaiy way. And re-
member——yon ran aerure yonr 
rhoire of any one of lhe»e 12.00 
••lla for only 65r Ihrough 
Kroger't Silver-Mine plan. 

FRESH BUTTER MICWGAII MAID 2 6 7 C 

FLOUR COUNTIT CLUB 
NONE BETTEI AT ANY P U C E 79c 

PURE BUCKWHEAT FLOUR 

PANCAKE 

HENKEL S VELVET 

lb. 
aaok 

FLOU1 - COUKTIT CLUB 
AILDDLB TESTED 

i r e 

5 JL. 25c 
r a » i t 

FLOtJB 
AMD A V m O C I MIXING BOWL FBEE 

sack 

lb. 
aaok 31c 

COFFEES 
"HOT D A I D " 
(l-Ik. b a r t i e l 

HOT DATID 

VACUUM 
PACKED 

SPOTLIGHT 

FRENCH BRAND 

COUNTRY CLUB 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

BEECHNUT 

HILL'S BROS. 

DEL MONTE 

SANKA or KAFFEE MAC 

£ , 18c 

& 2 3 c 

L 2 5 c 

• a n 2 8 C 

£ 2 8 c 

1 2 9 c 

^ 2 6 c 

L 3 8 c 

WHEAT FLAKES comtirrciui 3 X * 25c 

CLOCK BREAD 

CAMAY 

T w m o i 
SANDWICH 

SI.00 DB-JUBZLLB PEBFUNE 
FOB I c WITH S SABS 

CANVAS 

C L O V E S 

i a 
WELL MADE 

LONG WEABDIG 

PAIR 

COCOA 2 
CUB NOTHEB'S 

FEED 

2 . 1 12c 

3 bow 17c 

S. 15c 

100-lb. 

WESCO - SCBATCH 

$1.75 

MASH ^ 
WESCO - EGO 

too-ib. $ 1 < 9 5 

Jer toy Clovoi pair 15c 

pofr 17c 
NOMKET FACE 

Cloves 
BUBBEB DIPPED 

Cloves 

• r A M ^ BLUE LABEL 
KARO 1v4.ib.ea. 1*c 

S lb. can SSo - 8 lb. can l i e 
GIANT 10 lb. eaa tSa 

BED LABEL 

pai, 2 1 c &>• ea* M f t o - 3 U>. eaa BSc 
5 lb. eaa 35o — 10 lb. eaa S9e 

Y E L L O W 

CORN MEAL 
4 SACK 
UMIT 5 - 1 I V 2 C 

LEAN - MIATY 

SPARE RIBS -15c 
FANCY FINI SHRIDDID SAUII KRAUT *. ) c 

. 1 9 , Whit ing ^ 7V4c 
FAN PISH 

COTTAGE 

Butts *»• 
Callophaae wrapped 

P O T R O A S T * 1 7 c 
MEATY CUTS 

Rolled Rib ^ 19c Boiling Booff ib 1 2 ^ c 
BOAST BBISIET 

CHOICE SHOULDER ROAST *>. 19c 

SIRLOIN STEAK CHOICE CUTS lb. 19c 

JUST AHIVED - NEW SHIPMENT 

O R A N G E S — 1 9 c 
CAUFOBlflA NAVELS - SWEET AND JUICY 

An all tine low on this size orange 

NEW CAUUFLOWER SOLID HEADS • A C K 1 5 C 

NEW CARROTS FINGEB CABBOTS bnach 5 C 

NEW CABBACE * 5c 

KROGER 

Hew te Pick Squirrel 
When picking gray squirrel pelts 

for a winter coat pay special atten-
tion to color, fullness of fur. silkl-
ness and sire. The weight of the 
leather is about the same on all 
pelts, and need not influence your 
choice at a l l Really good squirrel 
fur is quite deep and generously cov-
ered with "guard" hairs which im-
par t the silky sheen. Cheap squir-
rel of poor quality looks dull and 
lifeless. 

Hew Sea Ancbera Work 
Sea anchors work on the surface, 

not on the bottom. They simpl;- ar t 
conical canvas bags that act as a 
drag to keep the boat's head toward 
the sea as she arifts. 

So. Boston G r a n g e 

A regular meeting of t ly Grange 
will be held next Saturday night, 
Jan. 8, at 8 o'clock. A card party 
and potluck supper will follow the 
meeting. 

The dancing party last Saturday 
night drew one of the largest 
crowds South Boston baa ever 
seen. Everyone had a fine time 
and we hope to see you back 
again Jan. 15. 

"We've just pulled Joe Alber's 
body out of the river. iHow about 
his Job—for me?" 

T o o late," came the answer. "I 
promised it five minutes ago to the 
man who saw him £all in." 

So. Keene-No. Boston 
Mrs. E d . Potter 

Alvln Bergsma and Mr. Toy of 
Grand Rapids were callers a t the 
Bergsma home Sunday afternoon. 

Recent guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Adrian Vandenhout were Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Vandenhout of near 
Ada, Jean Simmons of Lamsing, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Prledli and 
Chas. Vandenhout of Det ro i t 

Mr. aol! Mrs. Glen Sower and 
family had New Years dinner with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wm. 
Thompson. 

Dick Johnson of Lake Odesssa 
was a caller at the Will Potter and 
Ed. Potter homes Monday. 

Mr. Multikltis took Lucy Paul-
inkas and Catherine Hoover back 
to Kalamazoo Sunday. 

Edward Sower is staying with 
his grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wm. Thompson to assist with the 
chores while It is so Icy. 

Mary Anna Potter stayed all 

night Monday and Friday night 
with Jean Fashbaugh and Blanche 
Hawley and June Siefreld spent 
Tuesday afternoon until Wednes-
day afternoon with Mary Anna 
Potter. 

Mrs. Ed. Potter and Paul took 
Mary Anna back to Grand Rapids 
Sunday afternoon and called a t the 
Lisxewski, Byron Potter and Brad-
ley Boss homes. 

Mr. and Mra Adrian Vandenhout 
spent Tuesday evening at the Ed. 
Pot ter home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jake Staal and son, 
Claude, Mr. and Mrs. Bob Ford 
and baby were dinner guests a t 
the Gerald Staal home on New 
Year's day. 

Philippine government officials 
are getting ready to ask tha t the 
United States provide the islands 
with dominion status instead of 
independence. The growing pros-
pect that Japan may move in as 
the United States moves out In 
1046 is changing the attitude of 
the Filipinos. 

BE 
DECENT! 

Don't conch in public places! l a k e a Smirti Brothers Onigh Drop 
for yv**"ng, pleasant relief (TWo k imk-Black or Menthol-5#.) 

This is die vitamin that raises fhe resistanct of die mucous 
membranes of the nose and throat to cold and coogh infecdoos. 

I 
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LOWELL CREAMERY 

You owe it to your children and to your-

self to drink only 

Pore Pasteurized Milk 
We have taken every precaution to assure 

you of good health. 

E. A . C O M P A G N E R 

Want Ads. 

W a u l e d , For S a l e , Los! and Founo 

Bedding Cuts 
Dairy Diseases 

Jockey Sande Now A Trainer 

jCoweM Stems 

of25,30 and 

35 2/earsjfyc 
January 9, 1913—25 Y e a n Ago 

Eugene J. Mathewaon, 63, n 
care, reports A. C. Baltzer, exten- former Lowell re.sident, son of the 

wood cut sion dairyman at Michigan State late John M. Mathcwuon, Lowell's 
and hauled. Mrs. Charles H. College. pioneer ^iwyer, died at his home 
Thomas. 1 mile north of Mc- Deep bedding of from 12 to 16 in Portland. 
Cords. Alto Phone 24-F32. Cash, inches in depth is his recommen-: The Lowell school teachers and 

c34 dation. Most successful dairymen' Janitor Vaughan tendered a six 
— A * * 

FOR RENT —200 acres of clay Proper bedding for Michigan's 
loam soil for general farming, million dairy animala is one of the 
Thomas Gougherty, Alto, Mich, '"o.st neglected and yet most val-
Phone Alto 28-F11. p34 unMe pointers in proper dairy herd 

WANT—20 cords of 

... —ov .mwiuQ m m m n ociock oanquct to Supt. A. F. 
UK SAUE—Buick roadster. Good t h e y usually charge up about J3.50 Frazee and bride in the high 
tires, runs good. $20.00. J . Young, annually to each animal for bed- school laboratory. 
506 Avery St., Lowell. p34 ding. Yet these same dairvmen Births- At Bowne, to Mr. and 

. —T-TT ; agree with the college staff that Mrs. Harry Clemens, a son; to Mr. 
FOR SALE Good P ' a n 0 - proper bedding pays In the form of and Mrs. Wm. Flynn. a son; to Mr. 

walnut case. Mrs. C. M. Hime- J c g 8 ( j j 8 e n 8 e i more comfortable ani- and Mrs. Duncan Anderson of Ver-
baugh, Lowell Phone 187-F3. p34 m n j S i cleaner cows and greater gennes, a son. 

P f m HAIJC-Dinine room suite, conservation of manure. H. S. Young sold his interest in 
FOR SALfc. "Discaac alone is a problem |he Scott Hardware Co. to Louis dark oak; 

other household goods 
Faas, 1 mile north and 
west of Alto. 

_ t n a m wan* l̂ O. IC 
Lewis P ' O P " bedding can reduce the pos- Holtman of Grand Rapids. 

4 mile s'hility of mastitis by 25 to 30 per H. V. Getty and family of 
p34 cent," Baltzer declares. family of Gettys-

burg. Saskatchewan. N. W. T.. 
IT Many types of bedding are being formerly of Lowell-tp., returned to 

WANTED—250 men to save money used in dairy barns. Most popular the old home town to make their 
at Coons' January clearance sale likely is straw because it usually is home. 
of suits and overcoats. availoble as a homegrown product. Mrs. M. Kalward and two chil-

Flve pounds an animal for each 24 dren left for a two months' vi«if hr...... i- • • — 

FIVE 

NOTICE]—A boat came into our hour." i. j " 7 *".K" , , : , l i 0 1 n l w o months' visit 

L 0 " " ! ' 0 " , b 0 " t O " - }*• ? r n " .upply I. .bout o n / t o J . V e "! u . n ' 

months' visit 
witn relatives in Verdun. Montreal. 

— suppiy is about one ton for each Morrison Brighton left for a tr ip 
may have same by Identifying Cow. Oat hulls, flax straw, peanut to Los Angeles. Calif. 
and paying for this ad. See Wal- hulls, sawdust, baled shavings and Robert Benton. Infant son of Mr. 
ter Hall a t the King Milling Com- C Orn stover all can be used. Bean and Mrs. Glenn Conklln. passed] 
pany. p34 pods, swamp hay, peat and buck- away, having lived but two days. 

" , .. . r ,„„ wheat hulls also are used. John M. Rhodes. Lowell boy. who 
FARMERS F o , ' ' These materials differ In their had been employed by the Murphy 

tors, horses and o er s ability to absorb liquid manure. Chair Co. of Detroit, was promoted machinery, see John Watson. W h e r e l t t a k e 9 f l v e p o u n d 8 o f o a t t o t h c p o 8 ! t l o n o f h e a d o f t h c C 0 8 t 

McCormick-Deering Dealer at g t r a w f o r 2 4 h o u n | f o r e a c h a n i m a , d e p a r t m e n t W1th twelve clerks un-
>rna. P estimates place requirements of der his supervision. 

MONEY LOANED—To farmers at l 2 ' - Pounds for sawdust, about Mr. and Mrs. Earl Sherrard of - — —... aw>ui —»*• mm aara. £,ari anerrard of 
5 per cent Interest. See your f o u r pounds of corn stover and 4.4 Fallasburg sold their household 
County Agricultural Agent or Pounds of shavings. goods and left for Britton. S. D.. to 
Grand I?AnlHa PrnHnoHnn rVo^U , 

ARCADIA, Calif. . . . Earle Sande. famous race Jockey, and Maxwell 
Howard's The Chief wblch Sande is training for the fourth running of 
the 1100.000 added Santa Anita handicap. Brer a favorite with turf 

tana. Sande remarked to reporter^, "It's Just aa much fun to train 'em 
ia to ride 'em—and not aa much mud in your eye!" 

Al ton - V e r g e n n e s 
Mra. Clyde Condon 

Mr. and Mrs. Vern Leach, Mr. 
and Mrs. Merrltt Day, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Condon and Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Clark were New Year's eve 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Delbert 
House of Greenville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Condon and 
little daughter Merlene of Flint 
spent the holidays here with his 
mother, Mrs. Carrie Condon. 

Lionel Cahoon and friend of 
Pontlac were week-end visitors of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Baird. 

Chas. Rogers came home from 
the hospital Sunday. 

Harvey Elckhoff of Altoona, 
Illinois, Joined his family here last 
Wednesday and will live on his 

farm near Fallasburg 

Our dependable sel-
ected grades of coal 
are carefully chosen 
to insure the highest 
heating efficiency. 
Tell ue your heating 
problem and well be 
glad to recommend 
a type and size that 
will keep your fuel 
bill down to the 
minimum. For more 
beat value, less ash 
and dirt, call 

We Recommend: 
Brads haw Foe. 
Kenmont Lump A 

Egg 
Cameo Splint 

Macrariiiie Co. 
F. P. MacFarlane 

S. D. Wlngeler 

I I THE YEAR 

1938 
There will be at least one 
sure way to save money— 
and that will be by making 
your out-of-town trips by 
bus! 

Savings of 3 cents per mile 
or more will be yours if you 
go by bus instead of driving 
—and you 11 really enjoy the 
chance to relax while you go 
happily on your way. 

The local agent will gladly 
furnish complete information 
about fares or schedules. 

Bus Depot 

l E I I T I 1118 SIOIE 

Phone 30 

mother's 
Park. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Keecb. Mr. and 
Mrs. Merritt Day of Lowell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Florentus Vandenbroeck 
of Sparta and Tom Read. Jr., and 
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Clark were re-
cent visitors of Mr. and Mrs. Vern 
Leach. 

Mrs. Lewis and Laura Lewis re-
turned to Kalamazoo Sunday a f t e r 
a ten day vacation here. 

Clyde Condon got the largest fish 
reported so far—a four pounder. 
There a re twelve fish houses on the 
river out from Garfield's landing 
and several more including Den-
nick and the Kerr Brothers fur ther 
down on the pond. 

Mrs. Albert Blaser and daughter 
Jean returned Sunday from a 
week's visit in Ohio with her 
daughter and son-in-law. 

Ola Condon is visiting the L. B. 
Bignal family and Willie Rexford 
in Grand Rapids for a few days 
and then will go to Conklln for 
a while. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Bleri and 
Mary, Mr. and Mrs. Chris Bieri 
and children were New Years day 
guests of Mrs. Elise Bieri in Low-
ell. Other visitors were the Carl 
Sencmma family and his parents of 
Grand Rapids. 

Melvln Church of Flint is visit-
ing Dorus Church and the Peter-
sen family. 

Mrs. Fred O. Wlngeler had her 
children and grandchildren with 
her for New Years. Also Libbie 
Carr and Fred Roasch of Keene 
and Ola Condon. 

Groups of young folks have 
been skating on the Alton mill 
pond through their holiday vaca-
tion. 

Harold Miller has gone to Elwell 
with his parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Petersen were din-
ner guests New Years of their 
father, Dorus Church. 

Alton school and their teacher 
are to be congratulated on winning 
first prize in Kent County for sell-
ing the most Christmas seals per 
capita which was 66 and two-
thirds. The school will receive a set 
of books. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Condon were 
in Lowell Monday for the funeral 
services for Mrs. Katie Wilson. 
She will be greatly missed by her 
neighbors who always looked for-
ward to having her come home in 
the spring from staying the winter 
months at her nephew's home In 
Grand Rapids, a s they spent a par t 
of every day and evening together. 
The passing of Miss Dingier who 
lived in this same neighborhood a 
few years back will also be missed 
by many people around town who 
were used to exchanging a friendly 
greeting. She had been crippled 
since about five years of age and 
had expressed a desire to have her 
faithful crutches buried with her. 
She was 71 years of age and Mrs. 
Wilson was past 80 years. 

Grand Rapids Production Credit 
Ass'n. Murray Bldg., Grand Rap-
Ids. Mich. c3tf 

FOR SALE— 
1937 Dodge Trunk Sedan. 
1937 Dodge DeLuxe Coupe. 
1936 Ford DeLuxe Trunk Sedan. 
1936 Plymouth Trunk Sedan. 
1935 Plymouth 2-Door Sedan. 
1934 Plymouth Coach. 
1933 Plymouth Sedan. 
1930 Plymouth Coach. 
1935 Chevrolet Coach. 
1933 Chevrolet Master Sedan. 
1932 Chrysler DeLuxe Sedan. 
1931 Ford Sport Coupe. 
1929 Oldsmoblle Coupe. 
1928 Buick Coupe. 
Gould's Garage, Phone 269. 

W. B. B. A. 

The W. B. B. A. 4-H Club met a t 
the Waters School on Tuesday eve-
ning of January 4th. 

The meeting was called to order 
c34 by the president, Donald Anderson 

r a n d minutes of the last meeting 
FOR SALE—Delco pressure pump, were read and approved. After the 

32 volt; also 44 32 volt bulbs, business meeting several games 
Henry Klahn. 8 miles south of were played. Virginia Ford played 
Lowell. Elmdale phone 1-F5., several selections. 

p34-2t Last but not least came the re-
" ~T . , „ ~ | freshments of which there was F O U N D - W r i s watch by C. w m o r e t h a n p l e n t y f o r e v e r y o n e . 

Klumpp. Call a t R u n d m a n pout- M r C e n t m i a n d D e l b e r t F o r d are 
try house. Phone 11 Corner t h e ] e a d e r 8 f o r t h e H a n d l c r a f t 
prove property and pay for this C l u b 8 M l g 8 A n d e r 8 0 n M r s 

a c l ' ' Roy Ford, Mrs. Eva Kropf and 
FOR R E N T — L o w e r furnished Mrs. Christine Mol are the leaders 

apartment, reasonable. Inquire for the Sewing Clubs. 
Mrs. James Topp, 310 Avery St., 
Lowell. p34 

FOR SALE—We have a small 
H a p p y Maids" 

The "Happy Maids" 4-H Sewing 
quantity of buttermilk suitable Club has had two meetings under 
for hog or chicken feed, 2c per the leadership of Miss Estella An-
gallon. Lowell Creamery. c34 derson and the assistant leader, 

. Mrs. Donna Anderson. 
On Saturday afternoon of Dec-

ember 18, the girls met at the 
home of their leaders to organize. 

The following officers were elec-
ted: President, 
boom; Vice 

Lowell M a r k e t R e p o r t 
Corrected Jan. 6, 1938 

Wheat, bu. I ~ - | i e a : President, Eileen Gronen-
Rye. bu 65 boom; Vice President, Virginia 
Corn. bu. . . . 4 0 , F o r d . Secretary, Alice Tlminsky; 
Buckwheat cwt ^ T r e a s u r e r , Elsie Gronenboom. 
Barley, cwt 1.10 M l B 8 e Eleanor Densmore was 
Oats, b u . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .32 w j t h U 8 a t jjjjg meeting and helped Corn and Oats Feed. c w t . . . . 1.56 U 8 g e t 8 t a r t e d T h e a d v l 8 e r 8 f o r 

Corn Meal. • J J® the club are: Mrs. Jim Ford. Mrs 
Coarse Cracked Com. CWt. . . William Tlminsky and Mrs. Orle 
Shelled Corn, bu 'J* Gronenboom. 

i T ? T*16 M X * meeUng was held at 
w t h e h o m e o f M r 8 - J t m F o r d o n t h e 

Flour bbl . . . . afternoon of December 28. Mrs. Pea Beans, cwt 2.60 
Light Red Beans, c w t ! . . " . ! . 3.25 A n d e r 8 0 n gave a demonstration of 
Dark Red Beans, c w t . . . ! ! ! . ! 3.25 w h a t h a PP«n s when sewing Is left 
Light Cranberry cwt,. jTsO J " . • c h , l r w l t h " " " 
Yellow Eye Beans, cwt 3.25 , n "• 
Potatoes, cwt 65 
Butter, lb 33 F A I E ENOUGH 
But te r fa t lb 36 
Eggs, doz .25 
Hogs, live, cwt 8.25 
Hogs, dressed, cwt 11.50 
Beef, live, lb 04-.12 
Beef, dressed, lb 08-.18 
Chickens, lb 18-.20 

locate on a cattle ranch belonging 
to Mrs. Sherrard's brother. 

Olln Hyde, aged 8 years, and 
Marvin Kaufman, aged 6. were se-
verely Injured while sliding down 
hill at the South Ward school dur-
ing the recess hour. 

January 9, 1908—30 Years Ago 

Mrs. Charles McCarty, a life-long 
resident of Lowell, passed away at 
her home here af ter a six days" 
illness. 

Avery E. Field attended the Med-
al Contest banquet at Sparta, over 
175 being present. 

Mrs. Wm. A. Mullen, 18, passed 
away a f t e r a five days' Illness at 
her home in West Lowell. 

Several parties were given by 
relatives in Vergennes honoring 
Lawrence Anderson, before his de-
par ture fo r his home In Denver. 
Colo., a f t e r an extended visit here. 
This was his first visit home in 25 
years. 

A son was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Yelter of South Lowell. 

J . E. Pa rke r left for an extended 
trip to Denver, Colo., and other 
western points. 

W. W. Pullen left for a prospect-
ing tour of New Mexico and other 
states in the southwest, having re-
signed his poslton a t the Howk 
shoe store. 

Vere Parks returned from Twin 
Falls. Idaho, having been summon' 
ed by telegram from the Ypsilanti 
Reed Furni ture Co. of Ionia, to ac-
cept a fine position as traveling 
salesman for them. 

Edwin Fallas making 
weeks' business tr ip to 
Minn. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Boylan lo-
cated for the present In Los 
Angeles. Calif. R. B. writes: "Sun 
shines, flowers bloom, fleas bite, 
nose runs, everything goes but 
currency." 

An old landmark disappeared 
from the Peck farm on the hill, the 
barn which stood for many years 
on the west side of the road, north 
of the Peck house being torn dowm 
by Alfred Teft and removed to his 
farm home in Keene. 

CTOMMORES 

S T Y L E OF 
VALUES 

Greater Savings on Quality Foods Every 

Day in this New Year. Prompt, Cour-

teous, Helpful Service. 

FLOUR 
GRAHAM For Muffins and Brraid 

PANCAKE King Bird—Self Rising 

CORNiMEAL 
BEST YET 
LILY WHITE 
GOLDEN CREST 

Nationally Known and Pop-
ular Brands—Finest West-
ern and Michigan Flour. 

Buckeye ilrnnd 
For Corn Cakes and Gems 

Hard Kanna* 
Winter Wheat 

All rurpose-I'opular 
Brand Flour 

For Hreod 
and I'aHtrieH 

r ib. 
v l«K 15c 
5 lh-* baR 19c 
5 17c 

24V2 ^ 79c 
24V2 ^ 90c 
24^ ^ 87c 

CANNED FOODS 
3 
3 

a five 
Duluth. 

Sharp Tools Reduce 
on Farm • n i l 

Alton Community Church 
At 10:30 a. m. all are cordially 

invited to public worship. In the n e 8 8 l ) k e f a r m e r g i n M l c h i g a n ' a r e 
meantime the Sermon on t h e i f l n d l l t r o f l U l W e t 0 i e t pr<>. 
Mount Is recommemled for y o u r l . _. " -

The pilot was giving exhibition 
flights at five shillings a time. 

"Now." he said to his passengers 
before taking off, "I am going to 
rise to 2,000 feet. If by accident 
anything should go wrong, you have 
only to pull the rip cord of the para-
chute strapped to your shoul-
ders, and you will float gently to 
earth." 

"But," ventured a girl, rather 
nervously, "supposing the parachute 
doesn't open?" 

Diversification is a long word 
but it means millions to Mlchgan . 1 1 1 3 1 8 311 right, miss, he re-
agriculture. In this state the varl- t u r n e d - I n 11 ,01 c a s e J u s t 8° around 
ety In production probably means t o 11,6 aerodrome cashier's offlce— 
that Michigan farms have as wide third door left up the stairs—and 
a range in necessary cutting tools you'U get your money back."—Tit-
as any other state. Bits Magazine. 

Tools are made to be used and 
uniess they are in shape for most 
efficient use the time and the 
labor necessary for completion of a 
Job may be doubled. 

Something new In tinkering is 
suggested, however, by W. H. Shel-
don. instructor in agricultural en-
gineering at Michigan State Col-
lege. 

The more scientific and busi-

readlng. Look for "The Two Out-
looks on Life." This Is the wor-
ship theme. And we need your 
voice in the New Year's choruses. 

David F. Warner, Minister. 

War's Toll 
WHAT A PUZZLE 

fesslonal t lnkerers do their shar-
pening and repairing of f a rm 
tools," Sheldon declares. 

He sees reasonable room for a 
well equipped farm shop. But the 
man who claims to be a bandy 
man may find that tinkering low-
ers efficient use of time. I t takes 
his energy and time away from Ma—You say Jimmy has been ar-
more profitable ventures and rested for shooting craps? 
builds up eyesore Junkpiles around Pa—Yes—the young rascal! 
the farm buildings. Saws that are Ma—But how on earth did he ever 
ruined by amateurs are other ex- g e t hold of a gun? 
amples of unprofitable a t t empta 

The man who used to be the vil- j __ , , 
lage blacksmith perhaps may be 0 n c ' t h e

l
r e w e r e

 4
t w o 1 ^ i c a J1 

equipped to perform expert work »T
n otherwise empty padded cell, 

in repairing tools and sharpening No furniture, no nothing but 
up farm equipment. Anyone can g t r " , t l f c k

T
e t " a " d c e " p f ( ! d l n g : 1 , t 

grind away on a cutting tool. Shel- F ' r s t . Betcha don t 
don argues, but the expert Is the k n

o
0 w " j 1 * 1 v e l n my hands, 

man who knows when to stop Second Same. Yes. I do. You 
grinding. Each time a farm or K0*1* wheelbarrow. 
kitchen tool Is ground on a stone * ? r l t S a m e : N o f a , r - >'0" 
or emery wheel, some of the work- e d 

Ing surface is removed. 

January 8, 1903—35 Years Ago 

Joseph Graham. 14-year-old son 
of Selgel Graham of South Lowell, 
was accldently shot while hunting 
rabbits, the gun being discharged 
and the shot tearing away a par t 
of his left shoulder. Leonard Bar-
ton, another young man of the 
same neighborhood, also lost three 
fingers in an accident a t his home 
by the discharge of a shot gun. 

The Lowell Shakespeare Club 
was Invited to a reunion at the 
residence of Mrs. S. C. Bradfleld in 
Grand Rapids. 

Charles Yelter of South Lowell 
lost two fingers while buzzing 
wood. 

Dale Bowen of Keene was united 
in marriage to Elizabeth Smith of 
Ionia. 

Clifton Perry, a former Lowell 
boy. of Davenport. Iowa, was mar-
ried to Miss Cora Aimes of that 
place. 

J . B. Martin of Grand Rapids 
building a new barn on his f a rm 
near Lowell. 

George Mesecar working for the 
Grand Trunk again, being sta-
tioned a t Brent Creek. Mich. 

Wesley Wheeler and family mov-
ed to Ionia. 

In a letter. Aldls Dawson writes 
that he and Roy Cllley were camp-
ing out In the cedar district near 
LaJunta, Colo., and that both of 
them were gaining in flesh and 
hoping for complete recovery of 
health. 

Miss Mae VanArsdale recovering 
from a seige of typhoid fever. 

The co-partnership existing be-
tween the firm of McMahon Bros., 
composed of Arthur E. and F rank 
J., was dissolved by mutual con-
sent. Ar thur E carrying on the 
business. 

Born, to Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
Gougherty of Bowne. a son. 

Grandma Helrlgle died at her 
home In South Bowne af ter a short 
Illness. 

With Nature^Heal th , Freshness and Flavor Sealed in.' 
gest Values for 1938 on Fine Quality Foods. 

PEAS Medium Size, Sweet, Tender, Early June 

CORN Finest Golden Bantam, Cream Style 

WAX OR GREEN BEANS Cut Stringiess 

Q l A Q U K y ' c r ^ r e e a Com and Fresh Lima 
9 U W W W I M 3 n Beans Superior Branrf 

Saur Kraut Fresh, New Pack, Good Flavor 

Tomatoes ^ R,pe 

S n a p - h p t f i Frmnco-A,wrlcan 

In Rich Sauce 

Pork & Beans Nation's Favorite 

Soups 

Rig-

No. 2 
cans 
No. 2 
cans 

No. 2 
can 
No. 2 
can 

Large 
No. 2 4 can 

No. 2 3 
3 

Tomato, Vegetable, 
Cream of Mushroom 3 

large 
23 oz. can 
large 
tali cans 

10c 

F o r Hot B r e a k f a s t s 

Rolled Oats 5 ^ 19c 
Creaa of Wheat £ r23e 
WHEATENA pkg. 23c 
MALT-O-MEAL pkg. 22c 

RALSTON CEIEAL pkg. 23c 

L A D D I E S 
A new cookie for a new 
year—Oven fresh, tasty. 
Special low price 

Rich, Smooth 
Pal Brand 

Fancy, California Sunklst 

Oranges ^ 
Iceberg 

Head Lettiee 

Children 
Like It 

19c 

2 ^ 13c 
P & 6 SOAP 6 giant bars 25c 
IEX MINERAL large pkg. 20c 

Peamt Bitter 
Apple Bitter 
Krenel Pudding Deeeerts 

Maxwell Hoise Coffee 
SOUP MIXTURE 
For Making Home Made Soup 

A l A A P u r i t y Brand 
U l w w For Cooking or Table Use 

2 

3 

lb. 
jar 

38 oz. 
Jar 

Pkg«. 

lb. 
tin 

3 9 
w P 

2 lbs. 

Pkgs. 

23e 
17c 
lOe 

27c 
25c 
25e 

c . l 

209 W. Main St. 
LOWELL 

S m y r n a 
Mrs. Albert Houserman 

NANKIIfO . . . Thla pbotogrmph, 

Ke of tho flm of the Nk&ktni 
mblnts. shows a p a a n a t ca r ry 

jtaf hi t dying child, aa tnaocoDi 
ricUm of the t» tUJc mflltair b o w 
bardmrat trhl J lattod tor t a t 
Uayt.. D a i * aad shoekad, dooton 
allowed tha a a n l a b e d father U 
P t o * hia t a « 

I t In estimated that nearly one-
tenth of the population of the 
United States has been affected by 
syphilis. 

NOTICE TO CORRESPONDENTS 

Please make an effort to send in 
your letters earlier In the week, as 
we are particularly busy a t this 
time of the year and it makes our 
work much harder when copy 
comes in late. If each one will help 
in this way it will make things 
easier for us. Trusting t h a t allj 
will respond willingly. 

Yours sincerely, 
tf. The Ledger.' 

ttiM 
D A N C E ! | 

At Snyrna Every Friday 
Right 

Faaturinn Clarence Gllson, 
Radio's Singing Caller 

Opening Dance J in . 7 
Cants , 2Sc Ladies 10c 

Bill Bollock's Orckestn 

Smashes Gambli 

: 

Each Friday evening, beginning 
Jan. 7, Bill Bollock's orchestra will 
play for dances at Smyrna, featur-
ing Clarence Gllson, the singing 
caller. 

The Lady Maccabees are having 
public installation Wednesday 

evening. Jan . 12. All officers re-
quested to be at the hall Monday 
evening for practice. 

Mrs. Peter Engemann and two 
sons. Tom and Jerry, spent part of 
last week with her sister, Mrs. 
Martha Conant, of Cedar Springs. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clair Norton were 
in Greenville Thursday afternoon. 

Robert Engemann spent last 
week with relatives in Lansing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clair Norton were 
Sunday guests of her sister and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Hastings of Belding. 

Leo Cowles Is taking treatments 
in Grand Rapids. 

Alburtle Harris and family have 
moved on the first f a rm south of 
the life saver towards Greenville. 

Frank Davis is in a hospital in 
Grand Rapids. 

Over 260 numbers were sold at 
the dance at Smyrna Friday eve-
ning. 

Ture=danvd New Years Tuesday evening with their par-
ents. Mr. and Mrs. Vern Lorlng. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Campbell 
and son spent Sunday with their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Russell of 
Parmalee. 

Ruth and Billy Filsble spent 
Friday. Saturday with their aunt 
Mrs. Henry Wltz of Grand Rapids. 

N. C. Thomas and Albert Stauf-
fer called at the Vern Lorlng home 
Tuesday. 

Mrs. Mattie Fitch and family of 
Dutton spent Sunday with her sis-
ter. Mrs. Manley Eldrldge and 
family. 

Born, to Mr. and Mrs. Rex Jon-
sma a t St. Marys hospital Monday, 
Jan. 3, an 8 ^ lb. baby girl. 

Mrs. Ef f le Harper remains about 
the same at this writing. 

Vern Lorlng had the misfortune 
to lose a good work horse Sunday 
which he had just recently pur-
chased. 

guests of Mr. and 
Flynn of F'reeport. 

Mrs. 
supper 
Joseph 

Little Boy: "Can I play house 
with you today?" 

Little Girl: "Yes. you can be m y 
chaufreur, and this can be your 
day off." 

L a B a r g e Ripples 
Mrs. Vern Loring 

H a r r i s Creek 
Mr*. Basil R. Vreeland 

of 

c34 

ALTON, I I I . . . Cbarginf t 
alleged gambling syndicate . 
Btranglehold on the town, lira.' 
Irene Kite (abora). 11-year-old 
housewife, imaihed 14 a)ot-ma< 
ohlnes In a "Carrie Nation" raid 
and thraatanad to wield hat hand 
axe on dice gamaa which aha taya 
are onaratlns hare. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Lorlng and 
daughter spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvah Lorlng and daugh-
ter of Home Acres. 

Mr. and Mrs. Colin Campbell, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Campbell 
and Ruth and Billy enjoyed New-
Years with the former's daughter. 
Mrs. Henry Wltz and husband of 
West Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Rathbun of 
Grand Rapids spent Friday after-
noon and evening with their par-
ents. Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Rath-
bun, then attended the dance at the 
I. O. O. F. hall 

Louise and Grace Mack spent 
Thursday afternoon with Verda 
Dawson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vern Lorlng, Andy 
and daughter of Conklln. Mr. and 
Stewart. Mr. and Mrs. Phil Hlgley, 
Mrs. Louis Luneke and son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Walt Flynn, Mrs. Sallna 
Lorlng, and Elwln Pell of Plainwell 
enjoyed New Years with Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Hlgley and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Luneke and 
son and Elwln Pell of Plainwell, 

Mr. and Mrs. John Heier 
Grand Rapids spent Friday evening 
and New Years with Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Geib and Ruth. Mrs. Sophia 
Mumford and son Charles of Cale-
donia were New Years dinner 
guests also. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Barns and 
son Ernest were in Grand Rapids 
last Thursday. Mrs. Barns went 
for treatment. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. R. Vreeland 
and Harold were New Years sup-
per guests al the Glenn Sanborn 
home. 

Ernest Barns spent New Years 
eve In Grand Rapids with his wife. 

Mrs. John Weaver of Hastings 
spent last week with her mother 
Mrs. B. Flynn while Mr. Flynn is 
in St. Marys hospital. 

Miss Jospehlne Burns of Grand 
Rapids spent New Years and Sun-
day with the home folks. Mr. and 
Mrs. Wm. Burns and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. John McDonald 
were New Years supper guests 
of their parents Mr. and Mrs. Wm. 
Burns. 

Mr. and Mrs. Conrad Schondle-
meyer entertained a number of 
relatives and friends at their home 
New Years day and evening. 

A large number from this way 
attended the party a t Caledonia 
New Years eve. 

Barney Flynn is reported as rest-
ing easy but still in the hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Flynn and 

Active interest shown by some 
important officials in promoting 
Henry A. Wallace. Secretary of 
Agriculture, as a presidential pos-
sibility, is accepted as the latest 
answer to the question of whether 
President Rooeevelt is Interested 
In a third term. The President is 
accepting the activity of his Cabi-
net members without question. A 
surprising amount of "delegate 
getting" for the 1940 Democratic 
convention is rumored to be going 
on among friends of certain candi-
dates who are proceeding on the 
assumption that Mr. Roosevelt is 
not going to be the nominee. 

A L E MITE 
WINTER 

CEAR LUBRICANT 

l/QWl (Ml to Ui 

TRfti-
o f t i w e 
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L PUBLIC NOTICES 
PUBLIC NOTICES 

NOTICE OF MORTGAGE SALE 
Defaults having been made (and 

B U C H defaults having continued for 
more than ninety days) In the con-
ditions of a certain mortgage made 
by Charles Deater and Clara Dea-
ter, husband and wife of Township 

MORTGAGE SALE 

Defaults having occurred by 
reason of tho nonpayment of prin-
ciple and Interest long past due 

Council Proceedings 
VILLAGE OF LOWELL 

Official 

The regular mooting of the Com-
uiider terms of a mortgage execu- mon Council of the Village of 
tod and delivered by William Vltale Lowell was hold In the City Hall 
and Ida Vltale. husband and wife, Council Rooms on December 20, 
of the township of Ada, Kent Coun- 2037 
ty, Michigan, to John Mathews, of T h e m e e t l w a 9 c a n e d t o o r d e r 

, . .Lowell Township, said county, on n« n-i"; r. m 
of Wyoming. Kont County, Mich- the 2nd day of September, 1930, b y ^ ^ c . 8 ' d e n V A r e h a , r t JL J?! 
Igan, to Home Owners' Loan Cor-
poration, a Corporation organized 
under the laws of tho United States 
of America, dated March twenty-
eighth, 1934. and recorded In the 
office of the Register of Deeds for 
Kent County, Michigan, on May 
Third 1934. In Liber 767 of Mort-
gages. on Pages 111, and 112 sald.giatutes in such case made and pro-
mortgagee having elected under vlded. and to satisfy amount so due. 
the terms of said mortgage to de-

and recorded on the 6th day of Trustees present: Day, Cook, 
September 1930, In the office of Roth, Shopard. 
the Register of Deeds for Kent, Trustees absent: Thome, Chris-
County, Michigan, in liber 716 of tlanson. 
mortgages on pages 353 and 354. 

Notice Is Hereby Given, that by The minutes of the meeting held 
virtue of the power of sale con- December 6, 1937 read and ap-
talned 'n ^ i d mortgage, and the proved. 

The application for a building 

clare the entire principal and ac-
crued Interest thereon due. which 
election it does hereby exercise, 
pursuant to which there is claimed 
to b# due and unpaid on said mort-
gage at the date of this notice for 
principal and Interest the sum of 
One Thousand Two Hundred 
Twenty Eight and 271100 Dollars 
($1,228.27) and no suit or proceed-
ing at law or In equity having been 
Instituted to recover the debt se-
cured by said mortgage or any 
par t thereof: 

Now, Therefore, by virtue of the 
power of sale contained In said 
mortgage and pursuant to the Sta-
tutes of the State of Michigan In 
such case made and provided. No-
tice Is Hereby Given that on Mon-
day, January 24th, I9S8 at Ten 
o'clock forenoon. Eastern Standard 
Time at the North front door of 
the Court House In the City of 
Grand Rapids, County of Kent, 
Michigan (that being the place of 
holding Circuit Court in safd Coun-
ty) said mortgage will be fore-
closed by a sale at public auction 
to the highest bidder of the pre-
mises described In said mortgage, 
or so much thereof as may be nac-
esaary to pay thc amount ilue as 
aforesaid, and any sum or sums 
which may be paid by the under-
signed a t or before said sale for 
taxes and | or Insurance on said 
premises, and all other sums paid 
by the undersigned, with interest 
thereon, pursuant to law and to 
the terms of aald mortgage, and all 
legal coats, charges and expenses. 
Including an attorney's fee. which 
premises are described as followa: 

That certain piece or parcel of 
land situated In the Township of 
Wyoming, County of Kent. Mich-
igan, more particularly deacrlbed 

" L o t Number 105 of Hl-Park, ac-
cording to the recorded plat there-
of. 
Dated: October 28, 1937. 

HOME OWNERS' LOAN 
CORPORATION, 

Mortgagee. 
HENRY C. HART, 

Attorney for Mortgagee. 
Business Address: 244 House-
man Building. Grand Rapids, 
Michigan. 

HOLC 668 c24. 18t 

fy 
costs of sale and attorney fee, permit of Mert Sinclair read, 
as provided for by Statute, which Moved by Trustee Shopard and 
It Is claimed at date hereof, U the ^ p p o , . , ^ b y T r u s t e e Day that the 

?WTO.()0) Dollars, foTw'hlch no J t | P«nn l t be granted. Yeas 4, nays 0. 
or other proceeding has been in- Carried. 
atltuted to recover same, or any M o v e d b T r u B t c e D a n d 

s ' r . ^ T „ o , ; m b . p r . S " . e . ' ; u " : ^ x r r , r h , h ' t , h e 

lie auction, to the highest bidder, following bills bo paid. 
at the north front door of the u - h t and Power 
court house In the city of Grand ^ 
Rapids. Michigan, o n Friday, Secretary of S t a t e . . . . 
March 4th, 1938. at ten o'clock A. 
M. 

Said property aa described In ainrlnir 
said mortgage la that parcel of * e r t S'nclalr. 
land situated In the township of Byrne McMahon 
Ada, in the County of Kent and , Paul Rickert 
State of Michigan, to-wlt: Gerald Staal 

ZION M. E. CHURCH 
John Claus, Pastor 

German preaching Sunday 
10 o'clock. 

Bible School at 11 o'clock. 
You are cordially invited. 

the furnace for gold, but the Lord 
trleth the hearts."—Prov. 17:3. 

7:30 p. m.—Worship service. Sub-
ject, "The Three Untlla." 

"And It shall come to paas that 
whosoever shall call on the name 
of the Lord shall be saved." 

8:00 p. m., Wednesday—Prayer, 
at Pralae and Testimony service. 

"Knowing this that trying of your 
faith worketh patience." 

I 8:00 p.m., Thursday—Young Peo-
ple's Bible study at thc home of 
Mrs. Thompson. 

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
Robert S. Miller, Pastor | SEVENTH DAY ADVENTI8T 

Sunday School at ten o'clock. C h u r c h gervlces are being held 
Training in the Christian faith. Saturday 

Morning Worship at 11 o'clock, p. h 
The pastor will preach and the 

at Zlon M. E. 

Elmdale 
Mrs. Ira Sargeant 

music will be featured by two 
splendid solos by Mrs. Doyle and 
Mr. Walter. 

Epworth League at seven o'clock. 

^ ELMDALE MICH. 
R, C. Johnson, Pastor. 

The Men's Club will meet for a 
supper and fellowship hour Tues-
day evening at seven. 

F. J. McMahon 
Jas. McMahon 

Beginning at the southeast corn-
er of land formerly owned by John 
A. Wunch, as described In deed re-
corded In liber 135 of deeds on 
page 575, being In the southeast 
quarter of section one (1). run-
ning thence north 20 rods; thence 
southeaatorly parallel with high-
way 40 rods; thence south 20 rods 
to a highway, and thence north-
westerly along highway 40 rods to 
the place of beginning, being five 
(5) acres of land, more or less, all 
In the southeast quarter of section 
one (1), Town six (8) north range 
ten (10) west, aald county and 
state. 
Dated; December 6, 1937. 

HARRY MATHEWS, dul; 

Dick Rutherford 
Roger McMahon 
Mabel Knapp 
Kittle Charles 
Jerry DeVlne 
Ted VanOcker 
Ray IngersoU 
Vern Armstrong 
Michigan Bell Telephone.. 
Central Garage 
Wm. C. Hartman 
E. Pierson 
F. P. MacFarlane 
A. J. Llnderman Hoverson 

& Son 
Litschers Distributing Co.. 

2.50 
124.62 
76.00 
66.00 
70.00 
60.00 
54.00 
36.00 
54.00 
44.55 
17.40 

.42.10 
40.12 
37.64 
16J6 

9.02 
6.90 

12.58 
50.00 

3.25 

FIRST CONOKEOATIONAL CH. 
10:00 a. m.—Sunday School. 
11:00 a. m.—Church service. 
Dr. Roger Hazolton of Olivet 

will speak again thla week. 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARKNE 
Lowell, Mich. 

C. L. Bradley. Pastor 
Sunday School —10:00 a. m. 

Lawrence Maxson, Supt. 
Classes for all ages and a wel-

come to all. 
Preaching—11:00 a. m. by the 

pastor. 
N. Y. P. 8 . -8:45 p. m. Clyde 

Newell, Pres. 
Evangelistic Service—7:30 p. m. 

ARRY MATHEWS dujr W e 8 t i n g h o u M E , e c . Co 
appointed and Acting Ad- o,1_n |„ rv. 
mlnlstrator of said John Electric SuPPty Co. 
Mathewa, deceased 

EDWARD U EARDLEY, 
Attorney for Harry Mathews 
administrator. 
Grand Rapids, Michigan. 

Graybar Electric Co 
Munlclp'l Acceptance Corp. 
Mich. Gaaea 
Sherwood Hall Ltd 
L. R. Klose Co 

c 3 0 , 1 3 t Nilsson Dis t Co.. 
General Elec. Co 

399.44 

NOTICE O F MORTGAGE SALE 

Defaulta having been made (and 
such defaulta having continued for 
more than ninety days) in the con-
ditions of a certain mortgage made 
by Fred A. Wurzburg and Celeste 
B. Wurzburg, husband and wife of 
the city of Eaat Grand Raplda, 
Kent County, Michigan, to Home 
Owners' Loan Corporation, a Cor-
poration organized under the laws 
of the United States of America, 
dated the Wth day of April, A. D. 
1934, and recorded in the office of 
the Register of Deeds for Kent 
County, Michigan, on the 18th day 
of May A. D. 1934, In Liber 769 of 
Mortgages, on Pages 547, 548, and 
said mortgagee having elected un-
der the terms of said mortgage to 
declare the entire principal and 
accrued interest thereon d u e , 
which election it does hereby exer-
cise, purauant to wblch there la 
claimed to be due and unpaid on 
aald mortgage at the date of this 
notice for principal and Interest 
and other lawful charees the sum 
of Ten Thousand, five and 55|100 
dollars ($10,005.55) and no suit or 
proceeding at law or In equity hav-
ing been instituted to recover the 
debt secured by said mortgage or 
any part thereof; 

Now, Therefore, by virtue of the 
power of sale contained In suld 
mortgage and pursuant to the Sta-
tutes of the State of Michigan In 
such case made and provided. No-
tice Is Hereby Given that on tha 
1st day of March A D. 1938 a t 10 
o'clock forenoon. Eastern Standard 
Time at the north port door of the 
Court House In the city of Grand 
Rapids, County of Kent, Michigan 
(that being tne place of holding 
Circuit Court In said County) aald 
mortgage will be foreclosed by a 
aale at public auction to the high-
est bidder of the premises des-
cribed In said mortgaee, or so 
much thereof as may be necessary 
to pay the amount due as afore-
said, and any sum or sums which 
may be paid by the undersigned at 
or before said sale for taxes and 
| or insurance on said premises, 
and all other sums paid by the un-
dersigned, with Interest thereon, 
pursuant to law and to the terms 
of said mortgage, and all legal 
costs, charges and expenses. In-
cluding an attorney's fee. which 
premises are described as follows: 

That certain piece or parcel of 
land situated In the City of East 
Grand Rapids. County of Kent. 
Michigan more particularly des-
cribed as: 

Par t of the West One-half. ( V 4 ) 
Of the Southwest one-quarter ( V 4 ) 
of Section Twenty-eight (28), Town-
ship Seven (7) North, Range Ele-
ven (11) West commencing at a 

Int Seven Hundred Sixteen and 
'en One Hundredths (716.10) feet 

East and Four Hundred Fifty 
E k h t (458) feet North of the 
Southwest comer of said Section. 
Vuence North Four Hundred Eighty 
Three and Seventy Seven One 
Hundredths (483.77) feet to the 
center of Robinson Road, (so-call-
ed). thence Easterly along the cen-
ter of said Road One Hundred 
Fifty One (151) feet, thence South 
to a point due East of the begin-
ning. thence West One Hundred 
Fifty One (151) feet to the begin-
ning. except and reserving the 
South Two Hundred Twenty five 
(225> feet and all rlghta to the 
public In Robinson Road and 
Brlarwood Avenue (so-called.) 
Dated: November 29, 1937. 

HOME OWNERS' LOAN 
CORPORATION, 

Water Works 

APPOINTMENT O F AD MINIS 
TRATOR 1™ . . 

. , Total $1,411.53 
State of Michigan. The Probate 

Court for the County of Kent. 
At a session of aald court. h e l 4 i 

at the probate office In the city of Intereat on Bonda | 335.25 
Grand Raplda, In aald county on Julius Baaler 30.00 
the 29th day of December A. D. Michigan Bell Telephone.. 3.01 
1937. , , Wm. C. Hartman 

Preaent: JOHN DALTON, Judge 
of Probate. , Total 

In the Matter of the Estate of 
Lewis F. Denny, Deceased. City Hall 

Leo A. Denny having filed 
In said court hia petition praying Fred Gramer 

Michigan Bell Telephone.. 

10.46 

.$ 378.72 

Mr. and Mra. Carlos Sooao and 
Mr. and Mra. Clinton Schwab spent 
Sunday evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
Addison Erb of Ionia. 

Ora Miller and family visited 
New Year's day with Chauncey 
Miller and daughters of East 
Campbell. 

John Lott Is doing electrical wir-
ing for Sam Kelm and Walter at 
their home residence. 

Glenn Oversmlth and wife spent 
Monday In Grand Rapids. 

Wealey Kelm and family are 
now nicely aettled on hia father'a 
farm which they have rented. 

John Overholt and wife accom-
panied by their son Homer and 

j Rev. J . D. Glnrlch motored to 
OF T H E NAZARENE Goshen, Ind. where Homer will 

again reaume hia studlea at the 
College and the latter returned to 
hia home af ter conducting revival 
meetinga a t thla place. 

Rev. R. C. Johnson la holding re-
vival meetinga at the Nazarene 
church of Nashville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Will Shroyer en-
tertained her niece and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Wheeler, also 

Sabbath School—2:00 p. m. 
Preaching Service—3:00 p. m 
Everyone welcome. 

10:00 a. m.—Sunday School. 
11:00 a. m.—nMornlng Worship. 
7:15 p. m.—N. Y. P. S. 
8:00 p. m—Evangelistic service. 
8:J0 p. m.—Wednesday Prayer 

meeting. 
We sincerely trust that you will 

start the new year right by at-, . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
tending church every Sunday. You J d » u f h

J
t e r « n d husband all of 

will be richly rewarded, if you do. Elkhart, Ind. over the New Year s 
Keep the revival in mind, Jan. 23[holiday vacation 

to Feb. 8. Plan to attend as much " J " " " 
as possible. 

We want to welcome you to our 
regular services if you do not at-
tend elsewhere. 

RIVERSIDE CHAPEL 

Mr. and Mrs. Carlos Seese enter-
tained about 30 of their friends 
and neighbors New Year's eve. 
Card playing was the entertain-
ment of the evening. Mrs. John 
Lott and Ira Sargeant carried 
away first honors while Mrs. 

Corner Main S t and Riverside Dr. Clinton Schwab and John Lott 
:won consolations. At a late hour 

Riverside C h a p e l , formerly 
known as the Evangelistic church, 
has moved from the Hosley build-
ing to the new location, corner of 
Maln-st. and Riverside Drive. 

Evangelist L. Underwood, who conunu^ty mt-totgether. 
has hsd 25 years of experience, al- U n H e n r y Kauffman waa sev-
so an employee o f J ^ f r a l Bfcle e r eiy burned on her arms, hands. 
Institute, Is our special speaker. eye_ . n d hair Monday evening, 
M r t a I n ^ M^ollaf ^ n d ^ l w 0 F g r a n c J s w h e n B h e P o u r e d kerosene into the 

- ' 7 "ss; 
graduates of Central Bible Insti- E m a n u e , yoder was slightly burn-

praying 
that the administration of said 
estate be granted to Leo A. Denny 
or to some other suitable per-
son. 

It is Ordered, that the 28th day 
of January A. D. 1938 at ten o'-
clock in the forenoon, at said pro-
bate office, be and Is hereby ap-
pointed for hearing aald petition: 

I t la Further Ordered, that pub-
lic notice thereof be given by pub-
lication of a copy of thla order, for 
three successive weeks previous to 
said day of hearing, in the Lowell 
Ledger, a newspaper printed and 
circulated in said county. 

JOHN DALTON, 
Judge of Probate. 

A true copy. 
F R E D ROTH, 

Register of Probate c34, 35, 36 

F. P. MacFarlane. . . 

9.90 
3.72 
1.00 

Total .$ 14.62 

Street 

Gramer Fred Gramer $ 13.86 
L. A. Tanner 42.00 
Lodle Shear 42.00 
E. B. Clemenz 3.50 
Clinton Blocher 10.00 
Secretary of State 3.00 
V. W. Hunter 2.65 
W. A Hunter 4.40 
C. L. F. Williamson 7.50 
Lowell Lumber Co 9.82 
Kent Co. Road Commission 129.35 

Total .1 268.08 

General 

L. E. Johnson $ 34.70 
Secretary of State 1.00 
Fred Gramer 38.06 
Gene Carr 44.00 

Morse Lake 
Mrs. Frank Houghton 

Mr. and Mra. George Houghton 
and children were Sunday dinner1 sinking Fund l,500.0o 
guests of Mr. and Mra. Will Fair- Wm. Helm 3.28 
child. Michigan Bell Telephone.. 5.55 

S tua r t Bradley of Iron Mountain Central Garage 19.50 
spent from Thursday until Sunday R e . Sprlngett 99.00 
with Adrian Smith and both re- j h . Shultz Co 5.26 
turned to Houghton College of Economy Lantern Co .81 
Mines Sunday night. 

Mrs. Lucy Duell and Mrs. Jennie $1,751.16 
Yelter and son Donald were Sun-
day guests at Floyd Yelter's.' W. P. A. 

Mrs. Matt Metternick spent part W m ripim S 
of last week with relatives at Hud- y ^ 
a 0Pv i l l , e- „ . . . . . . F.' P . M a c F a r l a n e . ! ! " ! ! ! ! 

Lewis Houghton spent the week- G R S t e e l a n d s , ^ 

H o w i r f ^ h t ^ Overhead Door Sales 

M m S T D „ . 1 , vlil t td her ^ 1 1 ^ ^ C o _ 
daughter, Mrs. Mary Lorlng, last _, . . 
week. T o t a , 

8.18 
4.50 

21.40 
9.97 

307.80 
48.45 

a lovely carry-in luncheon was 
served and it was much later that 
the company finally disbanded for 
home, all voicing their sentiments 
that all had enjoyed the old time 

tute, Springfield. Mo. 
A nice, cheery place where every-

one can come and hear the old-
time and old-fashioned gospel and 
also the up-to-date gospel. Bring 
your friends along. They will en-
joy it also. 

Services Tuesday, Thursday,-Sat-
urday and Sunday evenings a t 7:80 
o'clock. Also Sunday School a t 
2:30 Sunday afternoons. 

ed, when she rushed to her daugh-
ter's aid to extinguish the fire on 
her hair and clothing. Mrs. Kauff-
man was immediately taken to a 
physician who dressed the burns 
and treated the eyes. 

Miss Shirley Leece is staying 
with Mrs. R. C. Johnson during her 
husband's absence. 

ALTON COMMUNITY CHURCH 
David F. Warner, Minister. 

.$ 400.30 

Mr. and Mrs. George Houghton Grand Total $4,224.41 
and children were Thursday sup- , 
per guests of Mr. and Mrs. Earl „ R ° 1 ' p a l 1- T r U 8 t e e 8 Day, Cook. 
Simons in Grand Rapids. R o t h . Shepard. yeas 4. nays 0. Car-

Marilyn, Caroline and Dorothy r l e d -
Lustig of Grand Rapids and Law- Moved by Trustees present that 
rence and Jack Curtlaa of Alto t h e meeting adjourn. 
spent Sunday at Charles Smith's. LEWIS E. JOHNSON, 

Mr. and Mrs. Adrian Zuledweg Clerk. 
were Sunday callers at Frank j A AREHART, 
Houghton s. President 

Mr. and Mrs. Merton Alderink of A p p r o v e d j a n . 3. 1938. 
Detroit called at Matt Metternick s 
Sunday afternoon. 

The special week of services, 
with Rev. E A. Ferguaou. the Irlah 
Evangelist of Port Huron, is of 
special Interest. Services each eve-
ning at 7:30. 

Rev. Ferguson was born and 
raised to manhood in Ireland. The 
rebellion of 1916 had some very 
horrifying experiences and he uses 
some of these experiences to Illus-
trate the truth that he preaches, 
and some evening during this week 
he will give his life story, which 
will be of great Interest. Do not 
miss this t r ea t 

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE SOCIETY 
Morning service every Sunday. 

11:00 a. m. 
Sunday School a t 11 o'clock. 
A testimonial meeting Is held 

every Wednesday evening a t 8 
o'clock. 

A reading room for the general 
public is maintained in the church 
building and is open from two until 
five o'clock each Saturday after-
noon. Here the authosized litera-
ture of Christian Science may be 
read or loaned. 

"Sacrament" will be the subject 
of the lesson-sermon in all Chris-
tian Science churches throughout 
the world on Sunday, Jan. 9. 

The Golden Text, from I Cor-
inthians 10:16, ia: "The cup of 
blessing which we bless. Is It not 
the communion of the blood of 
Christ? The bread which we break, 
is it not the communion of the 
body of Chrst?" 

Among the Bible citations is this 
passage (John 14:21): "He that 
hath my commandments, andkeep-
eth them, he It Is that loveth me; 
and he that loveth me shall be i Bible. 

UNITED B R E T H R E N CHURCH 
OF WEST LOWELL 
F. W. King. Pastor 
Lake Odessa. Mich. 

10:30 a. m.—Sunday School. 
11:30 a. m.—Preaching Service. 
Everyone welcome and cordially 

Invited to all of our services. 

CASCADE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
L. C. Doerr, Pastor 

Sunday School—10:00 a. re 
Church Services—11:06 a. m. 

ALTO and BOWNE CENTER 
M. E. CHURCHES 

F. S. Kinney, Minister 
Alto Parsonage, Phone 50 

Alto 
Worship Service—10:00 a. m. 
Sunday School—11:15 a. m. 

Bowne Center 
Sunday School-10:30 a. m. 
Worship Service—11:30 a. m. 

ALTO BAPTIST CHURCH 
W. B. Gardner, Pastor 

Bible School a t 10:00 a m. Enoch 
Carlson, S u p t 

Preaching service a t 11:00 a. m. 
Prayer meeting every Thursday 

evening. 
Communion the first Sunday In 

each month. 

Lowell DUt No. S 
Mrs. J . P. Needham 

School began Monday morning 
af ter a week's vacation' in Dis t 
No. 5. 

Among those who are on the sick 
list are Mrs. Emmett Needham and 
children and Mrs. Harold Graham. 

Mrs. George Conlery and son Eu-
gene of Battle Creek took dinner 
Monday with Mr. and Mrs. James 
Needham and attended the funeral 
of their a u n t Mrs. Katie Wilson 
in Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Schwarr 
der entertained relatives f rom Bel-
ding for New Years. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Needham 
took New Year's dinner with her 
sister. Mrs. Allen Lasby and fam-
ily at their new home In Lowell 
Other visitors were Morris Gra-
ham of Pontlac, Mr. and Mrs. Geo, 
Graham and little son George, Jr. 
and Mrs. I ra Johnson and children 
of McCords and Mrs. Catherine 
Taylor of Holland. 

Clifford Hoolsema of Skeels and 
cousin of Grand Rapids called on 
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Thompson one 
day during the week. 

Seeley Corners 
Mrs. 8. P. Reynolds 

The L. A. S. will sponsor a pan-
cake supper at the Grange Hall on 
Wednesday evening, Jan . 12. 

Mr. and Mrs. Seymour Hesche 
ADA COMMUNITY REFORMED a n d children were guests of Mr 

CQ^JUCH ' a n d M r 8 > Elmo Dygert of East 
Rev. Emo Ausema, Pastor Lansing on New Year'a Day. 

S. W. Bowne 
Mrs. L. T. Anderson The old-fashioned virtues con-

tinue to be the best. Consider this 
old-time formula: "If you wish for 
success In life make perseverance Richard Houseman of Grand 
your bosom friend, experience your Rapids waa a dinner guest at the 
wise counselor, caution your older Leon Anderson home Monday and 
brother, and hope your guardian Tuesday of last week. 
genius."—Grit. 

B. H. SHEPARD, M. D. 
PhoiM 47 

J. A. MacDONELL, M. D. 
P h o n . 110 

Negonce Block, Lowell 

Miss Lucy Youngs of Grand 
Rapids was a week-end guest of 

jher friend, Clair Gougherty. 
George Howard and sons were 

on the sick Hat the past week. 
| Mrs. John Flynn and son Joe 
were New Year'a guests a t the Joe 

1 Flynn home In Freepor t 
Misses Katherine and Mary 

OfflceHours, 210.4 .nd 7 to8p.m ? 1 : " ^ 
Office Phone 36 

LESLIE L. DA 
tgage 
VIDS ON 

Attorney for Mortgagee. 
Business Address; 850 Michigan 
Trust Bldg., Grand Raplda. 
Michigan. 

M-ST-558 c29, 18t 
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Our job ihoo ip m near to you 

• i j o u r rrtrphooe. Pbooe us to 

mH and ws will be d e b t on the 
j o b t o g a t t k a j o b j r o u L r e f o f U i 

You are invited to come every 
Sunday a t 10:00 a. m. and 7:80 p. 
na. 

Our aim is: 
To preach Christ Crucified. 
To Terxh Youag and Old the 

To cheer the Sick and Sorrowing. 
To befriend the Needy. 
To christianize our Community. 
Sunday School a t 11:15 a. m. 
Christian Endeavor at 8:45 p. m. 
A place for every member of 

loved by my Father, and I will 
love him, and will manifest myself 
to him." 

Correlative passages to be read 
from the Christian Science text-
book, "Science and Health with 
Key to the Scriptures," by Mary | your home. 
Baker Eddy, include the followin" 
(p. 4): 'To keep the command- CONGREGATIONAL CH. 
menta of our Master and follow I Henry L. Rust, Minister 
His example. Is our proper debt to Q m.nA „ — 

of our gratitude for all that He - . t i a n Endeavor 6:45 p. m. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawton Cole and 
daughter Madelon were New Year's 
guests of Mr. A. J . Porrlt t of 
Bowne Center. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Hesche spent 
New Year's day with Mr. and Mrs 
Leo Bloomer of N. McCords. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Vincent and 
son of Grand Rapids and Mr. and 

has done." 

and schoolmates at a skating party 
Wednesday evening. 

j j r a n d ^i r B - Leon Anderson and 
D O U G L A S H . O A T L E Y family enjoyed a New Year's dln-

....nr., ner with their sister and brother-
— D E N T I S T — i in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Richard 

Office over C. Thomaa Store Houseman, of Grand Rapids. 
Office Hours : 9 to 12 and 1 lo 5 ; Bernard Flynn, Sr., who has 

Closed Thursday Aflernoon been very 111 at hia home alnce 
,>• , n i n . - en D«o Christmas, was taken to St. Marys Phones : Office 50 Res. 35 ^ e 9 d a y w h e r e h e w m r e . 

celve treatment for a time. 
Miss Marlon Griffin of P ra t t 

Lake and Alice Nash were Thurs-
day afternoon guests of Margaret 
Anderson. 

Mr. and Mrs. BurweU McDiar-
mid. Mr. and Mrs. Henry Cooley 

CATHOLIC PARISHES 
S t Mary's—Lowell 

Rev. Fr . Jewell, pastor 
8:00 a. m.. Low Mass sermon. 
10:00 a. m . High Mass and ser 

mon. 

S t Pntrtck's—Parnell 
Rev. Fr . McNeil, pastor 

8:00 a. m., Low Mass and sermon. 
10:00 a. m. High Mass and ser 

mon. 
Cascade and Bowne 

Rev. Fr. E. H. Racette, pastor 
Services a t 8:80 and 10:00 a. m. 

Christian Endeavor 6:45 p 
Evening worship and sermon 

7:80 p. m. 
The annual meeting of the 

chnrch will be held at two o'clock 
on the afternoon of Saturday, Jan. 
8th. 

ALASKA BAPTIBT CHURCH 
A. Cederlund. Minister 

Sunday School a t 9:30 a. m 
Classes for a l l 

Preaching services at 10:80. 
No Sunday evening services. 
Bible study and prayer meeUng 

each Thursday evening. 

Our 1937 Record 
The offtcera, directors and every policy holder of the State 

Mutual Fire Insurance Company of Michigan have reason to 
feel proud of the record made by this company during the year 
Just closed. Our records reveal the following: 

Net increase of members - - 3,753 
Net increase of insurance $9,799,900 

Also substantial gains made in net assets. 

Every policy holder beneflta f rom this record. 

For fur ther Information see local representative or write the 
Home Office, 

Lowell—Harry 
Warner , A. R 
Cascade—John J. 

d D. A. Wlngeler, R E. 
th. 

Watte reo n. 

Sprlngett, Grant 

State Mi l ia l Fire l i n r a i M Cupaiy 
•f Miehigai 

7M Church St , FVnt, Mlohlgao 

W. V. HURRAS, Prealdent H. K. FISH, Secretary 

Mrs. Evan Fuller and daughters 
of Hastings spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Cole. Jer ry and 
Roy Fuller who have been spend-
ing the past week with their grand-
parents returned to their home 
with their parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elwln Hosklns and 
Marguerite Burras of Flint spent 
the week-end with Mr. ana Mrs. 
W. V. Burras. 

Mr. and Mrs. I ra Wesbrook at-
tended a New Tear 's dinner a t the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ster-
zlck near Alto. 

Estel King of Freeport spent 
Thursday with Mr. and Mrs. Wm. 
Hesche. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Gane spent 
New Year's day with their son 
Kenneth and wife of Grand Rap-
Ids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Cornell are 
moving to Hastings where he will 
be employed by Evan Fuller. 

Mrs. Helen Reynolds spent the 
week-end with her daughter Mrs. 
Lois Tidd of Lowell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elwyn Gane and 
son of Grand Rapids spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. George Gane. 
Little Kathleen Gane who spent 
the past week with her grandpar-
ents, returned home with her par-
ents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Hesche called 
on Fred Qulggle of Gove Comers 
and found him much improved. 

Mrs. I r a Blough and Ivan were 
treated to ice cream and wafers a t 
the John Krebs home Saturday 
evening. 

Anna, Margaret, David and Mary 
Wlngeler and Clare Krebs spent 
Saturday and Sunday with friends 
a t Bay City. 

Delton and Ervln Stahl were 
Sunday guests at Will Hof fman ' s 

Mr. and Mrs. I ra Blough and 
son were Thursday dinner guests 
at J a y Blough's. 

Fred Oesch and family entertain-
ed ' fr iends from Akron. Ohio, for 
dinner Thursday noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Bryant and 
Arleen and Mra Rose Bryant were 
supper guests a t the John Krebs 
home Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. E . Wlngeler and 
sons were the New Year's dinner 
guests at the Walter Qulggle home 
In Ada. 

Mr. and M r a Stephen Weaver 
and Wayne and Gerald Lape were 
visitors at I ra Blough's Saturday. 

The next W. C. T. U. meeting 
will he held at the home of Mrs. 
Glenn Layer Friday. Jan. 14, a t 
1:30 p. m. 

Mr. and Mrs. Peter Stahl called 
on Sam Kelm New Year's day. 

Edward and Russell Anderson of 
E l k h a r t Ind., are visiting a few 
days with their grandmother, Mrs. 
Hannah Johnson, and Erin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Peter Stahl were 
Sunday guests a t Mose Stahl's. 

Lowell Center 
Clara • . Aldrlch 

Gladys and Richard Kinyon and 
Russell Aldrlch are hack to school 
a f t e r the Christmas vaeatico. 

Mr. nd Mrs. Earl Aldrlch and 
son Russell were Friday evening 
visitors at the Ear l Kinyon home. 

Pear l Parsons of Lowell spent 
Tuesday and Wednesday with 
Gladys Kinyon. 

Mr. and Mra. Ear l Kinyon and 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Slabaugh family attended a Christmas party 

STAR CORNERS 
Mrs. Ira Blough 

Mr. and Mrs. Orvie Stahl were 
Sunday afternoon visitors a t the 
Francis Seese home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Will Hof fman and 
David called a t the Sam Dausman 
home Saturday. 

Mrs. Walter Qulggle of Ada as-
sisted her daughter, Mrs. Edwlna 
Wlngeler, with her meat canning 
last week. 

and son were Sunday dinner guests 
at Milton Mishlefs. 

Friends from Akron, Ohio, were 
recent overnight guests a t the Ford 
Wlngeler home. 

Mrs. Alma Mlshler attended a 
quilting ut Fannie Seese's Wednes-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emerson Stauffer 
were week-end guests a t the Klip-
fer-Lacey home. They all visited a t 
the Ed. Lacey home on New Years. 

Mr. and Mra. Lawrence Sutter 
and family of Illinois, who have 
been visiting at the Albert Sla-
baugh home, returned to their 
home Friday morning. 

Marie Seese spent Saturday night 
and Sunday with Treva Seese. 

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Miller of 
South Bend, Ind., were week-end 
visitors a t I r a Blough's. 

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Miller of 
South Bend, Ind., and Mr. and) 

of relatives, gathered a t the Chas. 
Sterzick home on New Year's day. 

Clara and Stella Rltzema were 
Thursday night callers of Gladys 
Kinyon. 

Mr. and M r a Joe Green and 
children were recent callera of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest Aldrlch. 

Mrs. E. W. Aldrlch visited her 
son Ernest Monday afternoon. 

Tragedy 

Newly-wed Husband—"Do you 
mean to say there's only one 
course for dinner tonight? Jus t 
cheese?" 

Wife : "Yes, dear You see, when 
the chops caught f i re and fell Into 
the dessert I had to use the soup 
to put It o u t " 

A fool wants to kill space and 
kill time; a wise man. first to gain 
them, then to animate them. 

WHITNEYVILLE and SNOW 
ML E. CHURCHES 

Edward A. Aumstrong. Pastor 
Public Worship service each 

Sunday a t 10:00 a. m., the paator 
preaching, the Church School fol-

lowing. All are Invited to theae 
' r h e services. 

Gove Lake 
Mrs. H. L. Coger 

JOHN R. STRYKER 
— D E N T I S T — 

Phone 216 Honrs 9 to 5 

Open Wednesday^ and Saturday! a n d ' 8 0 n a n d j o h n Andrews spent 
Evening, 7 to 9 j f j e w Years as guests at the Lewis 

Office closed Thursday af te rnoons McDiarmid home. 
Visitors at the Thomas Gougher-

. n X 7 ty home the past week were Mr. 
L O W E L L PUB. LIBRARY I a n d Mrs. John McDonald, Mra. 
GRAHAM BLDG. — W E S T 8IDE| losephlne Scully. Raymond and 

- O P E N -
Tuesday, Thursday , Saturday 

f rom 2 to 8 p. m. 
AUDIE E. POST. Librarian 

DR. R. T. LUSTIG 
OSTEOPATHIC 

Phyaician and Surgeon 
General Pract ice 

Special Attention to Rectal 
Diseases 

(Prepared and equipped to treat 
Piles. Prolapse, Fmures a n d 
Pistuli without bospiUUxation). 
1174 Hadissn Ave , Graad Rapids 
PfceDCs: Office t87S2; Res. *8019 

Joan and Michael Murphy, all of 
Grand Rapids. 

Misses Margaret Anderson and 
Vivian Proctor resumed their 
studies at M. S. C., East Lansing, 
Monday af ter enjoying the holiday 
vacation at their respective homes 
here. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Troy and 
daughters were Sunday guests last 
week a t the home of Mrs. Mary 
Reynolds of Caledonia. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Flynn called 
on the former's father a t S t Mary's 
hospital Friday and found him 
slightly improved. 

Ledger Want Ada pay. 

LOWELL GOSPEL CHURCH 
Old Post Office Bldg., Main St. 

Charles W. Boman. Pastor 

10:00 a. m.—Bible School. 
whole school will study the Life of 
Christ, aa found In the gospels. 

11:00 a. m.—The Pastor contin-
ues the aeries on "The Living 
Word." Note John 1:1. 

6:30 p. m. -Young People's sei-l T h e H o m e Extension Class will 
v , « - m e e t Friday, Jan. 14. a t the home 

7:30 p. m.—Onr Inspiring s o n g ; o f M r a Antonldea. Please 
service In song and muMc. the pas- torl t | k b I e M r v l c e , note books and 
tor presenting another Prophetic p e n c i i B ._Mra. Leon Seeley. class 
message from the Book of Revela- reporter 
tlon, "The Four Horsemen." Hear M r a n d M r s . Charles Qulggle 
about their actlvlttea aa they ride w e r e entertained at the home of 
, 0 £ h * ^ ct j their daughter and husband, Mr. 

Tuesday, 8:00 p. m - S u n d a y a n d M r s L e w l i t f o r New 
School teachera meet, pastor teach- year 's dinner on Sunday. Other 
Ing the leaaon. 8 t a w e r e M r a n d Mrs. Henry 

Tueaday 7:30 —Prayer Praise grown. 
Testimony. Mr. and Mra Henry Brown have 

F r iday -Our city wide People's returned to Flint a f te r spending 
Bible Hour. We Invite you to t h l s ; ^ holldsys here. 
most helpful study of God's word. I ^ a n d j j r s . Leon Storm and 

Wo welcome all to meet with us. b a b y Howard, Mrs. Lura Storm. 
All our services are Interesting, ln - l G e ra ld and Richard, all of Pontlac. 
structlve. We stand for the Book , | W e r e Week-end guests of relatives 
the Blood, the Blessed Hope. 

LOWELL BAPTIST CHURCH 
Robert C. Gentx. Paater 

10:00 a. m.—Bible School. Classes 
for all ages. Everybody welcome. 

11:00 a. m.—Worship Hour. Sub-
ject, T r a y e r " in the Book of 
Ephesians, 3rd chapter. 

6:10 p. m.—B. T . P. U. meeting. 

here. .Gerald remained with his 
Grandpa Storm for the remainder 
of the school year. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Lewis are 
driving a new car. 

Fred Qulggle and Mrs. Claude 
Qulggle u e both Improving slowly. 

A fool always wants to shorten 
•pace and time; a wise m a n wants 

T h e fining pot is for silver and to lengthen both. 

Do You Need Any ? 
LETTERHEADS LEAFLETS 

BLOTTERS CIRCULARS 

ORDER FORMS PROGRAMS 

TICKETS BUSINESS CARDS 

LABELS STATEMENTS 

MENUS CONTRACTS 

PLACARDS POSTCARDS 

ANNOUNCEMENTS SECOND SHEETS 

BOOKLETS NOTICES 

CREDIT FORMS REQUISITIONS 

FOLDERS WINDOW CARDS 

PRICE LISTS CALENDARS 

ENVELOPES HANDBILLS 

BILLHEADS TAGS 

TYPEWRITER LETTERS 

When yon want pr int ing yau natnral ly w a n t good pr int -

ing, p roBpt ly done and at fa i r c a s t . . . Tha t is the kind of 

pr int ing w e a r e qna l i l ed to r ender . We have modern type 

facea, a wide selection of paper stocks aad layaa t sugges-

tions which wil l enable you to at ta in real ^aal i ty charac-

ter fo r yonr business or enterpr ise . 

If yen will phone, oa r representat ive wil l call, and, if you 

wish, assist yoo in olanaing the work to be done. 

The Lowell-Ledger 
Printing Department 

210 East Main S t Telephone 200 
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Last Week's News Letters I Plumbing, Heating 
Editor's Note—On account of the New Year holiday, the Ledger 

was obliged to publish a day earlier than usual last week and for that 
reason, a goodly number of news letters arrived too late for publica-
tion and they are appearing herewith. 

SEELEY CORNERS 

The program given a t Snow 
church on Christmas eve was 
greatly appreciated by the au-
dience, An offering of twenty-one 
dollars was received for the Chil-
dren's Home at Farmlngton. 

Mr, and Mrs. Leo Bloomer and 
children of N. MoCords, Mr. and 
Mra. Seymour Hesche and children 
and Wm. Bunker were Chriatmaa 
dinner guesta of Mr. and M r s 
Wm. Hesche. 

Christmas day guests of Mr. and 
Mra. Frank Antonldea were Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Egbert, Mr. and 
Mra. Arnold Alflen and daughter 
of Grand Raplda, Mr. and Mrs. 

and family, Mr. and Mrs. Manley 
Eldrldge and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Menzle and daughter were 
tho ones to attend from here. 

Last Tuesday night about 35 
relatives and friends of Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Kaechele of Carlisle 
sprung a surprise on them. It be-
ing their 26th wedding anniversary. 
N. C. Thomaa did most of the en-
tertaining as Mrs. Kaechele was 
not feeling up to par. The evening 
waa apent In visiting. They receiv-
ed many lovely gifts. 

LOWE DISTRICT 

Elec t r i c P u m p s 

Stoves 

G lass 

Roof ing and 
Sheet Me ta l 

We stock a complete line of 
Plumbing Supplies and main-
tain a Modern Tin Shop. 

Phone 78 Res. 305 

Chas. W. Cook 

c49 tf Chriatmas dinner guests of Mr. 
..-r—. a n d M r g G u y gnjit}, a n d f a m i | y 

Lou Antonides and c h l l ^ e " ° f j were Ray Thomas and family of of Benton (Harbor. Miss Mary 
Alpine, Mrs Miles Monks of S a r a - D e t r o l t J o h n T h o m a 8 a n d f a r n i i y Byrne were guests of Leon Weeks 
nac, Mr. M r ^ " " t h e ^ f ° r d of Lansing, Mr. and Mrs. Howard and son Alien over Christmas. 

n ? M r ' l H o u « h t o n o f Detroit, Mr. and Mrs Mrs. Lucile Howard of Grand 
and Jerry. Mr. R . n l d . v , . l t f d h . r . o „ . RoKr , 

and Mrs. Guy Monks and J a m e s . . . . . . • 
Monks of West Lowell and Mr. T ® ^ a " ^ , , n d 

Mrs. Leater Antonldea and nnd 
son. 

Mr, and Mra. Elvln iHoskins and 
i Miss Marguerite Burras of Flint 
spent the week-end with their par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. W. V. Burras. 
When they returned home Mrs. 
Burras and Marlon went with 
them for a short visit. 

Mra. Lois Tldd, Helen 
Thurston 

and Lewis and called at the Leon 
Weeks and Mike McAndrews 

Walt Thomas family Wednesday 
evening. They all attended the 
Christmas tree at Lowe School. 
Mrs. Falrchlld gave a very enjoy-

e d able program to a full house, 
rnursion of Lowell, Mrs. Isadora' M r - • " d M " - E " ! Fox enter-
Onan and Ellery Onan of West t a ' n e d their children and families 
Lowell, Fred Reynolds and M i s s Christmss day. 
Margaret Mains of Grand Rapids' Sunday guests at the Thomas and 
and Alec Robertaon of Lyons were Ksrcher home were Mr. and Mra. 
Chriatmas dinner guests of Mra. John Thomaa, Agatha, Harrla, El-
Helen Reynolds. K " 1 

Mr. and Mra. Seymour Hesche 
called on Mr. and Mra. Claude Sll-
cox of Alto Sunday. 

Dinner gueats of Mr. and Mra. 
R . L. Cornell on Chriatmaa day 
were Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Daw-
aon and Mr. and Mrs. Walter Alley 
of Grand Rapids, Patty and Ken-
neth Alley of Lowell and Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Cornell. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Gane and 
son were dinner guests Christmas 
of Mr. and M r s Dan Dlnsen of 

| Grand Raplda. 
Holiday week-end guesta of Mr. 

and Mra. Claude Cole were Mr. 
j and Mra. Alden Cole of Florida, 
Mr. and Mra. Clarence Cole and 
children of Grand Raplda, Minn., 
Mr. and Mra. John Vincent and 
aon of Grand Rapids, Mich., Roy 
and Jerry Fuller of Hastings and 
Mr. and Mrs. Lawton Cole and 
daughter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elwyn Gane and 
I children of Grand Rapids spent 
{Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. George 
I Gane. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Tredenick 
land children of Sheridan were 

fa i t A iiumas. -
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Benton and h o m " Christmas. 

Helen were In Hastings Friday. w ' " a n ( 1 T 0 0 1 Weeks wore 
Russell Benton and family of Thursday supper guests at the 

H a s t i n g were supper giiests of tho Wlttenbach home In Grattan 
lar.a* mi # li.. •••_ ... •_ MfH DimPfin of Da* Vf.. Mrs. Duncan of Detroit. Mr. and 

Mrs. Archie Duncan of Lowell 
wore Christmas dinner guests of 
Mrs. Eva Kropf and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Kropf's chil-
dren and grandchildren were Sun-
day dinner guetrts at their homo to 
celebrate Christmas. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Kropf spent 
Tuesday with Jay Cummlngs and 
wife of Clarksvllle. 

her and girl friend. Ray Thomas K U e " , 8 « t h < ~ C 1 ? r e 

and daughter and Mr. and Mrs. f ™ . **** M
T

r8-
Lewis Skinner. l l n d

r i
 d a u Rhte r Laura, Mr, 

and Mrs. George Crady and Mr. 

Graham, Mr. and Mrs. John Ohl-
man, Mr. and Mrs. Henry Yonkera 
and son Nick. 

Sunday gueats at Frank Hough-
ton's were Mr. and Mra. Howard 
Houghton of Detroit, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Houghton and Suzanne, Mrs. 
George Houghton and children and 
Mrs. Merle Dawson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Blakeslee, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Schwab called 
on Mr. and Mrs. Will Fox Sunday 
at Lowell. 

Mrs. M. D. Lewis of San Antonio, 
Tex., and nephew Charles Blakes-
lee of Lansing called at Walter 
Blakeslee's, James Eastorby's and 
Frank Houghton's Christmas day. 
Mrs. Lewis was called to Lansing 
two weeks ago, on account of the 
serious illness of her mother, Mrs. 
Mary Blakesloe. She is much better 
and Mrs. Lewis left for her home 
in Texas Monday. 

Sunday callers at Charles Smith's 
were: Mr. and Mrs. Fred Grote, 
Freda and Henry, Miss Erma Wal-
ters of Fennvllle and Rev. and Mrs. 
F. S. Kinney and Stanley. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Blakeslee 
entertained for Christmas the fol-
lowing guests: Mr. and Mrs. John 
Schwab and children from Rock-
ford; Mrs. and Mrs. Phllo Blake 
slee, Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Hotchklsa 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Voss and daughter. 

SO. LOWELL—BUSY CORNERS 

Sunday dinner gueats at thc 
Wayne Benton home were Mr. and 
Mra. Vernor Benton and Jean of 
Grand Raplda, Mr. and Mra. Lau-
rence Benton of Lansing, Russell 
Benton and family of Lansing. 
Laurence and wife are making a 
more extended vlalt. 

HARRIS CREEK R I P P L E S 

Mrs. Ada Thompson, who Is at 
the James Bama home, apent 
Chriatmaa with her son Henry and 
family, 

Mr. and Mra. Arthur Thomaa 
and three aona of Haatlnga ate 
Chriatmaa dinner with his father 
Peter Thomas. 
r Lawrence Anderson, who is In 
Sunshine aanltarlum. Grand Rap-
lda, spent Chrlstmaa and Sunday 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Anderson and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sylvester Thomas 
and family and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Weaver and daughter of TTwuting^ 

VUUUIVU TTI OUOIUAU WEN. w e r ® Christmas guests of the la-
guests of Mr. and Mrs. I r a Wee-Id |e«' parents, Mr. snd Mrs. Barney 
brook on Christmas day. |Elynn. sr.. and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. Cole and their' Mr. and Mrs. Basil Vreeland. 
house guests spent Monday eve- Hrs. Arthur Gelb and daughter 
nlng with Mr. and Mrs. John VIn- 'Ruth and Mrs. Frank Welton en-

Icent of Grand Rapids. 

STAR CORNERS 

Venus Keller and son Russell of 
| Grand Rapids. Mrs. Susie Miller 
and two daughters and Lloyd Short 

| were Sunday dinner guests at Will 
Hoffman's. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. Sullivan of Ionia 
were supper gueats at Henry 
Klahn'a Saturday. 

Marcella Mlshler of Grand Rap-
Ids spent from Thursday until 
Monday with her mother Mrs. Al-
ma Mlshler and Velma and Grand-
ma. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Qulggle, 
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Qulggle and Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Bloomer and family 
were supper guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. A E. Wlngeler and son on 
Christmas eve. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Sutter 
of Illinois, Ed. Mlshler of Pa. and 
Rev. John Glnrlch of Ind. and Mr. 
and Mrs. George Stahl and son 
were dinner guests at the Albert 
Slabaugh home Monday. 

Mr. John Showers spent over 
Chriatmas with his parents at 
Lakeview. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Krebs and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. I ra Blough 
and son attended a family gather-
ing at the Ray Seese home Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Lacey and 
Mrs El Klipfer spent Christmas 
Day with Mr. and Mrs. Emerson 
Stauffer a t Hastings. 

Ford Wlngeler entertained all of 
his children and grandchildren on 
Christmas Day. A bountiful dinner 
was served at noon and r r h . n g t n y 
of gifts enjoyed by all. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Terpstra and 
family of Byron Center were 
Christmas guests a t the Alma 
Mlshler home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ira Blough and 
aon were dinner guests a t the Will 
Blough home at Freeport Christ-
mas. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Wlngeler and 
sons were dinner guests at the 
Alma Flngleton home Saturday. 
Don and Dick Flngleton returned 
home with them for a few days 
vacation. 

The Christmas program and tree 

I were well attended a t the Star 
School house Frldsy evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eligha Stahl were 
dinner guests a t Peter Stahl's on 
Friday, the occasion being the Is-
dies' birthdsys. 

LABARGE R I P P L E S 

Mr. and M r s Colin Campbell. Mr. 
aad Mrs. Henry Wits of W. Grand 
Rapids enjoyed Chrlstmaa with 
Bill Frlsble and family. 

Mr. and M r s Alvah Lorlng and 
daughter of Home Acres, Mrs. 
Isicy Duell of Alto were Christmas 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Claude Lor-
lng and daughter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ora Dawson and 
family attended the Christmas ex-
brclses a t the Alaska church on 

M r s Ellsworth Harper is very 
[lick s t this writing with s trained 
nurse In charge. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Spencer and 
1 family of Jackson spent over 
| Christmas with relatives at La-
| Barge. 

I
Mr. and Mrs. Louis Luneke and 

son. Mr. and Mrs. Carl Hlgley and 
family. Mr. and Mrs. Walt Flynn. 
and Mrs. Sallna Lorlng were 

I
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Vern Lorlng. Mrs. Sallna Loring 
spent Christmas eve with her son 
Claud and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Rathbun of 
Grand Rapids. Mr. and Mrs. Irving 
Luts and son of Mlddleville spent 
Chrlstmaa with their parents, Mr. 
snd Mrs. Ralph Rathbun. 

Mrs. Boyd McWhinney wss tak-
en to Grand Rapids Monday for 

| treatments. 
The Eldrldge fsmily, numbering 

41 held a pot luck Christmas gath-
| erlng a t the home of their brothsr-
UHaw Bard on Tup per of Grand 

i Rapids Mr. and Mrs. Or s Dswson 

Joyed the Chrlstmss program at 
Caledonia school Wednesday eve-
ning. 

Mrs. John Flynn and aon Joaeph 
were aupper gueata of Mr. and 
Mra. Wm. Anderson of Alto Sun. 

Mra. Roy Foater la confined to 
her bed with asthma. 

Mra. Margaret Sllcox spent 
Christmas and Sunday a t home. 

Clifford Tolan of Syracuse and 
brother Robert Tolan, Mr. and 
Mra. Glenn Sanborn, Lyle and Dor-
la were evening callera Chriatmas 
a t the Silcox-Vreeland home. 

Mr. and Mra. John Flynn and 
aon Joaeph took the former'a fa-
ther Barney Flynn to S t Mary'a 
hospital Monday for treatment 
and perhapa an operation. 

Mlas Joapehine Burna of Grand 
Rapids spent from Wednesday un-
til Tuesday with Mr. and Mrs. Wm. 
B u m s and family. 

Miss Mary Graham of Detroi t 
Miss Rose Graham of Cascade, Mr. 
and Mrs. John McDonald, Mr. and 
Mra. Will Troy and the Burna 
family apent Chriatmaa with Mr. 
and Mra. Wm. Burns. 

HICKORY HOLLOW 

Mrs. Clayton Sparks <8 confined 
to her bed again at the preaent 
time. 

Mr. and M r s James Dennis and 
children of Lansing and Mr. and 
Mrs. Guy Rickert were Sunday 
guesta at the home of their mother, 
and slater and family. 

Mr. and Mra. Theron Cahoon and 
M r s Mary Rickert attended Christ-
mas exercises a t Potter 's Comers 
Thursday. 

GOVE T.AKir. 

The Chriatmas program at the 
school house Thursday evening 
was very much enjoyed and well 
attended. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wlttenbach 
and Betty and George of Ware 
Center were Christmas dinner 
guests of her mother, Mrs. Eff le 
Gregory last Sundsy. 

Fred Qulggle is reported sa re-
covering from undulent fever f rom 
which he hss been suffering sev-
eral weeks. 

Mr. snd Mrs. Leon Seeley snd 
daughter Diane spent Christmas 
with Mrs. Seeley's mother, Mrs. 
Cora Richards and other relatives 
in Grand Rap ids 

Mrs. Kenneth Axford and daugh-
ter 9e t t y Jean, Mrs. Axford's 
mother, Mrs. Walters, visited Mrs. 
S. T. Seeley Wednesdsy sfternoon. 

The Ada Orchestra will enter-
tain with an evening of music a t 
the Cascade church Tuesday eve. 
Jan. 1L An offering will be taken. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Seeley and 
Diane, Frank Janasek, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cecil Seeley and Charles of 
Grand Rapids and little Mary Vos 
were Sunday visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. S. T. Seeley. Other guests on 
Christmas day were Mr. and Mrs. 
Leon Blakeslee; Mr. and Mrs. 
Cecil Seeley and Charles of Grand 
Rapids; Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Seeley and daughters Genevieve, 
Virginia and Margie of Cascade. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Qulggle en-
tertained their family for Christ^ 
mas. Covers were laid for ten. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Coger en-
tertained her parents, Mr. snd Mra. 
R J . Slater of Cascade on Chriat-
mas. 

and Mra. Dell Ford and daughter, 
Mr, and Mrs. Carl Moshor of 
Lansing were Sunday guests at 
the Ford home. 

Mrs. Eva Kropf and daughter 
Dorothy visited at the Will Can-
non home In Ada, 

Blllle Eberhart Is spending a 
week with friends In Grand Rap-
lda. 

Mr. and Mra. Bert Myers, Mra. 
Collar of Lowell. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Gilbert of Grand Raplda, Mr. 
and Mra. Chrla Kropf and aon 
Earl were among the Chriatmas 
callers at the Mike McAndrews 
home. 

Oren Frost la home from Lan-
sing for the holiday vacation. 

Mr. and Mra. Phil Sayles of Chi-
cago were guesta of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gordon Frost and hia mother, Mrs. 
Susie Sayles of Lowell over Chrlst-
maa. 

Mr. and Mra. John McDonald 
and baby apent from Thursday un-
til Sunday In Chicago with his par-
ents. 

Will and Thomas Weeks apent 
Christmas a t the Roas Blgnall 
home In Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clare Alchln and 
aon of Grand Rapids, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gua Schroeder of Belding were 
Christmas guesta at the George 
Kellogg home. 

Silas Aldrlch la quite III. 
Mr. and Mrs. George Barnes, 

Milton and Mildred Barnes spent 
Chrlstmaa In Belding. 

Mr. and Mrs. Karl Kropf were 
Chrlstmaa gueata of her parenta 
In Grand Rapids. 

Earl Kropf of Lowell spent Sat-
urday and Sunday with his par-
enta, Mr. and Mrs, Chris Kropf. 

Harry Heuvelhorst and son of 
Zealand were last Tuesday callers 
at the Ted Elhart home. 

Mrs. Helen Elhart entertained 
with a grocery shower last Tues-
day evening In honor of Miss 
Izetta Frost whose marriage took 
place New Year's day a t the home 
of her parenta. Mr. and Mrs. Gor-
don Frost. 

BOWNE BUGLE NOTES 

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Wlngeler, Mr. 
and Mra. Henry Johnaon, Mrs. 
John Nash. Mr. and M r s Corwln 
Porrlt t spent Tuesday evening, 
Dec. 21 when 20 Chriatmaa boxes 
were packed to be delivered to 
the sick and shutlns f rom the la-
dles aid of Bowne Center. 

Mr. and Mrs. Corwln Por r l t t 
Gilbert Porr i t t spent Christmas a t 
Howard Heacocks in Hastings. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Boughner 
of Freeport were Christmas guests 
of Mr. snd Mrs. Lawrence John-
son and aons. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Wat t s enter-
tained Mlas Alice Kenner and 
Mlsa Mabel Watta of Chicago and 
Mr. and Mrs. John Watta for 
Chrlstmss. 

A. J., Victor, Alice and Charlie 
Porrl t t apent Chrlstmaa a t Wm. 
Falrchlld'a of Alto. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Huntington 
and family spent Christmas with 
Mrs. Anna Foster uf Gaines. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Johnson and 
sons Morse and Henry, Jr., had as 
their guests Sunday Miss Alice 
Kenner, Miss Mabel Wat t s of Chi-
cago, Miss Frances McCarty of 
Lowell, Mr. and Mrs. LaVerne Bry-
a n t aon Dean of Alto, Mr. and 
M r s Stanley Coles and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Johnson and 
sons, Mr. and M r s John Watts. 

Mr. and Mrs. Corwln Porrlt t had 
as guests Sundsy Mr. and Mra. 
Robert Porr i t t and baby. Miss 
Myrtle Porr i t t and Clara Lucille 
Heacock of Haatlngs, Mr. and Mrs. 
Elmer Yelter and family of Morse 
Lake, Mr. and M r s William Por-
ritt and family and Francis Por-| 
rltt of Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Floyd Flynn snd daughters 
Miss Vernice Benson, Mr. and M r s 
Corwln Por r l t t and Gilbert Por-
ri t t attended the Chris tmas pro-
gram a t Logan school. 

Clara Lucille Heacock of Haa-
tlnga ia apending thla week with 
her grandparents, Mr. snd Mra. 
Corwln P o r r l t t 

Mr. snd M r s Eugene Brysnt of 
Hastings apent Chriatmaa night a t 
Dee Bryant'a. 

MOSELEY—MURRAY LAKE 

Mr. and M r s WIU Shannon 
spent Chriatmaa day in Chicago 
visiting with relatives 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Malone and 
family and Alvln Davis spent 
Sunday afternoon in Grand Rap-
lda. 

Mra. Lizzie Davis and Martin of 
Grand Rapids were Chrlstmaa din-
ner gueats of Lew Fr i t s and wife 
and evening callera of Mrs. Hettle 
Davis a n d family. 

Marjorie, Ella, Norma Weeks, 
Mr. and Mra. Harold Weeks and 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Hsrvey Capron 

Tho Sweet school entertained tho 
neighborhood at a Christmas tree 
party Friday night a t the school 
house. Thc program was excellent. 
Christmas carols by the children, 
Doris Sterzick at the piano, were 
nicely done. Old Santa gave pre-
sents to all from the pretty tree. 
Candy, apples and popcorn were 
plentiful and atl had a happy time. 
Thanks to our teacher. Miss Marie 
Beahan. 

Mrs. Helen Eyke wishes to thank 
tho carolers from Alto for com-
ing to sing for her. Helen is able 
to be around the house again. 

Emerson Wieland's celebrated 
Christmas again on Sunday with 
the Colby family at her brother's 
home, Mr. and Mrs. Emerson Col-
by and Peter. 

Jack Acheson's spent Christmas 
with their daughter's family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Guy Wlllett, Kenneth and 
Richard, of Clarksvllle. 

Callers a t Howard Bartlott's on 
Sunday to see Helen Eyke were 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Tlmmer and 
Rodger, Harry Ingle and Geraldlne 
McNutt, all of Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Paul of At-
lanta, who were visiting home 
folks for Christmas, accompanied 
by Mrs. Paul's mother, Mrs. Colby 
of Alto, visited her sister, Mrs. 
Emerson Wleland and family on 
Monday. 

Mrs. Annie Acheson and Mr. and 
Mrs. George Wleland and Marie 
had Sunday dinner a t Mrs. Eliza-
beth Wieland's 

Mr. and Mrs. Moat and family 
from Grand Rapids were Wednes-
day evening guests of the Wm. 
Kllgus'. The Kllgus' were at the 
school Christmas tree so the Moat 
family came on to the achool. They 
enjoyed our program and we were 
glad to have them see our fine 
show. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Lyons of 
Grand Rapids were a t Charlie Rlt-
tenger's over the holiday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Oxel Johnson had 
dinner Christmas eve with their 
son and wife Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Johnson of Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Oxel Johnson's brother. 
Earl King had Chrlstmaa dinner 
with Mr. and Mrs. Johnson. 

Earl Meddaugh, Mrs. Earl Mc-
Diarmid's nephew, has returned to 
his home in Oak Park . 

Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy Bradshaw 
of Lansing were Chrlstmaa guests 
a t Earl McDlarmld'a. 

John Schwarder is spending a 
couple of weeks In Hastings with 
his sister, Mrs. Helrlgle. 

Leo Kyser's visited their par-
enta, Roy Kyser In South Boston 
Chriatmaa. 

The Carolera f rom Alto M. E. 
church sang for Mra. Elizabeth 
Wleland Christmas eve. 

put on a very Impressive and pleas-
ing program with a Christmas tree 
last Thursday evening. They are to 
be complimented upon their tire-
less efforts In making this event a 
success. The school house was 
beautifully decorated, with a full 
house of parents and friends pre-
sent. 

Master Blaine and Gloria Peck 
of Saranac are enjoying part of 
tho holiday vacation with their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Wm 
Garfield. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Higglns 
were Christmas week-end guests 
at the Hazel Conner home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harlle Hunter, Ha-
zel Conner and Glenn attended the 
fine Christmas program and tree 
last Wednesday evening at the Wil-
kinson school, Mildred Shores, tea-
cher. 

Mr. Relchert and son Clifton en-
tertained their aynt from Elgin, 
III. this week at tho old Lee Lamp-
kin homo. 

Word received from Ettie Wicks, 
who was taken to Blodgett hospi-
tal last Tuesday, Is that she Is 
slowly Improving. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Kohn, Mr. 
and Mrs. York Kohn and Elaine 
and Melvln Kilncr and family of 
Grand Rapids enjoyed Christmas 
dinner a t tho Paul Kohn home. 

Bowne Bugle Notes 
Mlsa Myrtle Porrltt 

NEWS FROM GRAND RAPIDS 
OF FORMER BO'«VNE FOLKS 

Mrs. Lizzie Whitmer, Wilbur and 
May ate Christmas dinner with 
relatives at thc homc of John 
Whitmer and family near Beaver-
ton. 

Stephen Weaver and wife of 
Bowne ate Christmas dinner with 
Mrs. Weaver's parents, Willis Lape 
and wife, of Kirtland St. 

W. J. Glasgow, wife and daugh-
ter Mildred of Baylla St. spent 
Christmas with the "Hogan family 
at the home of Dewey Hogan. 

Miss May Whitmer, a teacher In 
the Holland schools for several 
years, who Is spending her holiday 
vacation with her mother and 
brother on Kirtland St., submitted 
to an operation for the removal of 
her tonsils Monday. She Is recover-
ing nicely. 

The Brandebury family were 
treated to a fine turkey dinner 
with all the trimmings going with 
It at the home of Arlee Brandebury 
and wife Christmas. A very pretty 
Christmas tree and gifts for all 
present helped to make the occa-
sion a happy one. Those present 
were Gilbert Heerlnga. wife and 
two sons, J . S. Brandebury and 
wife, Mrs. George Alger of Kent 
City, Miss Maud Gleason, Arlee 
Brandebury, wife and son. George 
Alger of K e n t City, with a friend, 
called at the same home Christmas 
n igh t 

Mark Troyer and family ate 
Chriatmas dinner with Mrs. Troy-
er's parents, Bert Heaven and wife, 
of near Clarksville. 

Joel Helntzelman and family of 
Lansing spent Christmas with the 
former's sister, Mrs. Ear l Glldden, 
her husband and family. 

W. J . Glasgow, wife and Mildred 
visited the former 's cousin, Bert 
Freeiand and wife of Hastings on 
Sunday. 

George Alger and wife of Kent 
City were Sunday dinner guests of 
J . S. Brandebury and wife. 

Mrs. E. Troyer apent Christmas 
with her daughter, Mrs. Sam Rod-
abush, of Lowell. She vlaited her 
daughter, Mrs. Ray Wleland and 
family of Freeport Sunday and 
Monday. 

Mrs. Dee Bryant and Miss Alice 
Porri t t spent Wednesday after-
noon In iHastinga 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Yelter and 
children were Sunday morning 
callers at Corwln Porrltt 's. 

Sunday callers at John Nash's 
were Mr. and Mrs, Harold Nash 
and Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Ellis and 
Joan of Lowell and Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Flynn and family. 

Rev. and Mrs. Floyd Kinney and 
son Stanley were Sunday dinner 
guests at Alice Gardner's. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Porrl t t and 
baby of Hastings were week-end 
guests at Corwin Porrltt 's. 

Mrs. Amanda Ervin, Mrs. Jennie 
Flynn, Mrs. John Nash, Mrs. Leo 
Church, Mrs. Floyd Flynn and 
children and Miss Vcrnice Benson 
attended the play given by the 
Lake school at Logan New Year's 
eve. 

Mr. and Mrs. Corwin Porrlt t and 
Gilbert Porrlt t spent Sunday at 
Howard Heacock's in Hastings. 

Mrs. Corwln Porritt and Gilbert 
Porrit t called on Mrs. Edith and 
Miss Ethel Boulard T h u r ^ a y . 

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Bryant of 
Hastings spent Sunday a t Dee 
Bryant's. 

Corwin and Gilbert Porrit t call-
ed on Peter Thomas New Year's 
day. 

Orley Burns was a Tuesday call-
er at Corwln Porrltt 's. 

Church night was observed with 
53 attending. A potluck supper 
was served at eight o'clock with 
each class and teacher having a 
special table. Decorations were in 
charge of Misses Alice Nash and 
Velma Mishler. Rev. Kinney asked 
for group and personal New Year's 
resolutions and the responses giv-
en were both serious and humor-
ous. After supper games and con-
tests were played and the occasion 
was so much enjoyed that it was 
suggested another church night be 
held In January. The date will be 
announced later. 

Christmas Sunday, the 26th, was 
observed w i t h an appropriate 
Christmas pageant under the di-
rection of Miss Alice Porrl t t . It 
was very well presented. A Christ-
mas tree was decorated and the 
children were remembered with 
candy and gifts. 

USED C A R 

BARGAINS 
1937 Chevrolet Town Sedan 

1936 Chevrolet Town Sedan 

1936 Chevrolet Coupe 

1934 Chevrolet Coach 

1932 Pontiac Coach 

1936 Chevrolet Coupe and Box 

1932 Plymouth Sedan 

1936 Chevrolet Truck 

1935 Chevrolet Truck 

Many Other Cars to Choose From 

Webster Chevrolet Sales 
Phone 298 W. Main St., Lowell 

Vergennes Center 
N. M. K. 

Mrs. White spent the week-end 
In Grand Rapids with her children. 

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Davis of 
Lansing were the Sunday dinner 
guests of their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. M. B. McPherson. Barbara 
and Margaret returned home with 
them af ter spending the week with 
their grandparents. 

Donald Anderson visited a t the 
Floyd Hall home In Grand Rapids 
last week. Sunday Mr. and Mrs. 

Hall and four children brought 
him homc and were dinner guests 
of the Clare Anderson family. 

James Read and Frank Baker 
returned to Flint Monday morning. 

Mrs. J . H. Wesbrook of Mlddle-
ville called on Miss Annie Ander-
son Thursday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stephen Carter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Vere Carter and Mrs. J . 
H. Wesbrook of Mlddleville were 
Thursday dinner guests of Mrs. 
Mary Kerr and Nettle. The picinic 
dinner was enjoyed very much by 
the Kcrrs. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Biggs of 
Muskegon were week-end guests of 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Karl 
Bleri. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Rader of 
Portland were the Sunday dinner 
guests of their daughter and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Sam Ryder. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Baldus and 
two daughters of Holland, Keith 
and Selma Kerr of Muskegon, Eva 
Kerr of Grand Rapids, Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Maloney of Ionia and 
Esther Kerr of Lowell were Sun-
day dinner guests of their mother, 
Mrs. Rosa Kerr. Don Baldus re-
turned home with his parents af ter 
spending a week a t the Kerr home. 

West Lowell 
Mra. Melvln Court 

Mrs. Gabe Onan visited Mrs. Har-
ley Mullen and Mrs. Edith Carey 
last Thursday in Grand Rapids. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Baker and 
family spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Dawson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Wheaton 
and three children of Grand Rap-
ids were Sunday evening callers 
of Melvln Court and wife 

Mrs. Gabe Onan and Eiery Onan 
spent New Year's at the home of 
Claude Schmidt and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Columbus Jay and 
Carl Munroe and wife of Lowell 
were New Year's guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. James Munroe. 

Mr. and Mrs. Melvln Court called 
on Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Myers 
of Lowell Sunday afternoon. 

Barbara Jean Dawson spent last 
week with her grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. George Tucker of South 
Boston. 

Never ask the parents of a young 
married man what he Is doing for 
a living. 

South Bowne 
Mrs. Jennie Pardee 

WARE DIST. 

MORSE LAKE 

Mra. Glen Yelter came home 
from Blodgett hoapltal Wednesdsy 
and la gaining. 

Dorla Yelter apent the week-end 
with the Watson glrla. 

Mr. and Mra. Jack Paul of At-
lanta were Monday vlaltora a t 
Floyd Yelter's. 

Mr. and Mra. M. A. Watson and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. E. C. Yel-
ter and children and Mra. Erwin 
Greenllegh were Chriatmaa gueata 
a t Jennie Yelter's. 

Charlea Smith and family were 
Chriatmas gueata s t Dr. R. T. Lua-
tig'a in Grsnd Rapids. 

Erwin Hosg of Detroit ate Sun-
dsy dinner with Adrisn Smith who 
la home from Houghton College 
of Minea for two weeka. 

Mr. and Mra. Liale Clark and 
children spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Oawsld Bleri of LoweU. 

Chriatmaa gueata a t Matt Matt 

Mrs. Henry Mulder, who has 
been very alck with pneumonia at 
the home of her brother in Grand 
Raplda, ia gaining nicely. 

Chriatmaa gueata a t the home of 
Mr. and Mra. I. P. Filklna were Mr. 
and Mra. A. Tibblt of Sparta. Mr. 
and Mra. John Willlama of Sara-
nac and Mrs. Carrie Bigler of 
Portland, Ore. Sunday callers were 
John Yelter, Mra. Lewis Howk and 
Libbie Meddough of Alto. 

Mr. and Mra. Ware Story enter-
tained twenty of Mra. S t o r / a rela-
tivea Chriatmaa day. 

Mr. and Mra. Lea Pitach and 
Larry apent Christmas with his 
slater In Grand Rapids. 

Marvin Brlgga of Grand Rapids 
spent Christmas with tho homo 
folks. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Bovee and 
aona apent Chriatmas with hie 
mother, Mra. Wm. Fox In Lowell. 
Mr. Fox remaina in a very critical 
condition. 

Miaa Eather Brlgga ia apending 
thla week In Grand Raplda. 

Our teacher and children gave a 
very fine Chriatmaa program on 
Thursday evening. 

K E E N E BREEZES 

L M. Cahoon entertained with 
a family Chriatmaa dinner. All of 
hia children were preaent Mr. and 
Mrs. Benjamin Simona of Dundee. 
Mra. Ethel Johnaon, daughter Phy-
llis Jane and friend of Delaware, 
O., were week-end gueata, return-
ing home Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mra. Carl Peck and 
family were Sunday callera a t the 
Wm. Garfield home. Callera at the 
Garfield home Friday upon Benny 
Colwell, were Fred Cowell, Judo 
Barger of Saranac and Everet 
Bowen. 

Mr. and Mra. Louia Stevens en-
tertained with a family dinner for 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Parker, Mar-| 
garet Helmer and Ray Lee of Ionia j 
and Mr. and Mra. Don Pierce. 

Billy Reitz of Detroit spent his 
holiday vacation with the home 
fOlKS. 

Benny Colwell entertained as 
guesta for Christmas dinner, his 
father, Pete Colwell, and Vernle 
Edison at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wm. Garfield. Benny was 
nicely remembered, receiving many 
gifts f rom friends and callera who 
found him Improving. 

Susie and Reva Ulia of Green-
ville spent the week-end with their 
parenta at the Lampkln farm. 

Mra. George Haaa is under the 
doctor's care, suffering with a se-
vere abscess on her neck. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dell Lee entertain-
ed Christmas day for 14 relatives 
and guests, Mr. snd Mrs. M. A 
Benson and Mr. and Mrs. Azor 
Parker, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Brest-
ley snd Msry Meyers. 

The pupils and teachsr, Gertrude 

Whatever the number of a man'a 
frienda, there will be tlmea In hia 
life when he baa one too few; but 
If he has only one enemy, he la 

r - f — —« «««*-• , vnuuuoo lucky Indeed, if be hss not one too 
e m i c k s were Mr, and Mrs. Forest Dyke, of Pot ters Comers achool many.—Buhrer. 

Adrian Kramer is spending the 
week with relatives In Grand Rap-
ids. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Mlshler and 
Gwendolyn were In Hastings last 
Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Yoder and 
family were New Year's guests of 
Emery Kime and family of Camp-
bell. 

Edwin Nash of Clarksvllle spent 
the week-end with the home folks, 
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Pardee. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alden Porrlt t and 
daughters and mother. Mrs. Lydla 
Porrltt , visited at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wm. Graham of Grand 
Rapids Thursday. Mrs. Porrl t t re-
mained with her daughter and 
son-ln-Iaw. The letter's sunt. Mrs. 
Kate Wilson of Lowell, who has 
been spending the winter with the 
Grahama, passed away Friday eve-
ning. 

Sylvester Boulard of Bowne, 
when returning from Freeport on 
Monday evening with a load of 
coal, waa crowded off the Duck 
creek bridge by Lelghton Yoder, 
who was driving the Coulter Com-
pany truck. Fortunately no one 
waa hurt. 

Fred DeCIair, 26, of Campbell, 
who has been driving a taxicab In 
Lansing the past year, met with a 
serious accident last Tuesday. De-
Clalr's left side of his face waa 
torn away by a charge from a shot 
gun. (He crawled a half mile to a 
farm house af ter his assallanta 
dumped him from the taxi, evi-
dently believing he was dead. He 
was removed to a Lansing hos-
pital where attendants said his 
condition waa critical. The gun-
men abducted DeCIair at 2:00 a. m, 
drove him a few mllea south of 
Lansing and shot him af ter beat-
ing him. They fled In the cab, 
which was later found parked on 
a Lansing street. Reports from 
him Sunday said that there was a 
good chance fo r recovery. 

Mary Blough of Freeport ia 
apending the week with her grand-
parents, Mr. snd Mra. Jer ry 
Blough. 

The Rev. Schrock of Zlon Hill 
and Rev. Gingrich of Indiana call 
ed Thuraday on Jerry Blougb, who 
Is on the sick list 

Alfred Custer waa In Grand Rap-
lda laat week having teeth ex-
tracted. 

Leater Blough of North Bowne 
called on hia uncle and aunt, Mr 
and Mra. Jer ry Blough. 

Mra. Alfred Custer entertained 
a large number of relatives on New 
Years for dinner. 

Mrs. Polly Eash spent Wednes-
day evening with Mrs. Jennie 
Pardee. 

C. M. Benedict was a business 
caller at Alto Thursday. 

Talking Pictures 

JOHN DEERE DAY 
M o n . , J a r i a 1 0 a t 0 o u r ^ s t o r e 

Join the crowd and have a good t ime with us. Learn about new mach-
ines, new methods and new ways of cu t t ing costs. 

Ask for Tickets 

Nelson B. Good & Company 
Caledonia, Michigan 

Train Schedules 
The time given below la East-

ern standard time. 
Fese Mnrquette 

Train going east 8:85 s. m. 
Train going weat 8:05 p. m. 

Grand Trunk 
Trains going eaat 8:59 a. m. 

2:10 p. m 
Trains going west 2:10 p. m 

(flag stop) 5:07 p. m. 

Let's Take a Look Around 
THERE are a lot of good values, opportunities 

and chances to profit parading through the Ledger 
classified ads every week. If you are not reading 
them, or using them to obtain something you want 
. . . then you are not looking around fo r real op-
portunities. Read the want-ads. . . . Use the want-
ads. . . . They cost only 35 cents fo r 25 words. 
Phone 200. 

READ and USE thc W A N T ADS 
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WHERE IHOPPERf 

RED & WHITE 

Baking Chocelate pkg. 15c 
Contains 8 1-oz. individually wrapped squares 

RED A WHITE 

Apple Sauce c
Ahol«d.p0i,e. 3 ^ 25c 

Q u e e n C a t s u p 10-oz. hot. 1 0 c 

P e a s Ro. 2 can 1 0 c 

Y e l l o w C o r n Ro. 2 can 1 0 c 

Blie & White Coffee Ib. 2 3 c 

Green & White Coffee . Ib. 1 7 c 

BLUE A WHITE 

Soap FlakesE C 0 N 0 M Y 

RED KING 
R . ^ C A A J A good food for 
Hog rOOO all dogs 

5-lb. box OQa 
only fcW 

6 l ± 29c 

CHOICE FRESH 
I Kl ITS AM) 
VEGETABLES 

B A N A N A S 
Large, ripe 

4 lbs. 25c 
TEXAS 

GRAPEFRUIT 

doxcn 35c 

Flor. Oranges 

7 lbs. S5c 

H i Lettiee 7c 
CALIFORNIA 

CARROTS 

bunch 6c 

- - HERE ARE "EXTRA VALUE" SPECIALS - -

RICE FANCY BLUE R0SE - - - 4 bulk 19e 
Rolled Oats 5 Ib. bag 19e Line Beans - - Ib. lOe 

GREEN PEAS Split or whole 5 lbs. 25c 

RAISINS NEDROW SEEDLESS 4 Ib. package 33c 

CHOICE FRESH MEATS 
TENDERIZED 

Smoked Hams 
Ham, Pore End 

Ib. 20c 

You can cut this ham 
with a fork 

String End 
Ib. 15c 

whole Ib. 2 1 c 

Center Slices 
Ib. 33c 

LARD Pure, home rendered style bulk 2 lbs. 25c 

Picnic Hams shankless Ib. 19c 

Social Events 

Pork Loin Roast 
Cut from choice young 
pigs 10 to 12 Ib. average 

Whole Lb. 1 9 c 

Shoulder End 
Lb. 18c 

Loin End 
Lb. 20c 

It will be a tasty meal, 
roast pork and apple 
sauce. 

RED & WHITE 

Apple Sauce 
3 No. 2 cans 2 5 c 

Veal Stew 
Ib. . . 17c 

Veal Roast 
Ib. . . 18c 

Pork Chops 
ctr. cats Ib. 23c 

Pork Steak 
Ib. - - 20c 

Bacon Squares 

Pork Roast 
Center cu t 4 1 m 
of shoulder Ib. 

Beef Pot Roast 
Ib. . . 17c 

Beef Chuck 
Roast lb.19c 

Beef Ribs 
meaty Ib. 14c 

- lb. 16c 

W E A V E R ' S 
FOOD MARKET 
Phone 156 We Deliver 

More Local News 

Mrs. Richard Nead is ill at the 
home of her parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Bry Condon. 

Theo Bailey had some turkeys 
killed toy dogs Sunday at his farm 
In Vergennes. 

Mrs. Nora Haines and daughter 
Betty spent the week-end in Grand 
Rapids with Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Sheneman. 

^lr . Und Mrs. David C. Cox and 
children returned the first of t h ^ 
week from Boston, Mass.. where 
they spent the holidays. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. L. Charles call-
ed on Mrs. Margaret Dennis in 
Grand Rapids Sunday. 

Richard Lampkin returned laat 
Thursday from a trip to Florida 
which proved very interesting. 

Mr. and Mrs. P. C. Sayles of 
Chicago visited his mother, Mrs. 
Susie Sayles, and other relatives 
over New Year's. 

Mr. and Mrs. Guy Davis and 
family of Grand Rapids spent New 
Years with Mrs. Myrtle Tredenick. 
Callers were Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Tredenick and family of Sheridan. 
Mrs, Myrtle Tredenick spent Christ-
mas day In Grand Rapids with the 
Davis family. 

Oren Frost left Sunday for Mich-
igan State College after spending 
the holidays with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gordon Frost, In Moseley. 

Mrs. Marguerte Kohn and chil-
dren, Carol Mae and Carl of De-
troit spent Christmas week with 
her mother, Mrs. Frank M. Gulll-
ford. 

Dixie, youngest daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Archie Travis and grand-
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Will J . 
Morse of Lowell, suffered a com-
pound fracture of an arm Tuesday 
while sliding down hill near her 
home In Ionia. 

Popular Couple Married on New 
Year's Day 

Miss Izetta Frost, daughter of 
Mr, and Mrs. Gordon Frost of 
Moseley, and Allison Roark, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Roark of Alto. 
wore united In marriage a t six 
o'clock on New Year's day at the 
home of the bride's parents. Rev. 
Walter Ryder of Grand Rapids 
performing the ceremony. 

Preceding the rites. Miss Mar-
garet Roark of Lansing rang "I 
Love You Truly" and played thc 
wedding march. 

The bride wore a gown of pow-
der blue taffeta, trimmed with lace 
from her mother's wedding dress. 
She was attended by Miss Maxino 
Roark. sister of the groom, who 
wore a dress of royal blue moire 
taffeta. Both carried similar bou-
quets of pink and while carnations. 
Robert Ellis attended his cousin as 
best man. The ceremony was per-
formed before the fireplace which 
waa decorated with palms and 
white flowers. l a . , « 

A wedding supper was served S* 425 •nr*T#d
 calalln plaque 

mmediately af ter the ceremony " 0 ® • ^Ml White 
with a wedding cake made by th# 
groom's aunt. Mrs. Walter Ryder. " 
The cake was a large one trimmed 
with silver and green and was sur-
rounded by candles Thirty-five 
relatives were present at the sup-

Huntera Beware 

BARNBGAT. N, J . . . . 'Tm Barne-
ra t Pete—DONT SHOOT 1" warns 

per. 
A reception was held at the home 

of the bride's parents at eight 
o'clock for friends and relatives. 
Refreshments were served and 
beautiful gifts received by the 
newly married couple. Oren Froet, 
brother of the toride, and an a r t 
student at Michigan State College, 
arranged an amusement room in 
the basement for games, decorat-
'ng with odd signs and colored 
lights. There were 125 guests pres-
ent from Grand Rapids, Chicago, 
Lansing, Conklln. Alto, McCords 
and Lowell. 

After the reception, Mr. and Mrs. 
Roark left for their new home In 
Bellevue, Mich. 

Both the bride and groom were 
graduates of Lowell high school, 
class of 1936. and have many 
friends In the community who ex-
tend them best wishes for a happy 
married life. 

pet deer who n n Into this com* 
tnunlty thre yeara ago to eicape 
ft forest fire. Pete is a Mend ot 
the children, has cart* blano a t 
the viltftte vegetable and oonfeo* 
Uonery stores, often rompe to 
school with the youngstera. and 
sleeps tn a bed every night above 
a loeal store. 

Basketball 

of 

47th Wedding Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. George Golds 
Keene celebrated their 47th wed-
ding anniversary with a dinner on 
New Year's day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Golds were mar-
ried at the home of Mrs. Golds' 
parents In Keene on New Year's 
eve, 1890. They have made their 
home In Keene ever since their 
marriage. 

Guests at the dinner were Harley 
Dennlson and daughter Marlon 
and Eleanor Moore of Grand Rap-
ids, Mr. and Mrs. Herto Howden 
and daughter Dolores of Detroit, 
Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Moore and son 
Loren of Keene and Mr. and Mrs. 
Brayton Golds and children of 
Lowell. 

All spent an enjoyable afternoon 
playing games and visiting. 

Social Brevities 

Of Interest to Lowell residents is 
the announcement of the engage-
ment of Miss Helen Elizabeth Ful-
ler, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Harry Fuller of Grand Rapids, and 
granddaughter of Mrs. C. O. Law-
rence of Lowell, to Robert Charles 
Smith of Grand Raplda Miss Pul-
ler's parents are former Lowell 
residents, Mrs. Fuller toeing the 
former Llla Lawrence. The wed-lThe 
ding will take place on Jan . 16 a t 
the Fuller home. 

Jan. 7—State Hospital, there. 
Jan. 11—Caledonia Merchants, 

here. 
Jan. 13—Grandvllle Merchants, 

there. 
Jan. 17—State Reformatory a t 

Ionia, there. 
Jan. 18—Junior College Frosh, 

here. , 
Jan . 25—Cedar Springs Mer-

chants, here. 
Jan . 2S->Iunlor College Frosh, 

there. 
Jan. 31—Cedar Springs Mer-

chants, there. 
Feb. 3 —Comstock Pa rk Mer-

chants, here. 
Feb. 8—^Herpolshelmer's or Fre-

mont Merchants, here. 
Feb. 15—Grandvllle Merchants, 

here. 
Feb. 22 —Fulton Theatres or 

Coopersville Merchants, here. 
Mar. l ^ J o e ' s Cut Rates or Beld-

ing, here. 
Mar. 8—Comstock Pa rk Mer-

chants, here. 
Mar. 15 —Wolverine Shoes or 

Lake Odessa Merchants, here. 
Mar. 22—Sparta Merchants, here. 
Mar. 29—Gibson's of Greenville, 

here. 
The Cafes have played 11 games 

to date and will schedule seven 
more games away In addition to 
the above. 

Phil Schneider, Manager. 

Local Basketeers 
Lose Thriller 

An over confident but crippled 
high school basketball team bowed 
In defeat In an overtime game to 
Rockford Tuesday night In the 
most thrilling game that has ever 
been played In tho new gymnasium. 
The score was 27 to 25. Teammates 
and spectators were shocked at 
the misfortune which befell Law-
rence Armstrong who was unable 

[to play because of the passing of 
his mother and In all fairness to 

| the squad it must be admitted that 
the regular center was sorely 
missed. On the other hand, the 
members of the team seemed to 
be collectively obsessed with a high 
degree of certainty as to the final 
outcome of the game. This super-
iority-complex grew In the early 
stages of the game for Lowell as-
sumed what appeared to be a com-
fortable margin of 12-5 at the half 
way mark. 

Careless handling of the ball In 
general and poor passing In parti-
cular during the third quarter en-
abled Rockford to out-score us 11 
to 5 making the score at the end 
of the third period Lowell 17. 
Rockford 16. The crowd was In a 
frenzy as the lead changed hands 
during the final period and when 
Lowell luckily tied the score a t 22-
22 at the close of the regulation 
period the large crowd expectantly 
awaited the result of the over-time 
period. But again Lowell was out-
scored 5-3 which made the final 
score Rockford 27, Lowell 25. The 
out-standing star of the game was 
Turner of Rockford who garnered 
11 points f rom many different an-
gles. 

The Lowell boys again clearly In-
dicated that they have the " s t u f f ' 
to "go places" if they can assume 
the right mental attitude. It is still 
possible for the team to bring bas-
ketball laurels to the famished fans 
but the road to the top Is now 
much more difficult. I t was per-
haps the keenest disappointment 
to Coach Avery since he has been 
coaching in Lowell for he had very 
definitely been entertaining hopes 
of bringing court honors to Low-
ell. 

The next game will be at East 
Grand Rapids on Friday which is 
to be followed by a game at Beld-
ing on January 14 and then on 
January 21 Grandvllle will bring 
one of the outstanding teams of the 
conference and county to Lowell. 

In Memoriam 

Social Brevities 

The Book Review Club met on 
Tuesday evening with Mrs. W. W. 
Gumser. Mrs. Lee Miller reviewed 
the story of "Katrina" by Sally 
Sallmen. 

FROST—In loving memory of 
our daughter and sister Joyce, who 
passed away three years ago, Dec. 
30. 
Remembrance is the golden chain 

Death tries to break, tout all in 
vain. 

To have to iove, and then to par t 
Is the greatest sorrow of one's 

heart. 
years may wipe out many 
things. 

But this they wipe out never. 
The memory of those happy years 

When we were all together. 
Her sorrowing Daddy, Mother, 

Sister and Brother. cS4 

Ledger want ads are noted for 
results. tf 

You Are As Safe To 

Drive Blindfolded 
As You Are To Drive 

Without 
Insurance Protection 

Insure Today —Be Prepared 

Wolverine Insurance Co. 
H. J. BITTENGER, Agent 

LoweU, Mich. 

CARD OF THANKS 

We wish to express our sincere 
thanks to the good neighbors and 
friends of our dear sister and 
aunt, Mrs. Katie Wilson, for their 
kind expressions of sympathy and 
love. 

Mrs. Sarah Wallace. 
Mr. J . Sigel Graham. 
Mr. and Mrs. William Graham 
and Gordon. 
Mr. and Mrs. V. J. Dickerson 
and Yvonne. p34 

CARD OF THANKS 

I wish to express my thanks to 
the merchants of Lowell for the 
gift received on Lowell Day, Dec. 
22. 
p34 Floy Golds. 

It is hard for an empty bag to 
stand upright. 

S T R A N D 
LOWELL 

SUNDAY-MONDAY, JAN. 9-10 

\ 

Red Comet 
W i l f D o Your 

Heating Job 

Bed Comet will help you hea t your house with less dirt 

and less waste. It 's real economy coal—burns clean and 

h o t Selected by experte to give you the greateat heat-

ing value fo r the money. Before your bin gets low, call 

84. 

C. H. RUNCIMAN 
Lowell, Michigan Phone 34 

BIRTHS 
To Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Jeffeiy, 

Dec. 29, a daughter, Ellen Marie, 
weight 6 lbs., 2 oz. 

To Mr. and Mrs. iHenry Weaver, 
a daughter. Sue Ann, on Jan. 5, at 
Belding hospital. 

CATALOGUED VARIETY 

"I'll betchu $50 y'won't get 
bean off your vines this season." 

"I 'm on; why man, they're all in 
bloom now." 

"Yes, but they are pea vines." 

Ow! 
Motorist (to man he Just ran over) 

—Hey, look out back there I 
Defeated Soul—What's the mat-

ter, y'ain't comin' back, are ya?— 
The Earth Mover. 

Clever 
Customer—I should like that par-

rot. But can It talk? 
Dealer—Talkl Why it flew from 

Paraguay to Stockholm, asking Us 
own way all the time. 

TWO 

STARS 
...TEAMED for 
the FIRST TIME 

KatkMietimm 

K n G E R ROGERS 
STAGE 
POOR 
M o l p h e M E N I O U 

* A o R.K-O fodio P '"*"" • 

SHORTS 

"BIQ APPLE" 
Comedy, Novelty, News 

'Member When 
When It was the style for men to 

wear trousers that were nearly 
skintight? This often resulted In 
embarrassing situations, for it was 
during the period that the skating 
rink flourished and a fall on the 
floor meant more than Just mere-
ly picking one's self up. A young 
man had to toe reasonably certain 
that none of the seams of his 
trousers had cracked before he 
essayed to rise. 

When the young people of Low-
ell gave more attention to coast-
ing than they do now? A little run 
of sleighing meant that the prin-
cipal hills in the village would be 
the gathering places for more of 
the younger population. Truly those 
were the days of real spor t 

When flag pole raisings were al-
ways a feature of Presidential 
campaigns? 

When a large shade tree flourish-
ed on the present site of the dime 
store? Mrs. Hatie Rouse says that 
she remembers i t 

4-H Club Boy 
Maps Farm Sol 

First in the state to complete a 
4-« club project In f a rm soil map-
ping Is Elmer Christenson, Fre-
mont, who has led the way In find-
ing that knowledge of scientific 
farming pays, from the soil up. 

"Where's Elmer?"—that old fa-
miliar Legion cry, might have been 
wisely used last summer on the 
Christenson farm, for the boy 
spent all his avallatole extra hours 
mapping the 13 fields which total 
160 acrea He became one of the 
best amateur soil map makers that 
specialists at Michigan State Col-
lege have ever found. 

Through cooperation with the 
county agricultural agent and with 
members of the soil conservation 
department Of the college, the boy 
set up maps showing lime re-
quirement of each field, made an 
erosion survey map, a soil type 
map, and a base map of the farm. 
Each one shows accurate outlines, 
fence lines and measured areas 
differing within fields. 

He found lime requirements 
range from none on six fields to a 
demand for 20 tons of marl for 
field 5 of 9.4 acres. He set down 
1936 and 1937 crop yields of the 
various fields so that results of 
future cropping and management 
changes can be measured. 

In the offices of A. G. Kettunen, 
state 4-H Club leader at the col-
lege, records show scores of boys 
enrolled in 1937, the first year the 
farm soil mapping project was 
offered in Michigan. The Fremont 
boy made the f irst project com-
pletion. Additional counties are to 
be added in 1938 as leaders become 
acquainted with methods used In 
directing the boys in the project. 

Diner: "Walter! This stew is ter-
rible. What kind is it?" 

Walter: 'The chef calls this his 
enthusiastic stew.'-

Diner: "Why?" 
Walter: "He puts everything he 

has Into It." 

We find that we enjoy life more 
if we avoid the company of well-
informed people. 

Wflliam Powell 

fonH remember him aa the fa-
mous detective Phllo Vance In the 
movie version of 8. S. Van Dlne'i 
thriller, the Kennel Murder Case. 
Ifcn Dlne's Kidnap Murder Case 
aill appear in aerial form fn this 
newspaper soon, with Phllo Vance 
snce more as the suave aleuth. 

R e a d , 8 5 

CHICAGO . . . Ople Read, com-
paratively unknown to preaent 
genera tioos, still finds that each 
birthday brings Wm thousands of 
congratulatory meaaagea Cram 
friends and admirers who "knew 
him when" he was one of Amer-
ica's favorite authors. Bare, s t 
hia 81 th birthday eelebfadoa. Read 
reminisces, recalling ssasag other 
eveata the t ime t h e e , a s a . 
ater of II . he h s t t a i B W at the 
aewa ** * 

UAW Challenges Ford At River Rouge 

DEARBORN, Mich, . . . Immediately after a refcent NLRB finding that 
Ford was guilty of vlolattag the National Labor Relatione Act by al-
leged Intimidation and coercion of employee active In organising nnlt i 
of the UAW. a CIO afflllate, 400 members of the UAW repeated attempU 
•to dlatribute literature In front of the main gate ot the f o r d River 
•Rouge plant and were again ousted b o m the ar ta from which they 
have been barred by a oily ordinance. Above, one ol the girl p*mber i 
M being arrested by a Dearborn poUeeasa. 

Some Consolation 

A meat dealer in a small town 
presented a bill to a customer who 
owed him quite a sum. 

"Well, John, here is your meat 
bill for the last three months; now 
I want you to pay up, as my bills 
are due and I must pay." 

"Newt, I'm sorry," replied John, 
"I can't pay, but don't feel toad 
about it, for I will keep on trading 
with you." 

Dfamer Wear 

NEW YORK CITT . . . Alls works 
her magic thla t i d e In black silk 
chiffon jersey. This dinner gowa 
la corded i t the neck 'and shoal* 
dera and k n g scarf ends of the 
fabric are twisted to swathe the 
body and tie In a huge bow. Bar-
baric gold metal jewelry 
with colored atones 

la aet 

SPECIAL 
10 D A Y OFFER 
1S87 FORD V-S 8S hp. Stand-
ard Fordor Touring Sedan 
Demonstrator.—A new car 

—only used a few months as 
a demonstrator and has been 
driven only a few miles. 
Full equipped with heaters. 
Special 10-day offer f rom 
regular price. 

$185.00 Diicount 
1SS7 FORD V-S SO hp. Tudor 
Sedan, Demonstrator—with 
only a few miles of wear. A 
chance to buy a brand new 
car a t a discount from the 
regular price of 

$800.00 Discount 
These c a n can be bought 

with a small down pay-
ment on U.C.C. Terms 

Easy Tarma on 
ACCESSORIES 

Does your car need new tires, 
battery, heater or other ao-
oessories? Come In and find 
out about our low cost bud-
get plan with as little asfLTl 
down. 

CHECK-UP PLAN 
YOU WOULD CHECK 

YOUR CAR AND LUBRI-
CATE IT MORE REGULAR-
LY I F YOU COULD SAVE 
MONEY BY DOING SO. 
WE CAN SAVE YOU MON-
EY! 15 MONTHS CHECK-
ING AND LUBRICATING 
SERVICING CAN BE PUR-
CHASED AT A REAL SAV-
INGS. ASK ABOUT IT. 

Cirlit & Dyke, l ie. 
Authorised Ford Sales and 

Service 

Phone 44 Lowell, Mich. 

East Caledonia 
Mrs. 8. VanNamee 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Scott and fam-
ily of Grand Rapids were New 
Year's guests of their daughter, 
Mra. Harold Welton and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Irwin Merrlman 
and son of Alto spent New Years 
with Mr. and Mrs. Howard Miller. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Flynn of 
Whitneyville and Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Metternick were Friday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Miller. 

Miss Vivian Proctor returned to 
M. S. C. Monday af ter spending 
the holiday vacation with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J . C. Proctor. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Winks of 
Grand Rapids spent Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Dutcher. 

The Glenn Sanborn family spent 
New Year's eve in Grand Rapids. 

Mrs. Roy McCaul spent Sunday 
afternoon with Mrs. S. VanNamee. 

Mrs. S. VanNamee visited Mrs. 
Geo. Skldmore at Alto Thursday 
afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stewart Johnson 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carl Konkle and 
son of Grand Rapids spent New 
Years with their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Welton. 

P R I C E R I T 1 11 1) U E 

Lined Stanchions 

$2.15 
Water Bowls $2.40 

Kleen-eiy Poultry Ware 

Oil and Coal Burning 
Brooder Stoves 

Safe, efficient and depend-
able year around: 
Water Fountains 

Feeders 

You are alwayt welcome at Price-Rite Hardware, 

I' R l - C E R H i II 1) U i 


